Florida Administrative Register

Volume 47, Number 139, July 20, 2021

Section |
Notice of Development of Proposed Rules
and Negotiated Rulemaking

WATER MANAGEMENT DISTRICTS
Suwannee River Water Management District

RULE NOS.: RULE TITLES:

40B-1.1010 Point of Entry into Proceedings

40B-1.703 Procedures for Consideration of Permit
Applications

40B-1.704 Bond

40B-1.706 Fees

40B-1.709 Suspension, Revocation, and Madification

of District Permits
PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The Suwannee River Water
Management District (District) gives notice that it is initiating
rulemaking to amend rules 40B-1.703, 40B-1.704, 40B-1.706,
and 40B-1.709, F.A.C.; and repeal rule 40B-1.1010, F.A.C. The
purpose of this rulemaking is to correct rule citations and a
misspelling, align procedural rules with agency delegated
authorities, and assign a lower cost fee for minor modifications
of Works of the District permits as set forth in rule 40B-4.1110,
F.A.C.
SUBJECT AREA TO BE ADDRESSED: General and
procedural rules.
RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 373.044, 373.083, 373.109,
373.113, 373.118, 373.171, 373.4141 FS.
LAW IMPLEMENTED: 120.57, 120.59, 120.60, 218.075,
373.084, 373.085, 373.086, 373.103, 373.106, 373.116,
373.118, 373.119, 373.219, 373.229, 373.313, 373.413,
373.414, 373.416, 373.426, 373.429 FS.
IF REQUESTED IN WRITING AND NOT DEEMED
UNNECESSARY BY THE AGENCY HEAD, A RULE
DEVELOPMENT WORKSHOP WILL BE NOTICED IN
THE NEXT AVAILABLE FLORIDA ADMINISTRATIVE
REGISTER.
Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 5 days before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: SRWMD at (386)362-1001 or 1(800)226-1066 (FL
only). If you are hearing or speech impaired, please contact the
agency using the Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771
(TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice).
THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT AND A COPY OF
THE PRELIMINARY DRAFT, IF AVAILABLE, IS: Warren
Zwanka, P.G., Suwannee River Water Management District,
9225 CR 49, Live Oak, Florida 32060, (386)362-1001 or
1(800)226-1066 (FL only)

THE PRELIMINARY TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE
DEVELOPMENT IS:

40B-1.1010 Point of Entry into Proceedings.
Rulemaking Authority 120.54(5), 373.044, 373.113 FS. Law
Implemented 120.54(5), 120.60, 253.115, 373.079(4)(a), 373.083(5),
373.216, 373.219, 373.308, 373.309, 373.323, 373.413, 373.4136,
373.414, 373.416, 373.418, 373.421, 373.426, 373.427 FS. History—
New 4-8-15, Repealed [DATE].

40B-1.703 Procedures for Consideration of Permit
Applications.

(1) General Permits.

(a) through (c) no change.

(d) General permits by rule, as defined in rule 40B-2.041,
F.A.C., are a category of general permits for activities which
have established standards and conditions for issuance of
permits in district rules. A permit application is not required for
any use that meets the requirements of rule 40B-2.041, F.A.C.
40B-24-041F-AC:, and is thereby considered to be an existing
legal use user of water.

(2) Individual Permits.

(a) through (b) no change.

(c) The Governing Board hereby delegates authority to the
Executive Director or their designee Assistant—Executive
Director to issue individual environmental resource permits that

require-no-special-limiting-conditions-or-that require-only-the

unless Ynless objection to the permit application or the

notice of application prepesed-agency-action is made according
to statute and these rules by a substantially affected person;-the

Executive Directoror-Assistant-Executive Director-shall-either

. I . | licati | 0 of 1}
(3) no change.

Rulemaking Authority 373.044, 373.083, 373.113, 373.118, 373.171,
373.4141 FS. Law Implemented 120.57, 120.59, 120.60, 373.084,
373.085, 373.086, 373.106, 373.116, 373.118, 373.229, 373.313,
373.413, 373.416, 373.426 FS. History—New 6-16-88, Amended 12-
22-92, 10-3-95, 1-29-01, 12-10-07, 10-25-09, 3-24-14, 4-8-15,
[DATE].

3341


https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=40
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=121
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=40B-1.1010
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=40B-1.703
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=40B-1.704
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=40B-1.706
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=40B-1.709
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=373.044
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20373.083
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20373.109
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20373.113
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20373.118
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20373.171
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20373.4141%20FS.
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=120.57
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20120.59
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20120.60
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20218.075
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20373.084
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20373.085
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20373.086
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20373.103
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20373.106
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20373.116
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20373.118
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20373.119
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20373.219
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20373.229
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20373.313
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20373.413
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20373.414
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20373.416
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20373.426
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20373.429%20FS.

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 47, Number 139, July 20, 2021

40B-1.704 Bond.

(1) no change.

(2) Applicants for environmental resource permits under
chapters 40B-4 and 40B-400, Florida Administrative Code
(F.A.C.), shall furnish a bond or other form of surety for
certification of completion of construction as required by
paragraphs 40B-4.1140(2)(c) and 40B-400.091(2) 40B-
400 115(f), F.A.C. The forms of surety acceptable to the
District include but are not limited to, cash deposit, letter of
credit, and performance bond. Bonds and other forms of surety
shall be in the following amounts: project area less than one
acre, $1,000; project area less than 10 acres, $2,000; project
area less than 40 acres, $3,000; project area less than 100 acres,
$4,000; project area less than 200 acres, $5,000; project area
greater than or equal to 200 acres, $10,000. The District shall
release the bond or other form of surety, without interest, upon
final acceptance of certification of completion of construction
and transfer of operation and maintenance to an entity approved
by the District as required by rule 40B-400.091(2) 40B-4-2035,
F.A.C.

(3) through (4) no change.

Rulemaking Authority 373.044, 373.113 FS. Law Implemented

373.085, 373.103, 373.219, 373.413, 373.414, 373.416 FS. History—
New 9-15-81, Amended 1-10-10, [DATE].

40B-1.706 Fees.

(1) no change.

(2) Upon delegation of the administration of a permitting
program from the department to the district, the fees for such
permits established by department rule shall be collected by the
district pursuant to section 373.109, F.S.

TABLE 1.A. SCHEDULE OF PERMIT FEES

WATER USE PERMITS

Water Use Permits less than 2,000,000 GPD-ADR $230
Modification or Renewal of Water Use Permits less than $115
2,000,000 GPD-ADR

Water Use Permits equal to or greater than 2,000,000
GPD-ADR

Modification or Renewal of Water Use Permits equal to  $265
or greater than 2,000,000 GPD-ADR

TABLE 1.B. SCHEDULE OF PERMIT FEES
ENVIRONMENTAL RESOURCE AND WORKS OF

THE DISTRICT PERMITS

Use of the reviewing agency’s electronic self- $0
certification system

$530

Verification of exemption under sections 373.406, $100
403.813, F.S., chapter 62-330 or 40B-4, F.A.C.

Verification of qualification to use a General Permit $250
under chapter 62-330, F.A.C., or Noticed General under
chapter 40B-4, F.A.C.

Variance or Waiver under section 120.542, F.S. $0

3342

Variances or Waivers $550
Works of the District General Permits $490
Major Modification of a Works of the District General ~ $245
Permit

Minor Modification of a Works of the District Permit $100

All Individual or Conceptual Approval Permits under
chapters 62-330 or 40B-4, F.A.C.:
(1) through (3) no change.
New Determinations of the Landward Extent of
Wetlands and Other Surface Waters.
(1) through (2) no change.
Reissuance of Informal Determinations. $50
Reissuance of Formal Determinations, in accordance $350
with subsection 62-330.201(5), F.A.C.
Application for any activity when submitted by the $0
Department of Defense.
Any fee in excess of $100, as determined by this section, $100
shall be reduced to this amount, which shall not exceed
$100, for public projects when the applicant is a county
or municipality (or under contract thereto) that qualifies
under section 218.075, F.S.

Rulemaking Authority 373.044, 373.109, 373.113, 373.118, 373.171
FS. Law Implemented 218.075, 373.109 FS. History—New 6-16-88,
Amended 11-25-90, 12-22-92, 10-16-94, 11-8-94, 10-3-95, 1-3-96, 6-
22-99, 5-6-12, 10-1-13, 3-24-14, [DATE].

40B-1.709 Suspension, Revocation, and Modification of
District Permits.

(1) through (3) no change.

(4) The Board shall consider any timely filed petition for a
sections 120.569 and 120.57, F.S., hearing at the next available
regular regtlatery meeting following expiration of the 14-day
time period in subsection (2).

(5) no change.

Rulemaking Authority 373.044, 373.113 FS. Law Implemented
120.53(1)(b)(€);120-60(2); 373.119, 373.429 FS. History—New 9-15-
81, Repromulgated 3-17-88, Amended 12-21-88, 10-25-09, [DATE].

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL
REGULATION

Florida Building Commission

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE:
61G20-2.003 Local Amendments to the Florida Building
Code

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: House Bill 401 (2021) created a
process whereby a person may petition the Florida Building
Commission for a nonbinding advisory opinion about whether
a local regulation constitutes a technical amendment to the
Florida Building Code, and requires the Florida Building
Commission to adopt a form for the petition and directions for
its filing. The Commission intends to open this rule for
development in order to adopt the required form and directions.


https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=1071
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61G20-2.003

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 47, Number 139, July 20, 2021

The Commission also intends to correct an outdated citation in
the current rule.

SUBJECT AREA TO BE ADDRESSED: A form to be used for
petitions for nonbinding advisory opinions about local
regulations.

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 553.73(4), 553.73(5), FS.
LAW IMPLEMENTED: 553.73(4), 553.73(5), FS.

IF REQUESTED IN WRITING AND NOT DEEMED
UNNECESSARY BY THE AGENCY HEAD, A RULE
DEVELOPMENT WORKSHOP WILL BE NOTICED IN
THE NEXT AVAILABLE FLORIDA ADMINISTRATIVE
REGISTER.

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT AND A COPY OF
THE PRELIMINARY DRAFT, IF AVAILABLE, IS: Mo
Madani, Technical Director, Florida Building Commission,
Department of Business and Professional Regulation, 2601
Blair Stone Road, Tallahassee, Florida 32399, (850)717-1825

THE PRELIMINARY TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE
DEVELOPMENT IS:

61G20-2.003 Local
Building Code.

(1) through (3) No change.

(4) Form XXXXXX, effective August XX, 2021, is
adopted for use by persons seeking a nonbinding advisory
opinion about whether a local government regulation, law,
ordinance, policy, amendment, or land use or zoning provision
constitutes a technical amendment to the Florida Building
Code, pursuant to section 553.73(4)(1), F.S.. The form is
available on the internet at https://floridabuilding.org/.

(5) 44 When triennially updating the Florida Building
Code, the Commission shall review each locally adopted
technical amendment and determine whether the amendment
meets the criteria listed in section 553.73(9)(a), F.S. subsection
61620-2.002(HF-AC: For purposes of such determination,
each amendment shall be referred to the applicable Technical
Advisory Committee for review and recommendation to the full
Commission. If the Commission determines that the
amendment meets the criteria, the Commission may adopt the
amendment into the Florida Building Code following the
procedures established in subsections 61G20-2.002(3)-(8),
F.A.C. If the Commission determines that the amendment does
not meet the criteria, the Commission shall rescind the
amendment. Rescissions shall be in writing with written
findings and shall be transmitted to the local government within
30 days of the conclusion of the meeting at which the
Commission’s decision is voted upon.

Amendments to the Florida

Rulemaking Authority 553.73(4), (5) FS. Law Implemented
553.73(4), (5) FS. History—New 11-20-01, Formerly 9B-3.051, 9N-
2.003. Amended .

Section Il
Proposed Rules

AGENCY FOR HEALTH CARE ADMINISTRATION
Health Facility and Agency Licensing

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE:

59A-35.040 License Required; Display

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The Agency proposes to amend rule

59A-35.040, F.A.C., to remove Multiphasic Health Testing
Centers pursuant the repeal of Chapter 483 Part I, F.S. Sunset
language and language related to home health agency
exemptions will also be added.

SUMMARY: The Agency proposes to amend rule 59A-35.040,
F.A.C., to remove Multiphasic Health Testing Centers pursuant
the repeal of Chapter 483 Part I, F.S. Sunset language and
language related to home health agency exemptions will also be
added

SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF ESTIMATED
REGULATORY COSTS AND LEGISLATIVE
RATIFICATION:

The Agency has determined that this will not have an adverse
impact on small business or likely increase directly or indirectly
regulatory costs in excess of $200,000 in the aggregate within
one year after the implementation of the rule. A SERC has not
been prepared by the Agency.

The Agency has determined that the proposed rule is not
expected to require legislative ratification based on the
statement of estimated regulatory costs or if no SERC is
required, the information expressly relied upon and described
herein: A SERC has not been prepared by the agency. For rules
listed where no SERC was prepared, the Agency prepared a
checklist for each rule to determine the necessity for a SERC.
Based on this information at the time of the analysis and
pursuant to section 120.541, Florida Statutes, the rule will not
require legislative ratification.

Any person who wishes to provide information regarding a
statement of estimated regulatory costs, or provide a proposal
for a lower cost regulatory alternative must do so in writing
within 21 days of this notice.

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 408.819, F.S

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 408.804, 408.810, 408.813, F.S.

A HEARING WILL BE HELD AT THE DATE, TIME AND
PLACE SHOWN BELOW:

DATE AND TIME: Tuesday, August 17, 2021, from 2:00 pm
—3:30 pm

PLACE: No public face-to-face meeting. This hearing will be
conducted via teleconference. Participate by dialing the Open

3343


https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=553.73(4)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20553.73(5)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=553.73(4)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20553.73(5)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=59
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=186
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=59A-35.040
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/cfr.asp?id=408.819,%20F.S
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=408.804
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20408.810
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20408.813

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 47, Number 139, July 20, 2021

Voice conference line, 1(888)585-9008, then enter the
conference room number followed by the pound sign, 476-211-
242#. The agenda and related materials can also be found on the
web at:
https://ahca.myflorida.com/MCHQ/Health_Facility Regulatio
n/Rulemaking.shtml

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 3 days before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: Kim Stewart, Bureau of Health Facility Regulation,
2727 Mahan Drive, Tallahassee, Florida, (850) 412-3492. If
you are hearing or speech impaired, please contact the agency
using the Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or
1(800)955-8770 (Voice).

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULE IS: Kim Stewart, (850) 412-3492, email:
Kimberly.Stewart@ahca.myflorida.com

THE FULL TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE IS:

59A-35.040 License Required; Display.

(1) No change.

(2) Any request to amend a license must be received by the
Agency in advance of the requested effective date as detailed
below. Requests to amend a license are not authorized until the
license is issued.

(a) No change.

(b) Requests to change the address of record must be
received by the Agency 21 to 120 days in advance of the
requested effective date for the following provider types:

1. Drug Free Workplace Laboratories as provided under
Sections 112.0455 and 440.102, F.S.,

2. Mobile Surgical Facilities, as provided under Chapter
395, Part I, F.S.,

3. Home Health Agencies, as provided under Chapter 400,
Part 111, F.S., including certificate of exemption,

4. Nurse Registries, as provided under Chapter 400, Part
I, F.S,,

5. Companion Services or Homemaker Services Providers,
as provided under Chapter 400, Part 111, F.S.,

6. Home Medical Equipment Providers, as provided under
Chapter 400, Part VII, F.S.,

7. Health Care Services Pools, as provided under Chapter
400, Part IX, F.S.,

8. Health Care Clinics, as provided under Chapter 400, Part
X, F.S., including certificate of exemption,

Multiohasi " . ’ .

910. Organ and Tissue Procurement Agencies, as provided

under Chapter 381, F.S.

3344

(c) No change.

(3) through (4) no change.

(5) This rule is in effect for five years from its effective
date.

Rulemaking Authority 408.819 FS. Law Implemented 408.804,
408.810, 408.813 FS. History—New 7-14-10, Amended 1-15-20, .

NAME OF PERSON ORIGINATING PROPOSED RULE:
Kim Stewart

NAME OF AGENCY HEAD WHO APPROVED THE
PROPOSED RULE: Simone Marstiller

DATE PROPOSED RULE APPROVED BY AGENCY
HEAD: 07/09/2021

DATE NOTICE OF PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT
PUBLISHED IN FAR: 03/24/2021

AGENCY FOR HEALTH CARE ADMINISTRATION
Health Facility and Agency Licensing

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE:
59A-35.110 Reporting Requirements; Electronic
Submission

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The Agency is proposing to revise
Rule 59A-35.110, F.A.C., to add sunset language and strike a
requirement that approval of revisions to emergency
management plans be reported within 21 days of occurrence as
it conflicts with 408.821, F.S., which requires notification to the
Agency within 30 days after approval.

SUMMARY:: Health care provider reporting requirements.

SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF ESTIMATED
REGULATORY COSTS AND LEGISLATIVE
RATIFICATION:

The Agency has determined that this will not have an adverse
impact on small business or likely increase directly or indirectly
regulatory costs in excess of $200,000 in the aggregate within
one year after the implementation of the rule. A SERC has not
been prepared by the Agency.

The Agency has determined that the proposed rule is not
expected to require legislative ratification based on the
statement of estimated regulatory costs or if no SERC is
required, the information expressly relied upon and described
herein: A SERC has not been prepared by the agency. For rules
listed where no SERC was prepared, the Agency prepared a
checklist for each rule to determine the necessity for a SERC.
Based on this information at the time of the analysis and
pursuant to section 120.541, Florida Statutes, the rule will not
require legislative ratification

Any person who wishes to provide information regarding a
statement of estimated regulatory costs, or provide a proposal
for a lower cost regulatory alternative must do so in writing
within 21 days of this notice.

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY:: 395.0197, 408.806, 408.813,
408.819, 429.23, F.S


https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=59
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=186
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=59A-35.110
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/cfr.asp?id=395.0197,%20408.806,%20408.813,%20408.819,%20429.23,%20F.S
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/cfr.asp?id=395.0197,%20408.806,%20408.813,%20408.819,%20429.23,%20F.S

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 47, Number 139, July 20, 2021

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 408.806, 408.813, 408.810, 429.23,
395.0197, F.S

A HEARING WILL BE HELD AT THE DATE, TIME AND
PLACE SHOWN BELOW:

DATE AND TIME: Tuesday, August 17, 2021, from 2:00 pm
—3:30 pm

PLACE: No public face-to-face meeting. This hearing will be
conducted via teleconference. Participate by dialing the Open
Voice conference line, 1(888)585-9008, then enter the
conference room number followed by the pound sign, 476-211-
242#. The agenda and related materials can also be found on the
web at:
https://ahca.myflorida.com/MCHQ/Health_Facility Regulatio
n/Rulemaking.shtml

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 3 days before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: Kim Stewart, Bureau of Health Facility
Regulation, 2727 Mahan Drive, Tallahassee, Florida, (850)412-
3492. If you are hearing or speech impaired, please contact the
agency using the Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771
(TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice).

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULE IS: Kim Stewart, (850)412-3492, email:
Kimberly.Stewart@ahca.myflorida.com

THE FULL TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE IS:
59A-35.110 Reporting Requirements; Electronic
Submission.

(1) During the two year licensure period, any change or
expiration of any information that is required to be reported
under Chapter 408, Part Il, F.S., or authorizing statutes for the
provider type as specified in Section 408.803(3), F.S., during
the license application process must be reported to the Agency
within 21 days of occurrence of the change, including:

(@) Insurance coverage renewal,

(b) Bond renewal;

(c) Change of administrator or the similarly titled person
who is responsible for the day-to-day operation of the provider;

(d) Annual sanitation inspections;

(e) Fire inspections; and,

(2) No change.

(3) This rule is in effect for five years from its effective

date.

Rulemaking Authority 395.0197, 408.806, 408.813, 408.819, 429.23
FS. Law Implemented 408.806, 408.813, 408.810, 429.23, 395.0197
FS. History—New 7-14-10, Amended 11-13-17, 2-2-21,

NAME OF PERSON ORIGINATING PROPOSED RULE:

Kim Stewart

NAME OF AGENCY HEAD WHO APPROVED THE

PROPOSED RULE: Simone Marstiller

DATE PROPOSED RULE APPROVED BY AGENCY

HEAD: 07/09/2021

DATE NOTICE OF PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT

PUBLISHED IN FAR: 03/24/2021

DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE:

62-701.804 Standards for the Disposal of Coal
Combustion Residuals in Landfills and
Surface Impoundments

PURPOSE, EFFECT AND SUMMARY: Chapter 62-701,

F.A.C., contains the state solid waste management program
regulations and forms. DEP is authorized by EPA to administer
a state solid waste management program. The program is
seeking adoption of the requirements in 40 CFR Part 257.50
through 257.107, “Standards for the Disposal of Coal
Combustion Residuals (CCR) in Landfills and Surface
Impoundments” revised as of August 2016 and the subsequent
amendments in the Federal Register dated November 12, 2020,
into Chapter 62-701, F.A.C. Adoption of the federal regulations
through the Fast Track process for Rule 62-701.804, F.A.C.,
and separately adopting the permitting requirements in Rule 62-
701.805, F.A.C., will provide CCR facilities in Florida one set
of rules to comply with resulting in a more streamlined
permitting process.

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 403.061, 403.704, FS.

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 403.702, 403.703, 403.704, FS.
THIS RULEMAKING IS UNDERTAKEN PURSUANT TO
SECTION

403.8055, F.S. WRITTEN COMMENTS MAY BE
SUBMITTED WITHIN 21 DAYS OF THE DATE OF THIS
NOTICE TO: Kim Walker, Program Administrator,
Department of Environmental Protection, 2600 Blair Stone Rd.,
Tallahassee, FL 32399. Kim.Walker@FloridaDEP.gov or
(850)245-8934.

SUBSTANTIALLY AFFECTED PERSONS MAY WITHIN
14 DAYS OF THE DATE OF THIS NOTICE, FILE AN
OBJECTION TO THIS RULEMAKING WITH THE
AGENCY. THE OBJECTION SHALL SPECIFY THE
PORTIONS OF THE PROPOSED RULE TO WHICH THE
PERSON OBJECTS AND THE SPECIFIC REASONS FOR
THE OBJECTION.

THE FULL TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE IS:

62-701.804 Standards _for the Disposal of Coal
Combustion  Residuals _in _ Landfills _and Surface

Impoundments.

3345


https://www.flrules.org/gateway/cfr.asp?id=408.806,%20408.813,%20408.810,%20429.23,%20395.0197,%20F.S
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/cfr.asp?id=408.806,%20408.813,%20408.810,%20429.23,%20395.0197,%20F.S
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=62
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=62-701.804
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=403.061
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20403.704
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=403.702
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20403.703
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20403.704

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 47, Number 139, July 20, 2021

(1) Purpose and Scope.
(a) The Department adopts by reference the scope and

monitoring systems, 257.91; groundwater sampling and
analysis requirements, 257.93; detection monitoring program,

purpose contained in 40 Code of Federal Regulations (CFR)

257.94; assessment monitoring program, 257.95; assessment of

257.50 and 40 CFR 257.52 revised as of August 5, 2016

corrective _measures, 257.96; selection of remedy, 257.97;

[LINK].
(b) Coal Combustion Residual (CCR) landfills and Coal

implementation of the corrective action program, 257.98;
inactive CCR surface impoundments, 257.100; closure or

Combustion Residual surface impoundments, which are

retrofit of CCR units , 257.101; criteria for conducting the

collectively referred to as CCR units, are solid waste

closure or retrofit of CCR units, 257.102; alternative closure

management facilities in accordance with paragraph 62-

requirements, 257.103; post-closure care requirements,

701.200(112), F.A.C.
(c) Unless another rule is specifically stated to apply only

257.104; recordkeeping requirements, 257.105; notification
requirements, 257.106; publicly accessible Internet site

Rules 62-4, 62-110, 62-701.300, 62-701.804, and 62-701.805,

requirements, 257.107; Appendix Il to Part 257, Constituents

F.A.C., are applicable to CCR units.
(2) Definitions.

(a) The Department adopts by reference the definitions
contained in 40 CFR 257.53 revised as of August 5, 2016

for Detection Monitoring; and Appendix IV to Part 257,
Constituents for Assessment Monitoring.

(4) The Department does not adopt the following section
of 40 CFR Part 257 revised as of August 5, 2016: 257.50(e).

[LINK].

(b) When a term in any provision adopted in this chapter

(5) References to 40 CFR 257.50 and 257.3-1 through
257.3-3 and 257.53 through 257.107 in any provisions adopted

from 40 CFR 257.50 through 257.107 is not defined it shall

by reference and in Rule 62-701.805, F.A.C., shall mean rules

have the meaning as given in the federal Resource Conservation

adopted by the Department regarding Coal Combustion

and Recovery Act.

(c) The term “Wetlands” as used in any provision adopted
in this chapter from shall have the definition of “wetlands” as
defined in s. 373.019, F.S.

(d) When the same word, phrase, or term is defined in Part
IV of Chapter 403, F.S., and 40 CFR 257.53 and the definitions
are not identical, the definitions as given in the state statute shall
apply.

(3) The Department adopts by reference the following
Sections of 40 CFR 257 revised as of August 5, 2016 [LINK],
and as amended in the 85 Federal Register dated August 28,
2020 (53516-53566) [LINK] and 85 Federal Register dated
November 12, 2020 (72506-725430 [LINK] with the
exceptions listed in subsection 62-701.804(4), F.A.C.
floodplains, 257.3-1; endangered species, 257.3-2; surface
water, 257.3-3; placement above the uppermost aquifer, 257.60;
wetlands, 257.61; fault areas, 257.62; seismic_impact zones,
257.63; unstable areas, 257.64; design criteria for new CCR
landfills and any lateral expansion of a CCR landfill, 257.70;
liner design criteria for existing CCR surface impoundments,
257.71; liner design criteria for new CCR surface
impoundments and any lateral expansion of a CCR surface
impoundment, 257.72; -structural integrity criteria for existing
CCR_surface impoundments, 257.73; structural integrity
criteria for new CCR surface impoundments and any lateral
expansion of a CCR surface impoundment, 257.74; air criteria,
257.80; run-on and run-off controls for CCR landfills, 257.81;
hydrologic and hydraulic capacity requirements for CCR
surface impoundments, 257.82; inspection requirements for
CCR surface impoundments, 257.83; inspection requirements
for CCR landfills, 257.84; applicability, 257.90; groundwater

3346

Residuals in Rules 62-701.804 and 62-701.805, F.A.C.

Rulemaking Authority 403.061, 403.704 FS. Law Implemented
403.702, 403.703, 403.704 FS. History—New .

Section 11
Notice of Changes, Corrections and
Withdrawals

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL
REGULATION

Electrical Contractors’ Licensing Board

RULE NOS.: RULE TITLES:
61G6-9.001 Continuing Education for Reactivation
61G6-9.004 Continuing Education Requirements for

Renewal for Certificateholders and
Registrants
NOTICE OF CHANGE
Notice is hereby given that the following changes have been
made to the proposed rule in accordance with subparagraph
120.54(3)(d)1., F.S., published in VVol. 46 No. 160, August 17,
2020 issue of the Florida Administrative Register.
A previous Notice of Change published for the rules in Vol. 47,
No. 69 of the on April 9, 2021, issue of the Florida
Administrative Register. The change is in response to written
comments submitted by the staff of the Joint Administrative
Procedures Committee and public comments received for Rule
61G6-9.004, F.A.C., and discussion and subsequent vote by the
Board at the public telephonic meeting held May 21, 2021. The
rules shall now read as follows:
61G6-9.001 Continuing Education for Reactivation.


https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=276
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61G6-9.001
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61G6-9.004

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 47, Number 139, July 20, 2021

As a condition to the reactivation of an inactive license, a
licensee must submit proof of continuing education which
meets the criteria set forth in Rule 61G6-9.002 or 61G6-9.004,
F.A.C.

(1) through (2) No change.

Rulemaking Authority 489.507(3), 489.519(3) FS. Law Implemented
489.519 FS. History—New 1-2-80, Amended 10-13-80, Formerly
21GG-9.01, Amended 2-20-89, Formerly 21GG-9.001, Amended 12-
24-97,12-27-00, 10-1-03, 4-10-05, 11-21-12, 2-5-15

61G6-9.004 Continuing Education Requirements for
Renewal for Certificateholders and Registrants.

(1) Each person who is certified or registered by the Board
must, as a condition of each renewal of the certificate or
registration, provide proof of completion of continuing
education in one or more courses approved by the Board.

(a) As part of the required eleven (11) hours of continuing
education, Certified and Registered Electrical Contractors must
complete one (1) hour business practices; one (1) hour workers’
compensation; one (1) hour work place safety; one (1) hour
Florida laws and rules; and seven (7) hours on technical
subjects which includes one (1) hour of an approved provider’s
specialized or advanced module course, approved by the
Florida Building Commission, on any portion of the Florida
Building Code, relating to the contractor’s respective discipline

practices continuing-education-inthefollowing-areas—seven{)
hours—technicalto—include—one—{1)—hour—of—an—approved

(b) In addition to the continuing education hours required
by 61G6-9.004(1)(a), Certified and Registered electrical
contractors engaged in alarm system contracting must also
complete two (2) hours on false alarm prevention.

(c) {b) As part of the required seven (7) hours of continuing
education, Certified and Registered Alarm and Specialty
Contractors must complete one (1) hour business practices; one
(1) hour workers’ compensation; one (1) hour work place
safety; one (1) hour Florida laws and rules; two (2) hours on
false alarm prevention; and one (1) hour of an approved
provider’s specialized or advanced module course, approved by
the Florida Building Commission, on any portion of the Florida

Building Code, relating to the contractor’s respective discipline

practices continuing-education-inthe-folowing-areas:—seven{#)
| clude: | : | des”

alarm-prevention.

(2) through (3) No change.

(4) For his or her initial license renewal, a Certified or
Registered Electrical Contractor licensed 12 or more months
prior to the end of the first biennial period is required to
complete 5 hours of continuing education as a condition of
renewal. The 5 hours of continuing education must include be
in the following areas: +-heurtechnical; 1 hour business, 1 hour
worker’s compensation, 1 hour work place safety, and 1 hour
laws and rules. For alarm system contractors and electrical
contractors actively engaged in alarm contracting, the
remaining 1 hour shall be in false alarm prevention which-will

(5) through (10) No change.

Rulemaking Authority 455.2124, 489.507(3), 489.517(6) FS. Law
Implemented 455.2124, 489.517(3), (4), (6) FS. History—New 11-30-
94, Amended 4-22-01, 8-15-04, 1-30-05, 8-10-05, 8-15-06, 3-27-13,
2-5-15, 4-30-19 .

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULES 1S: Ruthanne Christie, Executive
Director, Electrical Contractors’ Licensing Board, 2601 Blair
Stone Road, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-0751 or by email at
Ruthanne.Christie@myfloridalicense.com.

Section IV
Emergency Rules

NONE

Section V
Petitions and Dispositions Regarding Rule
Variance or Waiver

WATER MANAGEMENT DISTRICTS

South Florida Water Management District

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE:

40E-6.011 Policy and Purpose

The South Florida Water Management District (District) hereby
gives notice: On July 15, 2021, the District's Governing Board
issued SFWMD Order No. 2021-029-DAO-ROW to Jesus

3347


https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=40
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=124
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=40E-6.011

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 47, Number 139, July 20, 2021

Reyes (Application No. 17-1102-1). The petition for waiver
was originally received by the District on December 13, 2017
and revised on May 17, 2019, and again on May 4, 2021. Notice
of receipt of the petition requesting the waiver was published in
the Florida Administrative Register, Vols. 43/242, 44/100, and
47/87 on December 18, 2017, May 22, 2018, and May 6, 2021,
respectively. No public comment was received on this item.
This Order provides a waiver of the District's criteria for
utilization of the District right of way to allow an existing
bulkhead, 13 trees, cross-fences, a below-grade patio with
stairs, and a proposed fence on top of the bulkhead within C-8
Extension Canal right of way; Section 14, Township 52 South,
Range 40 East, Miami-Dade County. Specifically, the Order
grants a waiver from subsections 40E-6.011(4) and (6), Fla.
Admin. Code, which prohibits the placement of permanent and
semi-permanent above-ground structures within 40 feet of top
of canal bank within Works or Lands of the District as set forth
in the Right of Way Criteria Manual for Use of Works or Lands
of the District, incorporated by reference in subsection 40E-
6.091(1), Fla. Admin. Code. Generally, the Order sets forth the
basis of the Governing Board decision to grant the waiver as
follows: 1) the existing and proposed uses will not interfere
with the District's current ability to perform necessary
construction, alteration, operation, and routine maintenance
activities; and 2) the Order granting a waiver from the subject
rule is based upon a substantial hardship and principles of
fairness.

A copy of the Order or additional information may be obtained
by contacting: Juli Russell at the South Florida Water
Management District, 3301 Gun Club Road, MSC 1410, West
Palm Beach, FL 33406-4680, telephone: (561)682-6268, or by
email at: jurussel@sfwmd.gov.

A copy of the Petition for Variance or Waiver may be obtained
by contacting: Jessica Sapp, Executive Director, Board of
Dentistry, /MQA, 4052 Bald Cypress Way, Bin #C08,
Tallahassee, Florida 32399-3258;
Jessica.Sapp@myflhealth.gov.

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH

Board of Psychology

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that on July 09, 2021, the Board
of Psychology, received a petition for Variance or Waiver filed
by Amanda Fae Frederick. Petitioner seeks a variance or waiver
of Rule 64B19-11.005, F.A.C., which requires 2 years or 4,000
hours of supervised experience for licensure. The Board
recognizes that the applicant’s internship satisfies 1 year or
2,000 of those hours. This rule concerns the remaining 1 year
or 2,000 hours.

A copy of the Petition for Variance or Waiver may be obtained
by contacting: Allen Hall, Executive Director, Board of
Psychology, 4052 Bald Cypress Way, Bin #C05, Tallahassee,
Florida 32399-3253, Allen.Hall@flhealth.gov. Comments on
this petition should be filed with the Board of Psychology
within 14 days of publication of this notice.

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH

Board of Dentistry

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE:

64B5-2.013 Dental Examinations

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that on July 16, 2021, the Board
of Dentistry, received a petition for variance or waiver filed by
Michael Abdelmalik regarding paragraph 64B5-2.013(1)(b),
F.A.C, which requires all parts of the ADEX shall be completed
within eighteen (18) months from the initial start of any portion
of the examination. A failure to complete all parts of the
examination within eighteen (18) months will require the
applicant to retake the entire examination. Due to hardship, the
COVID-19 pandemic and actions to limit gatherings of people
and “social distancing,” Petitioner is requesting a variance and
waiver to be granted credit for the Anterior Restorative portion,
completed in 2021 (within 22 months) rather than 18 months.
Comments on this petition should be filed with the Board of
Dentistry within 14 days of publication of this notice.

3348

DEPARTMENT OF FINANCIAL SERVICES

Division of Funeral, Cemetery, and Consumer Services

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE:

69K-18.004 Intern Training Agencies.

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that on July 16, 2021, the
Division of Funeral, Cemetery, and Consumer Services,
received a petition for waiver of certain requirements of
subsection 69K-18.004(3), FAC. The petitions were filed on
behalf of FPG Florida, LLC d/b/a Foundation Partners of
Florida, LLC (FPG), which is acquiring a funeral establishment
that is currently a training agency. FPG seeks a waiver such that
the number of cases done by the prior owner of the funeral
establishment should count against the requirement of the cited
rule, so that the training agency status of the funeral
establishment may be continued, thus preventing the imposition
of serious hardship to the interns currently training at the said
funeral establishment.

A copy of the Petition for Variance or Waiver may be obtained
by contacting: Jasmin Richardson at (850)413-3039.



https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=64
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=328
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=64B5-2.013
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=64
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=310
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=69
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=369
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=69K-18.004

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 47, Number 139, July 20, 2021

Section VI
Notice of Meetings, Workshops and Public
Hearings

DEPARTMENT OF EDUCATION

Education Practices Commission

The Education Practices Commission announces a public
meeting to which all persons are invited.

DATE AND TIME: Executive Director Evaluation Committee
Meeting, 2:00 p.m. or as soon thereafter on July 27, 2021
PLACE: Zoom Meeting:
https://zoom.us/j/93493020198?pwd=SzhaSUOvekFrZXBaeH
dgTOF2Q0wrdz09

Meeting ID: 934 9302 0198, Passcode: 3h2cHR

The following conference number will only be activated if the
Zoom Video Hearing needs to be terminated.

Phone Meeting: United States Toll-Free: 1(888)585-9008,
Conference Room Number: 847-456-389

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: The
Executive Director Evaluation Committee Meeting is held to
discuss and determine the evaluation for the Executive Director.
A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Faith
Lenzo at (850)245-0455.

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 5 days before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: Faith Lenzo at (850)245-0455. If you are hearing or
speech impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida
Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770
(Voice).

If any person decides to appeal any decision made by the Board
with respect to any matter considered at this meeting or hearing,
he/she will need to ensure that a verbatim record of the
proceeding is made, which record includes the testimony and
evidence from which the appeal is to be issued.

For more information, you may contact: Faith Lenzo at
(850)245-0455.

The following conference number will only be activated if the
Zoom Video Hearing needs to be terminated.

Phone Meeting: United States Toll-Free: 1(888)585-9008,
Conference Room Number: 847-456-389

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: The
Executive Director Evaluation Meeting is held to discuss,
determine, and vote on the evaluation for the Executive
Director.

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Faith
Lenzo at (850)245-0455.

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 5 days before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: Faith Lenzo at (850)245-0455. If you are hearing or
speech impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida
Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770
(Voice).

If any person decides to appeal any decision made by the Board
with respect to any matter considered at this meeting or hearing,
he/she will need to ensure that a verbatim record of the
proceeding is made, which record includes the testimony and
evidence from which the appeal is to be issued.

For more information, you may contact: Faith Lenzo at
(850)245-0455.

DEPARTMENT OF EDUCATION

Education Practices Commission

The Education Practices Commission announces a public
meeting to which all persons are invited.

DATE AND TIME: Executive Director Evaluation Meeting,
1:00 p.m. or as soon thereafter on July 30, 2021

PLACE: Zoom Meeting:
https://zoom.us/j/93493020198?pwd=SzhaSUOvekFrZXBaeH

dgTOF2Q0wrdz09

Meeting I1D: 934 9302 0198, Passcode: 3h2cHR

EXECUTIVE OFFICE OF THE GOVERNOR

The Financial Emergency Board announces a public meeting to
which all persons are invited.

DATE AND TIME: July 30, 2021, 9:30 a.m.

PLACE: City Commission Chambers, 215 N. Perviz Ave. and
Virtual Meeting

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: A
meeting of the Financial Emergency Board for the City of Opa-
locka to discuss the current state of the City's financial affairs
and to consider action items related to the ongoing work of the
Board.

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Brian
Hunter at (850)717-9264 or
opalockal6.35cig@eog.myflorida.com.

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 3 days before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: Brian Hunter at (850)717-9264. If you are hearing
or speech impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida
Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770
(\Voice).

3349


https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=6
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=196
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=6
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=196
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=27

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 47, Number 139, July 20, 2021

REGIONAL PLANNING COUNCILS

South Florida Regional Planning Council

The South Florida Regional Planning Council announces a
public meeting to which all persons are invited.

DATE AND TIME: Monday, July 26, 2021, 10:30 a.m.
PLACE: Physical/Virtual Meeting - “Go to Meeting” by the
web or conference call

1 Oakwood Boulevard, Suite 250, Hollywood, FL 33020
Please join my meeting from your computer, tablet or
smartphone. https://global.gotomeeting.com/join/752112437
You can also dial in using your phone. United States (Toll
Free): 1(877)309-2073, United States: (646)749-3129, Access
Code: 752-112-437

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED:
Review of Comprehensive Plan Amendments received prior to
the meeting; General Council Business

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: contacting
Administration at the South Florida Regional Planning Council,
1 Oakwood Boulevard, Suite 250, Hollywood, Florida 33020,
(954)924-3653, or sfadmin@sfrpc.com.

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 5 days before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: contacting Administration at the South Florida
Regional Planning Council, 1 Oakwood Boulevard, Suite 250,
Hollywood, Florida 33020, (954)924-3653, or
sfadmin@sfrpc.com. If you are hearing or speech impaired,
please contact the agency using the Florida Relay Service,
1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice).

If any person decides to appeal any decision made by the Board
with respect to any matter considered at this meeting or hearing,
he/she will need to ensure that a verbatim record of the
proceeding is made, which record includes the testimony and
evidence from which the appeal is to be issued.

For more information, you may contact: contacting
Administration at the South Florida Regional Planning Council,
1 Oakwood Boulevard, Suite 250, Hollywood, Florida 33020,
(954)924-3653, or sfadmin@sfrpc.com.

As a part of the selection process, the Selection Committee will
hear presentations and conduct interviews with short-listed
forms in order to determine the highest ranking firm to
recommend for award.

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Records
Department at (727)796-2355.

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 3 days before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: Records Department at (727)796-2355. If you are
hearing or speech impaired, please contact the agency using the
Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-
8770 (Voice).

For more information, you may contact: Records Department at
(727)796-2355.

REGIONAL UTILITY AUTHORITIES

Tampa Bay Water - A Regional Water Supply Authority

The Tampa Bay Water, a Regional Water Supply Authority
announces a public meeting to which all persons are invited.
DATE AND TIME: August 5, 2021, 10:00 a.m. — 1:00 p.m. or
until completed

PLACE: Tampa Bay Water Administrative Offices, 2575
Enterprise Road, Clearwater, Florida 33763

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: A
public meeting of the Selection Committee for as Needed
Hydrogeological Services, CONTRACT NO. 2022-005 - 009.

3350

DEPARTMENT OF THE LOTTERY

The Department of the Lottery announces a public meeting to
which all persons are invited.

DATE AND TIME: Friday, August 20, 2021, 4:00 p.m. ET
PLACE: Florida Lottery Headquarters, 250 Marriott Drive,
Tallahassee, FL 32301

Telephonic: 1(888)585-9008#; Conference Room Number:
779-281-710

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED:
Public Meeting to open Public Replies and Costs for ITN# 036-
20-21, Prize Payment System & Related Commodities and
Services

For more information, please visit the Vendor Bid System
(VBS) at:
http://www.myflorida.com/apps/vbs/vbs_www.main_menu. A
copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Lisa
Kirkland O’Steen at (850)487-7710, osteenl@flalottery.com,
or by going to the Department of the Lottery’s website,
www.flalottery.com.

Any person requiring a special accommodation because of a
disability at this public meeting should contact the individual
identified above at (850)487-7710 (voice), or through the
Florida Relay Service at 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-
8770 (voice), at least 24 hours prior to the meeting.

DEPARTMENT OF ELDER AFFAIRS

The Department of Elder Affairs announces a public meeting to
which all persons are invited.

DATE AND TIME: August 13, 2021, 12:30 p.m. — 2:30 p.m.
ET

PLACE: This meeting will be held in-person at the Florida
Department of Elder Affairs, 4040 Esplanade Way,
Tallahassee, FL 32399. For those who cannot attend in-person,
you can join the meeting via Zoom:
https://us02web.zoom.us/j/89908912329?pwd=NW8rQWIJIR


https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=29
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=66
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=49
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=158
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=53
mailto:osteenl@flalottery.com
http://www.flalottery.com/
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=58

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 47, Number 139, July 20, 2021

GKOOEILY?2VjZDFWZnJ4dz09, Meeting I1D: 899 0891 2329,
Passcode: 174092. Find  your  local number:
https://us02web.zoom.us/u/kDtcK80Q

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: In
accordance with Section 430.501, Florida Statutes, the
Alzheimer's Disease Advisory Committee will be holding an
interim meeting in order to fulfill its duties in advising the
Department of Elder Affairs in the performance of its duties
under this act regarding legislative, programmatic, and
administrative matters that relate to those living with
Alzheimer's disease and their caretakers.

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Margie
Bell, bellm@elderaffairs.org, (850)414-2105.

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 10 days before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: Margie Bell, bellm@elderaffairs.org, (850)414-
2105. If you are hearing or speech impaired, please contact the
agency using the Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771
(TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice).

For more information, you may contact:
bellm@elderaffairs.org, (850)414-2105.

Margie Bell,

DATE AND TIME: **Change of Date** August 12, 2021,
10:00 a.m. — 12:00 Noon ET

PLACE: Suntree Viera Library, 902 Jordan Blass Drive,
Melbourne, FL 32940

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED:
Brevard Council Business

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Dept of
Elder Affairs / LTCOP, 4040 Esplanade Way, Tallahassee, FL
32399, or call: (850)414-2323, or email:
Itcopinformer@elderaffairs.org.

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 72 hours before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: Dept of Elder Affairs / LTCOP, 4040 Esplanade
Way, Tallahassee, FL 32399, or call: (850)414-2323, or email:
Itcopinformer@elderaffairs.org. If you are hearing or speech
impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida Relay
Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice).

DEPARTMENT OF ELDER AFFAIRS

Long-Term Care Ombudsman Program

The Long-Term Care Ombudsman Program announces a public
meeting to which all persons are invited.

DATE AND TIME: August 6, 2021, 10:30 a.m. — 11:30 a.m.
ET

PLACE: **Change of Location**First Presbyterian Church of
Brandon, 121 Carver Avenue, Brandon FL 33510

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED:
West Central Council Business

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Dept of
Elder Affairs / LTCOP, 4040 Esplanade Way, Tallahassee, FL
32399, or call: (850)414-2323, or email:
Itcopinformer@elderaffairs.org.

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 72 hours before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: Dept of Elder Affairs / LTCOP, 4040 Esplanade
Way, Tallahassee, FL 32399, or call: (850)414-2323, or email:
Itcopinformer@elderaffairs.org. If you are hearing or speech
impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida Relay
Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice).

DEPARTMENT OF ELDER AFFAIRS

Long-Term Care Ombudsman Program

The Long-Term Care Ombudsman Program announces a public
meeting to which all persons are invited.

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH

Division of Children’s Medical Services

The Children’s Medical Services/ Newborn Screening Follow-
up Program announces a public meeting to which all persons
are invited.

DATE AND TIME: August 20, 2021, 9:30 a.m.

PLACE: Bureau of Public Laboratories, 1217 North Pearl
Street, Jacksonville, FL

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED:
Newborn Screening and Genetics related issues.

Please join my meeting from your computer, tablet or
smartphone. https://global.gotomeeting.com/join/989314229.
You can also dial in using your phone. United States (Toll
Free): 1(877)309-2073, United States: (571)317-3129.

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting:
Caitlin.Roberts@flhealth.gov.

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 48 hours before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: If you are hearing or speech impaired, please
contact the agency using the Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-
8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice).

If any person decides to appeal any decision made by the Board
with respect to any matter considered at this meeting or hearing,
he/she will need to ensure that a verbatim record of the
proceeding is made, which record includes the testimony and
evidence from which the appeal is to be issued.
For more information, you may
Caitlin.Roberts@flhealth.gov.

contact:

3351


https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=58
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=184
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=58
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=184
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=64
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=333

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 47, Number 139, July 20, 2021

DEPARTMENT OF CHILDREN AND FAMILIES

The Department of Children and Families announces a public
meeting to which all persons are invited.

DATE AND TIME: Friday, July 23, 2021, 8:30 a.m.

PLACE: CALL IN ONLY: 1(888)585-9008, Code 191 850 997
GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: on-
going Lee County Community Alliance business.

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting:
stephanie.jones@myflfamilies.com.

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 3 days before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: stephanie.jones@myflfamilies.com. If you are
hearing or speech impaired, please contact the agency using the
Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-
8770 (Voice).

For more information, you may
stephanie.jones@myflfamilies.com.

contact:

DEPARTMENT OF CHILDREN AND FAMILIES

Family Safety and Preservation Program

The Department of Children and Families announces a public
meeting to which all persons are invited.

DATE AND TIME: August 3, 2021, 10:00 a.m.

PLACE: Telephonically via Microsoft Teams

Join on your computer or mobile app

Click here to join the meeting

Join with a video conferencing device, 929981474@t.plcm.vc

Video Conference ID: 115 780 439 6 or call in (audio only):
(850)666-4692, 862513737# United States, Tallahassee, Phone
Conference ID: 862 513 737#

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED:
Quarterly Child Welfare Practice Task Force Meeting

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting:
Justine.Hicks@myflfamilies.com or (850)717-4658.

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 48 hours before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: Justine.Hicks@myflfamilies.com or (850)717-
4658. If you are hearing or speech impaired, please contact the
agency using the Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771
(TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice).

PLACE: Meeting will take place via the Microsoft Teams
platform. Use the below link to connect to the meeting:
https://teams.microsoft.com/l/meetup-
join/19%3ameeting_YjIOMTQON2EtOWEA4YY0ONTEzLWJI
ZTAtOTgwOTUILN]jA3Zjc5%40thread.v2/0?context=%7b%2
2Tid%22%3a%22f70dba48-bh283-4c57-8831-
ch411445a94¢%22%2¢c%220id%22%3a%224c7ac74e-0835-
4242-a8cf-f26976fc1c32%22%7d

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: The
purpose of the Miami-Dade Refugee Task Force meeting is to
increase awareness of the refugee populations, share best
practices, spot trends in refugee populations, build
collaborations  between agencies, help create good
communication among service providers, get informed about
upcoming community events, and discuss refugee program
service needs and possible solutions to meeting those needs.

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Lourdes
Dysna-Leconte at (786)257-5173 or David Draper at (407)317-
7335.

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 5 days before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: Lourdes Dysna-Leconte at (786)257-5173 or David
Draper at (407)317-7335. If you are hearing or speech impaired,
please contact the agency using the Florida Relay Service,
1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (\Voice).

For more information, you may contact: Lourdes Dysnha-
Leconte at (786)257-5173 or David Draper at (407)317-7335.

DEPARTMENT OF CHILDREN AND FAMILIES

Refugee Services

The Miami-Dade Refugee Task Force announces a public
meeting to which all persons are invited.

DATE AND TIME: Friday, August 13, 2021, 10:00 a.m. —
12:00 Noon

3352

DEPARTMENT OF ECONOMIC OPPORTUNITY

Division of Community Development

The Florida Department of Economic Opportunity announces a
hearing to which all persons are invited.

DATE AND TIME: Public Comment Period, July 20, 2021
through August 4, 2021.

Public Hearing, July 29, 2021, 10:00 a.m. Eastern Time
PLACE: Public Hearing will be held via Microsoft Teams and
in-person:

Join by Computer/Tablet/Smartphone or Dial-in at (850)988-
5144 (Conference ID: 787 849 821 #) or

Attend In Person: Florida Department of Economic
Opportunity, 107 E. Madison St., Caldwell Building, Room
232, Tallahassee, FL

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: The
Florida Department of Economic Opportunity (DEO), in
cooperation with other agencies, requests public comment on
the FFY 2021 Annual Action Plan for Housing and Community
Development (“FFY 2021 Annual Action Plan”) prior to
submitting it to the U.S. Department of Housing and Urban
Development (HUD).


https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=65
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=65
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=342
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=65
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=528
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=73
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=1066

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 47, Number 139, July 20, 2021

The HUD-funded programs in the FFY 2021 Annual Action
Plan are the Florida Small Cities Community Development
Block Grant Program (CDBG) administered by DEO, the
Emergency Solutions Grant Program (ESG) administered by
the Florida Department of Children and Families, the Housing
Opportunities for Persons With AIDS Program (HOPWA)
administered by the Florida Department of Health, the Home
Investment Partnership Program (HOME) and Housing Trust
Fund (HTF) administered by the Florida Housing Finance
Corporation.

The Draft FFY Annual Action Plan is available for public
review and comment prior to submission of the plan to HUD.
The 15-day comment period will begin on July 20, 2021 and
will end on August 4, 2021. The draft of the Action Plan will
also be posted on DEO’s website:
http://floridajobs.org/community-planning-and-
development/assistance-for-governments-and-
organizations/florida-small-cities-community-development-
block-grant-program/annual-action-plan.

Written comments on the drafted Action Plan are encouraged
and may be made at the public meeting, emailed to
cdbg@deo.myflorida.com or mailed to: Florida Small Cities
CDBG Program, 107 East Madison St., MSC-400, Tallahassee,
FL 32399.

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting:
cdbg@deo.myflorida.com.

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 5 days before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: cdbg@deo.myflorida.com or (850)717-8478. If you
are hearing or speech impaired, please contact the agency using
the Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or
1(800)955-8770 (Voice).

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 24 days before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: Sue Mabe, Secretary, 1(863)669-2908. If you are
hearing or speech impaired, please contact the agency using the
Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-
8770 (Voice).

If any person decides to appeal any decision made by the Board
with respect to any matter considered at this meeting or hearing,
he/she will need to ensure that a verbatim record of the
proceeding is made, which record includes the testimony and
evidence from which the appeal is to be issued.

For more information, you may contact: Sue Mabe, Secretary,
smabe@polk.edu, Hans Lehman, Chairman,
hans.lehman@Iakelandgov.net.

POLK STATE COLLEGE KENNETH C. THOMPSON
INSTITUTE OF PUBLIC SAFETY

The Polk State College, Kenneth C. Thompson Institute of
Public Safety announces a public meeting to which all persons
are invited.

DATE AND TIME: Thursday, August 5, 2021, 2:00 p.m.
PLACE: Center for Public Safety, 1251 Jim Keene Boulevard,
Winter Haven, FL 33880, Room CPS 207

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED:
Approve Minutes from 1/28/21 meeting; Vacancy nominations,
approvals; Old business; New business; Training issues;
Financial report

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Sue Mabe,
Secretary, smabe@polk.edu.

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to

SOUTH DADE SOIL AND WATER CONSERVATION
DISTRICT

The South Dade Soil & Water Conservation District announces
a public meeting to which all persons are invited.

DATE AND TIME: Tuesday, July 20, 2021, 9:30 a.m.
PLACE: Due to Covid the USDA office is closed to the public,
please call for meeting location information.

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED:
Regular agenda items for presentation to the Board of
Supervisors. Updates from the USDA

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Wendy
Canty, (305)242-1288.

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least days before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: SDSWCD, (305)242-1288. If you are hearing or
speech impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida
Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770
(Voice).

For more information, you may contact: Cooper McMillan,
(305)242-1288.

INFINITE SOURCE COMMUNICATIONS GROUP, LLC
The Florida Department of Transportation (FDOT), District Six
announces a public meeting to which all persons are invited.
DATE AND TIMES: Thursday, July 29, 2021, 3:00 p.m. —4:30
p.m. and 6:00 p.m. — 7:30 p.m.

PLACE: Attend in person at Trinity Church located at 17801
NW 2 Avenue, Miami, FL 33169. Register online at
www.fdotmiamidade.com/i95northPDE. More event details
below.

The in-person meeting will be in compliance with all current
Centers for Disease Control and Prevention (CDC) guidelines
and social distancing will be followed.

Attend Virtually

3353


https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=1389
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=1389
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=724
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=724
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=1035

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 47, Number 139, July 20, 2021

To participate virtually from your computer, tablet or
smartphone please register using the following link:
www.fdotmiamidade.com/i95northPDE. More event details
below.

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: The
Florida Department of Transportation (FDOT), District Six, has
scheduled both an Elected Officials/Agencies Kick-off Meeting
and a Public Kick-off Meeting to discuss the 1-95/SR 9 Project
Development & Environment (PD&E) Study from south of SR
860/Miami Gardens Drive to the Broward County Line, in
Miami-Dade County, Florida. The project identification
number is 414694-1-22-01. The project’s primary objective is
to address the deficient operational capacity and relieve
existing/future congestion along the 1-95/SR 9 corridor.

The meetings will be held simultaneously, both in-person and
virtually.

The Elected Officials/Agencies Kick-off Meeting is scheduled
for Thursday, July 29, 2021, 3:00 p.m. — 4:30 p.m. Attend in
person at Trinity Church located at 17801 NW 2 Avenue,
Miami, FL 33169. Register online at
www.fdotmiamidade.com/i95northPDE.

To participate virtually, from your computer, tablet or
smartphone  please click on the link below:
https://attendee.gotowebinar.com/register/5254189352483312
910. Participants can also use their phone by dialing 1(866)952-
8437, access code: 943-555-1009.

A Public Kick-off Meeting will also be held for the public on
Thursday, July 29, 2021, 6:00 p.m. —7:30 p.m. Attend in person
at Trinity Church located at 17801 NW 2 Avenue, Miami, FL
331609. Reqgister online at
www.fdotmiamidade.com/i95northPDE.

To participate virtually, from your computer, tablet or
smartphone  please click on the link below:
https://attendee.gotowebinar.com/register/5820075001950906
638.

Participants can also use their phone by dialing 1(866)901-
6455, access code: 894-331-717.

The same information will be presented at both meetings. These
meetings are an opportunity to provide attendees with a short
presentation of the proposed project, including existing as well
as social, environmental and economic effects, followed by a
question and answer session. Questions will be responded to as
time permits, in the order received. If your question is not
responded to during the meeting, a response will be provided in
writing. Persons wishing to submit statements, in place of or in
addition to oral statements, may do so at the meeting or by
sending them to the Community Outreach Specialist. All
statements postmarked on or before August 8, 2021, will
become part of the meeting record.

3354

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting:
Community Outreach Specialist Monica Diaz at (305)573-
0089, email: monica@iscprgroup.com.

The environmental review, consultation, and other actions
required by applicable federal environmental laws for this
project are being, or have been, carried-out by FDOT pursuant
to 23 U.S.C. 8 327 and a Memorandum of Understanding dated
December 14, 2016, and executed by the Florida Highway
Administration (FHWA) and FDOT.

Public participation is solicited without regard to race, color,
national origin, age, sex, religion, disability or family status.
Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 7 days before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: Nicholas Danu, P.E. at (305)470-5219 or in writing
at FDOT, 1000 NW 111 Avenue, Miami, FL 33172 or by email
at Nicholas.Danu@dot.state.fl.us?. If you are hearing or speech
impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida Relay
Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice).

THE CORRADINO GROUP, INC.

The Florida Department of Transportation (FDOT) District
Four announces a public meeting to which all persons are
invited.

DATE AND TIME: he In-Person Construction Open House
will be held Tuesday, August 3, 5:00 p.m. — 7:00 p.m. and the
Virtual Public Meeting will be held Wednesday, August 4, 5:30
p.m.—6:30 p.m.

PLACE: he in-person construction open house will be held at
the PJ Meli Park Aquatics Complex located at 2901 SW 52nd
Street, Fort Lauderdale, FL 33312.

Please use the  following link to register:
https://tinyurl.com/40AveVPM or dial into (631)992-3221,
Access Code: 568-883-047. to join the virtual meeting (your
line will be muted).

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED:
Financial Management No.: 436196-1-52-01

Project Description: SW 40th Avenue from Stirling Road to
Griffin Road, Broward County.

Project improvements include widening the roadway to
accommodate 5-foot bicycle lanes in each direction, providing
continuous sidewalks on both sides of the road, installing a
bulkhead wall with atraffic railing at Lake George, upgrading
vehicle and pedestrian signalization at Griffin Road

milling, resurfacing, and replacing pavement markings.
Construction will begin August 12, 2021 and is estimated to be
completed in Spring 2023. The estimated construction cost is
$3,377,160.


https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=1048

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 47, Number 139, July 20, 2021

The in-person Construction Open House will have project
representatives available to answer questions and provide
assistance at any time during the meeting.

The Virtual Public Meeting will consist of a brief presentation
followed by a question & answer segment and comments from
5:30 p.m. — 6:00 p.m., and again from 6:00 p.m. — 6:30 p.m.
Project staff will be available to answer questions and provide
assistance. Questions will be answered as time allows and in
order received. If your question is not addressed during the
event, a response will be provided in writing following the
Virtual Public Meeting. If you are not able to join the Virtual
Public Meeting, a recording will be posted at:
https://d4fdot.com/bcfdot/.

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Mr.
Matthew May, FDOT Project Manager, at (954)940-7519 or by
email at matthew.may@dot.state.fl.us.

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 7 days before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: Mr. Matthew May, FDOT Project Manager, at
(954)940-7519 or by email at matthew.may@dot.state.fl.us. If
you are hearing or speech impaired, please contact the agency
using the Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or
1(800)955-8770 (Voice).

For more information, you may contact: Rebecca Guerrero,
Community Outreach Specialist, at (954)940-7605 or by email
at rguerrero@corradino.com.

Section IX
Notice of Petitions and Dispositions
Regarding Non-rule Policy Challenges

NONE

Section X
Announcements and Objection Reports of
the Joint Administrative Procedures
Committee

NONE

Section XI
Notices Regarding Bids, Proposals and
Purchasing

NONE

Section VII
Notice of Petitions and Dispositions
Regarding Declaratory Statements

NONE

Section VIII
Notice of Petitions and Dispositions
Regarding the Validity of Rules

Notice of Petition for Administrative Determination has been
filed with the Division of Administrative Hearings on the
following rules:

NONE

Administrative
Division of

Notice of Disposition of Petition for
Determination has been filed with the
Administrative Hearings on the following rules:

NONE

Section XIlI
Miscellaneous

DEPARTMENT OF STATE

Index of Administrative Rules Filed with the Secretary of State
Pursuant to subparagraph 120.55(1)(b)6. — 7., F.S., the below
list of rules were filed in the Office of the Secretary of State
between 3:00 p.m., Tuesday, July 13, 2021 and 3:00 p.m.,
Monday, July 17, 2021.

Rule No. File Date Effective

Date
5C-18.006 7/16/2021 8/5/2021
5C-18.011 7/16/2021 8/5/2021
5E-14.105 7/19/2021 8/8/2021
5E-14.110 7/19/2021 8/8/2021
5E-14.117 7/19/2021 8/8/2021
5E-14.132 7/19/2021 8/8/2021
5E-14.136 7/19/2021 8/8/2021
28-42.001 7/19/2021 8/8/2021
28-42.002 7/19/2021 8/8/2021
28-42.003 7/19/2021 8/8/2021

3355


https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=1

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 47, Number 139, July 20, 2021

28-42.004 7192021 8/8/2021 62-610.466 711972021 8/8/2021
28-42.005 7/19/2021 8/8/2021 62-610.472 7/19/2021 8/8/2021
28-42.006 7/19/2021 8/8/2021 62-610.525 7/19/2021 8/8/2021
28-42.007 71192021 8/8/2021 62-610.560 7/19/2021 8/8/2021
28-42.008 7/19/2021 8/8/2021 62-610.562 7/19/2021 8/8/2021
28-42.009 7/19/2021 8/8/2021 62-610.568 7/19/2021 8/8/2021
28-43.001 71192021 8/8/2021 62-610.652 711972021 8/8/2021
28-43.002 7/19/2021 8/8/2021 62-610.800 7/19/2021 8/8/2021
28-43.003 7/19/2021 8/8/2021 62-610.865 7/19/2021 8/8/2021
28-43.004 71192021 8/8/2021 62-610.870 711972021 8/8/2021
28-43.005 7/19/2021 8/8/2021 62-610.890 7/19/2021 8/8/2021
28-43.006 7/19/2021 8/8/2021 64B5-14.003 7/16/2021 8/5/2021
28-43.007 711972021 8/8/2021 65C-30.011 711312021 8/2/2021
28-43.008 7/19/2021 8/8/2021 69A-37.065 711412021 8/3/2021
28-43.009 7/19/2021 8/8/2021 69L-31.002 7/13/2021 8/2/2021
28-43.010 711972021 8/8/2021 69L-31.003 711312021 8/2/2021
53ER21-41 7/16/2021 7/16/2021 69L-31.004 7/13/2021 8/2/2021
59C-1.004 7/19/2021 8/8/2021 69L-31.005 7/13/2021 8/2/2021
59C-1.005 7/19/2021 8/8/2021 69L-31.006 711312021 8/2/2021
59C-1.010 7/19/2021 8/8/2021 69L-31.007 7/13/2021 8/2/2021
59C-1.012 7/19/2021 8/8/2021 69L-31.008 7/13/2021 8/2/2021
59C-1.020 7/19/2021 8/8/2021 69L-31.009 711312021 8/2/2021
59C-1.021 7/19/2021 8/8/2021 69L-31.010 7/13/2021 8/2/2021
59C-1.022 7/19/2021 8/8/2021 69L-31.011 7/13/2021 8/2/2021
59C-1.030 7/19/2021 8/8/2021 69L-31.012 711312021 8/2/2021
59C-1.0085 7/19/2021 8/8/2021 69L-31.013 7/13/2021 8/2/2021
61D-6.007 7/15/2021 8/412021 69L-31.014 7/13/2021 8/2/2021
62-610.100 7/19/2021 8/8/2021 LIST OF RULES AWAITING LEGISLATIVE
APPROVAL SECTIONS 120.541(3), 373.139(7)
62-610.200 7/19/2021 8/8/2021 AND/OR 373.1391(6), FLORIDA STATUTES
62-610.300 7/19/2021 8/8/2021 Rule No. File Date Effective
62-610.330 7/19/2021 8/8/2021 Date
62-610.463 771912021 8/8/2021 60FF1-5.009 | 7/21/2016 e

3356




Florida Administrative Register

Volume 47, Number 139, July 20, 2021

60P-1.003 11/5/2019 sk [k [k sk
60P-2.002 11/5/2019 ok [k [k
60P-2.003 11/5/2019 ok [k [k
64B8-10.003 12/9/2015 Sk [k [k sk

DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION
Clean Water State Revolving Fund

NOTICE OF AVAILABILITY

FLORIDA CATEGORICAL EXCLUSION NOTICE

CITY OF FORT MEADE, FLORIDA

The Florida Department of Environmental Protection (DEP)
has determined that the City of Fort Meade’s project involving
the replacement of existing gravity sewers is not expected to
generate controversy over potential environmental effects. The
total estimated construction cost is $3,636,000. The project may
qualify for a Clean Water State Revolving Fund loan composed
of federal and state funds. DEP will consider public comments
about the environmental impacts of the proposed project that
are postmarked or delivered at the address below within 30 days
of this notice. A full copy of the Florida Categorical Exclusion
Notice can be obtained by writing to: Catherine Murray,
CWSRF Program, Department of Environmental Protection,
3900 Commonwealth Boulevard, MS#3505, Tallahassee,
Florida 32399-3000 or calling (850)245-2966 or emailing to
catherine.m.murray@dep.state.fl.us.

Section XIlI
Index to Rules Filed During Preceding
Week

NOTE: The above section will be published on Tuesday
beginning October 2, 2012, unless Monday is a holiday, then it
will be published on Wednesday of that week.
INDEX TO RULES FILED BETWEEN
JULY 12, 2021 AND JULY 16, 2021
Rule No.

File Date Amended

Vol./No.

Effective Proposed
Date Vol./No.

DEPARTMENT OF AGRICULTURE AND CONSUMER
SERVICES

Division of Animal Industry
5C-18.006 7/16/21 8/5/21
5C-18.011 7/16/21 8/5/21

47175
47175

DEPARTMENT OF THE LOTTERY

53ER21-41 7/16/21 7/16/21 47/138
DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL
REGULATION

Division of Pari-Mutuel Wagering
61D-6.007 7/15/21 8/4/21 47/60 47/88  47/100
DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH

Board of Dentistry

64B5-14.0037/16/21 8/5/21 47/49  47/111
Board of Medicine

64B8-41.0017/12/21 8/1/21 47/114

Vital Statistics

64VER21-117/12/21 7/12/21 47/135

DEPARTMENT OF CHILDREN AND FAMILIES
Family Safety and Preservation Program
65C-30.011 7/13/21 8/2/21 47/112

DEPARTMENT OF FINANCIAL SERVICES

Division of State Fire Marshal

69A-37.065 7/14/21 8/3/21 46/188 46/248 47/39
47/107

Division of Workers’ Compensation

69L-31.002 7/13/21 8/2/21 45/228 46/246
69L-31.003 7/13/21 8/2/21 45/228 46/246 47/97
69L-31.004 7/13/21 8/2/21 45/228 46/246
69L-31.005 7/13/21 8/2/21 45/228 46/246 47/97
69L-31.006 7/13/21 8/2/21 45/228
69L-31.007 7/13/21 8/2/21 45/228 46/246 47/36
69L-31.008 7/13/21 8/2/21 45/228
69L-31.009 7/13/21 8/2/21 45/228
69L-31.010 7/13/21 8/2/21 45/228
69L-31.011 7/13/21 8/2/21 45/228
69L-31.012 7/13/21 8/2/21 45/228
69L-31.013 7/13/21 8/2/21 45/228 46/246
69L-31.014 7/13/21 8/2/21 45/228

LIST OF RULES AWAITING LEGISLATIVE REVIEW/
APPROVAL PURSUANT TO SECTIONS 120.541(3),
373.139(7) AND/OR 373.1391(6), FLORIDA STATUTES

DEPARTMENT OF MANAGEMENT SERVICES

E911 Board

60FF1-5.009 7/21/2016  **/[**[**** 42/105

Division of State Employees’ Insurance

3357


https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=62

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 47, Number 139, July 20, 2021

60P-1.003  11/5/2019  **[**[***x*
60P-2.002 11/5/2019  **[**[****
60P-2.003  11/5/2019  **[**[****

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH
Board of Medicine
64B8-10.00312/9/2015  **/[**[**x**

NOTE: The above section will be published on Tuesday
beginning October 2, 2012, unless Monday is a holiday, then it

45/191
45/191
45/191

39/95

will be published on Wednesday of that week.

41/49

3358



