Florida Administrative Weekly

Volume 33, Number 11, March 16, 2007

but not later than thirty (30) days prior to the date of such
acquisition. Such applications must be filed in accordance with
Section 516.03, ES.

(4) The office shall waive the requirement for alicenseeto
file a new application pursuant to subsection 516.05(5), E.S.:

() when a person or group of persons proposing to
purchase or acquire a controlling interest in a Chapter 516,
ES., licensee has previoudy filed with the Office the
information required in Section 516.03, E.S., with the licensee
to the office, provided that such person is currently affiliated
with the licensee; or

(b) when the acquirer is currently licensed with the office
under Chapter 516, F.S.

(5) If the requirement to file a new application for a
change in controlling interest is waived pursuant to subsection
4 of this rule, the licensee must file an amendment as
prescribed in subsection (2) of this rule to report the change in
controlling interest.

(6) Form OFR-516-01 is incorporated by reference in
subsection 69V-160.030(1), FA.C.

Specific Authority 516.05(4), 516.05(5), 516.23(3) FS, Law
Implemented 516.01. 516.02(1), 516.05(4), 516.05(5) FS. History—
New .

Section 11
Proposed Rules

DEPARTMENT OF EDUCATION

Sate Board of Education

RULE NO.: RULETITLE:

6A-2.0010 Educational Facilities

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: Thisruleisamended to incorporate
the 2007 State Requirements for Educational Facilities and to
remove at the Joint Administrative Procedures Committee’'s
request, other codes and specifications from the rule. The
removal of the codes and specifications do not affect
educational facilities asthey are still enforceable by law.
SUMMARY: This rule is amended to adopt the 2007 State
Requirements for Educational Facilities.

SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF ESTIMATED
REGULATORY COST: No Statement of Estimated Regulatory
Cost was prepared.

Any person who wishes to provide information regarding a
statement of estimated regulatory costs, or provide a proposal
for a lower cost regulatory alternative must do so in writing
within 21 days of this notice.

SPECIFIC AUTHORITY: Section 1(a) Article IX, State
Constitution; 1001.02(1), 1013.02(2), 1013.37 FS.

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 1(a) Article IX, State Constitution;
50.011, 50.021, 50.031, 50.041, 50.051, 50.061, 50.071,
1001.02, 1001.42(9), 1001.453, 1011.09, 1011.74, 1031.01,
1013.03, 1013.31, 1013.35, 1013.37, 1013.371, 1013.60,
1013.61, 1013.64, 1013.735, 1013.736, 1013.737 FS.

A HEARING WILL BE HELD AT THE DATE, TIME AND
PLACE SHOWN BELOW:

DATE AND TIME: April 17, 2007, 8:30 am.

PLACE: Department of Education, 325 West Gaines Street,
Tallahassee, Florida 32399-0400

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULE IS: Spessard Boatright, Director, Office of
Educational Facilities, Department of Education, 325 West
Gaines Street, Suite 1054, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-0400,
(850)245-0494

THE FULL TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE IS

6A-2.0010 Educational Facilities.
State Board of Education Cemmissioner—of—Edueation

requirements adopted pursuant to Chapter 120, Florida
Statutes, to implement the State Uniform Building Code for
Public Educational Facilities Construction in Chapter 1013,
Florida Statutes, are contained in Section 423 of the Florida
Building Code and the Department of Education publications
titted “State Requirements for Educational Facilities, 2007,”

which is are hereby incorporated by reference and made a part
of this rule to become effective with the effective date of the

amended rule. All educational and ancillary facilities

'a ]
O v 1w O

constructed by a school board or community college board
shall comply with “State Requirements for Educational
Facilities, 2007, 1999-Velume+—Process,” “2005-Addendum

Section I - Proposed Rules 1271



Florida Administrative Weekly Volume 33, Number 11, March 16, 2007

(1) Copies of the publications “ State Requirements for
Educational Facilities, 2007” 4999—Velume———2005

C i
|

are
Facilities, Florida Department of Education, Room 1054, 325
West Gaines Street, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-0400, at a cost
to be determined by the Commissioner, but which shall not
exceed actual cost or from the Department of Education’s
website at http://www.firn.edu/doe/edfacil in pdf format.

Copies—of-the-codesHsted-ir—subsection{1)-ef-thisruleare

Specific Authority Section 1(a) Article IX, State Constitution;
1001.02(1), 1013.02(2), 1013.37 FS. Law Implemented 1(a) Article
IX, State Congtitution; 50.011, 50.021, 50.031, 50.041, 50.051,
50.061, 50.071, 1001.02, 1001.42(9), 1001.453, 1011.09, 1011.74,
1031.01, 1013.03, 1013.31, 1013.35, 1013.37, 1013.371, 1013.60,
1013.61, 1013.64, 1013.735, 1013.736, 1013.737 FS. History—New
10-30-94, Amended 4-28-97, Formerly 6A-2.0111, Amended 1-5-00,
Formerly 6-2.001, Amended 8-22-05, 7-2-06,

NAME OF PERSON ORIGINATING PROPOSED RULE:
Spessard Boatright, Director, Office of Educational Facilities
NAME OF SUPERVISOR OR PERSON WHO APPROVED
THE PROPOSED RULE: Linda Champion, Deputy
Commissioner for Finance and Operations

DATE PROPOSED RULE APPROVED BY AGENCY
HEAD: March 6, 2007

DATE NOTICE OF PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT
PUBLISHED IN FAW: March 2, 2007

DEPARTMENT OF EDUCATION
State Board of Education

RULE NO.: RULETITLE:
6A-4.0021 Florida Teacher Certification
Examinations

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The purpose of this proposed rule
amendment is to adopt changes to selected subject area
competencies and skills. These changes are incorporated by
reference through the adoption of the document, Competencies
and Skills Required for Teacher Certification in Florida,
Twelfth Edition. In addition, the rule specifies the effective
date for implementation of the new competencies and skills.
The effect of these changes is that the updated competencies
and skills for the subject area examinations will be available to
examination candidates and the examinations will be updated
to include these competencies and skills.

1272 Section Il - Proposed Rules



Florida Administrative Weekly

Volume 33, Number 11, March 16, 2007

SUMMARY: References and the effective date are changed for
the new edition of the Competencies and Skills Required for
Teacher Certification in Florida, Twelfth Edition. Changes to
competencies and skills for subject area content examinations
are implemented with the specified date.

SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF ESTIMATED
REGULATORY COST: No Statement of Estimated Regulatory
Cost was prepared.

Any person who wishes to provide information regarding a
statement of estimated regulatory costs, or provide a proposal
for a lower cost regulatory alternative must do so in writing
within 21 days of this notice.

SPECIFIC AUTHORITY: 1012.56(8) FS.

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 1012.56(8) FS.

A HEARING WILL BE HELD AT THE DATE, TIME AND
PLACE SHOWN BELOW:

DATE AND TIME: 9:00 am., April 17, 2007

PLACE: 325 West Gaines Street, Suite 1514, Tallahassee,
Florida 32399-0400

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULE IS: Dr. Cornelia Orr, Administrator,
Assessment and School Performance, 325 W. Gaines Street,
Suite 414, Tallahassee, Florida 32399, (850)245-0513

THE FULL TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE IS

6A-4.0021 Florida Teacher Certification Examinations.

(1) Scope. This rule governs the written examinations for
teacher certification. Additional requirements for certification
are specified in Chapter 6A-4, FA.C.

(2) Description of the examinations and competencies to
be demonstrated.

(8) The Florida Teacher Certification Examinations shall
be devel oped by the Commissioner of Education.

(b) The written examinations shall include subtests of
reading, writing, mathematics, professional skills, and subject
area specialty. These examinations may contain multiple
choi ce questions and questions requiring the examinee to write
an answer or demonstrate a proficiency.

(c) The following competencies are to be demonstrated by
means of the written examinations:

1. Before July 21, 2007, the general knowledge
competencies and skills as contained in the publication,
“Competencies and Skills Required for Teacher Certification
in Florida, Eleventh Edition.” Beginning with the July 21,
2007 2006 test administration, the general knowledge
competencies and skills as contained in the publication
“Competencies and Skills Required for Teacher Certification
in Florida, Twelfth Eleventh Edition.” Copies of these
publications may be obtained from Florida Teacher
Examinations, Department of Education, 325 West Gaines

Street, Tallahassee, Florida 32399, at a price to be established
by the Commissioner not to exceed actual cost.

2. Before July 21, 2007 Oeteber21,-2006, the professional
education test competencies and skills contained in the
publication, “Competencies and Skills Required for Teacher
Certification in Florida, Eleventh Fenth Edition” which is
hereby incorporated by reference and made a part of this rule.
Beginning July 21, 2007 Octeber21,-2006, the professional
education test competencies and skills contained in the
publication “Competencies and Skills Required for Teacher
Certification in Florida, Twelfth Eleventh Edition” which is
hereby incorporated by reference and made a part of this rule.
Caopies of these publications may be obtained as described in

suboaraqraph (2)(c)1. of this rule #em—FLeHda—Teaeher

3. Before July 21, 2007 222006, the subject area
competencies and skills contained in the publication,
“Competencies and Skills Required for Teacher Certification
in Florida, Eleventh Fenth Edition” which is hereby
incorporated by reference and made a part of this rule.
Beginning July 21, 2007 22—2006, the subject area

competencmﬁ and skllls—wrth—the—exeepaen—ef—ElementaFy

K12, contai ned in the publlcatlon “ Competenqes and Sk|lls
Required for Teacher Certification in Florida, Twelfth Eleventh
Edition” which is hereby incorporated by reference and made a
part of this rule. Copies of these publications may be obtained
as d@cnbed in subparagraph (0l of this ruIe

(d) through (15) No change.

Specific Authority 1012.55(1), 1012.56, 101259 FS. Law
Implemented 1012.56 FS. History—New 8-27-80, Amended 1-11-82,
1-6-83, 5-3-83, 10-5-83, 10-15-84, Formerly 6A-4.021, Amended
12-25-86, 4-26-89, 4-16-90, 7-10-90, 4-22-91, 10-3-91, 8-10-92,
11-28-93, 4-12-95, 7-1-96, 9-30-96, 10-1-99, 7-17-00, 7-16-01,
3-24-02, 7-16-02, 3-24-03, 7-21-03, 12-23-03, 7-13-04, 5-24-05,
5-23-06

.

Section I - Proposed Rules 1273



Florida Administrative Weekly

Volume 33, Number 11, March 16, 2007

NAME OF PERSON ORIGINATING PROPOSED RULE: Dr.
Cornelia Orr

NAME OF SUPERVISOR OR PERSON WHO APPROVED
THE PROPOSED RULE: Jay Pfeiffer

DATE PROPOSED RULE APPROVED BY AGENCY
HEAD: March 7, 2007

DATE NOTICE OF PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT
PUBLISHED IN FAW: February 10, 2006

DEPARTMENT OF EDUCATION

Sate Board of Education

RULE NO.: RULETITLE:

6A-20.019 Children and Spouses of Deceased or
Disabled Veterans or Children of
Servicemen Classified as Prisoners
of War or Missing in Action
Scholarships

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The purpose of the rule amendment

is to include spouses of deceased or disabled veterans as

eligible for scholarships. The effect isarule which is expanded

pursuant to Section 295.01, Florida Statutes, to include

SPOUSES.

SUMMARY: Section 295.01, Florida Statutes, was amended to

expand digibility for scholarships through the Children of

Deceased or Disabled Veterans or Children of Servicemen

Classified as Prisoners of War or Missing in Action

Scholarships program to include spouses. The rule is amended

to reflect this change.

SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF ESTIMATED

REGULATORY COST: No Statement of Estimated Regulatory

Cost was prepared.

Any person who wishes to provide information regarding a

statement of estimated regulatory costs, or provide a proposal

for a lower cost regulatory alternative must do so in writing

within 21 days of this notice.

SPECIFIC AUTHORITY: 1001.02(1), 295.01(3), 295.02 FS.

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 1009.5385, 1009.42, 295.01,

295.015, 295.016, 295.017, 295.018, 295.019, 295.0195,

295.02, 295.03, 295.04, 295.05 FS.

A HEARING WILL BE HELD AT THE DATE, TIME AND

PLACE SHOWN BELOW:

DATE AND TIME: April 17, 2007, 8:30 am.

PLACE: Department of Education, 325 West Gaines Street,

Tallahassee, Florida 32399-0400

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE

PROPOSED RULE IS: Theresa Antworth, Director, State

Scholarships and Grants, Department of Education, Office of

Student Financia Assistance, 1940 N. Monroe Street, Suite 70,

Tallahassee, Florida 32399-0400, (850)410-5185

THE FULL TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE IS

1274 Section Il - Proposed Rules

6A-20.019 Children and Spouses of Deceased or Disabled
Veterans or Children of Servicemen Classified as Prisoners of
War or Missing in Action Scholarships.

(1) Eligibility criteriafor awards. To receive aid, a student
shall meet the provisions of Sections 1009.40, 1009.42,
295.01, 295.02, 295.03, 295.04, and 295.05, Florida Statutes,
and Section 295.015, or 295.016, or 295.017, or 295.018, or
295.019, or 295.0195, Florida Statutes, and Rule 6A-20.001
and 6A-20.0371, FA.C., and:

(8) Submit, for each academic year on or before April 1,
Form FFAA-1, Forida Financia Aid for Students, as
incorporated by reference in Rule 6A-20.020, FAC., and Form
CDDV-1, Scholarships for Children and Spouses of Deceased
or Disabled Veterans or Children of Servicemen Classified as
Prisoners of War or Missing in Action Certification Form.
Form CDDV-1 is hereby incorporated by reference and made a
part of this rule to become effective October 2002. A copy of
Forms FFAA-1 and CDDV-1 may be obtained from the Office
of Student Financial Assistance, Department of Education, 325
West Gaines Street, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-0400.

(6) Amount of award. The maximum amount of a
scholarship shall be the amount of tuition and registration fees
assessed the student at the end of regular registration, inclusive
of the drop-add period. However, the amount of the scholarship
in combination with other student aid shall not exceed the
student’s cost of education. A student who receives a Children
and Spouses of Deceased or Disabled Veterans Scholarship,
who is enrolled in nonpublic postsecondary institution, and
who is assessed tuition and fees that are the same as those of a
full-time student at that institution, shall receive a fixed award
caculated by using the average matriculation and fee
calculation for full-time attendance at a public postsecondary
education institution at the comparable level. A student
enrolled part-time shall receive a reduced award by either
one-haf or three-fourths of the maximum award, depending on
thelevel or fees assessed.

Specific  Authority 1001.02(1), 295.01(3), 295.02 FS. Law
Implemented 1009.5385, 1009.42, 29501, 295.015, 295.016,
295.017, 295.018, 295.019, 295.0195, 295.02, 295.03, 295.04, 295.05
FS. History-New 12-28-86, Amended 3-22-89, 5-16-90, 3-24-92,
10-18-94, 11-3-02

NAME OF PERSON ORIGINATING PROPOSED RULE:
Theresa Antworth, Director, State Scholarships and Grants
NAME OF SUPERVISOR OR PERSON WHO APPROVED
THE PROPOSED RULE: Linda Champion, Deputy
Commissioner for Finance and Operations

DATE PROPOSED RULE APPROVED BY AGENCY
HEAD: March 5, 2007

DATE NOTICE OF PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT
PUBLISHED IN FAW: March 2, 2007



Florida Administrative Weekly

Volume 33, Number 11, March 16, 2007

BOARD OF TRUSTEES OF THE INTERNAL
IMPROVEMENT TRUST FUND

Notices for the Board of Trustees of the Internal Improvement
Trust Fund between December 28, 2001 and June 30, 2006, go
to http://www.dep.state.fl.ug under the link or button titled
“Official Notices.”

AGENCY FOR HEALTH CARE ADMINISTRATION
Health Facility and Agency Licensing

RULE NO.: RULETITLE:

59A-3.2085 Department and Services

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The Agency proposes to amend
Rule 59A-3.2085, Florida Administrative Code, consistent
with provisions of Section 408.0361, Florida Statutes. This
section includes standards for adult diagnostic cardiac
catheterization services in hospitals, and provides for adoption
of rules to establish alicensure process for adult interventional
cardiology programs in Florida hospitals and to adopt
standards for those programs.

SUMMARY: The proposed amendments to this rule establish
standards for adult diagnostic cardiac catheterization services
in hospitals and criteria for licensure of interventional
cardiology programs in Florida hospitals.

SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF ESTIMATED
REGULATORY COST: No Statement of Estimated Regulatory
Cost was prepared.

Any person who wishes to provide information regarding a
statement of estimated regulatory costs, or provide a proposal
for a lower cost regulatory alternative must do so in writing
within 21 days of this notice.

SPECIFIC AUTHORITY: 408.0361(1) FS.

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 408.0361 FS.

A HEARING WILL BE HELD AT THE DATE, TIME AND
PLACE SHOWN BELOW:

DATE AND TIME: April 10, 2007, 1:00 p.m.

PLACE: Agency for Health Care Administration, 2727 Mahan
Drive, Building #3, Conference Room D, Tallahassee, FL
32308

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 5 days before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: Jeffrey N. Gregg, Chief, Bureau of Health Facility
Regulation, (850)922-0791. If you are hearing or speech
impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida Relay
Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice).
THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULE IS: Jeffrey N. Gregg, Chief, Bureau of
Health Facility Regulation, (850)922-0791

THE FULL TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE IS

59A.-3.2085 Department and Services.

(2) through (12) No change.

(13) Adult Hapatient Diagnostic Cardiac Catheterization
Program. All licensed hospitals that establish adult diagnostic
cardiac catheterization laboratory services under Section
408.0361, ES., shall operate in compliance with the most
recently published guidelines of the American College of
Cardiology/American Heart Association regarding the
operation of diagnostic cardiac catheterization laboratories.
The applicable guideline, herein incorporated by reference, is
the American College of Cardiology/Society for Cardiac
Angiography and Interventions Clinical Expert Consensus
Document on Cardiac Catheterization | aboratory Sandards:
Bashore et al, ACC/SCA&!| Clinical Expert Consensus
Document on Catheterization Laboratory Sandards, JACC
\ol. 37, No. 8, June 2001: 2170-214. Aspects of the guideline
related to pediatric services or outpatient cardiac
catheterization in freestanding non-hospital settings are not
applicable to this rule. AH-teensed-hospitals-that-establish-an

a idala) da' tron—Proo m
SLRLS, ci-Chck il o oGt

iied herein
All such exempted licensed hospitals shall have a department,
service or other similarly titled unit which shall be organized,
directed and staffed, and integrated with other units and
departments of the hospitalsin a manner designed to assure the
provision of quality patient care.
(&) Definitions. The following definitions shall apply

specificaly to al adult hpatient diagnostic cardiac
catheterization programs, as described in this subsection
59A-3.2085(13), FA.C.

13- “Diagnostic Cardiac Catheterization” means a
procedure requiring the passage of a catheter into one or more
cardiac chambers of the left and right heart, with or without
coronary arteriograms, for the purpose of diagnosing
congenital or acquired cardiovascular diseases, or for
determining measurement of blood pressure flow; and also
includes the sel ective catheterization of the coronary ostiawith
injection of contrast medium into the coronary arteries.

ohoav i iR,

Cardielegy-

2.4 “Adult Hapatient” means a person fifteen eighteen
years of age or older whe-has-been-admitted-for-bed-occupancy
F : ivina inpaticnt hosoi .

Section I - Proposed Rules 1275



Florida Administrative Weekly

Volume 33, Number 11, March 16, 2007

3. (—b} Therapeutic Procedures. An adult diagnostic cardiac
catheterization program established pursuant to an-exemption

granted-under Section 408.0361 408:036(3)(n), F.S., shall not
provide therapeutic services, such as balleen—angioplasty

percutaneous coronary intervention or stent insertion, intended

to treat an identified condition or the administering of
intra-coronary drugs, such as thrombolytic agents.

4.¢e) Diagnostic Procedures. Procedures performed in the
adult diagnostic cardiac catheterization laboratory shall
include, for example, the following:

at Left heart catheterization with coronary angiography
and left ventricul ography

b.2: Right heart catheterization

¢.3: Hemodynamic monitoring line insertion

d.4- Aortogram

e.5: Emergency temporary pacemaker insertion

f.6- Transesophageal electric pacing

.7 Myocardial biopsy

h.8: Trans-septal procedures

i.9: Intra-coronary ultrasound (CV1S)

1.36- Fluoroscopy
k.2% Hemodynamic stress testing

(b)te} Support Equipment. A crash cart containing the
necessary medication and equipment for ventilatory support
shall be located in each cardiac catheterization procedure

room. A listing of al crash cart contents shall be readily
available. At the beginning of each shift, the crash cart shall be
checked for intact lock; the defribrillator and corresponding
equipment shall be checked for function and operational
capacity. A log shall be maintained indicating review.

1276 Section |l - Proposed Rules

(c) Radiographic Cardiac Imaging Systems. A quality
improvement program for radiographic imaging systems shall
include measures of image quality, dynamic range and
modulation transfer function. Documentation indicating the
manner in which this requirement will be met shall be available
for the Agency’sreview.

(@)¢H Physical Plant Requirements. Section 419.2.1.2,
Florida Building Code, subseetion—59A-3:08H53)—FA-C;,
contains the physica plant requirements for the adult
diagnostic Hapatient cardiac catheterization program.

(e)tg} Personnel Requirements. There shall be an adequate
number of trained personnel available. At a minimum, a team
involved in cardiac catheterization shall consist of a physician,
one registered nurse, and one technician.

(f) Quality Improvement Program. A quality improvement
program for the adult diagnostic cardiac catheterization
program laboratory shall include an assessment of proficiency
in_coronary interventions, as described in the American
College of Cardiology/American Heart Association
Guidelines. Essential data elements for the quality
improvement program include the individual physician
procedural volume and major complication rate; the
institutional procedural complication rate; relevant clinical and
demographic information about patients; verification of data
accuracy, procedures for patient, physician and staff
confidentiality; a comparison of outcomes with benchmark
data and the ability to risk-stratify patients. Documentation
indicating the manner in which this requirement will be met
shall be available for the Agency’s review.

(g){h} Emergency Serwc&s Garda%eathete%men

1. All providers of adult diagnostic cardiac catheterization
program services in a hospital not licensed as a Level 11 adult
interventional cardiology provider shall have written transfer
agreements developed specifically for diagnostic cardiac
catheterization patients with one or more hospitals that operate
a Level |l adult interventional cardiology services program.
Written agreements must be in place to ensure safe and
efficient emergency transfer of a patient within 60 minutes.
Transfer time is defined as the number of minutes between the
acceptance of the patient by the physician in the receiving
hospital and the patient’s arrival at the receiving hospital.
Transfer and transport agreements must be reviewed and tested

a Ieast every 3 months, with appropriate documentanon




Florida Administrative Weekly

Volume 33, Number 11, March 16, 2007

2. Patients at high risk for diagnostic catheterization
complications shall be referred for diagnostic catheterization
serwc& to hospltals Ilcen%d asalevel |l adult |ntervent|onal

licensed as a Level Il _adult
interventional cardiology services provider must have
documented patient selection and exclusion criteria and
provision for identification of emergency situations requiring
transfer to a hospital with a Level Il adult interventional
cardiology services program. Documentation indicating the
manner in which this requirement will be met shall be available
for the Agency’s review.

3. Each adult diagnostic cardiac catheterization program
shall have the capability of rapid mobilization of its team 24
hours a day, 7 days a week. Documentation indicating the
manner in which this requirement will be met shall be available
for the Agency’s review.

(h) Policy and Procedure Manual for Medicaid and

ava#able Hosnltals not

2. The request shall attest to the hospital’s intent and
ability to comply with applicable ACC/AHA quidelines
including quidelines for staffing, physician training and
experience, operating procedures, equipment, physical plant
and patient selection criteria.

3. The request shall attest to the hospital’s intent and
ability to comply with physical plant requirements regarding
cardiac catheterization laboratories and operating rooms found
Section 419.2.1.2, Florida Building Code.

4. The request shall also include copies of one or more
written transfer agreements with hospitals that operate a L evel
Il adult interventional cardiology services program, including
written transport protocols to ensure safe and efficient transfer
of an emergency patient within 60 minutes. Transfer time is
defined as the number of minutes between the acceptance of
the patient by the physician in the receiving hospital and the
patient’s arrival at the receiving hospital.

5. All providers of Level | adult interventional cardiology
services programs shall operate in compliance with subsection
59A-3.2085(13), FA.C., and the most recently published
guidelines of the American College of Cardiology/American
Heart Association regarding the operation of adult diagnostic
cardiac catheterization |aboratories and the provision of

Charity Care.
1. Each provider of adult diagnostic cardiac
catheterization services shall maintain a policy and procedure

percutaneous coronary intervention (PCI).
6. The applicable guidelines, herein incorporated by
reference, are the American College of Cardiology/Society for

manual, available for review by the Agency, which documents

Cardiac Angiography and Interventions Clinical Expert

a plan to provide services to Medicaid and charity care

Consensus Document on Cardiac Catheterization Laboratory

patients.

2. At a minimum, the policy and procedure manual shall
document specific outreach programs directed at Medicaid and
charity care patients for adult diagnostic cardiac catheterization

Sandards: Bashore et al, ACC/SCA&I Clinical Expert
Consensus  Document _on  Catheterization Laboratory
Sandards, JACC \ol. 37, No. 8, June 2001: 2170-214.

ACC/AHA/SCAI 2005 Guideline Update for Percutaneous

Services.

(i) Enforcement. Enforcement of these rules shall follow

procedures established in Rule 59A-3.253, EA.C.

(16) Level | Adult Interventional Cardiology Services.

(a) Licensure.

1. A hospital seeking a license for a Level | adult
interventional cardiology services program shall submit a
request to the Agency, signed by the chief executive officer of
the hospital, attesting that, for the most recent 12-month
period, the hospital has provided a minimum of 300 adult
inpatient and outpatient diagnostic cardiac catheterizations or,
for the most recent 12-month period, has discharged or
transferred at least 300 inpatients with the principal diagnosis
of ischemic heart disease (defined by ICD-9-CM codes 410.0

through 414.9).

Coronary Intervention A Report of the American College of
Cardiology/American Heart Association Task Force on
Practice Guidelines (ACC/AHA/SCAI Writing Committee to
Update the 2001 Guidelines for Percutaneous Coronary
Intervention).

7. Notwithstanding ACC/AHA guidelines to the contrary,
all providers of Level | adult interventional cardiology services
programs may provide elective PCI procedures. Aspects of the
guidelines related to pediatric services or outpatient cardiac
catheterization in freestanding non-hospital settings are not
applicableto thisrule.

8. Hospitals with Level | adult interventional cardiology
services programs must renew their licenses at the time of the
hospital licensure renewal, providing the information in 2.
through 5. above. Failure to renew the hospital’s license and/or
theinformation in 2. through 5. above shall cause the license to
expire.

b) Staffing.

Section I - Proposed Rules 1277



Florida Administrative Weekly

Volume 33, Number 11, March 16, 2007

1. Each cardiologist shall be an experienced physician
who has performed a minimum of 75 interventional cardiology
procedures, exclusive of fellowship training and within the
previous 12 months from the date of the exemption
application.

2. Physicians with less than 12 months experience shall
fulfill applicable ACC/AHA training requirements (reference
ACC/AHA/SCAI 2005 Guideline Update for Percutaneous
Coronary Intervention) prior to being allowed to perform
emergency PClsin a hospital that is not licensed for al evel 1l
adult interventional cardiology services program.

3. The nursing and technical catheterization |aboratory

f) Enforcement.

1. Enforcement of these rules shall follow procedures
established in Rule 59A-3.253, FA.C.

2. The Agency shall use outcomes published on the
“Florida Compare Care” website to establish priorities for
appraisal visits of licensed Level | adult interventional
cardiology providers. Providers with higher than expected

risk-adjusted mortality rates on measures including “acute
myocardial infarction mortality rate” and “acute myocardial

infarction mortality rate, without transfer cases’ will receive an
appraisal visit by the Agency to review the operation of the
Level | adult interventional cardiology services program.

staff shall be experienced in handling acutely ill patients
requiring intervention or balloon pump, based on previous
experience in dedicated cardiac interventional |aboratories at a
hospital with al evel 11 adult interventional cardiology services
program. They shall be skilled in all aspects of interventional
cardiology equipment, and must participate in a
24-hour-per-day, 365 day-per-year call schedule.

4. A member of the cardiac care nursing staff who is adept
in_hemodynamic monitoring and Intra-aortic Balloon Pump
(IABP) management shall be in the hospital at all times.

(c) Emergency Services.

1. A hospital provider of Level | adult interventional
cardiology services program must ensure it has systems in
place for the emergent transfer of patients with intra-aortic
balloon pump (IABP) support to one or more hospitals licensed
to operate a Level 1l adult interventional cardiology services
program. Formalized written transfer agreements developed
specifically for emergency PCIl patients must be developed
with a hospital that operates a Level |l adult interventional
cardiology program. Written transport protocols must be in
place to ensure safe and efficient transfer of a patient within 60
minutes. Transfer time is defined as the number of minutes
between the acceptance of the patient by the physician in the
receiving hospital and the patient’s arrival at the receiving
hospital. Transfer and transport agreements must be reviewed
and tested at least every 3 months, with appropriate
documentation maintained.

(d) Policy and Procedure Manua for Medicaid and
Charity Care.

1. Each provider of Level | adult interventional cardiology
services shall maintain a policy and procedure manual,
available for review by the Agency, which documents a plan to
provide services to Medicaid and charity care patients.

2. At a minimum, the policy and procedure manual shall
document specific outreach programs directed at Medicaid and
charity care patients for | evel | adult interventional cardiology
Services.

(e) Physical Plant Requirements.

Section 419.2.1.2, Forida Building Code, contains the

3. Level | adult interventional cardiology services
programs that fail to meet outcome standards or other
provisions of this rule shall be given 15 days to develop a plan
of correction that must be accepted by the Agency.

4. Failure of the hospital with a Level | adult
interventional cardiology services program to make
improvements specified in the plan of correction shall result in
the revocation of the program license. The hospital may offer
evidence of mitigation and such evidence could result in a
lesser sanction.

(17) Level 11 Adult Interventional Cardiology Services.

(a) Licensure.

1. A hospital seeking a license for a Level Il adult
interventional cardiology services program shall submit a
request to the Agency, signed by the chief executive officer of
the hospital, attesting that, for the most recent 12-month
period, the hospital has provided a minimum of a minimum of
1,100 adult inpatient and outpatient cardiac catheterizations, of
which at least 400 must be therapeutic cardiac catheterizations,
or, for the most recent 12-month period, has discharged at |east
800 patients with the principal diagnosis of ischemic heart
disease (defined by 1CD-9-CM codes 410.0 through 414.9).

2. The request shall attest to the hospital’s intent and
ability to comply with applicable ACC/AHA quidelines
including quidelines for staffing, physician training and
experience, operating procedures, equipment and physical
plant.

3. The request shall attest to the hospital’s intent and
ability to comply with physical plant requirements regarding
cardiac catheterization laboratories and operating rooms found
Section 419.2.1.2, Florida Building Code.

4. All providers of Level |l adult interventional cardiology
services programs shall operate in compliance with subsections
59A-3.2085(13) and 59A.2085(16), FA.C. and the most
recently published guidelines of the American College of
Cardiology/American Heart Association regarding the
operation of diagnostic cardiac catheterization |aboratories, the
provision of percutaneous coronary intervention (PCl) and the
provision of coronary artery bypass graft surgery.

physical plant requirements for adult cardiac catheterization
laboratories operated by alicensed hospital.

1278 Section Il - Proposed Rules



Florida Administrative Weekly

Volume 33, Number 11, March 16, 2007

a_The applicable guidelines, herein incorporated by
reference, are the American College of Cardiology/Society for

2. At a minimum, the policy and procedure manual shall
document specific outreach programs directed at Medicaid and

Cardiac Angiography and Interventions Clinical Expert

charity care patients for Level [l adult interventiona

Consensus Document on Cardiac Catheterization Laboratory

cardiology services.

Sandards: Bashore et al, ACC/SCA&I Clinical Expert
Consensus  Document on  Catheterization  Laboratory
Sandards, JACC \ol. 37, No. 8, June 2001: 2170-214; and

b. ACC/AHA/SCAI 2005 Guideline  Update for
Percutaneous Coronary Intervention A Report of the American
College of Cardiology/American Heart Association TaskForce
on Practice Guidelines (ACC/AHA/SCAI Writing Committee to
Update the 2001 Guidelines for Percutaneous Coronary
Intervention; and

c. ACC/AHA 2004 Guideline Update for Coronary Artery
Bypass Graft Surgery: A Report of the American College of
Cardiology/American Heart Association Task Force on
Practice Guidelines (Committee to Update the 1999
Guidelines for Coronary Artery Bypass Graft Surgery)
Developed in Collaboration Wth the American Association for
Thoracic Surgery and the Society of Thoracic Surgeons.

d. Aspects of the guideline related to pediatric services or
outpatient cardiac catheterization in freestanding non-hospital
settings are not applicable to thisrule.

5. Hospitals with Level Il adult interventional cardiology
services programs must renew their licenses at the time of the
hospital licensure renewal, providing the information in 2.
through 4. above. Failureto renew the hospital’s license and/or
the information in 1. through 4. above shall cause the license to
expire.

(b) Staffing.

1. Each cardiologist shall be an experienced physician
who has performed a minimum of 75 interventional cardiology
procedures, exclusive of fellowship training and within the
previous 12 months from the date of the exemption
application.

2. The nursing and technical catheterization |aboratory
staff shall be experienced in handling acutely ill patients
requiring intervention or balloon pump, based on previous
experience in dedicated cardiac interventional |aboratories at a
hospital with al evel 11 adult interventional cardiology services
program. They shall be skilled in all aspects of interventional
cardiology equipment, and must participate in a
24-hour-per-day, 365 day-per-year call schedule.

3. A member of the cardiac care nursing staff who is adept
in_hemodynamic monitoring and Intra-aortic Balloon Pump
(IABP) management shall be in the hospital at all times.

(c) Policy and Procedure Manual for Medicaid and Charity
Care.

1. Each provider of adult Level 11 adult interventional
cardiology services shall maintain a policy and procedure
manual, available for review by the agency, which documentsa
plan to provide servicesto Medicaid and charity care patients.

(d) Physical Plant Requirements.
Section 419.2.1.2, Florida Building Code, contains the
physical plant requirements for adult cardiac catheterization
laboratories and operating rooms for cardiac surgery operated
by alicensed hospital.

(€) Enforcement.

1. Enforcement of these rules shall follow procedures
established in Rule 59A-3.253, EA.C.

2. The Agency shall use outcomes published on the
“Florida Compare Care” website to establish priorities for
appraisal visits of licensed Level Il adult interventional
cardiology providers. Providers with higher than expected
risk-adjusted mortality rates on measures including “acute
myocardial Infarction mortality rate” and “acute myocardial
infarction mortality rate, without transfer cases” and “ coronary
artery bypass graft mortality rate” will receive an appraisal
visit by the Agency to review the operation of the Level Il
adult interventional cardiology services program.

3. Level Il adult interventional cardiology services
programs that fail to meet outcome standards or other
provisions of this rule shall be given 15 days to develop a plan
of correction that must be accepted by the Agency.

4. Failure of the hospital with a Level 1l adult
interventional cardiology services program to make
improvements specified in the plan of correction shall result in
the revocation of the program license. The hospital may offer
evidence of mitigation and such evidence could result in a
lesser sanction.

Specific  Authority 395.1055, 395.3038, 395.401, 408.036,

408.0361(1) FS. Law Implemented 395.001, 395.1055, 395.1065,
395.3038, 395.401, 408.036, 408.0361, 957.05 FS. HIStory—New
4-17-97, Amended 3-29-98, 8-23-99, 3-23-06,

NAME OF PERSON ORIGINATING PROPOSED RULE:
Jeffrey N. Gregg, Chief, Bureau of Health Facility Regulation

NAME OF SUPERVISOR OR PERSON WHO APPROVED
THE PROPOSED RULE: Elizabeth Dudek, Deputy Secretary,
Health Quality Assurance

DATE PROPOSED RULE APPROVED BY AGENCY
HEAD: March 7, 2007

DATE NOTICE OF PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT
PUBLISHED IN FAW: December 8, 2006

Section I - Proposed Rules 1279



Florida Administrative Weekly

Volume 33, Number 11, March 16, 2007

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL
REGULATION

Division of Florida Land Sales, Condominiums and Mobile

Homes
RULE NO.: RULETITLE:
61B-79.001 Developer, Filing

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: This rule amendment creates the
Notice of Cooperative Incorporation/Recording Information
form required by Section 719.1035(1), Florida Statutes. The
developer, upon creation of a cooperative, is required to file
recording information for the cooperative with the division
prior to the conveyance of the cooperative property.
SUMMARY: This rule amendment addresses the filing of
cooperative creation and recording information with the
division.

SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF ESTIMATED
REGULATORY COST: No Statement of Estimated Regul atory
Cost was prepared.

Any person who wishes to provide information regarding a
statement of estimated regulatory costs, or provide a proposal
for a lower cost regulatory alternative must do so in writing
within 21 days of this notice.

SPECIFIC AUTHORITY: 719.1035(1), 719.501(1)(f) FS.
LAW IMPLEMENTED: 719.1035(1), 719.403(7), 719.502,
719.503, 719.504 FS.

IF REQUESTED WITHIN 21 DAYS OF THE DATE OF
THIS NOTICE, A HEARING WILL BE HELD AT THE
DATE, TIME AND PLACE SHOWN BELOW (IF NOT
REQUESTED, THISHEARING WILL NOT BE HELD):
DATE AND TIME: April 9, 2007, 10:00 a.m.

PLACE: The Northwood Centre, Suite 16, Conference Room,
1940 North Monroe Street, Tallahassee, Florida

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 48 hours before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: Sharon A. Malloy, Senior Management Analyst 1l
at (850)488-1631. If you are hearing or speech impaired,
please contact the agency using the Florida Relay Service,
1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice).

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULE IS: Sharon A. Malloy, Senior Management
Analyst 11, Division of Florida Land Sales, Condominiums and
Mobile Homes, 1940 North Monroe Street, Tallahassee,
Florida 32311-1030, (850)488-1631

THE FULL TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULEIS:

61B-79.001 Developer, Filing.

(2) through (5) No change.

(6)(a) Upon recording the cooperative documents as
defined in Section 719.1035(1), Florida Statutes, or recording
amendments adding phases as defined in Section 719.403(7),

1280 Section |l - Proposed Rules

Florida Statutes, the developer or the association shall file the
incorporation and recording information with the division
within 30 working days on DBPR Form CP 6000-2, NOTICE
OF COOPERATIVE INCORPORATION/RECORDING
INFORMATION, incorporated in this rule and effective

._You may request a copy of the form, as well as all
forms referenced in these rules, by sending a written request to
the Division of Florida Land Sales, Condominiums, and
Mobile Homes at the Department of Business and Professional
Regulation, 1940 North Monroe Street, Tallahassee, Florida
32399-1033.

(b)1. If you, the developer or the association, have not
aready filed and the division has not reviewed and approved
the recorded documents under subsection (2) of this rule and
Sections 719.502, 719.503 and 719.504, Florida Statutes, prior
to recording, then you shall submit a complete copy of the
recorded documents with DBPR Form CP 6000-2, NOTICE
OF COOPERATIVE INCORPORATION/RECORDING
INFORMATION:; or

2. If the division has aready reviewed and approved the
recorded documents, then you, the developer or the
association, shall only file the form.

Specific Authority 719.1035(1), 719.501(1)(f) FS. Law Implemented

719.1035(1), 719.403(7), 719.502, 719.503, 719.504 FS. History—
New 1-8-98, Amended

NAME OF PERSON ORIGINATING PROPOSED RULE:
Michael Cochran, Director, Division of Florida Land Sales,
Condominiums and Mobile Homes, 1940 North Monroe
Street, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-1030

NAME OF SUPERVISOR OR PERSON WHO APPROVED
THE PROPOSED RULE: Holly Benson, Secretary,
Department of Business and Professional Regulation

DATE PROPOSED RULE APPROVED BY AGENCY
HEAD: March 3, 2007

DATE NOTICE OF PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT
PUBLISHED IN FAW: December 15, 2006

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL
REGULATION

Construction Industry Licensing Board

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE:

61G4-16.009 Examination and Reexamination
PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The Board proposes a rule
amendment for review of the contractor category list and the
modification for consistancy within the rule.

SUMMARY: The Board proposed a rule amendment to add an
area of competency for the contractor’'s examination and
address the requirements for reexamination.

SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF ESTIMATED
REGULATORY COST: No Statement of Estimated Regulatory
Cost was prepared.



Florida Administrative Weekly

Volume 33, Number 11, March 16, 2007

Any person who wishes to provide information regarding a
statement of estimated regulatory costs, or provide a proposal
for a lower cost regulatory alternative must do so in writing
within 21 days of this notice.

SPECIFIC AUTHORITY: 489.219(1), 489.108, 489.129(2)
FS.

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 455.217, 489.109, 489.11 FS.

IF REQUESTED WITHIN 21 DAYS OF THE DATE OF
THIS NOTICE, A HEARING WILL BE SCHEDULED AND
ANNOUNCED IN FAW.

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULE IS: GW. Harrell, Executive Director,
Construction Industry Licensing Board, Northwood Centre,
1940 N. Monroe Street, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-0750

THE FULL TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE IS

61G4-16.009 Examination and Reexamination.

(1)(a) The general areas of competency to be covered by
the examination for general, building, residential, sheet metal,
roofing, class A and B air conditioning, mechanical,
commercial pool/spa, residentia pool/spa, swimming pool/spa
servicing, plumbing, underground utility and excavation,
specialty structure, solar, pollutant storage, gypsum drywall,
glass and glazing, and gas line contractors, and the relative
weight to be assigned in grading each area tested shall be as
specified in Rule 61G4-16.001, FA.C.

(b) Reexamination.

1. A candidate who:

a. Fails to achieve a passing score on any of the tests
referenced to in Rule 61G4-16.001, F.A.C., above; or

b. Fails to appear for a scheduled test shall be required to
pay the reexamination fee as set forth in paragraph (3)(c)
below.

2. A candidate shall be required to retake only the tests on
which he or she failed to achieve a passing score or failed to
appear to take when scheduled. However, a candidate must
pass all tests within two years three-hundred-sixty-five{365)
days of the first attempt; after which time all past test scores of
the candidate shall be considered invalid and he or she shall be
required to take all parts of the test as specified in Rule
61G4-16.001, FA.C. A candidate may take any specific part of
the test no more than six times in the two year period.

3. A candidate who fails to achieve a passing score on the
examination in whole or in part en-his-erherfirst-ersecond
attempt may submit an application to retake the certification
examination to the examination vendor no less than thirty (30)
days prior to the administration of the examination the
candidate wishes to take provided he or she pays dl
appropriate fees as set forth in subsection (3) below.

(2) through (4) No change.

Specific Authority 455.217(2), 455.219(1), 489.108, 489.129(2) FS.
Law Implemented 455.217, 489.109, 489.111 FS. History—New
2-25-93, Formerly 21E-16.009, Amended 10-17-93, 7-20-94,
11-25-97, 9-15-99, 4-26-00, 10-24-00, 2-6-03, 1-10-05,
11-3-06

NAME OF PERSON ORIGINATING PROPOSED RULE:
Construction Industry Licensing Board

NAME OF SUPERVISOR OR PERSON WHO APPROVED
THE PROPOSED RULE: Construction Industry Licensing
Board

DATE PROPOSED RULE APPROVED BY AGENCY
HEAD: January 10, 2007

DATE NOTICE OF PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT
PUBLISHED IN FAW: February 2, 2007

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL
REGULATION

Board of Cosmetology

RULE NO.: RULETITLE:

61G5-24.005 Salon License Fee

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: To address fees.

SUMMARY: Raises the salon license application fee to
$50.00.

SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF ESTIMATED
REGULATORY COST: No Statement of Estimated Regulatory
Cost was prepared.

Any person who wishes to provide information regarding a
statement of estimated regulatory costs, or provide a proposal
for a lower cost regulatory alternative must do so in writing
within 21 days of this notice.

SPECIFIC AUTHORITY: 477.026, 477.026 FS.

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 477.026(1)(c) FS.

IF REQUESTED WITHIN 21 DAYS OF THE DATE OF
THIS NOTICE, A HEARING WILL BE SCHEDULED AND
ANNOUNCED IN THE FAW.

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULE IS: Robyn Barineau, Executive Director,
Board of Cosmetology, 1940 North Monroe, Street,
Tallahassee, Florida 32399-0750

THE FULL TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE IS

61G5-24.005 Salon License Fee.
The salon license fee shal be fifty dollars ($50.00). In
addition, a non-refundable application fee of fifty fertyfive
dollars ($50.00) {$45.00) shall be submitted with the salon
license application.
Specific Authority 477.016, 477.026 FS. Law Implemented

477.026(1)(c) FS. History—New 11-2-80, Amended 5-3-82, 10-1-85,
Formerly 21F-24.05, 21F-24.005, Amended 12-27-95 .

Section I - Proposed Rules 1281



Florida Administrative Weekly

Volume 33, Number 11, March 16, 2007

NAME OF PERSON ORIGINATING PROPOSED RULE:
Board of Cosmetology

NAME OF SUPERVISOR OR PERSON WHO APPROVED
THE PROPOSED RULE: Board of Cosmetology

DATE PROPOSED RULE APPROVED BY AGENCY
HEAD: November 20, 2006

DATE NOTICE OF PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT
PUBLISHED IN FAW: February 20, 2007

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL
REGULATION

Board of Landscape Architecture

RULE NO.: RULETITLE:
61G10-18.006 Approval of Continuing Education
Courses

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The Board proposes to amend the
rule for the approval of continuing education courses.
SUMMARY: The Board proposed a rule amendment to deny
the approval of a continuing education course which
constitutes a sales presentation or promotion.

SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF ESTIMATED
REGULATORY COST: No Statement of Estimated Regulatory
Cost was prepared.

Any person who wishes to provide information regarding a
statement of estimated regulatory costs, or provide a proposal
for a lower cost regulatory alternative must do so in writing
within 21 days of this notice.

SPECIFIC AUTHORITY: 455.2179, 481.306, 481.325(2) FS.
LAW IMPLEMENTED: 455.2179 FS.

IF REQUESTED WITHIN 21 DAYS OF THE DATE OF
THIS NOTICE, A HEARING WILL BE SCHEDULED AND
ANNOUNCED IN THE FAW.

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULE IS: Juanita Chastain, Executive Director,
Board of Landscape Architecture, Northwood Centre, 1940 N.
Monroe Street, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-0750

THE FULL TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULEIS:

61G10-18.006 Approva of
Courses.

(2) through (5) No change.

(6) A course which constitutes a sales presentation or
promotion will be denied.

()6} Approval of an instructor shall be limited by the
Board to courses he/she is qudlified to teach by education or
experience.

(8)fA Notice of any changein thetitle of a course shall be
provided to the Board office thirty (30) days prior to
implementation of the change.

(968} Any change in the-rame-er the qualifications of the
course instructor or an increase in the number of continuing
education credits to be awarded for the course must be

Continuing  Education

1282 Section Il - Proposed Rules

submitted on the form identified in subsection one (1) of this
rulein timeto permit review and approval or disapproval of the
changed course by the Board prior to implementation of the
proposed change.

(109} Any portion of a course approved by the Board
during the biennium in progress may be shortened by the
elimination of certain content, and offered for credit equal to
the time spent in the shortened presentation during the
biennium with Board Approval. The provider must comply
with Rule 61G10-18.006, F.A.C.

Specific Authority 455.2179, 481.306, 481.325(2) FS. Law
Implemented 455.2179 FS. History-New 9-19-01, Amended
6-6-02

NAME OF PERSON ORIGINATING PROPOSED RULE:
Board of Landscape Architecture

NAME OF SUPERVISOR OR PERSON WHO APPROVED
THE PROPOSED RULE: Board of Landscape Architecture
DATE PROPOSED RULE APPROVED BY AGENCY
HEAD: February 23, 2007

DATE NOTICE OF PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT
PUBLISHED IN FAW: January 12, 2007

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL
REGULATION

Board of Professional Geologists

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE:

61G16-5.004 Application Evaluations

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The Board proposes the substantial
rewrite of the rule to delete unnecessary language and to add
language clarifying application evaluations.

SUMMARY: The substantia rewrite of the rule will delete
unnecessary language and to add language clarifying
application evaluations.

SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF ESTIMATED
REGULATORY COST: No Statement of Estimated Regulatory
Cost was prepared.

Any person who wishes to provide information regarding a
statement of estimated regulatory costs, or provide a proposal
for a lower cost regulatory alternative must do so in writing
within 21 days of this notice.

SPECIFIC AUTHORITY: 492.104, 492.105 FS.

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 492.105 FS.

IF REQUESTED WITHIN 21 DAYS OF THE DATE OF
THISNOTICE, A HEARING WILL BE SCHEDULED AND
ANNOUNCED IN THE FAW.

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULE IS: Rick Morrison, Executive Director,
Board of Professional Geologists, 1940 North Monroe Street,
Tallahassee, Florida 32399-0764

THE FULL TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE IS



Florida Administrative Weekly

Volume 33, Number 11, March 16, 2007

(Substantial rewording of Rule 61G16-5.004 follows. See
Florida Administrative Code for present text.)

61G16-5.004 Application Evaluations.

(1) The determination of qualification for examination is a
complex and subjective matter, therefore the Board has
established the following quidelines which are generally
applicable absent extraordinary evidence and documentation
supporting a departure therefrom.

(2) In order to meet the prerequisites for examination for
licensure as a professional geologist in Florida, an applicant is
required to have graduated from a college or university with a
major in geology or a related science acceptable to the Board.
Each application is considered on an individual basis.

(a) A list of those related sciences previously determined
to be acceptable isfound in Rule 61G16-5.001, FA.C.

(b) The applicant must also demonstrate satisfactory
completion of a minimum of 30 semester hours of geological
courses, 24 of those hours must be at the third or fourth year
level or graduate level. A list of courses previoudly determined
to be acceptable is found at Rule 61G16-5.002, FA.C. No
examination authorization will be granted anyone without
documentation of having successfully passed these courses or
their substantial equivalent. A degree in a related science
without meeting these curricular requirements is insufficient to
qualify one for examination for licensure.

(3) In addition, the Board has determined that an applicant
is required to have at least seven (7) years of professional
geological work experience.

(a) Geological experience obtained prior to meeting the
educational requirements in subsection (2), above, is usually of
a_ subprofessional nature. Such experience, if deemed
acceptable and properly verified shall be awarded experience
credit at 25% of the actual time spent. If the experience is
obtained after the completion of 15 semester hours of
geological courses, experience credit shall be awarded at up to
50% of _actual time spent. In no event shall the total geological
experience credit allowable prior to meeting the educational
reguirements in subsection (2), above, exceed 12 months.

(b) Experience must be progressive on geologic projectsto
indicate that it is of increasing quality and requiring greater
responsibility.

(c) Two (2) years of experience are credited from the
completion of the course work described in subsections (2),
above, and

(d) The other five (5) years of experience should logically
follow and constitute the application of the geologic education
previously obtained.

(e) Experience should be gained under the supervision of a
Professional Geologists, Professional Engineer qualified by
education and experience to do the work being supervised, or
“gualified geologists’ as that term is defined in Section
492.102(5), Florida Statutes.

(f) No experience acquired while employed by and
enrolled as a student in a college or university shall be counted
unless it is demonstrated to the Board that the experience
constituted responsible charge of geologic work. Teaching
experience, to be creditable, must be in.an accredited college or
university and in the geological sciences.

(g) Full time: Geological work experience credit shall be
granted on a month-for-month basis for those periods in which
the applicant was engaged in_responsible charge of_geological
work on a 40 hour per week, full time basis. Teaching 9 credit
hours/semester, or the equivalent, of geological courses is
considered full time.

(h) Part time: Periods in which the applicant was engaged
in responsible charge of geological work on a part-time basis
shall be credited toward the geological work experience
requirements based on the percentage of full-time worked,
provided the work is otherwise creditable,

Specific Authority 492.104, 492.105 FS. Law Implemented 492.105
FS. History—New 12-8-98, Amended 4-13-99

NAME OF PERSON ORIGINATING PROPOSED RULE:
Board of Professional Geologists

NAME OF SUPERVISOR OR PERSON WHO APPROVED
THE PROPOSED RULE: Board of Professional Geologists
DATE PROPOSED RULE APPROVED BY AGENCY
HEAD: October 26, 2006

DATE NOTICE OF PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT
PUBLISHED IN FAW: October 17, 2006

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL
REGULATION

Florida Real Estate Appraisal Board

RULE NO.: RULETITLE:
61J1-3.004 I ssuance of Registration or
Certification

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: To establish standards for the
issuance of certification.

SUMMARY: Standards for the issuance of certification are
established.

SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF ESTIMATED
REGULATORY COST: No Statement of Estimated Regulatory
Cost was prepared.

Any person who wishes to provide information regarding a
statement of estimated regulatory costs, or provide a proposal
for a lower cost regulatory alternative must do so in writing
within 21 days of this notice.

SPECIFIC AUTHORITY: 475.613(2), 475.614, 475.6171 FS.
LAW IMPLEMENTED: 475.6171 FS.

IF REQUESTED WITHIN 21 DAYS OF THE DATE OF
THIS NOTICE, A HEARING WILL BE SCHEDULED AND
ANNOUNCED IN THE FAW.

Section I - Proposed Rules 1283



Florida Administrative Weekly

Volume 33, Number 11, March 16, 2007

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULE IS: Thomas O’Bryant, Director, Division
of Rea Estate, 400 West Robinson Street, Hurston Building,
North Tower, Suite N801, Orlando, Florida 32801

THE FULL TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULEIS:

61J1-3.004 Issuance of Certification.

Any applicant requesting the issuance of his or her certification
shall submit an application after completing the required
education and experience components and shall submit to the
Board the following in order for the applicant’s certification to
be issued:

(1) Have completed and submitted an application for
certification in the manner prescribed by Rule 61J1-3.001,
EA.C.. that demonstrates compliance with qualifications for
certification as specified in Section 475.615, ES.;

(2) Provide the Board with proof of successful completion
of the education component as specified in Section 475.617,
ES. and as further defined in Rule 61J1-4.001, FA.C. The
education component completed by the applicant for
certification must have conformed to the AQB’s education
criteria in effect at the time the applicant’s education
component  was completed. Specifically, the education
component completed by the applicant for certification prior to
January 1, 2008, must have conformed to the AQB's education
criteria effective on January 1, 2003. Education completed on
or_after January 1, 2008, must comply with the AQB's
education criteriain effect on January 1, 2008:;

(3) Provide the Board with proof of completion of the
experience component for certification as specified in Section
475.617, ES., and as further defined in Rule 61J1-6.001,
EA.C. The experience component completed by the applicant
for certification must have conformed to the AQB’s experience
criteria in effect at the time the applicant’s experience
component was completed. Specifically, the experience
component must be completed by the applicant for certification
prior to January 1, 2008, must have conformed to the AQB’s
experience criteria effective on January 1, 2003. Experience
completed on or after January 1, 2008, must comply with the
AQB’s experience criteriain effect on January 1, 2008; and

(4) Provide the Board with proof of passing a written
examination as specified in Section 475.616, FS., and as
further defined by Rule 61J1-5.001, FA.C., if a written
examination is reguired. Examination results are only valid for
amaximum period of 24 months from the exam date.

(5) Effective January 1, 2009, the education and
experience for all applicants requesting appraiser certification
must conform to the AQB’s education and experience criteria
effective January 1, 2008.

Specific Authority 475.613(2), 475.614, 475.6171 FS. Law
Implemented 475.6171 FS. History—New .

1284 Section Il - Proposed Rules

NAME OF PERSON ORIGINATING PROPOSED RULE:
Florida Real Estate Appraisal Board

NAME OF SUPERVISOR OR PERSON WHO APPROVED
THE PROPOSED RULE: Florida Real Estate Appraisal Board
DATE PROPOSED RULE APPROVED BY AGENCY
HEAD: January 10, 2007

DATE NOTICE OF PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT
PUBLISHED IN FAW: February 23, 2007

DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION

Notices for the Department of Environmental Protection
between December 28, 2001 and June 30, 2006, go to
http://www.dep.state.fl.ug under the link or button titled
“Official Notices.”

DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION

RULE NOS.: RULE TITLES:

62-210.200 Definitions

62-210.300 Permits Required

62-210.310 Air General Permits

62-210.920 Registration Formsfor Air General

Permits
PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The proposed rule involves
amendments to Chapter 62-210, F.A.C,, to clarify and update
rules that address requirements for bulk gasoline plants. The
bulk gasoline plant permitting exemption is removed for new
bulk gasoline plants. The requirements for operation under the
bulk gasoline air general permit are amended to include
submerged filling for existing plants, where currently required,
and Stage | vapor recovery for new plants statewide. The Bulk
Gasoline Plant Air General Permit Registration Form is
amended to incorporate these changes. This rulemaking is
being conducted in conjunction with proposed amendments to
Chapters 62-252 and 62-296, F.A.C., on the subject of gasoline
vapor control.
SUMMARY: The proposed rule amendments revise and update
requirements for bulk gasoline plant permitting exemptions
and for the use of the Bulk Gasoline Plant Air General Permit.
SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF ESTIMATED
REGULATORY COST: No Statement of Estimated Regulatory
Cost was prepared.
Any person who wishes to provide information regarding a
statement of estimated regulatory costs, or provide a proposal
for a lower cost regulatory alternative must do so in writing
within 21 days of this naotice.
SPECIFIC AUTHORITY: 403.061, 403.8055 FS.
LAW IMPLEMENTED: 403.031, 403.061, 403.087, 403.814
FS.
IF REQUESTED WITHIN 21 DAYS OF THE DATE OF
THIS NOTICE, A HEARING WILL BE HELD AT THE
DATE, TIME AND PLACE SHOWN BELOW (IF NOT
REQUESTED, THISHEARING WILL NOT BE HELD):
DATE AND TIME: Wednesday, April 11, 2007, 10:00 am.



Florida Administrative Weekly

Volume 33, Number 11, March 16, 2007

PLACE: Horida Department of Environmental Protection,
Division of Air Resource Management, 111 South Magnolia
Drive, Suite 23, Directors Conference Room, Tallahassee,
Florida

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 48 hours before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: Ms. Lynn Scearce at (850)921-9551. If you are
hearing or speech impaired, please contact the agency using the
Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or
1(800)955-8770 (Voice).

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULES IS: Ms Teri Long at
terri.long@dep.state.fl.us, phone (850)921-9556

THE FULL TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULESIS:

62-210.200 Definitions.

The following words and phrases when used in this chapter and
in Chapters 62-212, 62-213, 62-214, 62-296, and 62-297,
FA.C., shadl, unless the context eentent clearly indicates
otherwise, have the following meanings:

(2) through (49) No change.

(50) “Bulk Gasoline Plant” — Any gasoline storage and
distribution facility that whieh receives gasoline from bulk
terminals by pipeline, ship, barge, or gasoline cargo tank traiter
transpert, stores it in tanks, and subsequently delivers
dispenses it to resellers, farms, businesses, service stations, or
other end users, and that whieh has an average annual average
daily throughput of less than 20,000 gallons (75,700 liters), but
rere than-2000-gaHens{(7.570-iters) calculated on the basis of
the number of calendar days that the facility receives or
distributes gasoline ef-actual-eperation.

(51) “Bulk Gasoline Terminal” — Any gasoline storage and
distribution facility that whieh receives gasoline from its
supply sources primarily by pipeline, ship, ef barge, or
gasoline cargo tank and delivers gasoline to bulk gasoline
plants or to commercia or retail accounts primarily by tanker
truck or trailer, and that has an annual average daily throughput
of equal to or more than 20,000 gallons (75,700 liters) of
gasoline, calculated on the basis of the number of calendar
days that the facility receives or distributes gasoline ef-actual
oeperation.

(52) through (149) No change.

(150) “Gasoline Cargo Tank” — A delivery tanker truck,
trailer, or railcar that isloading or unloading gasoline.

(151)(456) “Gasoline Dispensing Fecility” — Any
stationary facility that site—where—gaseline—is dispensesd
gasoline directly into the fuel tank of a t6 motor vehicle

(151) through (294) renumbered (152) through (295) No
change.

(296)(295) “Submerged Filling” — The filling of a
gasoline cargo tank or a stationary storage tank through an
internal fill pipe whose discharge is no more than six (6) inches
from the bottom of the tank. Bottom filling of gasoline cargo

tanks or stationary storage tanksisincluded in this definition.

(296) through (333) renumbered (297) through (334) No
change.
Specific Authority 403.061, 403.8055 FS. Law Implemented 403.031,
403.061, 403.087, 403.8055 FS. History—Formerly 17-2.100,
Amended 2-9-93, 11-28-93, Formerly 17-210.200, Amended
11-23-94, 4-18-95, 1-2-96, 3-13-96, 3-21-96, 8-15-96, 10-7-96,

10-15-96, 5-20-97, 11-13-97, 2-5-98, 2-11-99, 4-16-01, 2-19-03,
4-1-05, 7-6-05, 2-2-06, 4-1-06, 9-4-06, 9-6-06, 1-10-07

62-210.300 Permits Required.

(2) through (2) No change.

(3) No change.

(a) Categorical and Conditional Exemptions. Except as
otherwise provided at subsection 62-210.300(3), FA.C.,
above, the following facilities, emissions units, and
pollutant-emitting activities shall be exempt from any
requirement to obtain an air construction permit or non-Title V
air operation permit, or to use an air general permit pursuant to
Rule 62-210.310, FA.C. The exemptions listed at
subparagraphs 62-210.300(3)(a)23. through 36., FA.C., are
valid only if the owner or operator ensures that the conditions
of exemption are met.

1. through 29. No change.

30. Bulk gasoline plants, provided:

a. The facility receives and distributes only
petroleum-based lubricants, gasoline, diesel fuel, mineral
spirits and kerosene;

b. The total storage capacity for gasoline at the facility
does not exceed 100,000 gallons;

¢. The facility shall not exceed a throughput rate (receive
and distribute) of 1.3 million gallons of gasoline in any
consecutive twelve (12) months; and

d. The facility is not subject to Rule 62-296.418, FA.C.

31. through 37. No change.
(b) through (c) No change.

Section I - Proposed Rules 1285



Florida Administrative Weekly

Volume 33, Number 11, March 16, 2007

(4) through (7) No change.

Specific Authority 403.061 FS. Law Implemented 403.031, 403.061,
403.087, 403.814 FS. History—Formerly 17-2.210, Amended
11-28-93, Formerly 17-210.300, Amended 11-23-94, 4-2-95, 4-18-95,
10-16-95, 1-2-96, 3-13-96, 3-21-96, 5-13-96, 8-15-96, 10-7-96,
5-20-97, 11-13-97, 2-5-98, 2-11-99, 4-16-01, 6-21-01, 7-6-05, 2-2-06,
1-10-07

62-210.310 Air Genera Permits.

(2) through (3) No change.

(4) Air General Permits for Fecilities Claiming
Conditional Exemption from Title V Air Permitting.

(&) Air General Permit for Facilities Comprising a Bulk
Gasoline Plants.

1. A facility comprising a ere{4)-erere bulk gasoline
plants shall be eligible to use this air general permit provided it
meets the general €ligibility criteria of paragraph
62-210.310(2)(a), F.A.C., and the following specific criteria.

a. Thefacility shall use no other air general permit.

b. The facility shall not be subject to any unit-specific
applicable requirement other than any applicable provisions of
Rule 62-296.418, F.A.C.

2. A facility using this air general permit shall comply
with the general conditions given at subsection 62-210.310(3),
F.A.C., and the following specific conditions.

a. The facility shal receive and distribute only
petroleum-based lubricants, gasoline, diesel fuel, mineral
spirits and kerosene.

b. The total storage capacity for gasoline at the facility
shall not exceed 150,000 gallons.

c. The facility shall not exceed a throughput rate (receive
and distribute) of 6.0 million gallons of gasoline in any
consecutive twelve (12) months.

d. The owner or operator shall maintain records to
document the throughput rate of gasoline on a monthly basis.
The owner or operator shall retain these records, available for
Department inspection, for aperiod of at least five (5) years.

e. The facility shall comply with all applicable provisions
of Rule 62-296.418, F.A.C.

(b) through (f) No change.

(5) No change.

Specific Authority 403.061 FS. Law Implemented 403.031, 403.061,
403.087, 403.814 FS. History—New 1-10-07, Amended

62-210.920 Registration Formsfor Air General Permits.
The registration forms for use of air general permits provided
at Rule 62-210.310, F.A.C., are adopted and incorporated by
reference in this section. The forms are listed by rule number,
which is aso the form number, with the subject, title and
effective date. Copies of the forms may be obtained by writing
to the Department of Environmental Protection, Division of
Air Resource Management, 2600 Blair Stone Road,
Tallahassee, Florida 32399-2400.

1286 Section Il - Proposed Rules

(1) Air Genera Permit Registration Forms for Facilities
Claiming Conditional Exemption from Title V Air Permitting.

(8) Bulk Gasoline Plant Air General Permit Registration
Form (DEP Form No. 62-210.920(1)(a), Effective
1-16-67).

(b) through (f) No change.

(2) No change.
Specific Authority 403.061 FS. Law Implemented 403.031, 403.061,
403.087, 403.814 FS. History—New 10-16-95, Amended 1-2-96,
3-21-96, 5-13-96, 8-15-96, 11-13-97, 5-25-98, 2-11-99, 6-21-01,
1-10-07

NAME OF PERSON ORIGINATING PROPOSED RULE:
Larry George

NAME OF SUPERVISOR OR PERSON WHO APPROVED
THE PROPOSED RULE: Joseph Kahn

DATE PROPOSED RULE APPROVED BY AGENCY
HEAD: February 28, 2007

DATE NOTICE OF PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT
PUBLISHED IN FAW: January 12, 2007

DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION

RULE NOS.: RULE TITLES:

62-252.200 Definitions

62-252.300 Gasoline Dispensing Facilities—
Stage | Vapor Recovery

62-252.400 Gasoline Dispensing Facilities—
Stage 11 Vapor Recovery

62-252.500 Gasoline Tanker Trucks or Trailers

62-252.900 Form

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The proposed rule involves
amendments to Chapter 62-252, F.A.C., to revise requirements
for gasoline vapor control from gasoline dispensing facilities,
and tanker trucks and trailers. The proposed rule would
eliminate Stage 11 vapor recovery requirements for new and
upgraded gasoline dispensing facilities in Miami-Dade,
Broward and Palm Beach counties and phase out Stage Il
vapor recovery requirements for existing facilities in those
counties. The proposed rule would also apply Stage | vapor
recovery requirements statewide to new and upgraded gasoline
dispensing facilities, and phase in Stage | vapor control
requirements statewide for gasoline dispensing facilities. This
rulemaking is being conducted in conjunction with proposed
amendments to Chapters 62-210 and 62-296, FA.C., on the
subject of gasoline vapor control.

SUMMARY: The proposed rule amendments address air
pollution regulatory requirements statewide for gasoline
dispensing facilities and tanker trucks and trailers.
SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF ESTIMATED
REGULATORY COST: No Statement of Estimated Regulatory
Cost was prepared.



Florida Administrative Weekly

Volume 33, Number 11, March 16, 2007

Any person who wishes to provide information regarding a
statement of estimated regulatory costs, or provide a proposal
for a lower cost regulatory alternative must do so in writing
within 21 days of this notice.

SPECIFIC AUTHORITY: 403.061 FS.

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 403.021, 403.031, 403.061, 403.087
FS.

IF REQUESTED WITHIN 21 DAYS OF THE DATE OF
THIS NOTICE, A HEARING WILL BE HELD AT THE
DATE, TIME AND PLACE SHOWN BELOW (IF NOT
REQUESTED, THISHEARING WILL NOT BE HELD):
DATE AND TIME: Wednesday, April 11, 2007, 10:00 am.
PLACE: Florida Department of Environmental Protection,
Division of Air Resource Management, 111 South Magnolia
Drive, Suite 23, Directors Conference Room, Tallahassee,
Florida

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring specia accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 48 hours before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: Ms. Lynn Scearce at (850)921-9551. If you are
hearing or speech impaired, please contact the agency using the
Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or
1(800)955-8770 (Voice).

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULES IS: Ms Teri Long at
terri.long@dep.state.fl.us, phone (850)921-9556

THE FULL TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULESIS:

62-252.200 Definitions.

The following words and phrases when used in this chapter
shall, unless the context eentent clearly indicates otherwise,
have the following meanings:

(2) through (2) No change.

(3) “Gasoline Cargo Tank” — A delivery tanker truck,
trailer, or railcar that is loading or unloading gasoline.

(463} “Gasoline Dispensing Facility” — Any stationary
facility that dispenses gasoline directly into the fuel tank of a
site-where—gasehne—is—dispenrsed—te motor vehicle gaselne
tanksfrom-stationary-sterage-tanks.

(4) through (8) renumbered (5) through (9) No change.

(10)9) “Stage | Vapor Recovery System” — A system that
captures and transfers gasoline vapors, which are generated by
the transfer of gasoline from a gasoline cargo tank dehvery
vessel to a gasoline dispensing facility’s stationary storage
tanks, into a vapor-tight gasoline cargo tank detvery—vessel
through direct displacement caused by the gasoline being
loaded.

(11)20) “Stage |1 Vapor Recovery System” — A system
that captures and transfers gasoline vapors, which are
generated during motor vehicle refueling, into a gasoline
dispensing facility’s stationary storage tanks.

(12)(11y “Submerged Filling” — The filling of a gasoline
cargo tank or a stationary storage tank through an internal fill
pipe whose discharge is no more than six (6) inches from the
bottom of the tank. Bottom filling of gasoline cargo tanks or
stationary storage tanksis included in this definition.

.

(13)22} No change.

Specific Authority 403.061 FS. Law Implemented 403:021, 403.031,
403.061, 403.087 FS. History—Formerly 17-2.100, Amended 2-2-93,
Formerly 17-252.200, Amended

62-252.300 Gasoline Dispensing Facilities— Stage | Vapor
Recovery.

(1) Applicability. The emission—timiting—standards—and
eontroltechneloegy requirements as—setferth—in of this rule
section shall apply to:

(& All gasoline dispensing facilities with a monthly
gasoline throughput of 20,000 gallons (75,700 liters) or more
located in any area designated as a nonattainment area or air
quality maintenance area for ozone under Rule 62-204.340
275, FA.C.; and:

(b) All gasoline dispensing facilities which are subject to
the Stage Il vapor recovery requirements of Rule 62-252.400,
FA.C;

(c) All gasoline dispensing facilities in the state with a
monthly throughput of 10,000 gallons (37,850 liters) or more
that begin operation on or after August 1, 2007;

(d) All gasoline dispensing facilities in the state with a
monthly throughput of 10,000 gallons (37,850 liters) or more
that are not otherwise subject to this rule pursuant to
paragraphs 62-252.300(1)(a), (b), or (c), FA.C., and whose
storage tanks are upgraded or replaced to meet the secondary
containment requirements for integral piping in Rule
62-761.510, FA.C., and are returned to operation on or after
August 1, 2007; and

(e) All gasoline dispensing facilities in the state with a
monthly throughput of 10,000 gallons (37,850 liters) or more
that are not otherwise subject to this rule pursuant to
paragraphs 62-252.300(1)(a). (b). (c), or (d), FA.C.

(2) Prohibition. No owner or operator of a any-delvery
vessel-er gasoline dispensing facility subject to the provisions
of this section shall transfer or cause or alow the transfer of

Section I - Proposed Rules 1287



Florida Administrative Weekly

Volume 33, Number 11, March 16, 2007

gasoline from any gasoline cargo tank sueh-delivery-vessel into
any dstationary storage tank located at any such gasoline

dispensing facility unless the stationary storage tank is
equipped for submerged filling and the vapors displaced from
the storage tank during filling are processed by a Stage | vapor
recovery system in accordance with subsection Rdle

62-252.300(3), F.A.C.
(3) Control Technology Requirements.
(a) The Stage | vapor recovery system required by thisr u

2-A-system conforming with the equipment specifications
of the U.S. Environmental Protection Agency EPA document,

“Design Criteriafor Stage | Vapor Control Systems — Gasoline
Service Stations,” dated November 1975, with the exception of
Attachment A hereby adopted and mcorporated by reference

(a) Owners and operators of gasoline dispensing facilities

subject to this rule pursuant to paragraph 62-252.300(1)(a),
EA.C., shall continue to operate and maintain their Stage |
vapor recovery systemsin compliance with thisrule.

(b) Owners and operators of gasoline dispensing facilities
subject to this rule pursuant to paragraph 62-252.300(1)(b),
EA.C., shal continue to operate and maintain their Stage |
vapor recovery systemsin compliance with thisrule.

(c) Owners and operators of gasoline dispensing facilities
subject to this rule pursuant to paragraph 62-252.300(1)(c).
EA.C., shall install Stage | vapor recovery systems prior to
beginning operation and thereafter operate and maintain such
systems in compliance with this rule.

1288 Section Il - Proposed Rules

(d) Owners and operators of gasoline dispensing facilities
subject to this rule pursuant to paragraph 62-252.300(1)(d),
EA.C., shdl install Stage | vapor recovery systems at the time
of upgrade or replacement of the stationary storage tanks and
thereafter operate and maintain such systems in compliance
with thisrule.

(e) Owners and operators of gasoline dispensing facilities
subject to this rule pursuant to paragraph 62-252.300(1)(€).
EA.C., shal install Stage | vapor recovery systems by January
1, 2010, and thereafter operate and maintain such systems in
compliance with thisrule.

Specific Authority 403.061 FS. Law Implemented 403:021; 403.031,

403.061, 403.087 FS. History—Formerly 17-2. 650(1)(f)11 Amended
2-2-93, Formerly 17-252.300, Amended

62-252.400 Gasoline Dispensing Facilities — Stage 1l
Vapor Recovery.

(1) Applicability.

(a) The control technology requirements set forth in this
rule section shall apply to all gasoline dispensing facilities
located in Broward, Miami-Dade and Palm Beach counties that
whieh have dispensed 10,000 gallons (37,850 liters) or more of
gasoline in any one month during or after 1991, unless the
owner of any such facility demonstrates to the Department that
it is an independent small business marketer of gasoline and
has dispensed less than 50,000 gallons (189,250 liters) of
gasoline in every month during and after 1991, or unless the
facility is exempt from the control technology requirements of
this rule pursuant to paragraph 62-252.400(1)(b), (c) or (d),
EA.C.

(b) Gasoline dispensing facilities at which the storage
tanks or integral piping are upgraded or replaced to meet the
secondary containment requirements of Rule 62-761.510,
EA.C., and are returned to operation on or after May 15, 2007,
shall not be required to install, operate, test or maintain Stage 1|
vapor recovery systems after such upgrade or replacement.

(c) Gasoline dispensing facilities that have not been
required to install Stage |1 vapor recovery systems through a
variance issued by the Department prior to May 15, 2007, shall
not be required to install, operate, test or maintain Stage |1
vapor recovery systems.

(d) Gasoline dispensing facilities that begin operation on
or after May 15, 2007, shall not be required to install, operate,
test, or maintain Stage 11 vapor recovery systems.

(2) Prohibition.

(@ No owner or operator of a gasoline dispensing facility
subject to the provisions of this section shall transfer, allow the
transfer, or provide equipment for the transfer of gasoline to a
vehicular fuel tank unless the facility is equipped with a Stage
I vapor recovery system that whieh complies with the control
technology requirements of subsection Rute 62-252.400(3),

F.A.C., and the system is preperhy used as designed duringthe
transfer.




Florida Administrative Weekly

Volume 33, Number 11, March 16, 2007

(b) Any gasoline dispensing facility that was required to
have a Stage Il vapor recovery system pursuant to this rule

(c) The tanker truck or trailer shall be designed and
maintained to be vapor-tight at all times except when

prior to May 15, 2007, shall operate and maintain the system

undergoing maintenance, inspection, or gauging, or during

through December 31, 2009, except as provided at paragraph

normal pressure vacuum venting as may be otherwise required

62-252.400(1)(b), FA.C.

(c) Any gasoline dispensing facility that ceases to operate
and maintain its Stage |1 vapor recovery system pursuant to the
rule shall decommission the system in such a manner asto seal
and eliminate all areas of possible liquid and vapor leakage.

(3) No change.

(4) Compliance Schedules.

(a) through (c) No change.

(d Any gasoline dispensing facility that whieh
commences construction or undertakes a significant
modification after November 15, 1992, must install a Stage |1
vapor recovery system prior to dispensing 10,000 gallons or
more in any one month, except as otherwise provided at
subsection 62-252.400(1), EA.C.

(5) through (8) No change.

Specific Authority 403.061 FS. Law Implemented 403:021; 403.031,

403.061, 403.087 FS. History—New 2-2-93, Formerly 17-252.400,
Amended 11-23-94

62-252.500 Gasoline Tanker Trucks or Trailers.

(1) Applicahility. All gasoline tanker trucks or trailers are
subject to the prohibitions of subsection Rute 62-252.500(2),
FA.C. In addition, all gasoline tanker trucks or trailers with a
delivery-vessel capacity of more than 4,500 gallons are subject
to the leak testing requirements of subsection Rdte
62-252.500(3), FA.C.

(2) Prohibitions.

(8) No gasoline tanker truck or trailer shall be filled at any
bulk gasoline plant or bulk gasoline terminal required by the
Department to have a vapor recovery system, unless the
delivery vessel of the tanker truck or trailer is equipped to
receive gasoline by means of submerged filling.

(b) No gasoline tanker truck or trailer shall be used to
deliver gasoline to one or more gasoline dispensing facilities
whose stationary storage tanks are equipped with subjectte-the
Stage | vapor recovery systems eentrol-requirements-of Rule
62-252.300—FA-C:, unless the tanker truck or traler is
equipped to dispense and receive gasoline by means of
submerged filling._If the tanker truck or trailer is designed to
receive displaced vapors from the stationary storage tank, the
operator of such tanker truck or trailer shall ensure the vapor
return line is completely connected before any gasoline is
transferred to the storage tank. and Tthe vapors displaced from
the storage tanks during filling shall be are processed by a
vapor recovery system, if available, at a bulk gasoline plant or
bulk gasoline terminal.

by the Federal Department of Transportation.
(3) No change.

Specific Authority 403.061 FS. Law Implemented 403:021; 403.031,
403.061, 403.087 FS. History—Formerly  17-2.650(1)(c)3.,
17-2.700(6)(c)2.d., Amended 2-2-93, Formerly 17-252.500, Amended
9-10-96 .

62-252.900 Form.
The form used by the Department in the gasoline vapor control
program is adopted and incorporated by reference in this
section. The form is listed by rule number, which is also the
form number, with the subject, title, and effective date. Copies
of the form may be obtained by writing to the Department of
Environmental Protection, Division of Air Resources
Management, 2600 Blair Stone Road, Tallahassee, Florida
32399-2400.

(1) Gasoline Tanker Truck Leak Test Report. (DEP Form
62-252.900(1), Effective September-10,-1996)

Specific Authority 403.061 FS. Law Implemented 403:021; 403.031,
403.061, 403.087 FS. History—New 2-2-93, Formerly 17-252.900,
Amended 11-23-94, 9-10-96 .

NAME OF PERSON ORIGINATING PROPOSED RULE:
Larry George

NAME OF SUPERVISOR OR PERSON WHO APPROVED
THE PROPOSED RULE: Joseph Kahn

DATE PROPOSED RULE APPROVED BY AGENCY
HEAD: February 28, 2007

DATE NOTICE OF PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT
PUBLISHED IN FAW: January 12, 2007

DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION

RULE NOS: RULE TITLES:
62-296.418 Bulk Gasoline Plants
62-296.509 Bulk Gasoline Plants

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The proposed rule involves
amendments to Chapter 62-296, FA.C., to repea the
Reasonably  Available Control  Technology (RACT)
requirements for bulk gasoline plants in seven counties and to
create new control technology requirements for bulk gasoline
plants statewide. This rulemaking is being conducted in
conjunction with proposed amendments to Chapters 62-210
and 62-252, F.A.C., on the subject of gasoline vapor control.
SUMMARY: The proposed rule addresses control technology
requirements for new bulk gasoline plants on a statewide basis.
SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF ESTIMATED
REGULATORY COST: No Statement of Estimated Regulatory
Cost was prepared.

Section I - Proposed Rules 1289



Florida Administrative Weekly

Volume 33, Number 11, March 16, 2007

Any person who wishes to provide information regarding a
statement of estimated regulatory costs, or provide a proposal
for a lower cost regulatory alternative must do so in writing
within 21 days of this notice.

SPECIFIC AUTHORITY: 403.061 FS.

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 403.031, 403.061,403.087 FS.

IF REQUESTED WITHIN 21 DAYS OF THE DATE OF
THIS NOTICE, A HEARING WILL BE HELD AT THE
DATE, TIME AND PLACE SHOWN BELOW (IF NOT
REQUESTED, THISHEARING WILL NOT BE HELD):
DATE AND TIME: Wednesday, April 11, 2007, 10:00 am.
PLACE: Florida Department of Environmental Protection,
Division of Air Resource Management, 111 South Magnolia
Drive, Suite 23, Director’s Conference Room, Tallahassee,
Florida

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring specia accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 48 hours before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: Ms. Lynn Scearce at (850)921-9551 If you are
hearing or speech impaired, please contact the agency using the
Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or
1(800)955-8770 (Voice).

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULES IS: Ms Teri Long at
terri.long@dep.state.fl.us, phone (850)921-9556

THE FULL TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULESIS:

62-296.418 Bulk Gasoline Plants.

(1) The owner or operator of abulk gasoline plant that has
begun operation prior to August 1, 2007, is located in an area
designated as a nonattainment area or air quality maintenance
area for ozone under Rule 62-204.340, FA.C., and has an
average annual daily throughput of more than 2,000 gallons
(7,570 liters) shall comply with the following requirements.

(a) Gasoline shall not be loaded into a stationary storage
tank at the bulk gasoline plant unless the storage tank is
equipped for submerged filling, and such equipment is used as
designed.

(b) Gasoline shall not be loaded into a gasoline cargo tank
at the bulk gasoline plant unless the gasoline cargo tank is
equipped for submerged filling, and such equipment is used as
designed.

(2) The owner or operator of a bulk gasoline plant that
begins operation on or after August 1, 2007, at any location in
the state and with any throughput rate shall comply with the
following requirements.

(a) Gasoline shall not be loaded into a stationary storage
tank at the bulk gasoline plant unless the storage tank is
equipped for submerged filling, and such equipment is used as

designed.

1290 Section |l - Proposed Rules

(b) Gasoline shall not be loaded into a gasoline cargo tank
at the bulk gasoline plant unless:

1. The gasoline cargo tank is equipped for submerged
filling, and such equipment is used as designed;

2. The loading rack is equipped with a vapor collection
and control system designed to minimize emissions of vapors
displaced from the gasoline cargo tank during product loading;
and

3. The loading rack vapor collection and control system is
designed and operated to prevent any vapors collected at the
loading rack from passing to another loading rack.

Specific Authority 403.061 FS. L aw Implemented 403.031, 403.061,
403.087 FS. History—New .

62-296.509 Bulk Gasoline Plants.

Specific Authority 403.061 FS. Law Implemented 403.021, 403.031,
403061, 403087 FS. History—Formerly  17-2.650(1)(f)9.,
17-296.509, Repealed .

NAME OF PERSON ORIGINATING PROPOSED RULE:
Larry George

NAME OF SUPERVISOR OR PERSON WHO APPROVED
THE PROPOSED RULE: Joseph Kahn

DATE PROPOSED RULE APPROVED BY AGENCY
HEAD: February 28, 2007

DATE NOTICE OF PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT
PUBLISHED IN FAW: January 12, 2007

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH

RULE NOS.: RULE TITLES:

64-3.010 Definitions

64-3.020 Eligibility Criteriafor Special Needs
Shelters

64-3.030 Guidelines for Special Needs Shelter
Staffing Levels

64-3.040 Definition of Special Needs Shelter
Supplies and Equipment

64-3.050 Specia Needs Shelter Registration

64-3.060 Addressing the Needs of Families

64-3.070 Pre-event Planning Activities

64-3.080 Service Reimbursement

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The purpose of the proposed ruleis
to implement Section 381.0303(3) and Section 381.0303(6),
FS. The statute establishes requirements for definitions,
guidelines and standards related to persons with special needs,
the registration process for persons with specia needs, and
specia needs shelters.

SUMMARY: The proposed new rule defines a person with
special needs including eligibility criteria for access to the
special needs shelter. The rule identifies the service
environment and the type of service the person with special
needs should expect. The rule provides scalable guidelines for
special need shelter staffing. The rule defines special needs



Florida Administrative Weekly

Volume 33, Number 11, March 16, 2007

shelter and equipment and the responsibility of the person with
specia needs or hisor her home medical equipment provider to
ensure that his or her own life-sustaining or life-supporting
equipment is brought to the special needs shelter. The rule
specifies the registration information that should be gathered
on al persons with special needs, which will be used for
pre-event planning. The rule aso specifies that the local
emergency management and county health department share
this information to determine appropriate placement for
sheltering. Information from the unregistered person with
specia needs is gathered upon his or her arrival at the shelter.
The rule makes allowances for families to shelter together. The
rule requires the county health department to invite local health
and medical stakeholders to participate in special needs shelter
planning. The rule establishes how the health care practitioner
and facilities may apply for reimbursement.

SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF ESTIMATED
REGULATORY COST: No Statement of Estimated Regulatory
Cost was prepared.

Any person who wishes to provide information regarding a
statement of estimated regulatory costs, or provide a proposal
for a lower cost regulatory alternative must do so in writing
within 21 days of this notice.

SPECIFIC AUTHORITY: 381.0303(3), (6) FS.

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 381.0303(3), (6) FS.

IF REQUESTED WITHIN 21 DAYS OF THE DATE OF
THIS NOTICE, A HEARING WILL BE HELD AT THE
DATE, TIME AND PLACE SHOWN BELOW:

DATE AND TIME: April 11, 2007, 9:00 am. — 12:00 p.m.
PLACE: Building 4040, Room 301, 4040 Esplanade Way,
Tallahassee, FL 32399-7000

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 7 days before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: Christie Brown, 4052 Bald Cypress Way, Bin C27,
Tallahassee, FL 32399-1711, Phone Number: (850)245-4444,
Extension: 3871 If you are hearing or speech impaired, please
contact the agency using the Florida Relay Service,
1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice).

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULES IS: Christie Brown, 4052 Bald Cypress
Way, Bin C27, Talahassee, FL 32399-1711, Phone Number:
(850)245-4444, Extension: 3871

THE FULL TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULESIS:

64-3.010 Definitions.

(1) A person with special needs is someone, who during
periods of evacuation or emergency. requires sheltering
assistance, due to physical impairment, mental impairment,
cognitive impairment, or sensory disabilities, that exceeds the
basic level of care provided at a general population shelter, but

does not require the level of care provided at a skilled medical
facility. A person with special needsis not a person residing in
a facility required by state law to have an evacuation and
emergency management plan for natural and man-made
disasters.

(2) A caregiver is an individual who is familiar with the
care requirements of the person with special needs, is capable
of providing the level of care necessary to maintain the health
of the person with special needs and has been identified by the
person with special needs to be his or her caregiver.

(3) Special needs shelters are locations that are, in whole
or in part, designated in pre-event planning activities as refuges
that provide shelter to persons with special needs who have no
other option for sheltering. These shelters have back-up
generator power. Special needs shelter services are provided in
an_austere environment, with the intent of minimizing
deterioration of pre-disaster levels of health.

Specific _Authority 381.0303(6)(a)
381.0303(6)(a) FS. History—New

FS. Law Implemented

64-3.020 Eligibility Criteriafor Special Needs Shelters.

(1) A person shall be eligible for access to a special needs
shelter if they are a person with special needs.

(2) Special needs shelters may choose to accept persons
with care needs that exceed the criteria stated in subsection
64-3.010(1), F.A.C.

(3) Determination as to the capacity (either in skills or
assets) of the special needs shelter is made by the local
emergency management agency and the county health
department or their designees.

(4) Every reasonable effort shall be made to avoid
admitting a person with a known communicable condition or a
condition that reguires airborne precautions.

Specific Authority 381.0303(6)(a) FS. Law Implemented
381.0303(6)(a) FS. History—New

64-3.030 Guidelines for Special Needs Shelter Staffing
Levels.

(1) The following is a guideline for special needs shelter
staffing:

(@) Each special needs shelter should be staffed at a
minimum with one registered nurse or advanced registered
nurse practitioner on every shift during the sheltering event.

(b) The special needs shelter may be additionally staffed
with one licensed medical practitioner per 20 persons with
special needs per shift during the sheltering event.

(c) The special needs shelter may be additionally staffed
with one unlicensed person per 20 persons with special needs
per shift during the sheltering event.

(2) Saffing levels may reguire adjustment as the
sheltering event warrants. Variables may include the stage of
the sheltering event, acuity of the persons with special needs,
presence of caregivers, or availability of volunteers.

Section I - Proposed Rules 1291



Florida Administrative Weekly

Volume 33, Number 11, March 16, 2007

Specific Authority 381.0303(6)(c) FS. Law Implemented
381.0303(6)(c) FS. History—New

64-3.040 Definition of Special Needs Shelter Supplies and
Equipment.

(1) Special needs shelter supplies and equipment are the
items necessary to provide services in a special needs shelter
during an evacuation or emergency to minimize deterioration
of the person’s pre-disaster levels of health.

(2) The Depatment of Headth maintains a list of
recommended special needs shelter supplies and equipment.
The list may be requested from the Department of Health,
Office of Public Health Nursing, 4052 Bald Cypress Way, Bin
#C27, Tallahassee, FL 32399-1711.

(3) The person with special needs or his or her home
medical equipment provider will be required to ensure all life
sustaining or life supporting equipment is available at the
special needs shelter in accordance with Section 400.925(13)
and Section 400.934(20)(a)1., ES.

Specific Authority 381.0303(6)(d) FS. Law Implemented
381.0303(6)(d) FS. History—New

64-3.050 Special Needs Shelter Registration.

(1) The entity registering a person with special needs for
access to the special needs shelter will gather information on
the person with special needs. The information items gathered
will be used for pre-event planning and will include but not be
limited to the following:

(a) Full name.

(b) Phone number and street address including the city and
Zip code.

(e) Height and weight.

(f) Primary language.

() Emergency contact information for a local and
non-local emergency point of contact including the name,
relationship, and phone number.

(h) Residence type and living situation, whether alone or
with arelative or caregiver.

(i) Any type of medical dependence on electricity, such as
oxygen concentrator, nebulizer, feeding pump, continuous
positive airway pressure equipment, suction equipment, or
medication requiring refrigeration.

() Any type of medical dependence on oxygen. including
the type, rate, and mode of administration.

(k) Any assistance required with medications.

() _Any cognitive impairment, mental health problems,

(n) Any mobility impairment and any related assistive
device.

(0) Any use of atrained service animal.

(p) Any type of incontinence.

(q) Any dependence on dialysis.

(r) Name and contact information for any other medical
support providers, such as home health agency, hospice, nurse
registry, home medical equipment provider, and dialysis center.

(s) A list of all medical conditions.

(t) A list of all medications.

(u) Any transportation needs.

(2) The reqistry application information of all persons with
special needs will be provided to the county health department
or the agency with the responsibility for the management of
care in the special needs shelter at pre-determined intervals
established jointly by the county emergency management
agency and the county health department or the agency with
the responsibility for the management of care in the special
needs shelter.

(3) The county health department or the agency with the
responsibility for the management of care in the special needs
shelter will review the registry application information to
determine if the applicant is appropriate to place in the special
needs shelter during an evacuation or emergency. The county
emergency management agency will be notified of the
determination.

(4) The application information of all persons with special
needs who are on the county emergency management agency’s
special needs shelter list will be provided to the county health
department or the agency with the responsibility for the
management of care in the special needs shelter immediately
prior to a sheltering event.

(5) Persons with special needs who are unregistered, but
who arrive at the special needs shelter during a sheltering
event, will be assessed at the activated special needs shelter
point of intake, and assessed for appropriate shelter placement.

Specific  Authority 381.0303(6)(€)
381.0303(6)(€e) FS. History—New

FS. Law Implemented

64-3.060 Addressing the Needs of Families.

(1) The caregiver of a person with special needs who is
eligible for admission to a special needs shelter, and all persons
for whom he or she is the caregiver, will be allowed to shelter
together in the special needs shelter.

(2) A person with special needs, who is also responsible
for the care of individuals without specia needs, will be

psychiatric, or personality disorder such as Alzheimer's

alowed to shelter in the special needs shelter with the persons

disease, dementia, obsessive compulsive disorder, autism,
conduct disorder, anxiety, or depression.

(m) Any sensory loss or impairment and any related
assistive device.

1292 Section Il - Proposed Rules

for whom he or sheisthe careqgiver.

Specific  Authority  381.0303(6)(f)
381.0303(6)(f) FS. History—New

FS. lLaw Implemented




Florida Administrative Weekly

Volume 33, Number 11, March 16, 2007

64-3.070 Pre-event Planning Activities.

The local emergency management agency will be the lead
agency in the coordination of integrated and comprehensive
special needs shelter planning in cooperation with county
health department, or locally designated ESF 8 Heath and
Medical lead agency, consistent with Appendix 8 (Health and
Medical Services) of the State Comprehensive Emergency
Management Plan. This planning process will seek to include,
but not be limited to, the participation of Children’s Medical
Services, hospitals, nursing homes, assisted living facilities,
home health agencies, hospice providers, nurse registries,
home medical equipment providers, oxygen providers, dialysis
centers, and other health and medical emergency preparedness
stakeholders in the pre-event planning activities to enhance the
safety and well-being of persons with special needs before,
during, and after a disaster.

Specific  Authority 381.0303(6)(q)
381.0303(6)(q) FS. History—New

FS. Law Implemented

64-3.080 Service Reimbursement.

(1) Health care practitioners shall make reimbursement
reguests for services rendered under Section 381.0303(3)(a)1.
consistent with Section 381.0303(3)(b), F.S. using the DOH
form # DH 1989, 12/06, “Vendor Invoice for Special Needs
Health Care Practitioner”, which is incorporated by reference.
This document is available from the Department of Health,
Bureau of Finance and Accounting, 4052 Bald Cypress Way,
Bin # B01, Tallahassee, FL 32399-1729.

(2) Vendors shall make reimbursement requests for
services rendered under Section 381.0303(3)(a)2. consistent
with Section 381.0303(3)(b), F.S., using DOH form # DH
1990, 12/06, “Vendor Invoice for Services Rendered to Special
Needs Clients Placed by the Multiagency Special Needs
Shelter Discharge Planning Team”, which is incorporated by
reference. This document is available from the Department of
Health, Bureau of Finance and Accounting, 4052 Bald Cypress
Way, Bin #B01, Tallahassee, FL 32399-1729. Reimbursement
shall be at the Medicaid rate in effect the date the service, for
which reimbursement is requested by the vendor, is rendered.

Specific Authority 381.0303(3)(a)2., 381.0303(6)(b) FS. Law
Implemented 381.0303(3)(a)2., 381.0303(3)(b), 381.0303(6)(b) FS.
History—New .

NAME OF PERSON ORIGINATING PROPOSED RULE:
Christie Brown, R.N., Registered Nursing Consultant, Office
of Public Health Nursing, Department of Health

NAME OF SUPERVISOR OR PERSON WHO APPROVED
THE PROPOSED RULE: Sandra Schoenfisch, R.N., Ph.D.,
Acting Director, Office of Public Health Nursing, Department
of Hedlth

DATE PROPOSED RULE APPROVED BY AGENCY
HEAD: February 27, 2007

DATE NOTICE OF PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT
PUBLISHED IN FAW: November 3, 2006

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH
Board of M assage
RULE NO.:
64B7-28.010

RULE TITLE:

Requirements for Board Approval of
Continuing Education Programs

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: Approval of continuing education

programs.

SUMMARY: Includes approval of designated association

sponsored programs.

SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF ESTIMATED

REGULATORY COST: No Statement of Estimated Regulatory

Cost was prepared.

Any person who wishes to provide information regarding a

statement of estimated regulatory costs, or provide a proposal

for a lower cost regulatory alternative must do so in writing

within 21 days of this notice.

SPECIFIC AUTHORITY: 456.013(8), (9),

456.036, 480.035(7), 480.0415 FS.

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 456.013(8), (9), 456.025(7), 456.036,

480.041 FS.

IF REQUESTED WITHIN 21 DAYS OF THE DATE OF

THIS NOTICE, A HEARING WILL BE SCHEDULED AND

ANNOUNCED IN THE FAW.

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE

PROPOSED RULE IS: Pamela E. King, Executive Director,

Board of Massage Therapy, 4052 Bald Cypress Way, Bin CO06,

Tallahassee, Florida 32399

456.025(7),

THE FULL TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE IS

64B7-28.010 Requirements for
Continuing Education Programs

(2) through (8) No change.

(9) The following courses, that meet the criteria for
approval under this section, are approved by the Board:

(a) Organized and accepted courses of study offered by
providers approved by the National Certification Board for
Therapeutic Massage and Bodywork; ane

(b) Organized courses offered by a Board Approved
Massage School;-

(c) Continuing education courses offered by or sponsored
by the Florida Board of Massage Therapy:-

(d) Continuing education courses sponsored by the Florida
State Massage Therapy Association; and

(e) Continuing education courses sponsored by the
American Massage Therapy Association or the American
Massage Therapy Association Florida Chapter.

Board Approva of

Section I - Proposed Rules 1293



Florida Administrative Weekly

Volume 33, Number 11, March 16, 2007

Specific Authority 456.013(8), (9), 456.036, 480.035(7), 480.0415
FS. Law Implemented 456.013(8), (9), 456.025(7), 456.036, 480.0415
FS History—New 4-21-86, Amended 9-14-87, 8-29-88, 2-8-89,
3-12-90, 1-3-91, Formerly 21L.-28.010, Amended 9-30-93, 8-16-94,
6-12-97, Formerly 61G11-28.010, Amended 2-18-98, 10-26-98,
9-20-99, 11-4-99, 11-21-02, 10-12-03, 12-13-05, 7-5-06,

NAME OF PERSON ORIGINATING PROPOSED RULE:
Board of Massage Therapy

NAME OF SUPERVISOR OR PERSON WHO APPROVED
THE PROPOSED RULE: Board of Massage Therapy

DATE PROPOSED RULE APPROVED BY AGENCY
HEAD: January 18, 2007

DATE NOTICE OF PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT
PUBLISHED IN FAW: February 16, 2007

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH

Council of Medical Physicists

RULE NO.: RULETITLE:

64B23-4.001 Continuing Education Requirements
PURPOSE AND EFFECT: To update therule

SUMMARY: The rule is amended to state the continuing
education requirements in plain English including one hour
relating to the transmission and prevention of HIV/AIDS.
SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF ESTIMATED
REGULATORY COST: No Statement of Estimated Regul atory
Cost was prepared.

Any person who wishes to provide information regarding a
statement of estimated regulatory costs, or provide a proposal
for a lower cost regulatory alternative must do so in writing
within 21 days of this notice.

SPECIFIC AUTHORITY: 456.013, 483.901(6)(a) FS.

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 456.013, 483.901(6)(a) FS.

IF REQUESTED WITHIN 21 DAYS OF THE DATE OF
THIS NOTICE, A HEARING WILL BE SCHEDULED AND
ANNOUNCED IN THE FAW.

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULE IS: Joe Baker, Executive Director, 4052
Bald Cypress Way, Bin #C06, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-3250

THE FULL TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULEIS:

64B23-4.001 Continuing Education Reguirements.

(1) The Ferthe—purpese—ef—renewing—or+reactvatng—a
Heense—the licensee must complete demenstrate—to—the
Department—that—he—er—she—participated—n at least 24

twenty-four—(24} hours of approved continuing education,
including 1 hour relating to the transmission and prevention of

HIV/AIDS and 2 ef-which-twe{2) hours must-be-r-a-course
relating to the prevention of medical errors for renewal or

reactivation of the license pursuant—te—thereguirements—of
Section-456:013Heorida-Statutes.

(2) through (3) No change.

1294 Section Il - Proposed Rules

Specific Authority 456.013, 483.901(6)(a) FS. Law Implemented
381.0034, 456.013, 483. 901(6)(a) FS. History-New 6-21-99,
Amended 8-21-02

NAME OF PERSON ORIGINATING PROPOSED RULE:
Joe Baker

NAME OF SUPERVISOR OR PERSON WHO APPROVED
THE PROPOSED RULE: Lucy Gee

DATE PROPOSED RULE APPROVED BY AGENCY
HEAD: January 11, 2007

DATE NOTICE OF PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT
PUBLISHED IN FAW: January 26, 2007

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH

Council of Medical Physicists

RULE NO.: RULETITLE:

64B23-6.001 Penalty Guidelines

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: To update therule.

SUMMARY: Disciplinary penalty guidelines are provided for
all violations of the practice act and violations of the applicable
portions of Section 456.072, Florida Statutes.

SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF ESTIMATED
REGULATORY COST: No Statement of Estimated Regulatory
Cost was prepared.

Any person who wishes to provide information regarding a
statement of estimated regulatory costs, or provide a proposal
for a lower cost regulatory alternative must do so in writing
within 21 days of this notice.

SPECIFIC AUTHORITY: 456.079(1), 483.901(6)(a) FS.

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 456.072, 456.079, 483.901(6)(a) FS.
IF REQUESTED WITHIN 21 DAYS OF THE DATE OF
THIS NOTICE, A HEARING WILL BE SCHEDULED AND
ANNOUNCED IN THE FAW.

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULE IS: Joe Baker, Executive Director, MQA,
4052 Bald Cypress Way, Bin #C06, Tallahassee, Florida
32399-3250

THE FULL TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE IS

64B23-6.001 Penalty Guidelines Penalties.




Florida Administrative Weekly

Volume 33, Number 11, March 16, 2007

(12 Unless mitigating or aggravating factors are present,
demeonstrated when the Department finds an applicant or
licensee whom it regulates under Chapter 483, Part IV, F.S,,
has committed any of the acts set forth in Section 483.901(6),
F.S., it shal issue a final order imposing appropriate penaties
based on the severity and repetition of the violation efferse
within the ranges recommended in the following disciplinary
guidelines:: The identification of violations is descriptive only:

the violation is for fraud or making a false or fraudulent
representation, the Department shall impose a fine of $10,000
per count or offense.

(8 Section 483.901(6)(g)l. or 456.072(1)(h), ES.:
Attempting to obtain, obtaining or renewing a license to
practice medical physics by bribery, by fraudulent
misrepresentation, or through an error of the Department.
Bribery — from a minimum fine of $500 and/or up to two years
of probation to a maximum of revocation. For a second or
subsequent violation, revocation and a maximum fine of
$10,000.

Fraudulent misrepresentation — from six months probation and
a fine of $10,000 to a maximum of revocation and a fine of
$10,000. For a second or subsequent violation, revocation and
afine of $10,000.

Department error — from a letter of concern and/or a fine of
$500, up to a maximum of suspension of license for one year,
followed by two years of probation, and a fine of $5,000. For a
second or subsequent violation, from a minimum fine of
$5,000 to revocation. Hr—the—ease—of—an—apphicant—the
Bepartment—shaHl—deny—the—appHeation—n—thecase—ofa

(b) Section 483.901(6)(g)2. or 456.072(1)(f), ES.: Having
a license to practice medical physics revoked, suspended, or
otherwise acted against, including the denial of licensure, by
the licensing authority of another state, territory, or country —
action consistent with the penalty guidelines for the violation
had the violation occurred in the State of Florida. For a second
or_subseguent violation, action consistent with the penalty
deellnes for a repeat violation had it occurred in Florida.

(c) Section 483.901(6)(g)3. or 456.072(1)(c), ES.: Being
convicted or found guilty, regardless of adjudication, of a
crime in any jurisdiction which is directly related to the
practice of medical physics or the ability to practice medical
physics — from a minimum fine of $1,500 and six months
probation to a maximum fine of $5,000 and/or revocation. For

the full language of each statutory provision cited must be

asecond or subsequent violation, from a minimum of one year

considered in order to determine the conduct included. For all

of probation up to a maximum fine of $10,000 and/or

persons subject to this rule, conditions of probation may be
required following any period of suspension of the license. All
listed violations provide sufficient grounds for denying a
licensure application. A finding of financial benefit or self-gain
related to the violation is grounds for requiring the subject to
refund fees billed and collected from a patient or third party in
addition to any other appropriate penalties. In addition to any
other discipline imposed, the Department shall assess the
actual costs related to the investigation and prosecution of a
case. In addition to or in lieu of the penalties provided herein, if

revocatlon of license. mieheeaseef—a+reensee,—ﬂqe49epaﬁmeﬂt

456.072(1)(g) _or
456.072(1)(1), E.S.: Willful filing of afalse report or impeding

(d) Section 483.901(6)(q)4. or

and/or inducing another to file afalse report — from a minimum
fine of $3,000 and/or suspension of license for three months

Section I - Proposed Rules 1295



Florida Administrative Weekly

Volume 33, Number 11, March 16, 2007

followed by six months probation up to a maximum of
revocation and/or afine of $7,500. For a second or subsequent

(i) Section 483.901(6)(g)9. or 456.072(1)(p). ES.
Delegating professiona responsibilities to a person when the

violation, up to a maximum fine of $10,000 and/or revocation.

delegating licensee knows or _has reason to know that such

(e)d) Section 483.901(6)(g)5. or 456.072(1)(a), E.S.
Advertising or otherwise making representations in a manner
which isfalse, deceptive or misleading — from a minimum fine
of $1,000 and areprimand up to a maximum fine of $7,500 and
one year of probation. For a second violation, from a minimum
fine of $2,500 and/or one year of probation to a maximum fine
of $10,000 and/or six months suspension of license. For athird

violation, afine of up to $10,000 and/or one year of suspension
followed by two years probation up to a maximum fine of

$10,000 and/or revocatlon iFhe—Depatheqt—shaH—kmpese—a

person is not qualified by training, experience or licensure to
perform them — from a minimum fine of $1,500 and/or six
months of probation up to a maximum fine of $5,000 and
suspension of license for two years followed by up to three
years of probation. For a second or subsegquent violation, from
a minimum fine of $3,000 and/or suspension of license for six
months followed by one year of probation up to a maximum

fine of $10 000 and/or revocation. M—akmguer—ﬁerg&FepeFtreF

(f) Section 483.901(6)(g)6. or 456.072(1)(i), ES.: Failing
to report to the Department any person the licensee knows to
be in violation of Chapter 456 or 483, Part IV, F.S,, or therules
of the Department —from a minimum letter of concern and/or a
fine of $500 up to amaximum fine of $1,000 and/or six months
of probation. For a second or subsequent violation, a minimum
of six months of probation and/or a fine of $2,000 to a
maX|mum fine of $7, 500 and/or revocation. ZFhe—Depathem

(@ Sectlon 483 901(6)(0)7 or 456. O72(1)(k) ES. Faulmq
to perform any statutory or legal obligation placed upon a
licensee — from aminimum fine of $500 and aletter of concern
up to a maximum fine of $7,500 and/or two years of
suspension followed by two years of probation. For a second
violation, from a minimum fine of $2,500 and six months of
probation up to a maximum fine of $10,000 and/or revocation.
For a third or subsequent violation, up to a fine of $10,000
and/or revocation.

(h){g) Section 483.901(6)(9)8. or 456.072(1)(j), F.S.
Aiding, assisting, procuring, permitting or advising any
unlicensed person to practice medical physics contrary to
Chapter 483, Part |1V, F.S., or the rules of the Department —
from a minimum $3,500 fine and/or one year of suspension
followed by probation to afine of $7,500 and/or revocation of
license. For a second or subsequent violation, from a fine of

$5.000 up to a maximum fine of $10,000 and/or revocation.

1296 Section Il - Proposed Rules

(j) Section 483.901(6)(9)10. or 456.072(1)(0), ES.
Practicing or offering to practice beyond the scope permitted
by law or accepting and performing professional
responsibilities which the licensee has reason to know that the
licensee is not competent to perform — from a minimum fine of
$1,000 and/or one year of probation up to a maximum fine of
$5.000 and/or two years of probation. For a second or
subsequent violation, from a minimum fine of $2,500 and two
years of probation up to a maximum fine of $8,000 and/or

revocation. Paymg—er—reeewmg—any—eemn%ssen—benus

(k) Section 483.901(6)(g)11. FS.: Gross or repeated

mal practice or the failure to practice medical physics at alevel
of care, skill, and treatment which is recognized by a
reasonably prudent medical physicist as being acceptable
under similar conditions and circumstances — from a minimum
fine of $1,000 up to a maximum fine of $10,000 and/or
revocation. For a second or subsequent violation, from a
minimum fine of $5,000 up to a maximum fine of $10,000 and
or revocation.

(1) Section 483.901(6)(g)12. ES.: Judicially determined
mental _incompetency — from a minimum of voluntary
relinquishment of license pending a judicial determination or
suspension until a judicial determination that competency to
practice has been restored to revocation.




Florida Administrative Weekly

Volume 33, Number 11, March 16, 2007

(m) Section 483.901(6)(0)13. or 456.072(1)(z). ES.
Practicing medical physics without reasonable skill and safety
by reason of illness, or use of acohol, drugs, narcotic,
chemicals or any other type of material or as a result of any
mental or physical condition —from a minimum of areferral to
a Department approved impaired practitioner program or the
Professionals Resource Network (PRN) for evaluation and/or
treatment and two years of probation to a maximum of
suspension of license until determined safe to practice
followed by up to five years of probation. For a second or
subsequent violation, from a $750 fine, referral to PRN, and a
minimum of two years probation to revocation.

(n) Section 483.901(6)(g)14. or 456.072(1)(b) or
456.072(1)(dd), FES.: Violating any provision of chapter 483,
Part IV, ES. or chapter 456, or any rules adopted pursuant
thereto — from a minimum fine of $1,000 and/or a reprimand
up to a maximum fine of $5,000 and/or suspension of license
for two years followed by two years of probation. For a second
violation, from a minimum fine of $5,000 and/or two years of
probation up to a maximum fine of $10,000 and/or revocation.
For a third or subseguent violation, from a minimum fine of
$7.500 and/or six months of suspension followed by two years
of probation up to a maximum fine of $10,000 and/or
revocation.

(o)) Section 456.072(1)(m), ES.: Making misleading,
deceptive, untrue or fraudulent representations in the practice
of medical physics or employing a trick or scheme in the
practice of medical physics when such scheme or trick failsto
conform to the generally prevailing standards of treatment in
the community —from a minimum six months of probationto a
maximum suspension of license for one year followed by two
years of probation and a $10,000 fine per count or violation.
For a second or subsequent violation, from a minimum of two
years of probation to revocation and a fine of $10,000 per

count or violation. iFhe—Depatheﬂt—shaH—i-mpese—a—peﬂaHy

(g) Section 456.072(1)(q), F.S.: Violating alawfully issued
order or subpoena — from a minimum fine of $1,000 and a
letter of concern to a maximum fine of $8,000 and suspension
of license for up to two years followed by two years of
probation. For a second or subsequent violation, from a
minimum fine of $2,000 and/or two years of probation to afine

of $10 000 and revocatlon GFes&eFFepeated—md-pFaeHeeer

() Section 456.072(1)(r), ES.: Interfering with an
investigation, inspection, or disciplinary proceeding — from a
minimum fine of $800 and/or one year of probation to a
maximum fine of $10,000 and/or revocation. For a second or
subsequent violation, a minimum fine of $2,500 and two years
Drobatlon to a maximum fme of $10, OOO and/or revocation.

om-$

L[_))(—H) Section 456 072( 1)( n), F.S.: ExerC|S| ng |an uence on
the patient or client in such a manner asto exploit the patient or
client for financial gain of the licensee or of a third party —
from a minimum fine of $1,000 and/or one year of probation to
amaximum fine of $10,000 and/or revocation. For a second or
subsequent violation, from a minimum two years probation
and afine of $2, 500 to afine of $10,000 and/or revocanon The

(S) Section 456.072(1)(€), ES.: Failing to comply with the
educational course requirements of HIV/AIDS — from
providing proof of compliance and a minimum fine of $500
and aletter of concern to a maximum fine of $1,500 and up to
three years of probation. For a second or subsequent violation,
from a minimum fine of $1,000 to a maximum fine of $5,000

and up to three months of susoens on fol Iowed by two years of

Section I - Proposed Rules 1297



Florida Administrative Weekly

Volume 33, Number 11, March 16, 2007

(t) Section 456.072(1)(t), F.S.: Failing to identify to a

medically unnecessary or unrelated to patient’s condition —

patient not in certain facilities that the practitioner is licensed

from aminimum fine of $1,000 and areprimand to a maximum

as a medical physicist — from a letter of apology and/or a

fine of $9,000 and/or three months suspension followed by two

minimum fine of $250 to a maximum fine of $500 and/or six

years probation. For a second or subsequent violation, from a

months probation. For a second or subsequent violation, from a

minimum fine of $5,000 and a year of probation to a fine of

fine of $500 and a reprimand to a fine of $1,000 and/or up to

one year Drobat|on Ddeg%ag—pre#e&enal—mensb#m%te

(u) Section 456.072(1)(v), F.S.: Engaging or attempting to
engage in sexual misconduct —from areprimand and/or fine of
$1,000 to a maximum fine of $10,000 and referral for

$10 000 and/or revocanon Ddeg%ﬂg—e#een#aetmg—ter—the

(y) Section 456.072(1)(ee) or

456.072(2)(ff), ES.
Intentionally submitting an “upcoded” bill or claim or abill or

evaluation and assistance and/or revocation. For a second or

claim for payment of services not rendered — from

subsequent violation, from a fine of $5.000, referral for

reimbursement and a fine of $1.000 and/or a year of probation

evaluation and/or six months suspension followed by one year

to amaximum fine of $10,000 and/or revocation. For a second

of Drobatlon to a fine of $10 000 and revocation. Geﬂqemﬂg

(v) Section 456.072(1)(x), F.S.. Failing to report a

or subsequent offense, afine of $2,000 and a year of probation
to a maX| mum fine of $10 OOO and/or revocatlon mereperl—y

(2) Section 456.072(1)(hh), F.S.: Being terminated from a
treatment program for impaired practitioners without good

conviction or plea, regardless of adjudication, within 30 days—
from a minimum letter of concern and/or fine of $250 to a

cause- from suspension of license until determined safe to
practice and/or reinstatement in the program to revocation.

maximum fine of $3,000 and/or up to two years of probation.

The same penalty would apply for a second or subsequent

For a second or subsequent violation, a reprimand and fine of

violation.

$500 up to a maximum fine of $5,000 and three months
susnens on foIIowed bv two vears Drobatlon Fraud—deceit-or

(w) Section 456.072(1)(aa), F.S.: Testing positive for any
drug on any preemployment or employer-ordered drug
screening — from a minimum of a referral to a Department
approved impaired practitioner program or PRN for evaluation
and treatment and two years of probation to a maximum of
suspension of license until determined safe to practice
followed by up to five years of probation. For a second or
subsequent violation, from a $750 fine, referral to PRN, and a
m|n|mum of two years probation to revocatlon PFaeHei-Hg—eF

(X) Section 456.072(1)(bb), ES.: Performing or preparing

for or attempting services on the wrong patient, wrong site,
wrong procedure, or an unauthorized procedure or one that is

1298 Section Il - Proposed Rules

(2) Any or al of the following conditions may be imposed
as terms of probation:

(8) Restitution of the costs of probation.

(b) Restitution to patient(s) or third party payor(s).

(c) Affidavit of understanding laws and rules.

(d) Department access to all business records.

(e) Continuing education classes beyond those required for
biennial renewal.

(f) Attendance or participation in specific training and/or
Classes.

(0) Direct or indirect
Department-approved monitor.

(h) Restitutions on practice.

(i) Submission of reports by licensee, monitor, and or
supervisor or employer at a frequency determined by the
Department.

(1) Community service.

(k) Urine, blood, and hair testing.

(1) Other appropriate conditions related to the committed
violation.

supervision by a




Florida Administrative Weekly

Volume 33, Number 11, March 16, 2007

Specific Authority 456.079(1), 483.901(6)(a) FS. Law Implemented
456.072, 456.079, 483.901(6)(a) FS. History—New 7-15-99,
Amended .

NAME OF PERSON ORIGINATING PROPOSED RULE:
Joe Baker

NAME OF SUPERVISOR OR PERSON WHO APPROVED
THE PROPOSED RULE: Lucy Gee

DATE PROPOSED RULE APPROVED BY AGENCY
HEAD: February 2, 2007

DATE NOTICE OF PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT
PUBLISHED IN FAW: January 26, 2007

DEPARTMENT OF FINANCIAL SERVICES
Division of Insurance Agents and Agency Services

RULE NO.: RULETITLE:
69B-211.320 Curriculum Standards for Special
Designation

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The rule adds Professional
Property Insurance Adjuster (PPIA) and Certified Claims
Adjuster (CCA) as specia designations for curriculum
standards as established by the rule in accordance with the new
legidation.

SUMMARY: The PPIA and CCA designations are added to the
existing Accredited Claims Adjuster (ACA) and Professional
Claims Adjuster (PCA) designations which relieve an
insurance adjuster applicant of the examination requirement
imposed by Section 626.221, Florida Statutes.

SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF ESTIMATED
REGULATORY COST: No Statement of Estimated Regulatory
Cost was prepared.

Any person who wishes to provide information regarding a
statement of estimated regulatory costs, or provide a proposal
for a lower cost regulatory alternative must do so in writing
within 21 days of this notice.

SPECIFIC AUTHORITY: 626.221 FS.

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 626.221 FS.

IF REQUESTED WITHIN 21 DAYS OF THE DATE OF
THIS NOTICE, A HEARING WILL BE HELD AT THE
DATE, TIME AND PLACE SHOWN BELOW (IF NOT
REQUESTED, THISHEARING WILL NOT BE HELD):
DATE AND TIME: Friday, April 13, 2007, 9:30 am.

PLACE: 142 Larson Building, 200 East Gaines Street,
Tallahassee, Florida

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 5 days before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: Hazel Muhammad, (850)413-5460. If you are
hearing or speech impaired, please contact the agency using the
Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or
1(800)955-8770 (Voice).

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULE IS: Hazel Muhammad, Chief, Bureau of
Licensing, Divison of Agent and Agency Services,
Department of Financial Services, 200 East Gaines Street,
Tallahassee, Florida 32399-0319, (850)413-5460

THE FULL TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULEIS:

69B-211.320 Curriculum Standards for
Designation.

Pursuant to Section 626.221(1), Florida Statutes, the
Department of Financial Services establishes the following
curriculum standards:

(1) No change.

(2) For designation as an Accredited Claims Adjuster
(ACA), eor Professiona Clams Adjuster (PCA), or
Professional Property Insurance Adjuster (PPIA) from the
HurriClaim Training Academy, or Certified Claims Adjuster
(CCA) from the Association of Property and Casualty Claims
Professionals, the requirement is at |east 40 course hours:

(a) through (b) No change.

Specific Authority 626.221 FS. Law Implemented 626.221 FS.

History—New 11-6-01, Amended 8-7-03, Formerly 4-211.320,
Amended 1-17-05

Specia

NAME OF PERSON ORIGINATING PROPOSED RULE:
Hazel Muhammad, Chief, Bureau of Licensing, Division of
Agent and Agency Services, Department of Financial Services
NAME OF SUPERVISOR OR PERSON WHO APPROVED
THE PROPOSED RULE: Mary Alice Palmer, Director,
Bureau of Licensing, Division of Agent and Agency Services,
Department of Financial Services

DATE PROPOSED RULE APPROVED BY AGENCY
HEAD: December 5, 2006

DATE NOTICE OF PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT
PUBLISHED IN FAW: January 19, 2007

FINANCIAL SERVICES COMMISSION

OIR —Insurance Regulation

RULE NO.: RULETITLE:

690-149.002 Scope and Applicability

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: Rule 690-149.002 is being
amended to adopt the recent National Association of Insurance
Commissioners (NAIC) interstate compact standard for
defining incidental for accelerated death benefits.

SUMMARY: If the cost of an accelerated desth benefit is
incidental, less than 10% of the cost of the contract as awhole,
the accelerated rider would not be subject to the heath
standards. These include such riders as accelerated long-term
care and accelerated death benefits due to heart or other critical
conditions. The standard provides for the formulato be used to
meet the test.

Section I - Proposed Rules 1299



Florida Administrative Weekly

Volume 33, Number 11, March 16, 2007

SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF ESTIMATED
REGULATORY COST: No Statement of Estimated Regulatory
Cost was prepared.

Any person who wishes to provide information regarding a
statement of estimated regulatory costs, or provide a proposal
for a lower cost regulatory alternative must do so in writing
within 21 days of this notice.

SPECIFIC AUTHORITY: 624.308(1), 627.410(6)(b) FS.

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 624.307(1), 627.402, 627.410(1), (2),
(6), (7), 627.411(2)(e), (2), 627.6515(2)(a), 627.6699 FS.

IF REQUESTED WITHIN 21 DAYS OF THE DATE OF
THIS NOTICE, A HEARING WILL BE HELD AT THE
DATE, TIME AND PLACE SHOWN BELOW (IF NOT
REQUESTED, THISHEARING WILL NOT BE HELD):
DATE AND TIME: April 11, 2007, 9:30 am.

PLACE: Room 142, Larson Building, 200 East Gaines Street,
Tallahassee, Florida

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 5 calendar days before the workshop/meeting
by contacting: Tracie Lambright, Life and Health Product
Review, Office of Insurance Regulation, E-mail:
Tracie.Lambright@fldfs.com. If you are hearing or speech
impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida Relay
Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice).
THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULE IS: Tracie Lambright, Life and Health
Product Review, Office of Insurance Regulation, E-mail:
Tracie.Lambright@fldfs.com

THE FULL TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE IS

690-149.002 Scope and Applicahility.

(2) through (5) No change.

(6) Pursuant to the provisions of Section 627.410(6)(b),
F.S.,, rate filings required by Rule 690-149.003, FA.C. and
ARC filings required by Rule 690-149.007, F.A.C., are not
required to be made fer—thefeltewing; however, the rating
standards contained in this Part | and applicable statutes shall
continue to apply as if the rate schedules were required to be
filed for approval:

(@% Annualy rated group health insurance policies as
defined by Section 627.652(1), F.S., including blanket
insurance as defined by Section 627.659, F.S,, issued in this
state that provide availability of coverage only to groups with
51 or more employees/members.

(b)2 This filing exemption does not apply to franchise
policiesissued pursuant to Section 627.663, F.S.

(€)3- This filing exemption does not apply to stop-loss
policy forms, unless the policy is issued only to employers
with 51 or more employees.

1300 Section |l - Proposed Rules

(7)(a)}fb}E Forms that provide for the acceleration of the
benefits of a life insurance policy that are is incidental to the
total life insurance coverage are not subject to the annual rate
or ARC filing requirements of Section 627.410, FE.S., or these
rules. The insurer is required to submit an actuarial
demonstration with theinitial filing for approval demonstrating
such incidental compliance.

(b)2 The acceleration is considered incidental if the value
of the accelerated benefit is less than 10 percent of the total
value of the benefits provided by the life insurance coverage.
These values shall be measured as—a: tFhe present values of
the benefits determined as of the date of issue, determined
according to the formula (NSP2-NSP1)/NSP1, applied over a
range of underwriting classes and plans at which the benefit is
being made available, is not in any case greater than 10%,
where::-er

1. NSP1 and NSP2 are determined using an effective
annual interest rate of 6%.

2. NSP1 is the net single premium for the base policy
benefits assuming there is no accelerated death benefit.

3. NSP2 is the net single premium for the base palicy
benefits assuming that the full death benefit is paid at time of
death or the occurrence of the non-death accelerated death
benefit trigger.

(c) If a separate premium or cost of insurance (COI)
charge is the only charge being charged for the accelerated
benefit provided, the ratio of the present value of the
accelerated benefit premiums or COI charges over the life of
the policy to the present value of the policy premiums or COI
charges exclusive of any riders, does not exceed 10%, the
present values shall be determined using an effective annual
interest rate of 6%.

(d) Upon request of the Office, the insurer shall provide an
actuarial _demonstration that the accelerated death benefit
continues to meet these standards. If it is determined that the
accelerated death benefit fails to comply with these standards,
the provisions of these rules shall apply.

Specific Authority 624.308(1), 627.410(6)(b) FS. Law Implemented
624.307(1), 627.402, 627.410(1), (2), (6), (7), 627.411(1)(e), (2),
627.6515(2)(a), 627.6699 FS. History—New 7-1-85, Formerly
4-58.02, 4-58.002, Amended 4-18-94, 4-9-95, 10-27-02, Formerly
4-149.002, Amended 5-18-04

NAME OF PERSON ORIGINATING PROPOSED RULE:
Monica Rutkowski, Director, Life and Health Product Review,
Office of Insurance Regulation

NAME OF SUPERVISOR OR PERSON WHO APPROVED
THE PROPOSED RULE: Rich Robleto, Deputy
Commissioner, Office of Insurance Regulation



Florida Administrative Weekly

Volume 33, Number 11, March 16, 2007

DATE PROPOSED RULE APPROVED BY AGENCY
HEAD: February 6, 2007

DATE NOTICE OF PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT
PUBLISHED IN FAW: January 12, 2007

Section 111
Notices of Changes, Corrections and
Withdrawals

BOARD OF TRUSTEES OF THE INTERNAL
IMPROVEMENT TRUST FUND

Notices for the Board of Trustees of the Internal Improvement
Trust Fund between December 28, 2001 and June 30, 2006, go
to http://www.dep.state.fl.ug under the link or button titled
“Official Notices.”

AGENCY FOR HEALTH CARE ADMINISTRATION

Medicaid
RULE NO.: RULETITLE:
59G-4.071 Durable Medical Equipment and

Medical Supply Services Provider
Fee Schedules
NOTICE OF CHANGE
Notice is hereby given that the following changes have been
made to the proposed rule in accordance with subparagraph
120.54(3)(d)1., F.S., published in VVol. 32, No. 49, December 8,
2006 issue of the Florida Administrative Weekly.

This is the second notice of change on the proposed rule.
The first Notice of Change was published in Volume 33,
Number 9, March 2, 2007, issue of the Florida Administrative
Weekly. These changes are in response to written comments
received before the public hearing. The rule incorporates by
reference the Florida Medicaid Durable Medical Equipment
and Medical Supply Services Provider Fee Schedule for All
Medicaid Recipients, January 2007. The following procedures
codes were added to the fee schedule: E2601, E2602, E2603,
E2604, E2605, E2606, E2607, E2608, E2611, E2612, E2613,
E2614, E2615, E2616, E2618, and E2619.

AGENCY FOR HEALTH CARE ADMINISTRATION

M edicaid

RULE NOS.: RULE TITLES:

59G-4.190 Independent Laboratory Services
59G-4.230 Physician Services

NOTICE OF CHANGE

Notice is hereby given that the following changes have been
made to the proposed rule in accordance with subparagraph
120.54(3)(d)1., F.S., published in Vol. 32, No. 51, December
22, 2006 issue of the Florida Administrative Weekly.

These changes are in response to comments received from the
Joint Administrative Procedures Committee and comments
received at the public hearing. On 2-11-07, Rule 59G-4.230

was amended to incorporate by reference the Florida Medicaid
Physician Services Coverage and Limitations Handbook,
January 2007. We corrected the rule text to reflect this
amendment will incorporate by reference update January 2007
to the Florida Medicaid Physician Services Coverage and
Limitations Handbook, January 2007. We aso corrected the
last sentence of the rule text to state papercopies of the
handbooks may be obtained by calling Provider Enrollment,
not Provider Inquiry.

The amendment to Rule 59G-4.190, Independent Laboratory
Services, incorporates by reference update January 2007 to the
Florida Medicaid Independent Laboratory Coverage and
Limitations Handbook. The following changes were made to
the handbook.

On Page 2-5, we replaced Preconception Genetic Carrier
Screening Laboratory Testing Covered Services and Prenatal
Genetic Carrier Screening Laboratory Testing Covered
Services with the following:

“Covered  Services. Medicaid reimburses  for
preconception and prenatal genetic carrier screening laboratory
tests that are accepted by the American College of Medical
Genetics and that can be hilled using Heathcare Common
Procedure Coding System (HCPCS) procedure codes. The
laboratory testing method must be considered to be a proven
method for the identification of a genetically-linked inheritable
disease (i.e., the genotypes to be detected by a genetic test must
be shown by scientifically valid methods to be associated with
the occurrence of a disease, and the observations must be
independently replicated and subject to peer review).”

“Service Requirements. Preconception and prenatal
genetic carrier screening laboratory tests must be ordered by a
licensed healthcare practitioner authorized within the scope of
his practice to order genetic carrier screening laboratory tests.
The laboratory must maintain requests for the specific
laboratory tests on file with copies of the report of the test
results. The recipient must be eligible for Medicaid on the date
of service.”

Under DNA-Based Preconception and Prenatal Genetic
Laboratory Services Limitations, we deleted the reference to
the specific molecular diagnostic codes (83890-83912) and “up
to amaximum of six probes of primer pairs per recipient.”

On Page 2-6, we deleted Documentation Required for
Preconception or Prenatal Genetic Carrier Screening
Laboratory Testing, Preconception or Prenatal Genetic Carrier
Screening Laboratory Testing Genetic Carrier  Screening
Services Exclusions, Accepted Clinical Laboratory Methods
for Preconception or Prenatal Genetic Carrier Screenings. We
repaginated the pages so that Limitations will begin on Page
2-6.

Section |11 - Notices of Changes, Corrections and Withdrawals 1301



