
Florida Administrative Weekly Volume 33,  Number  47,  November 21, 2007

Section I - Notices of Development of Proposed Rules and Negotiated Rulemaking   5501

Section I 
Notices of Development of Proposed Rules 

and Negotiated Rulemaking

DEPARTMENT OF EDUCATION
State Board of Education
RULE NO.: RULE TITLE:
6A-6.0783 District School Board Exclusive 

Authority to Sponsor Charter 
Schools

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The purpose of this rule
development workshop is to provide an opportunity for the
public (including educators, administrators and stakeholders)
to provide input for revisions to the District Exclusive
Authority Rule. The workshop will give an opportunity for
DOE personnel to explain and describe the revision process as
well as allow for participation from the audience on the
revisions to the District Exclusive Authority Rule. The effect
of the meeting will provide clarification and revision to the
existing rule and rubric.
SUBJECT AREA TO BE ADDRESSED: Revisions to District
Exclusive Authority Rule.
SPECIFIC AUTHORITY: 1002.335 FS.
LAW IMPLEMENTED: 1002.335 FS.
A RULE DEVELOPMENT WORKSHOP WILL BE HELD
AT THE DATE, TIME AND PLACE SHOWN BELOW:
DATE AND TIME: December 4, 2007, 1:00 p.m. – 3:00 p.m.
PLACE: The Hilton in the Walt Disney World Resort, 1751
Hotel Plaza Boulevard, Lake Buena Vista, Florida 32830
THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT AND A COPY OF
THE PRELIMINARY DRAFT, IF AVAILABLE, IS: Lynn
Abbott, Agency Clerk, Department of Education, 325 West
Gaines Street, Room 1514, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-0400;
(850)245-9661
THE PRELIMINARY TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE
DEVELOPMENT IS NOT AVAILABLE.

DEPARTMENT OF REVENUE
Miscellaneous Tax
RULE NO.: RULE TITLE:
12B-6.005 Payment of Tax; Reports; Public Use 

Forms
PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The purpose of this rule
development is to include the provisions of Section 2, Chapter
2007-60, L.O.F., which moves the due date of the payment of
the gross receipts tax imposed on utility services from the last
day of the month to the 20th day of the month. When adopted,
this rule will provide that to avoid penalty and interest for late

filing the payment of the tax and the return to report the tax
must reach the Department, or be postmarked, on or before the
20th day of the month for receipts  for utility services received
in the preceding month.
A Notice of Rule Development for these proposed rule
amendments was published in the Florida Administrative
Weekly on November 16, 2007. In this previous Notice, a
workshop, if requested, was scheduled for November 28, 2007.
The date for this workshop, if requested, is being changed from
November 28, 2007 to December 7, 2007.
SUBJECT AREA TO BE ADDRESSED: The subject area to
be addressed is the change to the remittance and reporting due
date for the gross receipts tax imposed on utility services, as
provided in Section 2, Chapter 2007-60, L.O.F.
SPECIFIC AUTHORITY: 213.06(1) FS.
LAW IMPLEMENTED: Section 2, Chapter 2007-60, L.O.F.
IF REQUESTED IN WRITING AND NOT DEEMED
UNNECESSARY BY THE AGENCY HEAD, A RULE
DEVELOPMENT WORKSHOP WILL BE HELD AT THE
DATE, TIME AND PLACE SHOWN BELOW:
DATE AND TIME: December 7, 2007, 10:00 a.m.
PLACE: Room 118, Carlton Building, 501 South Calhoun
Street, Tallahassee, Florida
Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 48 hours before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: Larry Green at (850)922-4830. If you are hearing
or speech impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida
Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770
(Voice).
THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT AND A COPY OF
THE PRELIMINARY DRAFT, IF AVAILABLE, IS: Robert
Babin, Deputy Director, Technical Assistance and Dispute
Resolution, Department of Revenue, P. O. Box 7443,
Tallahassee, Florida 32314-7443, telephone (850)922-4842
THE PRELIMINARY TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE
DEVELOPMENT IS AVAILABLE AT NO CHARGE FROM
THE CONTACT PERSON LISTED ABOVE.

BOARD OF TRUSTEES OF THE INTERNAL 
IMPROVEMENT TRUST FUND 
Notices for the Board of Trustees of the Internal Improvement
Trust Fund between December 28, 2001 and June 30, 2006, go
to http://www.dep.state.fl.us/ under the link or button titled
“Official Notices.”



Florida Administrative Weekly Volume 33,  Number  47,  November 21, 2007

5502   Section I - Notices of Development of Proposed Rules and Negotiated Rulemaking

BOARD OF TRUSTEES OF THE INTERNAL 
IMPROVEMENT TRUST FUND
RULE NOS.: RULE TITLES:
18-21.001 Intent
18-21.002 Scope and Effective Date
18-21.003 Definitions
18-21.004 Management Policies, Standards, and 

Criteria
18-21.005 Forms of Authorization
18-21.0051 Delegation of Authority
18-21.008 Applications for Lease
18-21.011 Payments and Fees
18-21.020 Aquacultural Activities
18-21.021 Applications for Aquacultural 

Activities
18-21.022 Payments and Fees for Aquacultural 

Activities
18-21.900 Forms
PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The purpose and effect of the
proposed rule amendment is to implement statutory changes in
Chapter 253, Florida Statutes, and establish forms of
authorization for aquacultural activities on sovereignty
submerged lands.
SUBJECT AREA TO BE ADDRESSED: The proposed rule
amendment provides for the administrative and management
responsibilities of the Board of Trustees of the Internal
Improvement Trust Fund and the Department of Agriculture
and Consumer Services regarding the use of sovereignty
submerged lands for aquacultural purposes.
SPECIFIC AUTHORITY: 253.002, 570.07(23) FS.
LAW IMPLEMENTED: 253.002(2) FS.
A RULE DEVELOPMENT WORKSHOP WILL BE HELD
AT THE DATE, TIME AND PLACE SHOWN BELOW:
DATE AND TIME: Wednesday, December 12, 2007, 4:00 p.m.
– 6:00 p.m.
PLACE: Florida Fish and Wildlife Conservation Field Station,
11350 Southwest 153rd Court, Cedar Key, FL 32625,
(352)543-5732
DATE AND TIME: Thursday, December 13, 2007, 3:30 p.m. –
5:30 p.m.
PLACE: Pine Island Public Library, Meeting Room, 10700
Russell Road, Bokeelia, FL 33922, (239)461-3188
DATE AND TIME: Monday, December 17, 2007, 2:00 p.m. –
4:00 p.m.
PLACE: Division of Aquaculture, 1203 Governor’s Square
Boulevard, 5th Floor, Tallahassee, FL 32301, (850)488-5471
DATE AND TIME: Tuesday, December 18, 2007, 4:00 p.m. –
6:00 p.m.
PLACE: Franklin County Public Library, Carrabelle Branch,
311 St. James Avenue (Highway 98), Carrabelle, FL 32322,
(850)697-2366

DATE AND TIME: Wednesday, December 19, 2007, 4:00 p.m.
– 6:00 p.m.
PLACE: Brevard County Agriculture Center, 3695 Lake Drive,
Cocoa, FL 32926, (321)633-1702
Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 5 days before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: Mark Berrigan at (850)488-5471. If you are
hearing or speech impaired, please contact the agency using the
Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or
1(800)955-8770 (Voice).
THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT AND A COPY OF
THE PRELIMINARY DRAFT, IF AVAILABLE, IS: Mark
Berrigan, Division of Aquaculture, 1203 Governor’s Square
Boulevard, 5th Floor, Tallahassee, FL 32301, phone
(850)488-5471. A copy of the workshop agenda is also
available upon request
THE PRELIMINARY TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE
DEVELOPMENT IS AVAILABLE AT NO CHARGE FROM
THE CONTACT PERSON LISTED ABOVE.

WATER MANAGEMENT DISTRICTS
Suwannee River Water Management District
RULE NO.: RULE TITLE:
40B-4.1090 Publications and Agreements 

Incorporated by Reference
PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The purpose of the rule
development is to update this section of Chapter 40B-4,
Florida Administrative Code, to adopt the most current version
of the item incorporated by reference. The effect of the
proposed rule amendments will incorporate the new flood
insurance studies for the Suwannee River and its tributaries.
SUBJECT AREA TO BE ADDRESSED: These proposed
amendments will address items incorporated by reference.
SPECIFIC AUTHORITY: 373.044 FS.
LAW IMPLEMENTED: 373.083, 373.084, 363.085, 373.086,
373.413, 373.416 FS.
IF REQUESTED IN WRITING AND NOT DEEMED
UNNECESSARY BY THE AGENCY HEAD, A RULE
DEVELOPMENT WORKSHOP WILL BE NOTICED IN
THE NEXT AVAILABLE FLORIDA ADMINISTRATIVE
WEEKLY.
THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT AND A COPY OF
THE PRELIMINARY DRAFT, IF AVAILABLE, IS: Linda
Welch, Administrative Assistant, Suwannee River Water
Management District, 9225 C.R. 49, Live Oak, Florida 32060,
(386)362-1001 or (800)226-1066 (FL only)
THE PRELIMINARY TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE
DEVELOPMENT IS NOT AVAILABLE.



Florida Administrative Weekly Volume 33,  Number  47,  November 21, 2007

Section I - Notices of Development of Proposed Rules and Negotiated Rulemaking   5503

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 
REGULATION
Division of Alcoholic Beverages and Tobacco
RULE NO.: RULE TITLE:
61A-4.063 Alcoholic Beverage Surcharge 

Implemented for 
Consumption-on-Premises Vendors

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The purpose and effect of the
proposed rule amendment is to implement statutorily mandated
rules regarding the repeal of the alcoholic beverage surcharge
for consumption-on-premises vendors. This rule amendment
outlines the procedures for final close-out audits of
consumption-on-premises vendors including what form
vendors must use to report inventory as of the July 1, 2007,
repeal date.
SUBJECT AREA TO BE ADDRESSED: The subject area to
be addressed is the statutorily mandated rule amendment
relating to the repeal of the alcoholic beverage surcharge for
consumption-on-premises vendors.
SPECIFIC AUTHORITY: 561.11 FS.
LAW IMPLEMENTED: 561.501 FS.
IF REQUESTED IN WRITING AND NOT DEEMED
UNNECESSARY BY THE AGENCY HEAD, A RULE
DEVELOPMENT WORKSHOP WILL BE HELD AT THE
DATE, TIME AND PLACE SHOWN BELOW:
DATE AND TIME: Monday, December 17, 2007, 9:00 a.m. –
12:00 p.m., or until business is completed
PLACE: Alcoholic Beverages and Tobacco Roscoe Hargett
Conference Room, Suite 26, 1940 North Monroe Street,
Tallahassee, Florida 32399-1020
THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT AND A COPY OF
THE PRELIMINARY DRAFT, IF AVAILABLE, IS: Lisa
Livezey Comingore, Assistant General Counsel, Department
of Business and Professional Regulation, Division of Alcoholic
Beverages and Tobacco, Office of the General Counsel, 1940
North Monroe Street, Suite 42, Tallahassee, Florida 32399,
(850)487-9677
THE PRELIMINARY TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE
DEVELOPMENT IS NOT AVAILABLE.

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 
REGULATION
Board of Employee Leasing Companies
RULE NOS.: RULE TITLES:
61G7-5.0031 Audited Financial Statements
61G7-5.0032 Reviewed Financial Statements
61G7-5.005 Deficiency in Tangible Accounting 

Net Worth; Guaranty Form 
Acceptable to Board; Sufficient 
Evidence of Guarantor's Adequate 
Resources

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The Board will hold a rules
workshop in order to discuss the above-referenced rules and
afford the public an opportunity for comment.
SUBJECT AREA TO BE ADDRESSED: Questions regarding
the meaning of the rules listed above.
SPECIFIC AUTHORITY: 468.522 FS.
LAW IMPLEMENTED: 468.525(3) FS.
A RULE DEVELOPMENT WORKSHOP WILL BE HELD
AT THE DATE, TIME AND PLACE SHOWN BELOW:
DATE AND TIME: February 19, 2008, 12:00 Noon
PLACE: The Professions Board Room, Department Business
& Professional Regulation, 1940 North Monroe Street,
Tallahassee, Florida 32399
THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT AND A COPY OF
THE PRELIMINARY DRAFT, IF AVAILABLE, IS: Richard
Morrison, Executive Director, Board of Employee Leasing
Companies, 1940 North Monroe Street, Tallahassee, Florida
32399-0767
THE PRELIMINARY TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE
DEVELOPMENT IS NOT AVAILABLE.

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 
REGULATION
Board of Employee Leasing Companies
RULE NOS.: RULE TITLES:
61G7-10.0014 Requirements for Evidence of 

Workers’ Compensation Coverage
61G7-10.002 Reporting of Change of Status 

Required; Effect on Licensees; 
Change of Licensee Name

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The Board will hold a rules
workshop in order to discuss the above-referenced rules and
afford the public an opportunity for comment.
SUBJECT AREA TO BE ADDRESSED: Questions regarding
the meaning of the existing rules listed above.
SPECIFIC AUTHORITY: 468.522 FS.
LAW IMPLEMENTED: 468.529(2), 468.5245 FS.
A RULE DEVELOPMENT WORKSHOP WILL BE HELD
AT THE DATE, TIME AND PLACE SHOWN BELOW:
DATE AND TIME: February 19, 2007, 12:00 Noon
PLACE: The Professions Board Room, Department of
Business and Professional Regulation, 1940 North Monroe
Street, Tallahassee, Florida 32399
THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT AND A COPY OF
THE PRELIMINARY DRAFT, IF AVAILABLE, IS: Richard
Morrison, Executive Director, Board of Employee Leasing
Companies, 1940 North Monroe Street, Tallahassee, Florida
32399-0767
THE PRELIMINARY TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE
DEVELOPMENT IS NOT AVAILABLE.



Florida Administrative Weekly Volume 33,  Number  47,  November 21, 2007

5504   Section I - Notices of Development of Proposed Rules and Negotiated Rulemaking

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 
REGULATION
Board of Professional Engineers
RULE NOS.: RULE TITLES:
61G15-20.001 Definitions
61G15-20.007 Demonstration of Substantial 

Equivalency
PURPOSE AND EFFECT: For both Rules 61G15-20.001 and
61G15-20.007, F.A.C., it is to delete unnecessary language and
update existing language.
SUBJECT AREA TO BE ADDRESSED: Definitions;
Demonstration of Substantial Equivalency.
SPECIFIC AUTHORITY: 471.008, 471.013(1)(a) FS.
LAW IMPLEMENTED: 471.013, 471.015 FS.
IF REQUESTED IN WRITING AND NOT DEEMED
UNNECESSARY BY THE AGENCY HEAD, A RULE
DEVELOPMENT WORKSHOP WILL BE NOTICED IN
THE NEXT AVAILABLE FLORIDA ADMINISTRATIVE
WEEKLY.
THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT AND A COPY OF
THE PRELIMINARY DRAFT IS: Carrie Flynn, Executive
Director, Board of Professional Engineers, 2507 Callaway
Road, Suite 200, Tallahassee, Florida 32301

THE PRELIMINARY TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE
DEVELOPMENT IS: 

61G15-20.001 Definitions.
As used hereinafter in this chapter the following words or
phrases shall be defined as follows:

(1) No change.
(2) “Board approved engineering programs” shall mean:
(a) No change.
(b) In the case of an applicant who did not graduate from

an approved program as set forth in paragraph (2)(a) above,
and who either:

1. Holds a post-baccalaureate degree from a school or
college in the United States which has an EAC/ABET
accredited engineering program in a related discipline at the
baccalaureate level, or

2. Holds a baccalaureate degree from an engineering
program that is not accredited by EAC/ABET, provided the
applicant meets the educational requirements set forth in can
demonstrate substantial equivalency to an EAC/ABET
accredited program pursuant to subsection
61G15-20.007(1)(2), F.A.C., or

(c) No change.
Specific Authority 471.013(1)(a) FS. Law Implemented 471.013(1)(a)
FS. History–New 1-8-80, Amended 4-15-80, 7-7-83, 9-13-83,
Formerly 21H-20.01, Amended 4-20-86, 8-3-86, 5-20-92, 2-2-93,
Formerly 21H-20.001, Amended 11-19-03, 3-13-05,
4-9-07,________.

61G15-20.007 Demonstration of Substantial Equivalency.
(1) Applicants having engineering degrees from programs

that are not accredited by EAC/ABET shall be required to
document substantial equivalency to an EAC/ABET accredited
engineering program. 

(2) In order to document and prove substantial
equivalency to an EAC/ABET accredited engineering
program, the applicant must demonstrate:

(a) through (d) No change.
(3) through (5) renumbered (2) through (4) No change.

Specific Authority 471.008 FS. Law Implemented 471.013, 471.015
FS. History–New 7-20-95, Amended 6-5-96, 4-16-98, 1-17-99,
7-28-99, 1-6-02, 6-13-02, 6-30-02, 10-2-03, 6-16-04, 3-13-05, 5-1-05,
6-11-06, 1-29-07, 4-9-07,________.

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 
REGULATION
Board of Professional Engineers
RULE NO.: RULE TITLE:
61G15-23.002 Seal, Signature and Date Shall be 

Affixed
PURPOSE AND EFFECT: It is to delete unnecessary language
and update existing language.
SUBJECT AREA TO BE ADDRESSED: Seal, Signature and
Date Shall Be Affixed.
SPECIFIC AUTHORITY: 471.025 FS.
LAW IMPLEMENTED: 471.025 FS.
IF REQUESTED IN WRITING AND NOT DEEMED
UNNECESSARY BY THE AGENCY HEAD, A RULE
DEVELOPMENT WORKSHOP WILL BE NOTICED IN
THE NEXT AVAILABLE FLORIDA ADMINISTRATIVE
WEEKLY.
THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT AND A COPY OF
THE PRELIMINARY DRAFT IS: Carrie Flynn, Executive
Director, Board of Professional Engineers, 2507 Callaway
Road, Suite 200, Tallahassee, Florida 32301

THE PRELIMINARY TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE
DEVELOPMENT IS: 

61G15-23.002 Seal, Signature and Date Shall be Affixed.
(1) No change.
(2) Each sheet of plans and prints which must be sealed

under the provisions of Chapter 471, F.S., shall be sealed,
signed and dated by the professional engineer in responsible
charge. Engineers shall legibly indicate their name, address,
and license number on each sheet. If practicing through a duly
authorized engineering business, engineers shall legibly
indicate their name and license number, as well as, the name,
address, and certificate of authorization number of the
engineering business on each sheet. A title block shall be used
on each sheet containing the printed name, address, and license



Florida Administrative Weekly Volume 33,  Number  47,  November 21, 2007

Section I - Notices of Development of Proposed Rules and Negotiated Rulemaking   5505

number of the engineer or if applicable, the name and license
number of the engineer, and if practicing through a duly
authorized engineering business, the name, address and
certificate of authorization number of the engineering business
will satisfy this requirement. Engineers working for local, State
or Federal Government agencies shall legibly indicate their
name and license number, and may indicate the name and
address of the agency. A cover or index sheet for engineering
specifications may be used and that sheet must be signed,
sealed and dated by those professional engineers in responsible
charge of the production and preparation of each section of the
engineering specification, and if practicing through a duly
authorized engineering business, the name, address and
certificate of authorization number of the engineering business,
with sufficient information on the cover sheet or index so that
the user will be aware of each portion of the specifications for
which each professional engineer is responsible. Engineering
reports must be signed, sealed and dated on a signature page or
cover letter by each professional engineer who is in responsible
charge of any portion of the report, and if practicing through a
duly authorized engineering business, the name, address and
certificate of authorization number of the engineering business.
A professional engineer may only seal an engineering report,
plan, print or specification if that professional engineer was in
responsible charge of the preparation and production of the
engineering document and the professional engineer has the
expertise in the engineering discipline used in producing the
engineering document in question.

(3) through (5) No change.
Specific Authority 471.025 FS. Law Implemented 471.025 FS.
History–New 1-8-80, Amended 1-20-85, Formerly 21H-23.02,
Amended 5-14-86, Formerly 21H-23.002, Amended 11-15-94,
8-18-98, 2-3-00, 2-22-01, 2-5-04,_______.

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 
REGULATION
Board of Professional Engineers
RULE NOS.: RULE TITLES:
61G15-32.001 General Responsibility
61G15-32.002 Definitions
61G15-32.003 Common Requirements to All Fire 

Protection Engineering Documents
61G15-32.008 Design of Fire Alarms, Signaling 

Systems and Control System
PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The purpose and effect for Rule
61G15-32.001, F.A.C., is to clarify existing language and to
add tasks for which an Engineer of Record is responsible; for
Rule 61G15-32.002, F.A.C., it is to add a new requirement
with regard to Fire Protection Delegated Engineering
Documents; for Rule 61G15-32.003, F.A.C., it is to add new
requirements for Fire Protection Electrical Engineering
Documents; for Rule 61G15-32.008, F.A.C., it is to replace old

definitions of fire alarms, signaling, and control systems with
new definitions and to establish new requirements for such fire
alarms, signaling, and control systems.
SUBJECT AREA TO BE ADDRESSED: General
Responsibility; Definitions; Common Requirements to All Fire
Protection Engineering Documents; Design of Fire Alarms,
Signaling Systems and Control System.
SPECIFIC AUTHORITY: 471.008, 471.033(2) FS.
LAW IMPLEMENTED: 471.005(7), 471.033 FS.
IF REQUESTED IN WRITING AND NOT DEEMED
UNNECESSARY BY THE AGENCY HEAD, A RULE
DEVELOPMENT WORKSHOP WILL BE NOTICED IN
THE NEXT AVAILABLE FLORIDA ADMINISTRATIVE
WEEKLY.
THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT AND A COPY OF
THE PRELIMINARY DRAFT IS: Carrie Flynn, Executive
Director, Board of Professional Engineers, 2507 Callaway
Road, Suite 200, Tallahassee, Florida 32301

THE PRELIMINARY TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE
DEVELOPMENT IS: 

61G15-32.001 General Responsibility.
Fire protection engineering documents shall be prepared
utilizing in accordance with applicable technologies
technology and shall comply with the requirements of the
authority having jurisdiction. The documents shall identify the
Engineer of Record for the project. Both the Eengineer of
Rrecord for the fire protection system and the delegated
engineer, if utilized, shall comply with the requirements of the
general responsibility rules, Chapter 61G15-30, F.A.C., and
with the requirements of the more specific rules contained
herein. The Engineer of Record for the Fire Protection
System(s) shall provide design requirements in writing to the
delegated engineer if one is used and shall review the design
documents of the delegated engineer for conformance to his
written instructions in accordance with Rule 61G15-30.005,
F.A.C. Any Fire Protection Delegated Engineering Documents
must be included in the final set of documents filed for permit.
Specific Authority 471.008, 471.033(2) FS. Law Implemented
471.033 FS. History–New 5-19-93, Formerly 21H-32.001,
Amended________.

61G15-32.002 Definitions.
(1) through (9) No change.
(10) Fire Protection Delegated Engineering Documents.

Fire Protection System Engineering Documents prepared by a
delegated engineer to whom the Engineer of Record for the
Fire Protection System has delegated responsibility for the
design of a fire protection component or system and which are
signed sealed and dated by the delegated engineer.



Florida Administrative Weekly Volume 33,  Number  47,  November 21, 2007

5506   Section I - Notices of Development of Proposed Rules and Negotiated Rulemaking

Specific Authority 471.008, 471.033(2) FS. Law Implemented
471.005(7), 471.033(2) FS. History–New 5-19-93, Formerly
21H-32.002, Amended 4-2-00, 6-26-01,_________.

61G15-32.003 Common Requirements to All Fire
Protection Engineering Documents.

(1) through (8) No change.
(9) Fire Protection Electrical Engineering Documents shall

additionally meet the requirements of Rule 61G15-30.003,
F.A.C., Engineering Documents.
Specific Authority 471.008, 471.033(2) FS. Law Implemented
471.005(7), 471.033(2) FS. History–New 5-19-93, Formerly
21H-32.003, Amended 4-2-00, 6-26-01,_________.

(Substantial rewording of Rule 61G15-32.008 follows. See
Florida Administrative Code for present text.)

61G15-32.008 Design of Fire Alarms, Signaling Systems
and Control System.

(1) Fire alarms, signaling and control system include but
are not limited to fire protection supervision, emergency alarm
circuits, activation of life safety system controls and remote
signaling of emergency conditions. 

(2) The design specifications shall be based on applicable
codes, when applicable, or alternate engineering sources
including published underwriter’s engineering documents, and
sound engineering practices.

(3) For fire alarm plans on small systems below the
threshold requirements for mandatory use of professional
engineering services, the Engineer of Record shall specify the
minimum system requirements.

(4) To ensure minimum design quality of Fire Alarm
Signaling and Control Systems Engineering Documents, said
documents shall include as a minimum the following
information when applicable:

(a) The plans shall be clear, with a symbols legend, system
riser diagram showing all initiation and notification
components, and cabling requirements. Indicate locations
where fire ratings are required as determined by the system’s
survivability requirements. Identify the general occupancy of
the protected property, and for each rooms and area unless it is
clear from features shown.

(b) Locate initiation and notification devices and
connections to related systems on the floor plans and sections
when needed for clarity). Related systems include, but are not
limited to sprinkler systems, elevator controls, smoke control
systems, dampers, and doors.

(c) Strobe intensity and speaker output ratings for all
notification devices.

(d) Identify the Class and Style of circuits as listed in the
NFPA 72.

(e) Identify the functions required by the alarm and control
systems including the transmission of emergency signals being
monitored or annunciated.

(f) Indicate whether the fire alarm is conventional or
addressable, and indicate all zoning.

(g) Locate surge protective devices and required protective
features.

(h) Locate system devices that are subject to
environmental factors, and indicate requirements for the
protection of equipment from temperature, humidity or
corrosive atmospheres, including coastal salt air.

(i) The plans shall include a site plan of the immediate
area around the protected building, structure or equipment
when alarm devices are required outside the structure.

(j) In buildings were smoke detection will be obstructed by
walls, beams or ceiling features, the Engineer of Record shall
provide applicable design and details to direct the installer to
mitigate the obstructions. In buildings with smoke detection
under a pitched roof, the plans shall indicate the roof pitch and
a building section shall be provided as part of the Engineering
Design Documents.

(k) Fire detection systems utilizing smoke detection in
situations where smoke stratification is anticipated, the design
shall provide the necessary criteria to mitigate the problem.

(l) Systems designed using Performance Based criteria
shall be identified and referenced to design guides or standards
acceptable to the Florida State Fire Marshal or the Florida
Building Code.

(m) The system design must indicate if the system is to
provide a general evacuation signal or a zoned evacuation for
all high-rise buildings or multi-tenanted properties.

(n) Wiring requirements for underground, wet locations,
campus style wiring, protection against damage and burial
depth shall be specified or indicated on the engineering design
documents.

(o) Complete requirements for operations and
maintenance procedures, manuals, system documentation, and
instruction of Owner’s operating personnel, as needed to
operate the systems as intended over time.

(5) In the event that the Engineer of Record elects to
specify specific equipment and to show the required wiring,
battery and voltage drop (circuit analysis) calculations shall be
completed. The calculations shall be completed using the
equipment manufacture’s data and applicable NFPA 72
procedures.

(6) System test requirements shall be noted on the
Engineering Design Documents.

(7) When the engineer determines that special
requirements are required by the owner, insurance underwriter
or local fire code amendments these requirements shall be
documented or referenced on the Engineering Design
Documents.

Specific Authority 471.008, 471.033(2) FS. Law Implemented
471.033 FS. History–New 5-19-93, Formerly 21H-32.008,
Amended_________.



Florida Administrative Weekly Volume 33,  Number  47,  November 21, 2007

Section I - Notices of Development of Proposed Rules and Negotiated Rulemaking   5507

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 
REGULATION
Board of Professional Engineers
RULE NOS.: RULE TITLES:
61G15-34.001 General Responsibility
61G15-34.002 Definitions
61G15-34.003 Design of Heating Ventilation and 

Air Conditioning Systems
61G15-34.007 Design of Plumbing Systems
PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The purpose and effect for Rule
61G15-34.001 F.A.C., is to clarify existing language and to add
tasks for which an Engineer of Record is responsible; for Rule
61G15-34.002, F.A.C., it is to clarify and amend existing
definitions and add a new definition for Mechanical Delegated
Engineering Documents; for Rule 61G15-34.003, F.A.C., it is
to delete unnecessary language and add new requirements with
respect to Mechanical Engineering Documents; for Rule
61G15-34.007, F.A.C., it is to clarify existing language.
SUBJECT AREA TO BE ADDRESSED: General
Responsibility; Definitions; Design of Heating Ventilation and
Air Conditioning Systems; Design of Plumbing Systems.
SPECIFIC AUTHORITY: 471.008, 471.033(2) FS.
LAW IMPLEMENTED: 471.033 FS.
IF REQUESTED IN WRITING AND NOT DEEMED
UNNECESSARY BY THE AGENCY HEAD, A RULE
DEVELOPMENT WORKSHOP WILL BE NOTICED IN
THE NEXT AVAILABLE FLORIDA ADMINISTRATIVE
WEEKLY.
THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT AND A COPY OF
THE PRELIMINARY DRAFT IS: Carrie Flynn, Executive
Director, Board of Professional Engineers, 2507 Callaway
Road, Suite 200, Tallahassee, Florida 32301

THE PRELIMINARY TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE
DEVELOPMENT IS: 

61G15-34.001 General Responsibility.
Mechanical Engineering Documents shall be prepared utilizing
in accordance with the applicable technologiesy and shall
comply with the requirements of the authority having
jurisdiction. The documents shall identify the Engineer of
Record for the mechanical systems project. Mechanical
Engineering documents shall demonstrate compliance be
prepared in accordance with the requirements of the applicable
codes and standards as defined herein. The Engineer of Record
is responsible for determining the applicability of appropriate
codes and standards for a given project. In the event the codes
and standards fail to cover or address a specific requirement or
situation, alternative research, test results, engineering data,
and engineering calculations shall be utilized. New technology
may be utilized when said technology has been demonstrated
to provide equivalent or improved performance. Construction
documents shall indicate the nature and character of

mechanical work and shall describe, label and define the
required mechanical systems components, processes,
equipment and material and its structural utility support
systems. Both the Engineer of Record for the Mechanical
System and the Delegated Engineer if utilized, shall comply
with the requirements of the general responsibility Rules,
Chapter 61G15-30, F.A.C., and with the requirements of the
specific rules contained herein. The Engineer of Record for the
Mechanical System(s) shall provide design requirements in
writing to the delegated engineer if one is used and shall
review the design documents of the delegated engineer for
conformance to his written instructions in accordance with
Rule 61G15-30.005, F.A.C. Any Mechanical Delegated
Engineering Documents must be included in the final set of
documents filed for permit.
Specific Authority 471.008, 471.033(2) FS. Law Implemented
471.033 FS. History–New 11-16-94, Amended________.

61G15-34.002 Definitions.
(1) Engineer of Record for the Mechanical Systems. The

Florida Registered Professional Engineer who is in responsible
charge for the preparation, signing, dating, sealing and issuing
of any engineering document(s) for develops the mechanical
systems design criteria or performs the analysis and is
responsible for the preparation of the mechanical documents
for the project.

(2) through (4) No change.
(5) Mechanical Engineering Documents. All The

mechanical drawings, specifications, reports, calculations, data
and other documents utilized to establish setting forth the
overall design and requirements for the construction,
alteration, modernization, repair, demolition, arrangement,
and/or use of the mechanical system(s), or analysis or
recommendations, as prepared by the Engineer of Record for
the mechanical system. Mechanical Engineering Documents
shall additionally meet the requirements of Rule
61G15-30.003, F.A.C., Engineering Documents.

(6) Mechanical Shop Drawings Submittals. Submittals,
catalog information on standard products, or drawings
prepared solely to serve as a guide for fabrication and
installation and requiring no engineering input. These
submittals do not require the seal of a Florida Registered
pProfessional eEngineer.

(7) Codes and Standards. Those nationally recognized
Codes and Standards adopted directly or by reference in Part II,
Chapter 553, Florida Statutes. Florida Building Code
(including Florida Energy Efficiency Code, Chapter 13) and
Florida Fire Code. Applicable codes and standards are those
promulgated by the State Fire Marshal and those required by
the state and local authorities having jurisdiction. These codes
and standards include those published by the National Fire
Protection Association (NFPA), The American Society of
Heating, Refrigerating, and Air Conditioning Engineers



Florida Administrative Weekly Volume 33,  Number  47,  November 21, 2007

5508   Section I - Notices of Development of Proposed Rules and Negotiated Rulemaking

(ASHRAE), The American Society for Testing Materials
(ASTM), American Society for Mechanical Engineers
(ASME), National Electrical Manufacturers Association
(NEMA), American National Standards Institute (ANSI),
Underwriters’ Laboratories (UL), American Society of
Plumbing Engineers (ASPE), Sheet Metal and Air
Conditioning Contractor's Association (SMACNA), American
Movement and Control Association (AMCA), Air
Conditioning and Refrigeration Institute (ARI), SBCCA
Mechanical and Plumbing Codes, Florida Energy Code, State
Building Codes.

(8) Mechanical Delegated Engineering Documents.
Mechanical Engineering Documents prepared by a delegated
engineer to whom the Engineer of Record for the Mechanical
System has delegated responsibility for the design of a
mechanical component or system and which are signed sealed
and dated by the delegated engineer.
Specific Authority 471.008, 471.033(2) FS. Law Implemented
471.033 471.030 FS. History–New 11-16-94, Amended 2-5-96,
_________.

61G15-34.003 Design of Heating Ventilation and Air
Conditioning Systems.

(1) Heating, Ventilating, and Air Conditioning (HVAC)
Systems include, but are not limited to are those systems that
control the temperature and/or humidity, and/or mechanical
ventilation of a particular space or building. Items to be
considered in the design and analysis of these systems are
ambient dry and wet bulb temperatures, inside dry and wet
bulb temperatures, inside design humidity, fresh air makeup,
internal heat gains from any sources. Ventilation systems shall
be designed to remove foul odors from a space or building, or
to remove space heat from equipment rooms. 

(2) All HVAC systems shall be designed in accordance
with the Florida Codes, and reference standards ASHRAE
Standards and Building Code as adopted by the authority
having jurisdiction. The HVAC systems shall be designed and
operated such that the entire building is under positive or
neutral pressure when all primary HVAC systems are
operating.

(2) Mechanical Engineering documents applicable to
HVAC systems shall, where applicable, include but are not
limited to the following:

(a) Equipment selection schedule for each piece of
mechanical equipment. All equipment shall have capacities
listed including efficiencies, electrical or fuel requirements,
static pressure and fan air quantities as applicable to the
system, fluid flow and pressure head quantities as applicable to
the system, and heat transfer capacities.

(b) Floor plans; site plans; and building and mechanical
system elevations as appropriate.

(c) Outside (fresh) air make-up conditions.

(d) Cooling coil requirements based on sensible heat,
latent heat and total heat gains.

(e) Heating equipment requirements.
(f) Outside and inside design dry and wet bulb conditions.
(g) Exhaust riser diagrams.
(h) Outside air riser diagrams.
(i) Process flow diagrams with pipe sizes and fluid flow

quantities.
(j) Condensate discharge piping with pipe sizes.
(k) Instrumentation and Control System diagrams and

sequence of operation.
(l) Ductwork layout and sizing; insulation, supply, return,

and exhaust inlet and outlet sizes; and outside air intake sizes.
Air quantities shall be specified for inlets and outlets.

(m) Florida Energy Code calculations as applicable.
(n) NFPA Standards and all required fire protection

devices and systems.
(3) The Engineer of Record shall determine the level of

detail shown on plans for a HVAC system for mechanical
engineering plans pertaining to HVAC systems exempted by
the threshold requirements for mandatory use of professional
engineering services. All such plans shall provide a clear
understanding of the minimum system requirements expected
to be installed by the contractor.

(4) For Mechanical Engineering Documents pertaining to
HVAC systems that exceed the threshold requirements for
mandatory use of professional engineering services, the plans
shall have the following minimum indicate the following:

(a) Demonstrate and provide adequate information for the
AHJ to determine compliance with codes and ordinances.
These may include test methods and results; data and
tabulations for Energy Conservation that are results of the
design.

(b) Equipment selection schedule for each piece of
mechanical equipment. All equipment shall have capacities
listed including efficiencies, electrical or fuel requirements,
static pressure and fan air quantities as applicable to the
system, fluid flow and pressure head quantities as applicable to
the system, and heat transfer capacities.

(c) Floor plans; site plans; and building and mechanical
system elevations as appropriate.

(d) Outside (fresh) air make-up conditions.
(e) Cooling coil requirements based on sensible heat,

latent heat and total heat gains.
(f) Heating equipment requirements.
(g) Outside and inside design dry and wet bulb conditions.
(h) Exhaust riser diagrams on buildings more than three

stories when ductwork travels vertically.
(i) Outside air riser diagrams on buildings more than three

stories when ductwork travels vertically.
(j) Process flow diagrams with pipe sizes and fluid flow

quantities.



Florida Administrative Weekly Volume 33,  Number  47,  November 21, 2007

Section I - Notices of Development of Proposed Rules and Negotiated Rulemaking   5509

(k) Condensate discharge piping layout with pipe sizes.
(l) Instrumentation and Control System diagrams and

sequence of operation.
(m) Ductwork layout and sizing; insulation requirements,

supply, return, and exhaust inlet and outlet sizes; and outside
air intake sizes. Air quantities shall be specified for inlets and
outlets.

(n) All data needed to complete the Florida Energy Code
calculations as applicable.

(o) A list of referenced NFPA Standards and layouts of all
required fire protection devices and systems.

(p) Building pressurization criteria.

Specific Authority 471.008, 471.033(2) FS. Law Implemented
471.033 FS. History–New 11-16-94, Amended_______.

61G15-34.007 Design of Plumbing Systems.
(1) No change.
(2) Mechanical Engineering Documents applicable to

Plumbing Systems shall when applicable, include but are not
limited to the following:

(a) through (b) No change.
(c) Potable Water iIsometric diagrams with pipe sizes and

total water fixture units.
(d) through (m) No change.

Specific Authority 471.008, 471.033(2) FS. Law Implemented
471.033 FS. History–New 11-16-94, Amended_________.

DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION
Notices for the Department of Environmental Protection
between December 28, 2001 and June 30, 2006, go to
http://www.dep.state.fl.us/ under the link or button titled
“Official Notices.”

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH
Division of Medical Quality Assurance
RULE NO.: RULE TITLE:
64B-9.002 Physician Survey Procedures
PURPOSE AND EFFECT: To create a new rule relating to
physician workforce surveys.
SUBJECT AREA TO BE ADDRESSED: Physician Survey
Procedures.
SPECIFIC AUTHORITY: 458.3191(4), 459.0081(4) FS.
LAW IMPLEMENTED: 458.3191, 459.0081 FS.
IF REQUESTED IN WRITING AND NOT DEEMED
UNNECESSARY BY THE AGENCY HEAD, A RULE
DEVELOPMENT WORKSHOP WILL BE NOTICED IN
THE NEXT AVAILABLE FLORIDA ADMINISTRATIVE
WEEKLY.

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT AND A COPY OF
THE PRELIMINARY DRAFT IS: Lola Pouncey, Bureau
Chief, 4052 Bald Cypress Way, Bin #C10, Tallahassee, Florida
32399-3255

THE PRELIMINARY TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE
DEVELOPMENT IS: 

64B-9.002 Physician Survey Procedures.
(1) At time of licensure renewal, each medical doctor and

osteopathic physician who renews his or her license on line at
www.FLHealthSource.com must fully complete all applicable
portions of the physician survey questionnaire on line.
Physicians who do not renew online are required to obtain,
complete and submit a paper copy of the questionnaire with
their renewal.

(2) The nondisciplinary citation issued to a licensee for
failing to complete the survey shall be sent by regular U.S.
Mail to the licensee’s last address of record. The license
renewal notice warning of the prohibition against renewal
without first completing the survey shall be sent by regular
U.S. Mail to the licensee’s last address of record, and the
license shall not be renewed until the questionnaire has been
completed.
Specific Authority 458.3191(4), 459.0081(4) FS. Law Implemented
458.3191, 459.0081 FS. History–New________.

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH
Board of Acupuncture
RULE NO.: RULE TITLE:
64B1-6.005 Standards for Approval of 

Continuing Education Credit
PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The Board proposes the rule
amendment to set standards for continuing education in
Biomedical Clinical Competency.
SUBJECT AREA TO BE ADDRESSED: Standards for
approval of continuing education credit.
SPECIFIC AUTHORITY: 456.013(9), 456.033, 457.104,
457.107(3) FS.
LAW IMPLEMENTED: 456.013(9), 456.033, 457.107(3) FS.
IF REQUESTED IN WRITING AND NOT DEEMED
UNNECESSARY BY THE AGENCY HEAD, A RULE
DEVELOPMENT WORKSHOP WILL BE NOTICED IN
THE NEXT AVAILABLE FLORIDA ADMINISTRATIVE
WEEKLY.
THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT AND A COPY OF
THE PRELIMINARY DRAFT, IF AVAILABLE, IS: Pamela
King, Executive Director, Board of Acupuncture/MQA, 4052
Bald Cypress Way, Bin #C06, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-3256
THE PRELIMINARY TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE
DEVELOPMENT IS NOT AVAILABLE.



Florida Administrative Weekly Volume 33,  Number  47,  November 21, 2007

5510   Section I - Notices of Development of Proposed Rules and Negotiated Rulemaking

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH
Board of Dentistry
RULE NO.: RULE TITLE:
64B5-4.002 Advertising and Soliciting by 

Dentists
PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The Board proposes to review the
rule to remove unnecessary language and to add language to
clarify advertising and soliciting by Dentists.
SUBJECT AREA TO BE ADDRESSED: Advertising and
soliciting by dentists.
SPECIFIC AUTHORITY: 466.004(4), 466.019 FS.
LAW IMPLEMENTED: 466.019, 466.028(1)(d) FS.
A RULE DEVELOPMENT WORKSHOP WILL BE HELD
AT THE DATE, TIME AND PLACE SHOWN BELOW:
DATE AND TIME: Thursday, December 6, 2007, 4:00 p.m.
PLACE: Embassy Suites Hotel, 1100 S. E. 17th Street, Ft.
Lauderdale, Florida 33316
Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 5 days before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: Sue Foster, Executive Director, Board of
Dentistry/MQA, 4052 Bald Cypress Way, Bin #C08,
Tallahassee, Florida 32399-3258. If you are hearing or speech
impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida Relay
Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice).
THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT AND A COPY OF
THE PRELIMINARY DRAFT, IF AVAILABLE, IS: Sue
Foster, Executive Director, Board of Dentistry/MQA, 4052
Bald Cypress Way, Bin #C08, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-3258
THE PRELIMINARY TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE
DEVELOPMENT IS NOT AVAILABLE.

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH
Board of Dentistry
RULE NO.: RULE TITLE:
64B5-16.005 Remediable Tasks Delegable to 

Dental Assistants
PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The Board proposes to review the
rule to remove unnecessary language and to add language to
clarify remediable tasks that can be delegated to Dental
Assistants.
SUBJECT AREA TO BE ADDRESSED: Remediable tasks
delegable to Dental Assistants.
SPECIFIC AUTHORITY: 466.004(4), 466.024(3) FS.
LAW IMPLEMENTED: 466.024 FS.
A RULE DEVELOPMENT WORKSHOP WILL BE HELD
AT THE DATE, TIME AND PLACE SHOWN BELOW:
DATE AND TIME: Thursday, December 6, 2007, 4:00 p.m.
PLACE: Embassy Suites Hotel, 1100 S. E. 17th Street, Ft.
Lauderdale, Florida 33316

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 5 days before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: Sue Foster, Executive Director, Board of
Dentistry/MQA, 4052 Bald Cypress Way, Bin #C08,
Tallahassee, Florida 32399-3258. If you are hearing or speech
impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida Relay
Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice).
THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT AND A COPY OF
THE PRELIMINARY DRAFT, IF AVAILABLE, IS: Sue
Foster, Executive Director, Board of Dentistry/MQA, 4052
Bald Cypress Way, Bin #C08, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-3258
THE PRELIMINARY TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE
DEVELOPMENT IS NOT AVAILABLE.

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH
Board of Dentistry
RULE NO.: RULE TITLE:
64B5-16.006 Remediable Tasks Delegable to a 

Dental Hygienist
PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The Board proposes to review the
rule to remove unnecessary language and to add language to
clarify remediable tasks that can be delegated to Dental
Hygienists.
SUBJECT AREA TO BE ADDRESSED: Remediable tasks
delegable to Dental Hygienists.
SPECIFIC AUTHORITY: 466.004(4), 466.023, 466.024 FS.
LAW IMPLEMENTED: 466.023, 466.024 FS.
A RULE DEVELOPMENT WORKSHOP WILL BE HELD
AT THE DATE, TIME AND PLACE SHOWN BELOW:
DATE AND TIME: Thursday, December 6, 2007, 4:00 p.m.
PLACE: Embassy Suites Hotel, 1100 S. E. 17th Street, Ft.
Lauderdale, Florida 33316
Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 5 days before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: Sue Foster, Executive Director, Board of
Dentistry/MQA, 4052 Bald Cypress Way, Bin #C08,
Tallahassee, Florida 32399-3258. If you are hearing or speech
impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida Relay
Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice).
THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT AND A COPY OF
THE PRELIMINARY DRAFT, IF AVAILABLE, IS: Sue
Foster, Executive Director, Board of Dentistry/MQA, 4052
Bald Cypress Way, Bin #C08, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-3258
THE PRELIMINARY TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE
DEVELOPMENT IS NOT AVAILABLE.



Florida Administrative Weekly Volume 33,  Number  47,  November 21, 2007

Section I - Notices of Development of Proposed Rules and Negotiated Rulemaking   5511

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH
Board of Dentistry
RULE NO.: RULE TITLE:
64B5-17.016 Injectable Neurotoxins
PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The Board proposes to promulgate
and adopt a new rule clarifying the use of injectable
neurotoxins.
SUBJECT AREA TO BE ADDRESSED: Injectable
neurotoxins.
SPECIFIC AUTHORITY: 466.004(4) FS.
LAW IMPLEMENTED: 466.004(4) FS.
A RULE DEVELOPMENT WORKSHOP WILL BE HELD
AT THE DATE, TIME AND PLACE SHOWN BELOW:
DATE AND TIME: Thursday, December 6, 2007, 4:00 p.m.
PLACE: Embassy Suites Hotel, 1100 S. E. 17th Street, Ft.
Lauderdale, Florida 33316
Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 5 days before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: Sue Foster, Executive Director, Board of
Dentistry/MQA, 4052 Bald Cypress Way, Bin #C08,
Tallahassee, Florida 32399-3258. If you are hearing or speech
impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida Relay
Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice).
THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT AND A COPY OF
THE PRELIMINARY DRAFT, IF AVAILABLE, IS: Sue
Foster, Executive Director, Board of Dentistry/MQA, 4052
Bald Cypress Way, Bin #C08, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-3258
THE PRELIMINARY TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE
DEVELOPMENT IS NOT AVAILABLE.

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH
Board of Dentistry
RULE NO.: RULE TITLE:
64B5-17.017 Dermal Fillers
PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The Board proposes to promulgate
and adopt a new rule clarifying the use of dermal fillers.
SUBJECT AREA TO BE ADDRESSED: Dermal fillers.
SPECIFIC AUTHORITY: 466.004(4) FS.
LAW IMPLEMENTED: 466.004(4) FS.
A RULE DEVELOPMENT WORKSHOP WILL BE HELD
AT THE DATE, TIME AND PLACE SHOWN BELOW:
DATE AND TIME: Thursday, December 6, 2007, 4:00 p.m.
PLACE: Embassy Suites Hotel, 1100 S. E. 17th Street, Ft.
Lauderdale, Florida 33316
Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 5 days before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: Sue Foster, Executive Director, Board of
Dentistry/MQA, 4052 Bald Cypress Way, Bin #C08,

Tallahassee, Florida 32399-3258. If you are hearing or speech
impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida Relay
Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice).
THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT AND A COPY OF
THE PRELIMINARY DRAFT, IF AVAILABLE, IS: Sue
Foster, Executive Director, Board of Dentistry/MQA, 4052
Bald Cypress Way, Bin #C08, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-3258
THE PRELIMINARY TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE
DEVELOPMENT IS NOT AVAILABLE.

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH
Division of Environmental Health
RULE NO.: RULE TITLE:
64E-15.010 Permits and Fees
PURPOSE AND EFFECT: To increase fees to the extent the
program can meet the costs of providing the services.
SUBJECT AREA TO BE ADDRESSED: Permit fees.
SPECIFIC AUTHORITY: 513.045(1) (a) FS.
LAW IMPLEMENTED: 513.045(1) (a) FS.
IF REQUESTED IN WRITING AND NOT DEEMED
UNNECESSARY BY THE AGENCY HEAD, A RULE
DEVELOPMENT WORKSHOP WILL BE HELD AT THE
DATE, TIME AND PLACE SHOWN BELOW:
DATE AND TIME: December 21, 2007, 9:00 a.m.
PLACE: 4042 Bald Cypress Way, Conference Room 301,
Tallahassee, FL 32399-1710
THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT AND A COPY OF
THE PRELIMINARY DRAFT IS: David B. Wolfe,
Environmental Health Program Consultant, (850)245-4277

THE PRELIMINARY TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE
DEVELOPMENT IS: 

64E-15.010 Permits and Fees.
(1) through (3)(a) No change.
(b) In determining the fee of a recreational camp operating

as a commercial establishment, each 2 campers shall be
considered equivalent to the occupancy of a tent space or a non
self-contained recreational vehicle space. A commercial
recreational camp shall pay an annual fee based on $4.00 $3.50
per equivalent space which shall not be less than $100 $50 nor
more than $600. Commercial recreational camp permits for
changes of ownership, reinstatements after revocation of
permit, or new establishments permitted after December 31,
shall pay a prorated fee based on the remaining quarters of an
annual operation.

(c) Permit fees shall not be refunded once the permit has
been issued.

(d) A mobile home, recreational vehicle and/or lodging
park shall pay an annual fee based on $4.00 per space which
shall not be less than $100 nor more than $600.



Florida Administrative Weekly Volume 33,  Number  47,  November 21, 2007

5512   Section I - Notices of Development of Proposed Rules and Negotiated Rulemaking

Specific Authority 381.0011(13), 381.006, 381.0084, 513.05 FS. Law
Implemented 381.006(14), 381.0061, 381.008-.00895, 386.03,
512.065, 513.012, 513.02, 513.03, 513.045, 513.05 FS. History–New
5-20-96, Formerly 10D-26.190, Amended 6-23-98, 1-6-03,
_________.

FLORIDA HOUSING FINANCE CORPORATION
RULE NOS.: RULE TITLES:
67-21.002 Definitions
67-21.003 Application and Selection Process 

for Developments
67-21.0035 Applicant Administrative Appeal 

Procedures
67-21.004 Federal Set-Aside Requirements
67-21.0045 Determination of Method of Bond 

Sale
67-21.006 Development Requirements
67-21.007 Fees
67-21.008 Terms and Conditions of MMRB 

Loans
67-21.009 Interest Rate on Mortgage Loans
67-21.010 Issuance of Revenue Bonds
67-21.013 Non-Credit Enhanced Multifamily 

Mortgage Revenue Bonds
67-21.014 Credit Underwriting Procedures
67-21.015 Use of Bonds with Other Affordable 

Housing Finance Programs
67-21.017 Transfer of Ownership
67-21.018 Refundings and Troubled 

Development Review
67-21.019 Issuance of Bonds for Section 

501(c)(3) Entities
PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The purpose of this Rule is to
establish the procedures by which the Corporation shall: (1)
administer the Application process, determine loan amounts,
make and service mortgage loans for new construction or
rehabilitation of affordable rental units under the Multifamily
Mortgage Revenue Bond (MMRB) Program authorized by
Section 142 of the Code and Section 420.509, F.S.
SUBJECT AREA TO BE ADDRESSED: The Rule
Development workshop will be held to receive comments and
suggestions from interested persons relative to the
development of the 2008 application and program
requirements for the MMRB Program, as specified in Rule
Chapter 67-21, Florida Administrative Code (F.A.C.).
SPECIFIC AUTHORITY: 420.507, 420.508 FS.
LAW IMPLEMENTED: 420.509 FS.
IF REQUESTED IN WRITING AND NOT DEEMED
UNNECESSARY BY THE AGENCY HEAD, A RULE
DEVELOPMENT WORKSHOP WILL BE HELD AT THE
DATE, TIME AND PLACE SHOWN BELOW:
DATE AND TIME: December 7, 2007, following the Board
Meeting at a time to be announced at the conclusion of the
Board Meeting.

PLACE: Hyatt Regency Orlando Airport, 9300 Airport
Boulevard, Orlando, Florida 32827
Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 5 days before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: Wayne Conner (850)488-4197. If you are hearing
or speech impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida
Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770
(Voice).
THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT AND A COPY OF
THE PRELIMINARY DRAFT, IF AVAILABLE, IS: Wayne
Conner (850)488-4197.
THE PRELIMINARY TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE
DEVELOPMENT IS available on Florida Housing’s web site
www.floridahousing.org
THE PRELIMINARY TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE
DEVELOPMENT IS AVAILABLE AT NO CHARGE FROM
THE CONTACT PERSON LISTED ABOVE.

FLORIDA HOUSING FINANCE CORPORATION
RULE NOS.: RULE TITLES:
67-48.001 Purpose and Intent
67-48.002 Definitions
67-48.004 Application and Selection 

Procedures for Developments
67-48.005 Applicant Administrative Appeal 

Procedures
67-48.007 Fees
67-48.0072 Credit Underwriting and Loan 

Procedures
67-48.0075 Miscellaneous Criteria
67-48.009 SAIL General Program Procedures 

and Restrictions
67-48.0095 Additional SAIL Application 

Ranking and Selection Procedures
67-48.010 Terms and Conditions of SAIL Loans
67-48.0105 Sale, Transfer or Refinancing of a 

SAIL Development
67-48.013 SAIL Construction Disbursements 

and Permanent Loan Servicing
67-48.014 HOME General Program Procedures 

and Restrictions
67-48.015 Match Contribution Requirement for 

HOME Allocation
67-48.017 Eligible HOME Activities
67-48.018 Eligible HOME Applicants
67-48.019 Eligible and Ineligible HOME 

Development Costs
67-48.020 Terms and Conditions of Loans for 

HOME Rental Developments



Florida Administrative Weekly Volume 33,  Number  47,  November 21, 2007

Section II - Proposed Rules   5513

67-48.0205 Sale, Transfer or Refinancing of a 
HOME Development

67-48.022  HOME Disbursements Procedures 
and Loan Servicing

67-48.023 Housing Credits General Program 
Procedures and Requirements

67-48.027 Tax-Exempt Bond-Financed 
Developments

67-48.028 Carryover Allocation Provisions
67-48.029 Extended Use Agreement
67-48.030 Sale or Transfer of a Housing Credit 

Development
67-48.031 Termination of Extended Use 

Agreement and Disposition of 
Housing Credit Developments

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The purpose of this Rule is to
establish the procedures by which the Corporation shall: (1)
administer the Application process, determine loan amounts,
make and service mortgage loans for new construction or
rehabilitation of affordable rental units under the State
Apartment Incentive Loan (SAIL) Program authorized by
Section 420.5087, Florida Statutes (F.S.), and the HOME
Investment Partnerships (HOME) Program authorized by
Section 420.5089, Florida Statutes; and (2) administer the
Application process, determine Housing Credit (HC) amounts
and implement the provisions of the Housing Credit Program
authorized by Section 42 of the Code and Section 420.5099,
Florida Statutes.
SUBJECT AREA TO BE ADDRESSED: The Rule
Development workshop will be held to receive comments and
suggestions from interested persons relative to (1) the
development of the 2008 application and program
requirements for the SAIL, HOME, HC Programs, as specified
in Rule Chapter 67-48, Florida Administrative Code (F.A.C.)
and (2) amendments to the Florida Housing Finance
Corporation’s 2007 Qualified Allocation Plan (QAP).
SPECIFIC AUTHORITY: 420.507 F.S.
LAW IMPLEMENTED: 420.5087, 420.5089, 420.5099 F.S.
A RULE DEVELOPMENT WORKSHOP WILL BE HELD
AT THE DATE, TIME AND PLACE SHOWN BELOW:
DATE AND TIME: December 7, 2007, following the Board
Meeting at a time to be announced at the conclusion of the
Board Meeting
PLACE: Hyatt Regency Orlando Airport, 9300 Airport
Boulevard, Orlando, Florida 32827
THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT AND A COPY OF
THE PRELIMINARY DRAFT, IF AVAILABLE, IS: Deborah
Dozier Blinderman, Deputy Development Officer
THE PRELIMINARY TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE
DEVELOPMENT IS AVAILABLE AT NO CHARGE FROM
THE CONTACT PERSON LISTED ABOVE.

Section II 
Proposed Rules

DEPARTMENT OF LEGAL AFFAIRS
Division of Victim Services and Criminal Justice Programs
RULE NO.: RULE TITLE:
2A-2.002 Claims
PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The proposed rule amendment is
intended to set forth a revised form utilized for victim
compensation.
SUMMARY: The proposed rule amendment incorporates a
revised form with regard to victim compensation assistance.
SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF ESTIMATED
REGULATORY COSTS: No Statement of Estimated
Regulatory Cost was prepared.
Any person who wishes to provide information regarding a
statement of estimated regulatory costs, or provide a proposal
for a lower cost regulatory alternative must do so in writing
within 21 days of this notice.
SPECIFIC AUTHORITY: 960.045(1) FS.
LAW IMPLEMENTED: 960.065, 960.07, 960.12, 960.13,
960.15, 960.16, 960.17, 960.18, 960.195 960.198 FS.
IF REQUESTED WITHIN 21 DAYS OF THE DATE OF
THIS NOTICE, A HEARING WILL BE SCHEDULED AND
ANNOUNCED IN THE FAW.
THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULE IS: Gwen Roache, Chief, Bureau of
Victim Compensation, Department of Legal Affairs, PL-01,
The Capitol, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-1050

THE FULL TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE IS: 

2A-2.002 Claims.
Application and benefit payment criteria, limitations and
procedures for victim assistance are provided in the publication
entitled “Victim Compensation Assistance,” BVC-P001 (Rev.
9/07) (January 2000), effective ________ 2-3-00, which is
incorporated into these rules by reference. In addition, the
following documents are incorporated into this rule by
reference:

(1) through (12) No change.
Specific Authority 960.045(1) FS. Law Implemented 960.065,
960.07, 960.12, 960.13, 960.15, 960.16, 960.17, 960.18, 960.195
960.198 FS. History–New 1-1-92, Amended 11-1-92, 9-13-94,
1-8-96, 6-25-96, 10-1-96, 9-24-97, 8-17-99, 2-3-00, 10-23-01,
5-13-03,__________. 

NAME OF PERSON ORIGINATING PROPOSED RULE:
Gwen Roache, Chief, Bureau of Victim Compensation
NAME OF SUPERVISOR OR PERSON WHO APPROVED
THE PROPOSED RULE: Rodney Doss, Division Director,
Victim Services and Criminal Justice Programs
DATE PROPOSED RULE APPROVED BY AGENCY
HEAD: October 26, 2007


