
Florida Administrative Register Volume 39, Number 160, August 16, 2013 

4119 

 

Section I 

Notice of Development of Proposed Rules 

and Negotiated Rulemaking 

DEPARTMENT OF EDUCATION 

State Board of Education 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

6A-1.09422 Florida Comprehensive Assessment Test 

and End-of-Course Assessment 

Requirements 

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The purpose of this rule 

development is to include the U.S. History scale scores for 

each achievement level for use in reporting student 

proficiency levels in U.S. History as part of the student 

achievement testing program known as the U.S. History End-

of-Course (EOC) Assessment. In addition, the rule will be 

amended to designate passing scores for each Florida 

Comprehensive Assessment Test® 2.0 (FCAT 2.0) assessment 

and each Florida EOC Assessment. 

SUBJECT AREA TO BE ADDRESSED: Florida EOC 

Assessments and FCAT 2.0. 

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 1008.22 FS. 

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 1008.22 FS. 

A RULE DEVELOPMENT WORKSHOP WILL BE HELD 

AT THE DATES, TIMES AND PLACES SHOWN BELOW: 

DATES AND TIMES: September 3, 2013, 3:30 p.m. – 4:30 

p.m.; September 4, 2013, 3:00 p.m. – 4:00 p.m.; September 5, 

2013, 3:00 p.m. – 4:00 p.m. 

PLACES: September 3rd – Lee County Public Education 

Center, Board Room, 2855 Colonial Boulevard, Fort Meyers, 

Florida 33966; September 4th – Jim Miles Professional 

Development Center, Palm Room, 5204 U.S. Highway 98 S, 

Lakeland, Florida 33813; September 5th – Florida Department 

of Education, Turlington Building, 325 West Gaines Street, 

Room 1703, Tallahassee, Florida 32399 

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE 

PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT AND A COPY OF 

THE PRELIMINARY DRAFT, IF AVAILABLE, IS: Vince 

Verges, Director, Office of Assessment, 325 West Gaines 

Street, Room 414, Tallahassee, FL 32399, (850)245-0513. To 

submit a comment on this rule development, go to 

https://app1.fldoe.org/rules/default.aspx 

THE PRELIMINARY TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE 

DEVELOPMENT IS NOT AVAILABLE. 

DEPARTMENT OF CORRECTIONS 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

33-602.230 Institution Visits and Tours and Inmate or 

Probationer Presentations and Programs for 

the Public 

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The purpose and effect of the 

proposed rule is to disallow people under the age of 18 from 

entering areas that are not common assembly areas during 

their tours and eliminating inmate presenters from the tours. 

SUBJECT AREA TO BE ADDRESSED: Institution Visit and 

Tours and Inmate or Probationer Presentations and Programs 

for the Public. 

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 944.09 FS. 

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 944.09, 944.23, 945.75 FS. 

IF REQUESTED IN WRITING AND NOT DEEMED 

UNNECESSARY BY THE AGENCY HEAD, A RULE 

DEVELOPMENT WORKSHOP WILL BE NOTICED IN 

THE NEXT AVAILABLE FLORIDA ADMINISTRATIVE 

REGISTER. 

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE 

PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT AND A COPY OF 

THE PRELIMINARY DRAFT IS: LaDawna Fleckenstein, 

501 South Calhoun Street, Tallahassee, Florida 32399 

 

THE PRELIMINARY TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE 

DEVELOPMENT IS:  

 

33-602.230 Institution Visits and Tours and Inmate or 

Probationer Presentations and Programs for the Public. 

(1) Except as authorized in subsection (2) below, Nno 

tours by persons under 18 years of age beyond a common 

assembly area such as the visiting park will be permitted. 

Student and Juvenile Offender Tour groups shall be assembled 

in this common area and given briefings by staff members and 

shown orientation/training videos. Inmates shall not 

participate in these orientation briefings. 

(2) Juvenile Offender Tour Programs. 

(a) Definitions. 

1. No change. 

2. Central Office Program Manager – where used herein, 

refers to the staff member in the Bureau of Classification 

Management and Central Records who coordinates the 

juvenile offender tour program with designated institutions 

and the Bureau of Security Operations. 

3. No change. 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=6
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=195
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=6A-1.09422
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/cfr.asp?id=1008.22%20Florida%20Statutes.
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/cfr.asp?id=1008.22%20Florida%20Statutes.
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=33
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=33-602.230
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/cfr.asp?id=944.09%20FS
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/cfr.asp?id=944.09,%20944.23,%20945.75%20FS


Florida Administrative Register Volume 39, Number 160, August 16, 2013 

4120 

4. Inmate Presenter – where used herein, refers to an 

inmate whose participation in the program is voluntary, who 

has met prescreening criteria outlined in this rule, and who has 

successfully completed training to provide juvenile offenders 

with an accurate and realistic account of prison life and the 

effects of incarceration. 

4.5. Juvenile Offender – where used herein, refers to a 

youth not more than 17 years of age, but not less than 10 years 

of age, who is under court order to participate in a juvenile 

offender tour program. 

5.6. Juvenile Offender Tour Program – refers to a 

program implemented by the Department of Corrections 

which provides Florida’s courts with an intervention program 

that discourages juvenile offenders from continuing a criminal 

lifestyle by providing the juvenile offender with a realistic 

look at prison life.  

6.7. Outside Sponsor – where used herein, refers to an 

organization or agency working with a court to provide adult 

escorts for juvenile offenders participating in the juvenile 

offender tour program. 

7.8. Tour Program Facilitator – where used herein, refers 

to the staff member at the institution who is responsible for 

supervising tours and coordinating tours in conjunction with 

the central office program manager. 

(b) No change. 

(c) Staff Responsibilities for the Juvenile Offender Tour 

Program. 

1. The warden shall: 

a. No change. 

b. Based upon program activity, determine the number of 

inmate presenters who will participate in the program; 

b.c. Ensure the selection of staff to participate in the 

program; and 

c.d. Evaluate and approve or reject tour requests at least 

20 days in advance of the proposed tour date. Rejections shall 

be based on a determination that the tour is not in the best 

rehabilitative interests of the inmates incarcerated or that the 

tour will have an adverse impact on the security or orderly 

operation of the facility. 

2. No change. 

a. through c. No change. 

d. Select and train inmate presenters; 

d.e. Coordinate and provide orientation for participating 

staff; 

e.f. Place a copy of the court order for each juvenile that 

directs the juvenile offender’s participation in the program 

from the outside sponsor in a file that is to be maintained for 

three years; 

f.g. Report scheduling and completion results of the tour 

to the central office program manager. 

g.h. Ensure that all program guidelines are explained to 

the tour participants before allowing them entry into the 

compound; 

h.i. Coordinate notification to the court of tour 

participants who are disruptive or inappropriately dressed. 

3. No change. 

a. through b. No change. 

(d) Inmate Presenters. 

1. Inmates who wish to volunteer as presenters for the 

juvenile offender tour program shall submit Form DC6-236, 

Inmate Request, to the tour program facilitator. Form DC6-

236 is incorporated by reference in Rule 33-103.019, F.A.C. 

2. In order to be selected as an inmate presenter, an 

inmate must: 

a. Be free of disciplinary reports for a minimum of six 

months; 

b. Not be a certified or non-certified security threat group 

member; 

c. Be close custody or lower; 

d. Not have been in close management in the last 24 

months; and 

e. Not have a history of serious disciplinary reports or sex 

offense convictions. 

3. Inmate presenters shall receive at least four hours of 

training concerning presentation content. Inmate presenters 

shall receive instruction on and are expected to demonstrate an 

understanding of and a positive attitude towards the purpose 

and goals of the tour program. Inmate presenters will be 

trained that they will not: 

a. Use profanity, obscenities, individual confrontation, 

intimidation, or physical contact with tour participants, 

(“Scared Straight” techniques will not be used.) 

b. Exercise any control or authority over any tour 

participant, 

c. Remove their own nor tour participant’s clothing, 

d. Exchange personal information such as home addresses 

or telephone numbers with any tour participant, 

e. Give to or receive anything from tour participants, or 

f. Use any tobacco products. 

4. Inmate presenters shall: 

a. Wear uniforms that are clean, properly fitted, and in 

good repair, 

b. Maintain proper grooming in accordance with 

department rules, and 

c. Use courtesy in all their dealings with tour participants 

and adult escorts.  

(d)(e) Tours. 

1. through 2. No change. 

(e)(f) Upon tour approval, the tour program facilitator 

shall advise the outside sponsor in writing of the expectations 

and requirements of this rule, including the following: 



Florida Administrative Register Volume 39, Number 160, August 16, 2013 

4121 

 

1. through 2. No change. 

(f)(g) The outside sponsor shall be responsible for taking 

corrective action against disruptive participants. Unresolved 

situations shall result in the disruptive participants being 

removed from the tour. If necessary, the tour shall be 

terminated. 

(g)(h) The tour program facilitator shall, not later than 

two workdays following completion of the tour, report tour 

scheduling and completion results to the central office 

program manager.  

(3) through (5) No change. 

(6) The warden shall not discriminate on the basis of race, 

creed, color or national origin, but otherwise may deny a 

requested tour for any reason where approval would cause not 

be in the best rehabilitative interest of the inmates incarcerated 

or there would be the possibility of an adverse impact on the 

security and orderly operation of the facility. 

(7) No change. 

Rulemaking Authority 944.09 FS. Law Implemented 944.09, 944.23, 

945.75 FS. History–New 10-16-83, Formerly 33-5.12, Amended 7-

27-89, 3-8-98, Formerly 33-5.012, Amended 4-25-02, 7-2-

03,_________. 

COMMISSION ON ETHICS 

RULE NOS.: RULE TITLES: 

34-16.001 Scope and Applicability of Chapter 

34-16.002 Amount of Time for Individual Members of 

the Public to Address the Commission 

34-16.003 Procedure for Group Representative to 

Address the Commission 

34-16.004 Procedure for Informing Commission of 

Individual's Desire to be Heard or to 

Indicate Designation of a Representative 

Speaker 

34-16.005 Designation of Specified Time Period for 

Public Comment 

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: In accordance with Chapter 2013-

227, Section 1, LOF, (Section 286.0114, F.S. (2013)), the 

proposed new rule Chapter 34-16 sets forth procedures for 

reasonable opportunities for the public to be heard during 

public meetings of the Florida Commission on Ethics. 

SUBJECT AREA TO BE ADDRESSED: The procedures for 

public meetings of the Florida Commission on Ethics are 

affected by this rulemaking. 

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 112.322(9), 286.0114 FS. 

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 286.0114 FS. 

IF REQUESTED IN WRITING AND NOT DEEMED 

UNNECESSARY BY THE AGENCY HEAD, A RULE 

DEVELOPMENT WORKSHOP WILL BE NOTICED IN 

THE NEXT AVAILABLE FLORIDA ADMINISTRATIVE 

REGISTER. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 3 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Millie Fulford, Executive Secretary, Commission 

on Ethics, (850)488-7864. If you are hearing or speech 

impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida Relay 

Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice). 

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE 

PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT AND A COPY OF 

THE PRELIMINARY DRAFT, IF AVAILABLE, IS: Betsy 

Daley, Senior Attorney, Commission on Ethics, (850)488-

7864 

THE PRELIMINARY TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE 

DEVELOPMENT IS NOT AVAILABLE. 

DEPARTMENT OF ECONOMIC OPPORTUNITY 

Division of Community Development 

RULE NOS.: RULE TITLES: 

73C-23.0031 Definitions 

73C-23.0035 Eligibility 

73C-23.0041 Application Process and Administrative 

Requirements 

73C-23.0045 Specific Requirements for Competitive 

Categories 

73C-23.0048 Specific Requirements for Economic 

Development 

73C-23.0049 Funding for Special Economic Development 

Projects 

73C-23.0051 Grant Administration and Project 

Implementation 

73C-23.0061 Emergency Set-aside Assistance 

73C-23.0071 Section 108 Loan Guarantee Program 

73C-23.0081 Nonrecurring CDBG Funding 

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: This rulemaking will address 

changes that the Florida Legislature made during the 2011 and 

2013 legislative sessions to Sections 290.044 through 

290.0475, Florida Statutes. The rulemaking will also resolve 

conflicts between the rule and other sections of Florida 

Statutes and incorporate a revised process for environmental 

reviews required by the U.S. Department of Housing and 

Urban Development. Finally, the rulemaking will make it 

easier for local governments to understand the application 

process, find information related to economic development 

grants, and know what is required of them if they receive 

funding. 

SUBJECT AREA TO BE ADDRESSED: The application 

process, national objectives, eligibility to apply for funds, 

program categories, special economic development funding, 

financial management, environmental review, grant 

administration, program implementation, modifications to 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=34
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=34-16.001
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=34-16.002
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=34-16.003
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=34-16.004
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=34-16.005
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=112.322(9)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20286.0114%20FS.
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=286.0114%20FS.
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=73
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=1066
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=73C-23.0031
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=73C-23.0035
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=73C-23.0041
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=73C-23.0045
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=73C-23.0048
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=73C-23.0049
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=73C-23.0051
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=73C-23.0061
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=73C-23.0071
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=73C-23.0081


Florida Administrative Register Volume 39, Number 160, August 16, 2013 

4122 

grants, closing out grants, emergency set-aside and the Section 

108 loan guarantee program. 

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 290.044, 290.047, 290.048 

FS. 

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 290.043, 290.044, 290.0455, 

290.046, 290.047, 290.0475, 290.048 FS. 

IF REQUESTED IN WRITING AND NOT DEEMED 

UNNECESSARY BY THE AGENCY HEAD, A RULE 

DEVELOPMENT WORKSHOP WILL BE NOTICED IN 

THE NEXT AVAILABLE FLORIDA ADMINISTRATIVE 

REGISTER. 

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE 

PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT AND A COPY OF 

THE PRELIMINARY DRAFT, IF AVAILABLE, IS: Roger 

Doherty, Division of Community Development, Department 

of Economic Opportunity, 107 East Madison Street, MSC 400, 

Tallahassee, Florida 32399, (850)717-8417 

THE PRELIMINARY TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE 

DEVELOPMENT IS NOT AVAILABLE. 

 

Section II 

Proposed Rules 

PUBLIC SERVICE COMMISSION 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE:  

25-6.0431 Petition for Limited Proceeding 

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: Rule 25-6.0431, F.A.C., 

establishes the requirements for a petition for limited 

proceeding for electric utilities.  These requirements offer 

consistency in practice and codify the essential elements of a 

petition for limited proceedings by electric utilities. 

Docket No. 130148-PU 

SUMMARY: Rule 25-6.0431, F.A.C., requires that a petition 

for a limited proceeding for electric utilities include a list of all 

issues the petitioner believes should be decided, the reasons 

why the limited proceeding has been requested, and any other 

information that the utility deems relevant. 

SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF ESTIMATED 

REGULATORY COSTS AND LEGISLATIVE 

RATIFICATION: 

The agency has determined that this will not have an adverse 

impact on small business or likely increase directly or 

indirectly regulatory costs in excess of $200,000 in the 

aggregate within one year after the implementation of the rule. 

A SERC has been prepared by the agency.   

The SERC examined the factors required by Section 

120.541(2)(c), F.S., and concluded that the rule amendments 

will not have an adverse impact on economic growth, business 

competitiveness, or small business, and that there would likely 

be transactional cost savings to the individual and entities, 

including government entities, required to comply with the 

rule. 

The agency has determined that the proposed rule 

amendments are not expected to require legislative ratification 

based on the statement of estimated regulatory costs or if no 

SERC is required, the information expressly relied upon and 

described herein: based upon the information contained in the 

SERC.  

Any person who wishes to provide information regarding a 

statement of estimated regulatory costs, or provide a proposal 

for a lower cost regulatory alternative must do so in writing 

within 21 days of this notice. 

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 350.127(2), 366.05, 

366.06(1) FS. 

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 366.05(1), 366.06(1), 366.076(1) FS. 

IF REQUESTED WITHIN 21 DAYS OF THE DATE OF 

THIS NOTICE, A HEARING WILL BE SCHEDULED AND 

ANNOUNCED IN THE FAR. 

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE 

PROPOSED RULE IS: Pamela H. Page, Office of General 

Counsel, 2540 Shumard Oak Blvd., Tallahassee, FL 32399-

0850, (850)413-6214, phpage@psc.state.fl.us 

 

THE FULL TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE IS: 

 

25-6.0431 Petition for a Limited Proceeding. 

A petition for a limited proceeding shall include: 

(1) A list of all issues the petitioner believes should be 

decided; 

(2) A detailed statement of the reason(s) why the limited 

proceeding has been requested and why a limited proceeding 

is the appropriate type of proceeding for consideration of the 

requested relief; 

(3) A schedule showing the specific rate base components 

for which the utility seeks recovery, on both a system and 

jurisdictional basis, if the utility is requesting recovery of rate 

base components; 

(4) A detailed description of the expense(s) requested on 

both a system and jurisdictional basis, if the utility is 

requesting recovery of operating expenses;  

(5) A schedule showing how the utility proposes to 

allocate any change in revenues to rate classes, and the 

proposed rates, if the petition requests a change in retail rates; 

and 

(6) Any other information that the utility deems relevant. 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=290.044
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20290.047
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20290.048%20FS.
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20290.048%20FS.
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=290.043
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20290.044
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20290.0455
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20290.046
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20290.047
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20290.0475
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20290.048%20FS.


Florida Administrative Register Volume 39, Number 160, August 16, 2013 

4123 

 

Rulemaking Authority 350.127(2), 366.05, 366.06(1) FS.  Law 

Implemented 366.05(1), 366.06(1), 366.076(1) FS. History–

New__________. 

 

NAME OF PERSON ORIGINATING PROPOSED RULE: 

Cheryl Bulecza-Banks 

NAME OF AGENCY HEAD WHO APPROVED THE 

PROPOSED RULE: Florida Public Service Commission 

DATE PROPOSED RULE APPROVED BY AGENCY 

HEAD: August 13, 2013 

DATE NOTICE OF PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT 

PUBLISHED IN FAR: Volume 39, Number 46, March 7, 

2013 

PUBLIC SERVICE COMMISSION 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE:  

25-7.0391 Petition for Limited Proceeding 

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: Rule 25-7.0391, F.A.C., 

establishes the requirements for a petition for limited 

proceeding for gas utilities.  These requirements offer 

consistency in practice and codify the essential elements of a 

petition for limited proceedings by gas utilities. 

Docket No. 130148-PU 

SUMMARY: Rule 25-7.0391, F.A.C., requires that a petition 

for a limited proceeding for gas utilities include a list of all 

issues the petitioner believes should be decided, the reasons 

why the limited proceeding has been requested, and any other 

information that the utility deems relevant. 

SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF ESTIMATED 

REGULATORY COSTS AND LEGISLATIVE 

RATIFICATION: 

The agency has determined that this will not have an adverse 

impact on small business or likely increase directly or 

indirectly regulatory costs in excess of $200,000 in the 

aggregate within one year after the implementation of the rule. 

A SERC has been prepared by the agency.   

The SERC examined the factors required by Section 

120.541(2)(c), F.S., and concluded that the rule amendments 

will not have an adverse impact on economic growth, business 

competitiveness, or small business, and that there would likely 

be transactional cost savings to the individual and entities, 

including government entities, required to comply with the 

rule. 

The agency has determined that the proposed rule 

amendments are not expected to require legislative ratification 

based on the statement of estimated regulatory costs or if no 

SERC is required, the information expressly relied upon and 

described herein: based upon the information contained in the 

SERC.  

Any person who wishes to provide information regarding a 

statement of estimated regulatory costs, or provide a proposal 

for a lower cost regulatory alternative must do so in writing 

within 21 days of this notice. 

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 350.127(2), 366.05, 

366.06(1) FS. 

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 366.05(1), 366.06(1), 366.076(1) FS. 

IF REQUESTED WITHIN 21 DAYS OF THE DATE OF 

THIS NOTICE, A HEARING WILL BE SCHEDULED AND 

ANNOUNCED IN THE FAR. 

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE 

PROPOSED RULE IS: Pamela H. Page, Office of General 

Counsel, 2540 Shumard Oak Blvd., Tallahassee, FL 32399-

0850, (850)413-6214, phpage@psc.state.fl.us 

 

THE FULL TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE IS: 

 

25-7.0391 Petition for a Limited Proceeding. 

A petition for a limited proceeding shall include: 

(1) A list of all issues the petitioner believes should be 

decided; 

(2) A detailed statement of the reason(s) why the limited 

proceeding has been requested and why a limited proceeding 

is the appropriate type of proceeding for consideration of the 

requested relief; 

(3) A schedule showing the specific rate base components 

for which the utility seeks recovery, on both a system and 

jurisdictional basis, if the utility is requesting recovery of rate 

base components; 

(4) A detailed description of the expense(s) requested on 

both a system and jurisdictional basis, if the utility is 

requesting recovery of operating expenses;  

(5) A schedule showing how the utility proposes to 

allocate any change in revenues to rate classes, and the 

proposed rates, if the petition requests a change in retail rates; 

and 

(6) Any other information that the utility deems relevant. 

Rulemaking Authority 350.127(2), 366.05, 366.06(1) FS. Law 

Implemented 366.05(1), 366.06(1), 366.076(1) FS. History–

New_________. 

 

NAME OF PERSON ORIGINATING PROPOSED RULE: 

Cheryl Bulecza-Banks 

NAME OF AGENCY HEAD WHO APPROVED THE 

PROPOSED RULE: Florida Public Service Commission 

DATE PROPOSED RULE APPROVED BY AGENCY 

HEAD: August 13, 2013 

DATE NOTICE OF PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT 

PUBLISHED IN FAR: Vol. 39, No. – 46, March 7, 2013 



Florida Administrative Register Volume 39, Number 160, August 16, 2013 

4124 

PUBLIC SERVICE COMMISSION 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE:  

25-22.0406 Notice and Public Information on General 

Rate Increase Requests by Electric, Gas and 

Telephone Companies 

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: Rule 25-22.0406, F.A.C., is 

amended to update general rate case noticing requirements for 

electric and gas utilities and establishes noticing requirements 

for gas and electric utility limited proceedings.  

Docket No. 130148-PU 

SUMMARY: Rule 25-22.0406, F.A.C., is amended to apply to 

limited proceedings for electric and gas utilities, improves 

access by the public to these proceedings, and updates the rule 

to reflect current technology. 

SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF ESTIMATED 

REGULATORY COSTS AND LEGISLATIVE 

RATIFICATION: 

The agency has determined that this will not have an adverse 

impact on small business or likely increase directly or 

indirectly regulatory costs in excess of $200,000 in the 

aggregate within one year after the implementation of the rule.  

A SERC has been prepared by the agency.   

The SERC examined the factors required by Section 

120.541(2)(c), F.S., and concluded that the rule amendments 

will not have an adverse impact on economic growth, business 

competitiveness, or small business, and that there would likely 

be transactional cost savings to the individual and entities, 

including government entities, required to comply with the 

rule. 

The agency has determined that the proposed rule 

amendments are not expected to require legislative ratification 

based on the statement of estimated regulatory costs or if no 

SERC is required, the information expressly relied upon and 

described herein: based upon the information contained in the 

SERC.  

Any person who wishes to provide information regarding a 

statement of estimated regulatory costs, or provide a proposal 

for a lower cost regulatory alternative must do so in writing 

within 21 days of this notice. 

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 350.127(2), 366.05, 

366.06(1) FS. 

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 366.03, 366.041(1), 366.05(1) FS. 

IF REQUESTED WITHIN 21 DAYS OF THE DATE OF 

THIS NOTICE, A HEARING WILL BE SCHEDULED AND 

ANNOUNCED IN THE FAR. 

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE 

PROPOSED RULE IS: Pamela H. Page, Office of General 

Counsel, 2540 Shumard Oak Blvd., Tallahassee, FL 32399-

0850, (850)413-6214, phpage@psc.state.fl.us 

 

THE FULL TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE IS: 

 

25-22.0406 Notice and Public Information on General 

Rate Increase Requests and Petitions for Limited Proceedings 

by Electric, and Gas and Telephone Companies Utilities. 

(1) The provisions of this rule shall be applicable to all 

requests for general rate increases and to all limited 

proceedings filed by electric and gas utilities pursuant to Rules 

25-6.0431 and 25-7.0391 by electric, gas and telephone 

companies subject to the Commission’s jurisdiction. 

(2) The following noticing procedures shall apply to 

requests for a general rate increase: 

(a) Upon filing a petition for a general rate increase, Tthe 

utility shall mail a copy of the petition to the chief executive 

officer of the governing body of each municipality and county 

within the service area affected. 

(b) The utility shall establish a clearly identifiable link on 

the utility’s website to the address on the Commission’s 

website that provides electronic access to all documents filed 

in the rate case. 

(c) Location of Minimum Filing Requirements 

1.(3)(a) Within 15 days after it has been notified by the 

Commission that the Minimum Filing Requirements (MFRs) 

have been met, the utility shall place a copy of the MFRs at its 

official headquarters and at a location approved by the 

Commission staff its business office in each municipality in 

which service hearings were held in the last general rate case 

of the utility. 

2. Within 15 days after the time schedule has been posted 

on the Commission’s website mailed to the utility, copies of 

the MFRs shall be placed in a location approved by 

Commission staff the utility business office in each additional 

city in which service hearings are to be held in the current rate 

case. Upon customer request a copy of the MFRs shall be 

placed in a utility business office not located in a city where a 

service hearing is to be held. The copies of the MFRs shall be 

available for public inspection during the utility’s regular 

business hours. 

3.(b) In addition to the locations listed above, if the 

Commission staff determines that the locations listed above 

will not provide adequate access, the Commission staff will 

require that copies of the MFRs be placed at other specified 

locations. 

4. Copies of the MFRs shall be available for public 

inspection during the regular business hours of the location 

hosting the MFRs and through a link on the utility’s website. 

(d) Rate Case Synopsis. 



Florida Administrative Register Volume 39, Number 160, August 16, 2013 

4125 

 

1.(4)(a) Within 15 days after the time schedule for the 

case has been posted to the Commission’s website, mailed to 

the utility, the utility shall prepare and submit to the 

Commission staff for approval and distribute a synopsis of the 

rate request.  The synopsis shall be approved by the 

Commission or its staff prior to distribution and shall include: 

a.1. A summary of the section of the MFRs showing a 

comparison of the present and proposed rates for major 

services; 

b.2. A statement of the anticipated major issues involved 

in the rate case; 

c.3. A copy of the executive summary filed with the 

MFRs; 

d.4. A description of the ratemaking process and the time 

schedule established for the rate case; and 

e.5. The locations at which complete MFRs are available. 

2. (b) Within 7 days following approval of the synopsis, 

cCopies of the synopsis shall be distributed to the same 

locations as required for the MFRs, to the main county library 

within or most convenient to the service area, and to the chief 

executive officer of each county and municipality within the 

service area affected. 

(e)(5) Within 15 30 days after the rate case time schedule 

has been posted on the Commission’s website,  mailed to the 

utility, the utility shall prepare and submit a customer notice to 

Commission staff for approval.  The customer notice shall 

include: begin sending a notice approved by the Commission 

or its staff to its customers containing: 

1.(a) A statement that the utility has applied for a rate 

increase and the general reasons for the request; 

2.(b) The locations at which copies of the MFRs and 

synopsis are available, including the link on the utility’s 

website; 

3.(c) The time schedule established for the case, and the 

dates, times and locations of any hearings that have been 

scheduled; and 

4.(d) A comparison of current rates and service charges 

and the proposed new rates and service charges;.  Such notice 

shall be completed at least 10 days prior to the first scheduled 

service hearing. 

5. The docket number assigned to the petition by the 

Commission’s Office of Commission Clerk; 

6. A statement that written comments regarding the 

proposed changes in rates and charges should be addressed to 

the Office of Commission Clerk, 2540 Shumard Oak 

Boulevard, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-0850, and that such 

correspondence should include the docket number; and 

7. A statement that comments regarding service may be 

made to the Commission’s Office of Consumer Assistance and 

Outreach at this toll free number: (800) 342-3552. 

(f) The utility shall begin sending the notice to customers 

within 30 days after it has been approved by Commission 

Staff. 

(3) The following noticing procedures shall apply to a 

petition for a limited proceeding filed pursuant to Rules 25-

6.0431 and 25-7.0391, F.A.C.: 

(a) The utility shall establish a clearly identifiable link on 

the utility’s website to the address on the Commission’s 

website that provides electronic access to all documents filed 

in the limited proceeding. 

(b) Within 15 days after the time schedule for the limited 

proceeding has been posted to the Commission’s website, the 

utility shall prepare and submit a customer notice to the 

Commission staff for approval.  The customer notice shall 

contain: 

1. A statement that the utility has requested a change in 

rates, a statement of the amount requested, and the general 

reason for the request; 

2. A statement of where and when the petition and 

supporting documentation are available for public inspection, 

including the link on the utility’s website; 

3. A comparison of the current and proposed rates; 

4. The utility’s address, telephone number, and website 

address; 

5. The docket number assigned to the petition by the 

Commission’s Office of Commission Clerk; 

6. A statement that written comments regarding the 

proposed changes in rates and charges should be addressed to 

the Office of Commission Clerk, 2540 Shumard Oak 

Boulevard, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-0850, and that such 

correspondence should include the docket number; and 

7. A statement that comments regarding service may be 

made to the Commission’s Office of Consumer Assistance and 

Outreach at this toll free number: (800) 342-3552. 

(c) The utility shall begin sending the notice to customers 

within 30 days after it has been approved by staff. 

(4) All customer notices prepared pursuant to this rule 

shall be sent to the customer’s address of record at the time the 

notice is issued, in the manner in which the customer typically 

receives the monthly bill, whether electronically or via U.S. 

mail. 

(5) All customer notices regarding the locations and time 

of any service hearings or customer meetings shall be sent to 

the customer no less than 10 days, or more than 45 days, prior 

to the first service hearing or customer meeting. 

(6) At least 7 days and not more than 20 days prior to any 

each service hearing or customer meeting, the utility shall 

have published in a newspaper of general circulation in the 

area in which the hearing or customer meeting is to be held a 



Florida Administrative Register Volume 39, Number 160, August 16, 2013 

4126 

display advertisement stating the date, time, location and 

purpose of the hearing or customer meeting. The 

advertisement shall be approved by the Commission or its 

staff prior to publication. 

(7) When the Commission issues proposed agency action 

and a hearing is subsequently held, the utility shall give 

written notice of the hearing to its customers at least 14 days 

in advance of the hearing.  This notice shall be approved by 

the Commission or its staff prior to distribution. 

(8) After the Commission’s issuance of an order granting 

or denying a rate change, the utility shall give notice to its 

customers of the order and the revised rates.  The notice shall 

be approved in advance by the Commission or its staff and 

transmitted to the customers with the first bill containing the 

new rates. 

Rulemaking Specific Authority 350.127(2), 366.05, 366.06(1) FS. 

Law Implemented 120.569, 120.57, 364.01(4), 364.035(1), 

364.04(3), (4), 364.05(1), (2), 364.19, 366.03, 366.041(1), 366.05(1), 

366.06(1), 366.076(1) FS. History–New 9-27-83, Formerly 25-

22.406, Amended 5-27-93, 5-3-99,__________. 

 
NAME OF PERSON ORIGINATING PROPOSED RULE: 

Cheryl Bulecza-Banks 

NAME OF AGENCY HEAD WHO APPROVED THE 

PROPOSED RULE: Florida Public Service Commission 

DATE PROPOSED RULE APPROVED BY AGENCY 

HEAD: August 13, 2013 

DATE NOTICE OF PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT 

PUBLISHED IN FAR: Volume 39, Number 46, March 7, 

2013 

COMMISSION ON ETHICS 

RULE NOS.: RULE TITLES:  

34-5.001 Staff Procedures Upon Receipt of a 

Complaint of Breach of Public Trust 

34-5.002 Review for Sufficiency of Allegations of 

Breach of Public Trust and Order of 

Preliminary Investigation 

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The purpose of the proposed 

amendments clarifies the Commission staff's handling of 

complaints and also incorporates changes to the complaint 

process resulting from the enactment of Chapter 2013-36, 

LOF. 

SUMMARY: Complaints will be returned to complainants 

without any action being taken if they do not meet the 

technical requirements of the rule or if they allege a matter or 

name a person not within the jurisdiction of the Commission 

on Ethics. Complaints filed within 30 days of an election will 

be returned, and no action will be taken on complaints alleging 

a de minimis financial disclosure error or omission if the 

respondent files an amended disclosure form within 30 days of 

being notified of the complaint. 

SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF ESTIMATED 

REGULATORY COSTS AND LEGISLATIVE 

RATIFICATION:  

The Agency has determined that this will not have an adverse 

impact on small business or likely increase directly or 

indirectly regulatory costs in excess of $200,000 in the 

aggregate within one year after the implementation of the rule. 

A SERC has not been prepared by the agency.  

The Agency has determined that the proposed rule is not 

expected to require legislative ratification based on the 

statement of estimated regulatory costs or if no SERC is 

required, the information expressly relied upon and described 

herein: The proposed changes will likely result in increased 

mailing costs for the Commission, as more complaints could 

be returned to complainants. Any increases are expected to be 

absorbed in the agency's budget. 

Any person who wishes to provide information regarding a 

statement of estimated regulatory costs, or provide a proposal 

for a lower cost regulatory alternative must do so in writing 

within 21 days of this notice. 

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 112.322(9), 120.53 FS. 

LAW IMPLEMENTED: Art. II, Section 8(f), (h), Fla. Const., 

Chapter 2013-36, Sections 7, 9, and 17, LOF, 112.3144, 

112.3145, 112.322, 112.324 FS. 

A HEARING WILL BE HELD AT THE DATE, TIME AND 

PLACE SHOWN BELOW:  

DATE AND TIME: September 13, 2013, 8:30 a.m. 

PLACE: Senate Office Building, Room 37S, 404 South 

Monroe Street, Tallahassee, FL 

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE 

PROPOSED RULE IS: Julia Cobb Costas, Assistant General 

Counsel, Commission on Ethics 

 

THE FULL TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE IS:  

 

34-5.001 Staff Procedures Upon Receipt of a Complaint 

of Breach of Public Trust. 

(1) Safeguarding confidential materials. Upon receipt of a 

sworn complaint, staff shall stamp on the face thereof the date 

on which the complaint was received in the Commission 

office. Each complaint received shall be assigned a control 

number which shall be entered on the complaint itself and on a 

colored folder in which the complaint shall be filed so long as 

it remains confidential. Any document related to the complaint 

shall be entered into the complaint file. 

(2) Technical and Clerical Review. Upon receipt of a 

complaint, the staff of the Commission shall review the 

complaint to insure that the proper complaint form has been 

used, that all the information required has been provided, that 

only one respondent has been named in each complaint form 

submitted, and that the complaint has been properly signed by 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=34
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=34-5.001
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=34-5.002
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=112.322(9)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20120.53%20FS.
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/flconstitution.asp?id=Art.%20II,%20Section%208(f),%20(h),%20Fla.%20Const.,%20
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/flconstitution.asp?id=Art.%20II,%20Section%208(f),%20(h),%20Fla.%20Const.,%20
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/lawfl.asp?id=%20Chapter%202013-36,%20Sections%207,%209,%20and%2017,%20LOF,%20
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/lawfl.asp?id=%20Chapter%202013-36,%20Sections%207,%209,%20and%2017,%20LOF,%20
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20112.3145
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20112.322
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20112.324%20FS.


Florida Administrative Register Volume 39, Number 160, August 16, 2013 

4127 

 

the complainant under oath. One or more persons may sign a 

complaint under oath; however, when the complaint is to be 

filed under oath in a representative capacity in behalf of an 

incorporated association or group, the complaint shall include 

sufficient information to indicate the authority of the person 

signing the complaint to file such a complaint in behalf of the 

association or group. If the complaint lacks any of the 

foregoing, or is otherwise incomplete, or alleges a matter or 

names a person not within the jurisdiction of the Commission 

on Ethics, a copy of the complaint shall be returned to the 

complainant identifying the defect. The staff shall provide 

assistance or information to persons seeking to file a 

complaint, but shall not encourage, solicit or discourage the 

filing of a complaint. If the complaint is filed in behalf of an 

unincorporated group or association, the person(s) signing the 

complaint will be considered to be the complainant(s) rather 

than the group or association. 

(3) Each complaint which is not returned to the 

complainant shall be assigned a control number which shall be 

entered on the complaint itself and on a colored folder in 

which the complaint shall be filed so long as it remains 

confidential. Any document related to the complaint shall be 

entered into the complaint file. 

(4)(3) No change.  

(5)(4) Any complaint against a candidate in a general, 

special, or primary election that is received within the thirty 

(30) five calendar days immediately preceding the date of that 

election, including Saturdays, Sundays, and holidays, will be 

returned by the Executive Director to the person filing the 

complaint, with an explanation of why the complaint is being 

returned. 

Rulemaking Authority 112.322(9) FS. Law Implemented Art. II, Sec. 

8(f), (h), Fla. Const., Chapter 2013-36, Section 17, LOF, 112.322, 

112.324 FS. History–New 4-7-77, Amended 9-21-77, 11-9-77, 7-13-

80, 11-26-80, 4-29-81, 2-21-83, Formerly 34-5.01, Amended 2-16-

95,_________. 

 

34-5.002 Review for Sufficiency of Allegations of Breach 

of Public Trust and Order of Preliminary Investigation; 

Review of Allegations of Failure to Properly Complete 

Financial Disclosure Forms. 

(1) After a the complaint has been reviewed and found to 

be in proper form, the complaint shall be reviewed by the 

Executive Director in order to determine whether the 

Commission has jurisdiction over the complaint is legally 

sufficient to allege; that is, whether the complaint is one 

concerning a breach of public trust. Complaints need not be as 

precise as would be required by the rules of civil procedure in 

a court of law and shall be deemed sufficient if the 

complainant under oath upon knowledge or belief alleges 

matters which, if true, may constitute a breach of public trust. 

A complaint shall not be insufficient because it is based upon 

evidence which would be hearsay evidence in a court of law. 

In order to make this determination, the Executive Director 

may request additional information from the complainant and 

may obtain information from public records. 

(2) If the Executive Director finds that the complaint is 

legally sufficient to invoke the jurisdiction of the Commission, 

the Executive Director shall order an investigation of the 

complaint. 

(3) If the Executive Director finds that the complaint is 

not legally sufficient to invoke the jurisdiction of the 

Commission, the complaint shall be brought before the 

Commission in executive session with the recommendations 

of the Executive Director. The Commission may find the 

complaint to be sufficient and order an investigation; may find 

the complaint to be insufficient, dismiss it, and notify the 

complainant that no investigation will be made; or may take 

such other action as may be appropriate. In any case where a 

complaint is found legally insufficient and dismissed, a 

summary of the reasons for dismissing the complaint together 

with the complaint itself and all documents related thereto 

shall become a public record and constitute a public report. 

(4) Review of complaints alleging violation of Article II, 

Section 8(a) or (i), Florida Constitution, or Sections 112.3144 

or 112.3145, Florida Statutes, due to errors or omissions on an 

annual CE Form 6 – Full and Public Disclosure of Financial 

Interests, or CE Form 1 – Statement of Financial Interests. 

(a) Effective May 1, 2013, the Commission shall treat an 

amended annual CE Form 6 – Full and Public Disclosure of 

Financial Interests, or CE Form 1 – Statement of Financial 

Interests, filed prior to September 1 of the year in which the 

disclosure is or was due as the original filing, regardless of 

whether a complaint has been filed. 

(b) If a complaint filed after May 1, 2013, alleges an error 

or omission on an annual CE Form 6 – Full and Public 

Disclosure of Financial Interests, or CE Form 1 – Statement of 

Financial Interests, and is filed after August 25 of the year in 

which the annual disclosure is or was due, the Executive 

Director shall determine whether the complaint contains any 

allegations other than allegations of an immaterial, 

inconsequential, or de minimis error or omission on the 

disclosure form. If the complaint contains no such allegations, 

the staff shall take no action on the complaint other than to 

notify the respondent of the complaint. If the respondent files 

an amended disclosure correcting the error or omission with 

the Commission within 30 days of the date the notice is 

mailed, no further action shall be taken. If the respondent does 

not file an amended disclosure correcting the error or omission 

with the Commission within 30 days of the date the notice is 



Florida Administrative Register Volume 39, Number 160, August 16, 2013 

4128 

mailed, the procedures in subsections (1)-(3), above, shall be 

followed. 

Rulemaking Authority 112.322(9), 120.53 FS. Law Implemented Art. 

II, Section 8(f), (h), Fla. Const., Chapter 2013-36, Sections 7 and 9, 

112.3144, 112.3145, 112.322, 112.324 FS. History–New 4-7-77, 

Amended 9-21-77, 7-13-80, 1-12-82, Formerly 34-5.02, 

Amended_________. 

 

NAME OF PERSON ORIGINATING PROPOSED RULE: 

Virlindia Doss, Executive Director, Commission on Ethics 

NAME OF AGENCY HEAD WHO APPROVED THE 

PROPOSED RULE: Virlindia Doss, Executive Director, 

Commission on Ethics 

DATE PROPOSED RULE APPROVED BY AGENCY 

HEAD: August 15, 2013 

DATE NOTICE OF PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT 

PUBLISHED IN FAR: August 13, 2013 

COMMISSION ON ETHICS 

RULE NOS.: RULE TITLES:  

34-8.002  General Rules for Filing the CE Form 6 – 

Full and Public Disclosure of Financial 

Interests 

34-8.008 Final Filing Using the CE Form 6F 

34-8.009  Amended Filing Using the CE Form 6X 

34-8.202  General Rules for Filing the CE Form 1 – 

Statement of Financial Interests 

34-8.208  Final Filing Using the CE Form 1F 

34-8.209 Amended Filing Using the CE Form 1X 

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The Commission will be 

amending the disclosure forms adopted by reference in the 

rules of Chapter 34-8, FAC, to address changes as a result of 

legislation enacted in Chapter 2013-36, LOF, Sections 7 and 

9, as well as to change the form year from 2013 to 2014. The 

most significant change in the law is the provision that allows 

a public official to have a certified public accountant or 

attorney prepare their disclosure form. A signature block in 

being added to all of the disclosure forms for this purpose. 

SUMMARY: This rulemaking affects the CE Form 6 – Full 

and Public Disclosure of Financial Interests; CE Form 6F--

Final Full and Public Disclosure of Financial Interests; CE 

Form 6X – Amendment to Full and Public Disclosure of 

Financial Interests; CE Form 1 – Statement of Financial 

Interests; CE Form 1F – Final Statement of Financial Interests; 

and CE Form 1X – Amendment to Form 1 Statement of 

Financial Interests. 

SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF ESTIMATED 

REGULATORY COSTS AND LEGISLATIVE 

RATIFICATION:  

The Agency has determined that this will not have an adverse 

impact on small business or likely increase directly or 

indirectly regulatory costs in excess of $200,000 in the 

aggregate within one year after the implementation of the rule. 

A SERC has not been prepared by the agency.  

The Agency has determined that the proposed rule is not 

expected to require legislative ratification based on the 

statement of estimated regulatory costs or if no SERC is 

required, the information expressly relied upon and described 

herein: Approximately 40,000 persons are required by law to 

file either the CE Form 1 or the CE Form 6 each year, 

depending on their position. However, other the amount of 

time they expend to complete the form, any economic impact 

on filers is nominal. The Commission absorbs the costs of 

printing and distributing its forms in its annual budget. 

Any person who wishes to provide information regarding a 

statement of estimated regulatory costs, or provide a proposal 

for a lower cost regulatory alternative must do so in writing 

within 21 days of this notice. 

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: Art. II, Section 8, Fla. Const., 

Chapter 2013-36, Sections 7 and 9, Laws of Florida, 

112.3144, 112.3144(7), 112.3145, 112.3145(9), 112.3147, 

112.322(9) FS. 

LAW IMPLEMENTED: Art. II, Section 8, Fla. Const., 

Chapter 2013-36, Sections 7 and 9, Laws of Florida, 

112.3144, 112.3144(6), 112.3144(7), 112.3145, 

112.3145(2)(b), 112.3145(9) FS. 

A HEARING WILL BE HELD AT THE DATE, TIME AND 

PLACE SHOWN BELOW:  

DATE AND TIME: September 13, 2013, 8:30 a.m. 

PLACE: Senate Office Building, Room 37S, 404 South 

Monroe Street, Tallahassee, FL 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least three (3) days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Millie Fulford, Florida Commission on Ethics, 

Telephone (850)488-7864. If you are hearing or speech 

impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida Relay 

Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice). 

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE 

PROPOSED RULE IS: Julia Cobb Costas, Assistant General 

Counsel, Florida Commission on Ethics, Telephone (850)488-

7864 

 

THE FULL TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE IS:  

 

34-8.002 General Rules for Filing the CE Form 6 – Full 

and Public Disclosure of Financial Interests. 

(1) Every person who holds an office specified in Rule 

34-8.003, F.A.C., must file full and public disclosure of his or 

her financial interests with the Commission by July 1 of each 

year during which he or she is in office, and every person who 

held an office specified in Rule 34-8.003, F.A.C., on 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=34
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=34-8.002
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=34-8.008
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=34-8.009
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=34-8.202
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=34-8.208
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=34-8.209
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/flconstitution.asp?id=Art.%20II,%20Section%208,%20Fla.%20Const.,%20
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/flconstitution.asp?id=Art.%20II,%20Section%208,%20Fla.%20Const.,%20
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/lawfl.asp?id=%20Chapter%202013-36,%20Sections%207%20and%209,%20Laws%20of%20Florida,%20
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/lawfl.asp?id=%20Chapter%202013-36,%20Sections%207%20and%209,%20Laws%20of%20Florida,%20
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20112.3144
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20112.3144(7)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20112.3145
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20112.3145(9)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20112.3147
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20112.322(9)%20FS.
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/flconstitution.asp?id=Art.%20II,%20Section%208,%20Fla.%20Const.,%20
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/flconstitution.asp?id=Art.%20II,%20Section%208,%20Fla.%20Const.,%20
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/lawfl.asp?id=%20Chapter%202013-36,%20Sections%207%20and%209,%20Laws%20of%20Florida,%20
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/lawfl.asp?id=%20Chapter%202013-36,%20Sections%207%20and%209,%20Laws%20of%20Florida,%20
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20112.3144
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20112.3144(6)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20112.3144(7)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20112.3145
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20112.3145(2)(b)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20112.3145(9)%20FS.


Florida Administrative Register Volume 39, Number 160, August 16, 2013 

4129 

 

December 31st of a year must file full and public disclosure of 

his or her financial interests with the Commission by July 1 of 

the following year. Full and public disclosure of financial 

interests means filing a sworn statement showing net worth, 

assets and liabilities on the form prescribed by the 

Commission, CE Form 6 – Full and Public Disclosure of 

Financial Interests, together with either a copy of the person’s 

most recent federal income tax return, including all 

attachments, or the completed income disclosure portion of 

CE Form 6. The CE Form 6 (1/2014) (1/2013) 

http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-01714, 

is adopted by reference herein and may be obtained without 

cost from the Florida Commission on Ethics, P. O. Drawer 

15709, Tallahassee, Florida 32317-5709, and may also be 

downloaded from the Commission’s website: 

www.ethics.state.fl.us. A candidate for an elective office 

specified in Rule 34-8.003, F.A.C., or otherwise specified by 

law must file this information prior to or at the time he or she 

qualifies as a candidate. 

(2) through (3) No change. 

PROPOSED EFFECTIVE DATE JANUARY 1, 2014 

Rulemaking Authority Art. II, Section 8, Fla. Const., 112.3144, 

112.3147, 112.322(9) FS. Law Implemented Art. II, Section 8, Fla. 

Const., Chapter 2013-36, Section 7, LOF, 112.3144 FS. History–New 

4-7-77, Amended 10-3-84, Formerly 34-8.02, Amended 8-7-94, 7-2-

00, 11-7-01, 1-19-11, 1-1-12, 1-1-13,__________. 

 

34-8.008 Final Filing Using the CE Form 6F. 

(1) Each person who is required to file full and public 

disclosure of financial interests shall, within 60 days of 

leaving his or her public position, file with the Commission a 

final disclosure statement covering the period between January 

1 of the year in which the person leaves and his or her last day 

in the position, unless he or she takes another position within 

that 60-day period which requires full and public disclosure. 

The final filing shall be on the form prescribed by the 

Commission, CE Form 6F – Final Full and Public Disclosure 

of Financial Interests. The CE Form 6F (1/2014) (1/2013) 

http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-01718, 

is adopted by reference herein and may be obtained without 

cost from the Florida Commission on Ethics, P. O. Drawer 

15709, Tallahassee, Florida 32317-5709, and may also be 

downloaded from the Commission’s website: 

www.ethics.state.fl.us. 

(2) No change. 

PROPOSED EFFECTIVE DATE JANUARY 1, 2014 

Rulemaking Authority 112.3144, 112.3147, 112.322(9) FS. Law 

Implemented Chapter 2013-36, Section 7, LOF, 112.3144(5), (6) FS. 

History–New 11-7-01, Amended 1-19-11, 1-1-12, 1-1-13,_________. 

 

34-8.009 Amended Filing Using the CE Form 6X. 

(1) A person may amend his or her full and public 

disclosure of financial interests to add to or modify the 

information reported on the form as originally filed at any 

time after filing the disclosure form. The amended filing shall 

be filed with the same office where the original form was filed 

and shall be on the form prescribed by the Commission, CE 

Form 6X – Amendment to Full and Public Disclosure of 

Financial Interests. The CE Form 6X (1/2014) (1/2013) 

http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-01719, 

is adopted by reference herein and may be obtained without 

cost from the Florida Commission on Ethics, P. O. Drawer 

15709, Tallahassee, Florida 32317-5709, and may also be 

downloaded from the Commission’s website: 

www.ethics.state.fl.us.  

(2) No change. 
PROPOSED EFFECTIVE DATE JANUARY 1, 2014 

Rulemaking Authority 112.3144(6), (7), 112.3147, 112.322(9) FS. 

Law Implemented Chapter 2013-36, Section 7, LOF, 112.3144(7) FS. 

History–New 11-7-01, Amended 1-19-11, 1-1-12, 1-1-13,_______. 

 

34-8.202 General Rules for Filing the CE Form 1 – 

Statement of Financial Interests. 

(1) A person who was a local officer as defined in Section 

112.3145, F.S., on December 31st of a year must file by July 1 

of the following year a statement of financial interests on the 

form prescribed by the Commission, CE Form 1 – Statement 

of Financial Interests, with the supervisor of elections in the 

county where he or she permanently resides, or, if the person 

does not permanently reside in Florida, with the supervisor of 

elections in the county of his or her agency’s headquarters. 

The CE Form 1 (1/2014) (1/2013) 

http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-01713, 

is adopted by reference herein and may be obtained without 

cost from the Florida Commission on Ethics, P. O. Drawer 

15709, Tallahassee, Florida 32317-5709, and may also be 

downloaded from the Commission’s website: 

www.ethics.state.fl.us.  

(2) through (6) No change.  

PROPOSED EFFECTIVE DATE JANUARY 1, 2014 

Rulemaking Authority 112.3145, 112.3147, 112.322(9) FS. Law 

Implemented Chapter 2013-36, Section 9, LOF, 112.3145 FS. 

History–New 11-7-01, Amended 1-19-11, 1-1-12, 1-1-

13,__________. 

 

34-8.208 Final Filing Using the CE Form 1F. 

(1) No change. 

http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-01714%20
http://www.ethics.state.fl.us/
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-01718%20
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-01719%20
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-01713%20


Florida Administrative Register Volume 39, Number 160, August 16, 2013 

4130 

(2) The final filing shall be on the form prescribed by the 

Commission, CE Form 1F – Final Statement of Financial 

Interests. The CE Form 1F (1/2014) (1/2013) 

http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-01715, 

is adopted by reference herein and may be obtained without 

cost from the Florida Commission on Ethics, P.O. Drawer 

15709, Tallahassee, Florida 32317-5709, and may also be 

downloaded from the Commission’s website: 

www.ethics.state.fl.us.  

(3) through (4) No change. 

PROPOSED EFFECTIVE DATE JANUARY 1, 2014 

Rulemaking Authority 112.3145, 112.3147, 112.322(9) FS. Law 

Implemented Chapter 2013-36, Section 9, LOF, 112.3145(2)(b) FS. 

History–New 11-7-01, Amended 1-19-11, 1-1-12, 1-1-13,_________. 

 

34-8.209 Amended Filing Using the CE Form 1X. 

(1) A person may amend his or her statement of financial 

interests to add to or modify the information reported on the 

form as originally filed at any time after filing the disclosure 

form. The amended statement shall be filed with the same 

office where the original form was filed and shall be made on 

the form prescribed by the Commission, CE Form 1X – 

Amendment to Form 1 Statement of Financial Interests. The 

CE Form 1X (1/2014) (1/2013) 

http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-01716, 

is adopted by reference herein and may be obtained without 

cost from the Florida Commission on Ethics, P. O. Drawer 

15709, Tallahassee, Florida 32317-5709, and may also be 

downloaded from the Commission’s website: 

www.ethics.state.fl.us. 

(2) No change. 

PROPOSED EFFECTIVE DATE JANUARY 1, 2014 

Rulemaking Authority 112.3145(9), 112.3147, 112.322(9) FS. Law 

Implemented Chapter 2013-36, Section 9, LOF, 112.3145(9) FS. 

History–New 11-7-01, Amended 1-19-11, 1-1-12, 1-1-

13,__________. 

 

NAME OF PERSON ORIGINATING PROPOSED RULE: 

Julia Cobb Costas, Assistant General Counsel 

NAME OF AGENCY HEAD WHO APPROVED THE 

PROPOSED RULE: Virlindia Doss, Executive Director 

DATE PROPOSED RULE APPROVED BY AGENCY 

HEAD: August 14, 2013 

DATE NOTICE OF PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT 

PUBLISHED IN FAR: August 13, 2013 

WATER MANAGEMENT DISTRICTS  

Northwest Florida Water Management District 

RULE NOS.: RULE TITLES: 

40A-2.101 Content of Application 

40A-2.901 Forms 

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The overall purpose of the 

proposed rule change is to meet the requirements of Section 

373.250, Florida Statutes. Changes will also encompass 

reduction of the number of copies of the application and 

supporting data needed to be submitted by the applicant from 

two to only one. 

SUMMARY: This rule development will amend application 

forms for non-potable uses to require information regarding 

the availability and feasibility of utilizing reclaimed water. 

SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF ESTIMATED 

REGULATORY COSTS AND LEGISLATIVE 

RATIFICATION: 

The agency has determined that this rule will not have an 

adverse impact on small business or likely increase directly or 

indirectly regulatory costs in excess of $200,000 in the 

aggregate within one year after the implementation of the rule. 

A SERC has been prepared by the agency and is available on 

the District website. 

The Agency has determined that the proposed rule is not 

expected to require legislative ratification based on the 

statement of estimated regulatory costs. 

Any person who wishes to provide information regarding the 

statement of estimated regulatory costs, or to provide a 

proposal for a lower cost regulatory alternative must do so in 

writing within 21 days of this notice. 

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 373.044, 373.113, 373.171 

FS. 

LAW IMPLEMENTED:  373.042, 373.0421, 373.109, 

373.118, 373.219, 373.223, 373.227, 373.229, 373.236, 

373.239, 373.246, 373.250 FS. 

A HEARING WILL BE HELD AT THE DATE, TIME AND 

PLACE SHOWN BELOW: 

DATE AND TIME: September 12, 2013, 1:10 p.m., ET 

PLACE:  Northwest Florida Water Management District, 81 

Water Management Drive, Havana, FL (10 miles west of 

Tallahassee off Highway 90). 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 5 days before the workshop/meeting by 

http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-01715%20
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-01716%20


Florida Administrative Register Volume 39, Number 160, August 16, 2013 

4131 

 

contacting: Terri Peterson, Administrative Assistant, 

Northwest Florida Water Management District, Bureau of 

Ground Water Regulation, 152 Water Management Drive, 

Havana, Florida 32333, (850)539-5999, 

terri.peterson@nwfwmd.state.fl.us. If you are hearing or 

speech impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida 

Relay Service, (800)955-8771 (TDD) or (800)955-8770 

(Voice). 

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE 

PROPOSED RULE IS: Angela Chelette, Northwest Florida 

Water Management District, Bureau of Ground Water 

Regulation, 152 Water Management Drive, Havana, Florida 

32333, (850)539-5999, angela.chelette@nwfwmd.state.fl.us or 

Terri Peterson, Administrative Assistant, Northwest Florida 

Water Management District, Bureau of Ground Water 

Regulation, 152 Water Management Drive, Havana, Florida 

32333, (850)539-5999, terri.peterson@nwfwmd.state.fl.us. 

The text of the proposed rule is available on the District’s 

website (www.nwfwmd.state.fl.us). 

 

THE FULL TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE IS: 

 

40A-2.101 Content of Application. 

(1) All Individual Water Use Permit applications shall 

include one original copy of the following: 

(a) A completed District application appropriate for the 

specified use; either: 

1. Consumptive Use Permit Application for a Public 

Water Supply, NWFWMD Form No. A2-A, effective July 1, 

1998; 

2. Consumptive Use Permit Application for Agricultural, 

Aquaculture and Golf Course Water Uses, NWFWMD Form 

No. A2-B, effective November 1, 2013 July 1, 1998; 

3. Consumptive Use Permit Application for Landscape 

Uses, NWFWMD Form No. A2-C, effective November 1, 

2013 July 1, 1998; or 

4. Consumptive Use Permit Application for Other Uses, 

NWFWMD Form No. A2-D, effective November 1, 2013 July 

1, 1998. 

5. All applications for non-potable use shall include reuse 

feasibility information required per the appropriate 

application.  Information from the reuse provider shall be 

submitted on the Reuse Feasibility Information form, 

NWFWMD Form No. 174, effective November 1, 2013. 

These forms are hereby incorporated by reference and can be 

obtained from the District offices in Midway-Gadsden 

County, Crestview or Marianna or from the District’s website. 

(b) The information required by Section 373.229, F.S.; 

(c) An accurate description of the property by Section, 

Township and Range on which the withdrawal facility is 

located and which is owned or otherwise controlled by the 

applicant, an accurate sketch or map showing the location and 

boundaries of such property and the location of existing and 

proposed wells and surface water withdrawal facilities as 

specified by the forms referenced in subsection 40A-2.101(1), 

F.A.C.; 

(d) Water conservation plans and measures, if any, that 

are employed or are to be employed in the area of use; 

(e) A determination of the potential impact of the 

withdrawal on any existing legal users and on the water 

resources of the area; 

(f) Any other information demonstrating that the water 

use meets the criteria and conditions established in Rule 40A-

2.301, F.A.C. 

(g) Hydrogeological or engineering analysis and reports 

submitted by an applicant in support of an application shall be 

signed and sealed as provided by Florida Statutes. 

(2) A permit application shall be accompanied by the 

appropriate application fee identified in Rule 40A-2.201, 

F.A.C. Failure to provide the required fee shall result in the 

denial of the permit request. 

Rulemaking Authority 373.044, 373.113, 373.171 FS. Law 

Implemented 373.109, 373.223, 373.229, 373.250, 403.0877 FS. 

History–New 10-1-82, Amended 1-5-86, 5-31-92, 11-2-92, 11-1-93, 

10-1-95, 7-1-98, 1-4-10,___________. 

 

40A-2.901 Forms. 

(1) The following forms are used in the implementation of 

this chapter: 

(a) Consumptive Use Permit Application for a Public 

Water Supply, NWFWMD Form No. A2-A, effective July 1, 

1998, and incorporated by reference in Rule 40A-2.101, 

F.A.C.; 

(b) Consumptive Use Permit Application for Agricultural, 

Aquaculture and Golf Course Water Uses, NWFWMD Form 

No. A2-B, effective November 1, 2013, and incorporated by 

reference in Rule 40A-2.101, F.A.C. effective July 1, 1998; 

(c) Consumptive Use Permit Application for Landscape 

Uses, NWFWMD Form No. A2-C, effective November 1, 

2013, and incorporated by reference in Rule 40A-2.101, 

F.A.C. effective July 1, 1998; 

(d) Consumptive Use Permit Application for Other Uses, 

NWFWMD Form No. A2-D, effective November 1, 2013, and 

incorporated by reference in Rule 40A-2.101, F.A.C. effective 

July 1, 1998; 

(e) Reuse Feasibility Information, NWFWMD Form No. 

174, effective November 1, 2013, and incorporated by 

reference in Rule 40A-2.101, F.A.C.; 

mailto:terri.peterson@nwfwmd.state.fl.us
mailto:terri.peterson@nwfwmd.state.fl.us
http://www.nwfwmd.state.fl.us/


Florida Administrative Register Volume 39, Number 160, August 16, 2013 

4132 

(f)(e) Individual Water Use Permit Document, 

NWFWMD Form No. A2-E, effective January 4, 2010, and 

incorporated by reference in Rule 40A-2.381, F.A.C.; 

(g)(f) Request for Consumptive Use Permit Transfer, 

NWFWMD Form No. A2-F, effective May 31, 1992, and 

incorporated by reference in Rule 40A-2.351, F.A.C.; 

(h)(g) Annual Water Use Reporting Form, NWFWMD 

Form No. A2-G, effective July 1, 1998, and incorporated by 

reference in Rule 40A-2.381, F.A.C.; 

(i)(h) Periodic Water Use Reporting Form, NWFWMD 

Form No. A2-H, effective July 1, 1998, and incorporated by 

reference in Rule 40A-2.381, F.A.C.; and 

(j)(i) Water Use Summary Reporting Form, NWFWMD 

Form No. A2-I, effective July 1, 1998, and incorporated by 

reference in Rule 40A-2.381, F.A.C. 

(2) These forms are available at the following District 

offices: 

(a) District headquarters, Permitting Section, 152 Water 

Management Drive, Havana, FL 32333-9700, (850)539-5999; 

(b) Marianna field office, 4765 Pelt Street, Marianna, FL 

32446-0900, (850) 482-9522; and 

(c) Crestview field office, 180 E. Redstone Avenue 800 

Hospital Drive, Crestview, FL 32539, (850)683-5048. 

Rulemaking Authority 373.044, 373.171 FS. Law Implemented 

373.116, 373.219, 373.229 FS. History–New 10-1-82, Amended 1-5-

86, 8-1-89, 5-31-92, 10-1-95, 7-1-98, 1-4-10,_____________. 

 

NAME OF PERSON ORIGINATING PROPOSED RULE: 

Angela Chelette, Chief, Bureau of Ground Water Regulation, 

Division of Resource Regulation 

NAME OF AGENCY HEAD WHO APPROVED THE 

PROPOSED RULE: Jonathan P. Steverson, Executive 

Director 

DATE PROPOSED RULE APPROVED BY AGENCY 

HEAD: August 8, 2013 

DATE NOTICE OF PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT 

PUBLISHED IN FAR: July 15, 2013 

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 

REGULATION 

Electrical Contractors’ Licensing Board 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE:  

61G6-5.0036 Certification of Registered Contractors 

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The Board proposes the rule 

promulgation to provide a rule concerning the certification of 

registered contractors. 

SUMMARY: A rule concerning the certification of registered 

contractors will be promulgated. 

SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF ESTIMATED 

REGULATORY COSTS AND LEGISLATIVE 

RATIFICATION:  

The Agency has determined that this will not have an adverse 

impact on small business or likely increase directly or 

indirectly regulatory costs in excess of $200,000 in the 

aggregate within one year after the implementation of the rule. 

A SERC has not been prepared by the agency.  

The Agency has determined that the proposed rule is not 

expected to require legislative ratification based on the 

statement of estimated regulatory costs or if no SERC is 

required, the information expressly relied upon and described 

herein: During discussion of the economic impact of this rule 

at its Board meeting, the Board, based upon the expertise and 

experience of its members, determined that a Statement of 

Estimated Regulatory Costs (SERC) was not necessary and 

that the rule will not require ratification by the Legislature. No 

person or interested party submitted additional information 

regarding the economic impact at that time. 

Any person who wishes to provide information regarding a 

statement of estimated regulatory costs, or provide a proposal 

for a lower cost regulatory alternative must do so in writing 

within 21 days of this notice. 

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 489.507(3), 489.514 FS. 

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 489.513(3), 489.514, 489.517 FS. 

IF REQUESTED WITHIN 21 DAYS OF THE DATE OF 

THIS NOTICE, A HEARING WILL BE SCHEDULED AND 

ANNOUNCED IN THE FAR. 

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE 

PROPOSED RULE IS: Daniel Biggins, Executive Director, 

Electrical Contractors’ Licensing Board, 1940 North Monroe 

Street, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-0750 

 

THE FULL TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE IS:  

 

61G6-5.0036 Certification of Registered Contractors. 

Any registered contractor who wishes to become a certified 

contractor in the appropriate category pursuant to the 

“grandfathering” provisions of Section 489.514, F.S., shall 

meet all of the following requirements: 

(1) Submit a completed form provided by the Department. 

(2) Submit proof of continuing education pursuant to Rule 

61G6-9.001, F.A.C., for the latest renewal cycle prior to 

application. 

(3) For purposes of implementing Section 489.514, F.S., 

the registered contractor must have: 

(a) Passed a written, proctored examination in the 

appropriate category as specified in subsection (2) of the 

statute, and 

(b) Five (5) years experience as a registered contractor in 

the category for which certification is sought. The registered 

contractor must have held an active license in that category for 

a period of at least 5 years. The 5 year period is not required to 

be consecutive. Any time periods when the license was placed 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=276
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61G6-5.0036
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=489.507(3)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20489.514%20FS.
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=489.513(3)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20489.514
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20489.517%20FS.


Florida Administrative Register Volume 39, Number 160, August 16, 2013 

4133 

 

on inactive status or when the licensee was on probationary 

status shall not count toward the 5 years required experience; 

or 

(c) Five (5) years of oversight or inspection responsibility 

as a building code administrator or inspector in the category 

for which certification is sought. Any time periods when the 

license was placed on inactive status or when the licensee was 

on probationary status shall not count toward the five (5) years 

required experience. 

Rulemaking Authority 489.507(3), 489.514 FS. Law Implemented 

489.513(3), 489.514, 489.517 FS. History–New_________. 

 

NAME OF PERSON ORIGINATING PROPOSED RULE: 

Electrical Contractors’ Licensing Board 

NAME OF AGENCY HEAD WHO APPROVED THE 

PROPOSED RULE: Electrical Contractors’ Licensing Board 

DATE PROPOSED RULE APPROVED BY AGENCY 

HEAD: May 17, 2013 

DATE NOTICE OF PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT 

PUBLISHED IN FAR: June 21, 2013 

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 

REGULATION 

Electrical Contractors’ Licensing Board 

RULE NOS.: RULE TITLES:  

61G6-12.001 Requirements for Burglar Alarm System 

Agent Training Courses 

61G6-12.002 Requirements for Fire Alarm System Agent 

Training Courses 

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The Board proposes the rule 

amendments to update the requirements for Burglar Alarm 

System Agent Training Courses and to update the 

requirements for Fire Alarm System Agent Training Courses. 

SUMMARY: The requirements for Burglar Alarm System 

Agent Training Courses and Fire Alarm System Agent 

Training Courses will be updated. 

SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF ESTIMATED 

REGULATORY COSTS AND LEGISLATIVE 

RATIFICATION:  

The Agency has determined that this will not have an adverse 

impact on small business or likely increase directly or 

indirectly regulatory costs in excess of $200,000 in the 

aggregate within one year after the implementation of the rule. 

A SERC has not been prepared by the agency.  

The Agency has determined that the proposed rule is not 

expected to require legislative ratification based on the 

statement of estimated regulatory costs or if no SERC is 

required, the information expressly relied upon and described 

herein: During discussion of the economic impact of this rule 

at its Board meeting, the Board, based upon the expertise and 

experience of its members, determined that a Statement of 

Estimated Regulatory Costs (SERC) was not necessary and 

that the rule will not require ratification by the Legislature. No 

person or interested party submitted additional information 

regarding the economic impact at that time. 

Any person who wishes to provide information regarding a 

statement of estimated regulatory costs, or provide a proposal 

for a lower cost regulatory alternative must do so in writing 

within 21 days of this notice. 

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 489.507(3), 489.517, 

489.518(1)(b), 489.521, 489.5185 FS. 

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 489.507(3), 489.518(1)(b), 489.521, 

489.5185 FS. 

IF REQUESTED WITHIN 21 DAYS OF THE DATE OF 

THIS NOTICE, A HEARING WILL BE SCHEDULED AND 

ANNOUNCED IN THE FAR. 

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE 

PROPOSED RULE IS: Daniel Biggins, Executive Director, 

Electrical Contractors’ Licensing Board, 1940 North Monroe 

Street, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-0750 

 

THE FULL TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE IS:  

 

61G6-12.001 Requirements for Burglar Alarm System 

Agent Training Courses. 

(1) through (6) No change. 

(7) Courses may be offered in a synchronous distance 

learning format such as a webinar or live chat upon approval 

of the method of presentation by the Board. 

Rulemaking Authority 489.507(3), 489.518(1)(b), 489.521 FS. Law 

Implemented 489.507(3), 489.518(1)(b), 489.521 FS. History–New 

5-11-98, Amended 7-17-11,_________. 

 

61G6-12.002 Requirements for Fire Alarm System Agent 

Training Courses. 

(1) through (7) No change. 

(8) Courses may be offered in a synchronous distance 

learning format such as a webinar or live chat upon approval 

of the method of presentation by the Board. 

Rulemaking Authority 489.507(3), 489.517, 489.5185 FS. Law 

Implemented 489.507(3), 489.5185 FS. History–New 2-18-99, 

Amended 7-17-11,_________. 

 

NAME OF PERSON ORIGINATING PROPOSED RULE: 

Electrical Contractors’ Licensing Board 

NAME OF AGENCY HEAD WHO APPROVED THE 

PROPOSED RULE: Electrical Contractors’ Licensing Board 

DATE PROPOSED RULE APPROVED BY AGENCY 

HEAD: May 17, 2013 

DATE NOTICE OF PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT 

PUBLISHED IN FAR: July 25, 2013 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=276
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61G6-12.001
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61G6-12.002
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=489.507(3)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20489.517
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20489.518(1)(b)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20489.521
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20489.5185%20FS.
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=489.507(3)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20489.518(1)(b)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20489.521
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20489.5185%20FS.


Florida Administrative Register Volume 39, Number 160, August 16, 2013 

4134 

DEPARTMENT OF FINANCIAL SERVICES 

Division of Insurance Agents and Agency Services 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE:  

69B-231.150 Criminal Proceedings 

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The revisions in the proposed 

amendment are intended to conform Rule 69B-231.150, 

F.A.C., relating to administrative license actions based on 

criminal proceedings to changes already made to Rule 69B-

211.042, F.A.C. 

SUMMARY: Subsections (1) and (2) are amended to clarify 

what is meant by the terms “felony” and “revocation”. Also, 

the word “immediate” is removed to better reflect the 

administrative process requirements which exist. Subsection 

(3) is deleted to remove standards which are in conflict with 

statutory changes. A new subsection (3) is added to conform 

the penalty scheme with Section 626.207, F.S., and Rule 69B-

211.042, F.A.C. Subsection (4) incorporates definitions from 

Section 626.207, F.S. Subsection (5) adds qualifications for 

administrative actions based on criminal proceedings outside 

the United States. 

SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF ESTIMATED 

REGULATORY COSTS AND LEGISLATIVE 

RATIFICATION:  

The Agency has determined that this will not have an adverse 

impact on small business or likely increase directly or 

indirectly regulatory costs in excess of $200,000 in the 

aggregate within one year after the implementation of the rule. 

A SERC has not been prepared by the agency.  

The Agency has determined that the proposed rule is not 

expected to require legislative ratification based on the 

statement of estimated regulatory costs or if no SERC is 

required, the information expressly relied upon and described 

herein: The rule is being amended to conform to changes 

made to Section 626.207, F.S. The rule does not impose any 

regulatory costs above those imposed directly by the 

underlying statute. The statutory costs are themselves very 

limited. The effect of the statute is to make some insurance 

agents subject to revocation of licensure that would not have 

been prior to the amendment of Section 626.207, F.S. 

Any person who wishes to provide information regarding a 

statement of estimated regulatory costs, or provide a proposal 

for a lower cost regulatory alternative must do so in writing 

within 21 days of this notice. 

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 624.308, 626.207(8) FS. 

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 624.307(1), 624.308, 626.207, 

626.611, 626.621, 626.631, 626.641 FS. 

IF REQUESTED WITHIN 21 DAYS OF THE DATE OF 

THIS NOTICE, A HEARING WILL BE HELD AT THE 

DATE, TIME AND PLACE SHOWN BELOW (IF NOT 

REQUESTED, THIS HEARING WILL NOT BE HELD):  

DATE AND TIME: Thursday, September 12, 2013, 9:30 a.m. 

PLACE: 116 Larson Building, 200 East Gaines Street, 

Tallahassee, Florida 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 5 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Barry Lanier @ (850)413-5600 or 

Barry.Lanier@myfloridacfo.com. If you are hearing or speech 

impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida Relay 

Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice). 

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE 

PROPOSED RULE IS: Barry Lanier, Chief, Bureau of 

Investigation, Division of Insurance Agent & Agency 

Services, Department of Financial Services, 200 E. Gaines 

Street, Room 416A, Larson Building, Tallahassee, FL 32399-

0320, (850)413-5600 or Barry.Lanier@myfloridacfo.com 

 

THE FULL TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE IS:  

 

69B-231.150 Criminal Proceedings. 

(1) If a licensee is convicted by a court of a violation of 

the Insurance Code or a felony (regardless of whether or not 

such felony is related to an insurance license), the penalty 

shall be immediate revocations.  

(1)(2) While licensed by the Department, if If a licensee is 

not convicted of, or but has been found guilty of or has pled 

pleaded guilty or nolo contendere (no contest) to, a felony or a 

crime punishable by imprisonment of 1 year or more under the 

law of the United States of America or of any state thereof or 

under the law of any other country, regardless of adjudication 

which is a crime involving moral turpitude and is a crime 

involving breach of trust or dishonesty, the penalty shall be 

revocation of all licenses and appointments held by the 

licensee. The terms of revocation and the conditions for 

reapplying are contained in subsection 626.641(2) and Section 

626.207, Florida Statutes.  

(3) If a licensee is not convicted of, but has been found 

guilty of or has pleaded guilty or nolo contendere to, a felony 

or a crime punishable by imprisonment of 1 year or more 

under the law of the United States of America or of any state 

thereof or under the law of any other country, which is a crime 

involving moral turpitude or is a crime involving breach of 

trust or dishonesty, the penalties are as follows: 

(a) If the conduct directly relates to activities involving 

the business of insurance, the penalty shall be revocation. 

(b) If the conduct indirectly relates to the business of 

insurance or involves dishonesty or breach of trust, such as 

theft of money or property, or mishandling or 

misappropriation of money, the penalty shall be a 12-month 

suspension. 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=69
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=360
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=69B-231.150
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=624.308
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20626.207(8)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=624.307(1)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20624.308
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20626.207
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20626.611
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20626.621
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20626.631
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20626.641


Florida Administrative Register Volume 39, Number 160, August 16, 2013 

4135 

 

(c) If the conduct is not related to the business of 

insurance and does not involve dishonesty or breach of trust, 

the penalty shall be a 6-month suspension. 

(4) If a licensee is not convicted of, but has been found 

guilty of or has pleaded guilty or nolo contendere to, a felony 

or a crime punishable by imprisonment of 1 year or more 

under the laws of the United States of America or of any state 

thereof or under the law of any other country, which is not a 

crime involving moral turpitude and is not a crime involving 

breach of trust or dishonesty, the penalties are as follows: 

(a) If the conduct directly relates to the business of 

insurance, the penalty shall be a 24-month suspension. 

(b) If the conduct indirectly relates to the business of 

insurance such as theft of money or property, or mishandling 

or misappropriation of money, the penalty shall be a 12-month 

suspension. 

(c) If the conduct is not related to the business of 

insurance, the penalty shall be a 3-month suspension. 

(2)(a) In accordance with Section 626.207, Florida 

Statutes, any licensee, while licensed by the Department, that 

is convicted of, has pled guilty or nolo contendere (no contest) 

to, or was found guilty of, a first degree felony, a capital 

felony, a felony involving money laundering, fraud or 

embezzlement, or a felony directly related to the financial 

services business, regardless of adjudication, is permanently 

barred from applying for reinstatement of any revoked or 

suspended license and from applying for any license under the 

Florida Insurance Code. 

(b) While licensed by the Department, any licensee that is 

convicted of, has pled guilty or nolo contendere (no contest) 

to, or was found guilty of, a felony involving moral turpitude, 

and such felony is not specifically included in section (2)(a) of 

this rule or subsection 626.207(3), Florida Statutes, regardless 

of adjudication, is prohibited from applying for reinstatement 

of any revoked or suspended license and from applying for 

any license under the Florida Insurance Code in accordance 

with Section 626.207, Florida Statutes, for a period of 15-

years (subject to modification pursuant to Rule 69B-211.042) 

beginning in accordance with Section 626.207, Florida 

Statutes, from that person’s final release from supervision or 

upon completion of that person’s criminal sentence, including 

payment of fines, restitution, and court costs. 

(c) While licensed by the Department, any licensee that is 

convicted of, has pled guilty or nolo contendere (no contest) 

to, or was found guilty of, a felony not involving moral 

turpitude, regardless of adjudication, is prohibited from 

applying for reinstatement of a revoked or suspended license 

and from applying for any license under the Florida Insurance 

Code for a period of 7-years, in accordance with Section 

626.207, Florida Statutes, beginning from that person’s final 

release from supervision or upon completion of that person’s 

criminal sentence, including payment of fines, restitution, and 

court costs for such crime. 

(3) For purposes of this rule, the definitions of the terms 

“financial services business,” “felony of the first degree” and 

“capital felony” contained in Section 626.207, Florida 

Statutes, apply. 

(4) For purposes of this rule, in the event that a conviction 

or plea is based on the law of a country other than the United 

States, the Department shall consider the following factors to 

determine if the crime is the equivalent of a felony crime 

under Section 626.611 and/or 626.621, Florida Statutes: 

(a) Whether the crime would be a felony under the laws 

of the United States or any state within the United States; and 

(b) The degree of penalty associated with the same or 

similar crimes in the United States. 

Rulemaking Specific Authority 624.308, 626.207(8)(2) FS. Law 

Implemented 624.307(1), 624.308, 626.207(2), 626.611, 626.621, 

626.631, 626.631(1), 626.641 FS. History–New 7-13-93, Amended 

9-23-02, Formerly 4-231.150, Amended 8-15-06,__________. 

 

NAME OF PERSON ORIGINATING PROPOSED RULE: 

Barry Lanier, Chief, Bureau of Investigation, Division of 

Insurance Agent & Agency Services, Department of Financial 

Services 

NAME OF AGENCY HEAD WHO APPROVED THE 

PROPOSED RULE: Jeff Atwater, Chief Financial Officer, 

Department of Financial Services 

DATE PROPOSED RULE APPROVED BY AGENCY 

HEAD: August 8, 2013 

DATE NOTICE OF PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT 

PUBLISHED IN FAR: April 15, 2013 

 

Section III 

Notice of Changes, Corrections and 

Withdrawals 

STATE BOARD OF ADMINISTRATION 

Florida Prepaid College Board 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

19B-4.001 Application 

NOTICE OF CHANGE 

Notice is hereby given that the following changes have been 

made to the proposed rule in accordance with subparagraph 

120.54(3)(d)1., F.S., published in Vol. 39, No. 122, June 24, 

2013 issue of the Florida Administrative Register.  

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=19
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=47
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=19B-4.001


Florida Administrative Register Volume 39, Number 160, August 16, 2013 

4136 

Changes were made to address comments from the Joint 

Administrative Procedures Committee. 

19B-4.001 Application. 

(1) through (2) No change. 

(3) The Board may only require that applicants Applicants 

may be required to provide the following information to enroll 

in the Program: 

(a) For the Account Owner, Survivor, Parent and 

Beneficiary: 

1.(i) Full legal name and salutation 

2.(ii) Social Security Number 

3.(iii) Date of birth 

4.(iv) Full mailing address 

5.(v) Two telephone numbers 

6.(vi) Two e-mail addresses 

(b) Age, grade, and projected enrollment year of the 

Beneficiary 

(c) The plan type and payment option of Florida Prepaid 

College Plan(s) selected for enrollment 

(d) Proof of, or information used to verify proof of the 

Parent’s or Beneficiary’s Florida residency as defined in 19B-

7.002 

(e) Marketing information: 

1.(i) How did you hear about the Program? 

2.(ii)  Annual Family Income 

3.(iii) Purchaser’s relationship to the Beneficiary 

4.(iv) Beneficiary gender 

5.(v) Beneficiary race 

(f) A Florida 529 Savings Plan Account Number for the 

same Beneficiary to apply a discount on the Application Fee, 

if offered and applicable. 

(g) Information required for the processing of a one-time 

and recurring automatic withdrawal authorization. 

(4) A copy of the Master Contract and Application may 

be obtained from the Board by submitting a request to: P. O. 

Box 6448, Tallahassee, Florida 32314-6448. The available 

method or methods for submitting an Application will be 

published on the Board’s website (www.myfloridaPrepaid. 

com). 

STATE BOARD OF ADMINISTRATION 

Florida Prepaid College Board 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

19B-16.002 Application for Participation in the Program 

NOTICE OF CHANGE 

Notice is hereby given that the following changes have been 

made to the proposed rule in accordance with subparagraph 

120.54(3)(d)1., F.S., published in Vol. 39, No. 122, June 24, 

2013 issue of the Florida Administrative Register.  

These changes are being made in response to comments 

received from the Joint Administrative Procedures Committee. 

19B-16.002 Application for Participation in the Program. 

(1) The Board may only require that applicants Applicants 

for an Account in the Florida 529 Savings Plan may be 

required to provide the following information: 

(a) For the Account Owner, Survivor, Parent and 

Beneficiary: 

1.(i) Full legal name and salutation 

2.(ii) Social Security Number 

3.(iii) Date of birth 

4.(iv) Full mailing address 

5.(v) Two telephone numbers 

6.(vi) Two e-mail addresses 

(b) Age, grade, and projected enrollment year of the 

Beneficiary 

(c) An allocation of available Investment Options for 

initial and future contributions 

(d) The source and amount of the initial contribution and 

any Rollover Contribution. 

(e) Marketing Information: 

1.(i) How did you hear about the Program? 

2.(ii) Annual Family Income 

3.(iii) Purchaser’s relationship to the Beneficiary 

4.(iv Beneficiary gender 

5.(v) Beneficiary race 

(f) A Florida Prepaid College Plan Number for the same 

Beneficiary to apply a discount on the Application Fee, if 

offered and applicable 

(g) Information required for the processing of a one-time 

and recurring automatic contribution authorization 

(2)(4) A copy of the Participation Agreement, Terms and 

Conditions, and Application may be obtained from the Board 

by submitting a request for these documents to: P. O. Box 

6448, Tallahassee, Florida 32314-6448. The available method 

or methods for submitting an Application will be published on 

the Board’s website (www.myfloridaPrepaid. com). 

DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

62-330.340 Transfer of Permit Upon Change in 

Ownership or Control 

NOTICE OF CHANGE 

Notice is hereby given that the following changes have been 

made to the proposed rule in accordance with subparagraph 

120.54(3)(d)1., F.S., published in Vol. 39, No. 72, April 12, 

2013 issue of the Florida Administrative Register.  

Changes were made to address comments from JAPC. 

Form 62-330.340(1), incorporated by reference in subsection 

62-330.340(3), has been amended to clarify that it is not 

required for use when a valid permit is in the operation and 

maintenance phase and the permittee provides written notice 

to the Agency within 30 days of a change in ownership, and to 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=19
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=47
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=19B-16.002
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=62
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=62-330.340


Florida Administrative Register Volume 39, Number 160, August 16, 2013 

4137 

 

clarify the rule provision in which it is incorporated by 

reference.  

________________________________________________ 

Section IV 

Emergency Rules 

NONE 

Section V 

Petitions and Dispositions Regarding Rule 

Variance or Waiver 

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 

REGULATION 

Division of Hotels and Restaurants 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

61C-5.001: Safety Standards 

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that on August 12, 2013, the 

Department of Business and Professional Regulation, Division 

of Hotels and Restaurants, Bureau of Elevator Safety, received 

a petition for Loft Fitness. Petitioner seeks an emergency 

variance of the requirements of ASME A17.1, Section 2.2.2.5, 

2.26.2.33, 2.27.3.1.6(h), 2.27.3.2.5, 2.27.3.3.1(c), 2.27.3.3.7, 

2.27.3.4, 2.27.7.2 and 2.27.8, as adopted by subsection 61C-

5.001(1), Florida Administrative Code that requires upgrading 

the elevators with firefighters’ stop switch, sump pump, fire 

hat-visual/audible signal, fire recall, fire operation panel in car 

operating station, firefighters’ operation panel, interruption of 

power, firefighters’ emergency operation: operating 

procedures and switch keys which poses a significant 

economic/financial hardship. Any interested person may file 

comments within 5 days of the publication of this notice with 

Mark Boutin, Bureau of Elevator Safety, 1940 North Monroe 

Street, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-1013 (VW2013-270). 

A copy of the Petition for Variance or Waiver may be 

obtained by contacting: Mark Boutin, Bureau of Elevator 

Safety, 1940 North Monroe Street, Tallahassee, Florida 

32399-1013. 

________________________________________________ 

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 

REGULATION 

Division of Hotels and Restaurants 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

61C-5.001: Safety Standards 

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that on August 12, 2013, the 

Department of Business and Professional Regulation, Division 

of Hotels and Restaurants, Bureau of Elevator Safety, received 

a petition for The Courtney at Bay Pines. Petitioner seeks a 

variance of the requirements of ASME A17.1b, Section 

2.20.4, 2.18.5.1 and 2.24.2.1 as adopted by paragraph 61C-

5.001(1)(a), Florida Administrative Code that requires the use 

of a 9.5 mm steel rope and requirement of a metallic sheave 

which poses a significant economic/financial hardship. Any 

interested person may file comments within 14 days of the 

publication of this notice with Mark Boutin, Bureau of 

Elevator Safety, 1940 North Monroe Street, Tallahassee, 

Florida 32399-1013 (VW2013-271). 

A copy of the Petition for Variance or Waiver may be 

obtained by contacting: Mark Boutin, Bureau of Elevator 

Safety, 1940 North Monroe Street, Tallahassee, Florida 

32399-1013. 

_________________________________________________ 

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 

REGULATION 

Division of Hotels and Restaurants 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

61C-5.001: Safety Standards 

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that on August 12, 2013, the 

Department of Business and Professional Regulation, Division 

of Hotels and Restaurants, Bureau of Elevator Safety, received 

a petition for Laurel Building. Petitioner seeks an emergency 

variance of the requirements of ASME A17.3, Section 2.7.5, 

as adopted by subsection 61C-5.001(1), Florida 

Administrative Code that requires upgrading the elevators 

hoistway emergency door contacts which poses a significant 

economic/financial hardship. Any interested person may file 

comments within 5 days of the publication of this notice with 

Mark Boutin, Bureau of Elevator Safety, 1940 North Monroe 

Street, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-1013 (VW2013-272). 

A copy of the Petition for Variance or Waiver may be 

obtained by contacting: Mark Boutin, Bureau of Elevator 

Safety, 1940 North Monroe Street, Tallahassee, Florida 

32399-1013. 

_________________________________________________ 

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 

REGULATION 

Division of Hotels and Restaurants 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

61C-5.001: Safety Standards 

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that on August 12, 2013, the 

Department of Business and Professional Regulation, Division 

of Hotels and Restaurants, Bureau of Elevator Safety, received 

a petition for Cragg Building. Petitioner seeks an emergency 

variance of the requirements of ASME A17.3, Section 2.7.5, 

as adopted by subsection 61C-5.001(1), Florida 

Administrative Code that requires upgrading the elevators 

hoistway emergency door contacts which poses a significant 

economic/financial hardship. Any interested person may file 

comments within 5 days of the publication of this notice with 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=249
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61C-5.001
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=249
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61C-5.001
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=249
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61C-5.001
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=249
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61C-5.001


Florida Administrative Register Volume 39, Number 160, August 16, 2013 

4138 

Mark Boutin, Bureau of Elevator Safety, 1940 North Monroe 

Street, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-1013 (VW2013-273). 

A copy of the Petition for Variance or Waiver may be 

obtained by contacting: Mark Boutin, Bureau of Elevator 

Safety, 1940 North Monroe Street, Tallahassee, Florida 

32399-1013. 

_________________________________________________ 

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 

REGULATION 

Division of Hotels and Restaurants 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

61C-5.001: Safety Standards 

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that on August 12, 2013, the 

Department of Business and Professional Regulation, Division 

of Hotels and Restaurants, Bureau of Elevator Safety, received 

a petition for Glenridge Building. Petitioner seeks an 

emergency variance of the requirements of ASME A17.3, 

Section 2.7.5, as adopted by subsection 61C-5.001(1), Florida 

Administrative Code that requires upgrading the elevators 

hoistway emergency door contacts which poses a significant 

economic/financial hardship. Any interested person may file 

comments within 5 days of the publication of this notice with 

Mark Boutin, Bureau of Elevator Safety, 1940 North Monroe 

Street, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-1013 (VW2013-274). 

A copy of the Petition for Variance or Waiver may be 

obtained by contacting: Mark Boutin, Bureau of Elevator 

Safety, 1940 North Monroe Street, Tallahassee, Florida 

32399-1013. 

_________________________________________________ 

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 

REGULATION 

Division of Hotels and Restaurants 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

61C-5.001: Safety Standards 

The Department of Business and Professional Regulation, 

Division of Hotels and Restaurants, Bureau of Elevator Safety 

hereby gives notice: on August 14, 2013, the Department 

issued a Final Order that was in response to a Petition for 

Variance from Marina Bay Condominium, filed July 30, 2013, 

and advertised on August 5, 2013 in Vol. 39, No.151, of the 

Florida Administrative Register. No comments were received 

in response to the petition. The Final Order on the Petition for 

Variance denies the Petitioner a variance from Rule 

211.3c(3)(a), ASME A17.1, 1993 edition, as adopted by 

Chapter 30, Section 3001.2 Florida Building Code adopted by 

paragraph 61C-5.001(1)(a), Florida Administrative Code that 

requires upgrading the elevators from providing phase II 

emergency in-car operations because the Petitioner has not 

demonstrated that the purpose of the underlying statute will be 

met or that Petitioner would suffer a substantial hardship if 

required to comply with this rule (VW2013-253). 

A copy of the Order or additional information may be 

obtained by contacting: Mark Boutin, Bureau of Elevator 

Safety, 1940 North Monroe Street, Tallahassee, Florida 

32399-1013, (850)488-1133. 

________________________________________________ 

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 

REGULATION 

Division of Hotels and Restaurants 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

61C-5.001: Safety Standards 

The Department of Business and Professional Regulation, 

Division of Hotels and Restaurants, Bureau of Elevator Safety 

hereby gives notice: on August 14, 2013, the Department 

issued a Final Order that was in response to a Petition for 

Variance from Union 700 Warehouse, filed July 16, 2013, and 

advertised on July 19, 2013 in Vol. 39, No. 140, of the Florida 

Administrative Register. No comments were received in 

response to the petition. The Final Order on the Petition for 

Variance denies the Petitioner a variance from Rule 2.27, 

ASME A17.1b, 2009 edition, as adopted by Chapter 30, 

Section 3001.2 Florida Building Code adopted by paragraph 

61C-5.001(1)(a), Florida Administrative Code that requires 

upgrading the elevators emergency operations and signaling 

devices because the Petitioner has not demonstrated that the 

purpose of the underlying statute has been met or that 

Petitioner would suffer a substantial hardship if required to 

comply with this rule (VW2013-234). 

A copy of the Order or additional information may be 

obtained by contacting: Mark Boutin, Bureau of Elevator 

Safety, 1940 North Monroe Street, Tallahassee, Florida 

32399-1013, (850)488-1133. 

__________________________________________________ 

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 

REGULATION 

Division of Hotels and Restaurants 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

61C-5.001: Safety Standards 

The Department of Business and Professional Regulation, 

Division of Hotels and Restaurants, Bureau of Elevator Safety 

hereby gives notice: on August 14, 2013 the Division issued 

an order. The Final Order was in response to a Petition for a 

temporary Variance from Ocean Parks Bldg “B”, filed July 15, 

2013, and advertised on July 18, 2013 in Vol. 39, No. 139, of 

the Florida Administrative Register. No comments were 

received in response to the petition. The Final Order on the 

Petition for Variance grants the Petitioner a variance from 

Rule 61C-5.025, as adopted by paragraph 61C-5.001(1)(a), 

Florida Administrative Code that requires a hydraulic supply 

shut-off valve because the Petitioner has demonstrated that the 

purpose of the underlying statute has been met and that 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=249
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61C-5.001
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=249
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61C-5.001
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=249
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61C-5.001
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=249
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61C-5.001


Florida Administrative Register Volume 39, Number 160, August 16, 2013 

4139 

 

Petitioner would suffer a substantial hardship if required to 

comply with this rule (VW2013-232). 

A copy of the Order or additional information may be 

obtained by contacting: Mark Boutin, Bureau of Elevator 

Safety, 1940 North Monroe Street, Tallahassee, Florida 

32399-1013. 

_________________________________________________ 

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 

REGULATION 

Division of Hotels and Restaurants 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

61C-5.001: Safety Standards 

The Department of Business and Professional Regulation, 

Division of Hotels and Restaurants, Bureau of Elevator Safety 

hereby gives notice: on August 14, 2013 the Division issued 

an order. The Final Order was in response to a Petition for an 

emergency temporary Variance from The Palace, filed June 

20, 2013, and advertised on June 27, 2013 in Vol. 39, No. 125, 

of the Florida Administrative Register. No comments were 

received in response to the petition. The Final Order on the 

Petition for Variance grants the Petitioner a variance from 

Rule 3.10.3 and 3.10.4(q) ASME A17.3, 1996 edition, as 

adopted by paragraph 61C-5.001(1)(a), Florida Administrative 

Code that requires upgrading the elevators top-of-car 

operating devices and normal terminal stopping devices 

because the Petitioner has demonstrated that the purpose of the 

underlying statute has been met and that Petitioner would 

suffer a substantial hardship if required to comply with this 

rule (VW2013-201). 

A copy of the Order or additional information may be 

obtained by contacting: Mark Boutin, Bureau of Elevator 

Safety, 1940 North Monroe Street, Tallahassee, Florida 

32399-1013. 

__________________________________________________ 

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 

REGULATION 

Division of Hotels and Restaurants 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

61C-5.001: Safety Standards 

The Department of Business and Professional Regulation, 

Division of Hotels and Restaurants, Bureau of Elevator Safety 

hereby gives notice: on August 14, 2013 the Division issued 

an order. The Final Order was in response to a Petition for an 

emergency temporary Variance from Sevilla Condo 

Association, filed July 18, 2013, and advertised on July 24, 

2013 in Vol. 39, No. 143, of the Florida Administrative 

Register. No comments were received in response to the 

petition. The Final Order on the Petition for Variance grants 

the Petitioner a variance from Rule 3.9.1, 2.7.4, 3.10.4, 3.3.2 

and 3.10.3 ASME A17.3, 1996 edition, as adopted by 

paragraph 61C-5.001(1)(a), Florida Administrative Code that 

requires upgrading the elevators normal terminal stopping 

devices, restricted opening of hoistway doors and/or car doors 

on passenger elevators, electrical protective devices, platform 

guards and top-of-car operating devices because the Petitioner 

has demonstrated that the purpose of the underlying statute has 

been met and that Petitioner would suffer a substantial 

hardship if required to comply with this rule (VW2013-240). 

A copy of the Order or additional information may be 

obtained by contacting: Mark Boutin, Bureau of Elevator 

Safety, 1940 North Monroe Street, Tallahassee, Florida 

32399-1013. 

__________________________________________________ 

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 

REGULATION 

Division of Hotels and Restaurants 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

61C-5.001: Safety Standards 

The Department of Business and Professional Regulation, 

Division of Hotels and Restaurants, Bureau of Elevator Safety 

hereby gives notice: on August 14, 2013 the Division issued 

an order. The Final Order was in response to a Petition for a 

Variance from City of Clearwater Fire Station #45, filed July 

19, 2013, and advertised on July 24, 2013 in Vol. 39, No. 143, 

of the Florida Administrative Register. No comments were 

received in response to the petition. The Final Order on the 

Petition for Variance grants the Petitioner a variance from 

Rule 2.18.5.1 and 2.20.1 ASME A17.1b, 2009 edition, as 

adopted by paragraph 61C-5.001(1)(a), Florida Administrative 

Code that requires steel ropes of a minimum diameter of 9.5 

mm because the Petitioner has demonstrated that the purpose 

of the underlying statute has been met and that Petitioner 

would suffer a substantial hardship if required to comply with 

this rule (VW2013-241). 

A copy of the Order or additional information may be 

obtained by contacting: Mark Boutin, Bureau of Elevator 

Safety, 1940 North Monroe Street, Tallahassee, Florida 

32399-1013. 

__________________________________________________ 

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 

REGULATION 

Division of Hotels and Restaurants 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

61C-5.001: Safety Standards 

The Department of Business and Professional Regulation, 

Division of Hotels and Restaurants, Bureau of Elevator Safety 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=249
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61C-5.001
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=249
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61C-5.001
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=249
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61C-5.001
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=249
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61C-5.001


Florida Administrative Register Volume 39, Number 160, August 16, 2013 

4140 

hereby gives notice: on August 14, 2014 the Division issued 

an order. The Final Order was in response to a Petition for a 

Variance from Forever 21/Altamonte Mall, filed July 22, 2013 

and advertised on July 24, 2013 in Vol. 39, No. 143, of the 

Florida Administrative Register. No comments were received 

in response to the petition. The Final Order on the Petition for 

Variance grants the Petitioner a variance from Rule 2.18.5.1, 

2.20.1, 2.20.4, 2.20.5, and 2.20.9 ASME A17.1b, 2009 

edition, as adopted by paragraph 61C-5.001(1)(a), Florida 

Administrative Code that requires steel ropes of a minimum 

diameter of 9.5 mm because the Petitioner has demonstrated 

that the purpose of the underlying statute has been met and 

that Petitioner would suffer a substantial hardship if required 

to comply with this rule (VW2013-242). 

A copy of the Order or additional information may be 

obtained by contacting: Mark Boutin, Bureau of Elevator 

Safety, 1940 North Monroe Street, Tallahassee, Florida 

32399-1013. 

__________________________________________________ 

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 

REGULATION 

Division of Hotels and Restaurants 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

61C-5.001: Safety Standards 

The Department of Business and Professional Regulation, 

Division of Hotels and Restaurants, Bureau of Elevator Safety 

hereby gives notice: on August 14, 2013 the Division issued 

an order. The Final Order was in response to a Petition for a 

temporary Variance from America’s Best, filed July 24, 2013, 

and advertised on July 29, 2013 in Vol. 39, No. 146, of the 

Florida Administrative Register. No comments were received 

in response to the petition. The Final Order on the Petition for 

Variance grants the Petitioner a variance from Rule 3.11.3 

ASME A17.3, 1996 edition, as adopted by paragraph 61C-

5.001(1)(a), Florida Administrative Code that requires 

upgrading the elevators with firefighters’ emergency 

operations because the Petitioner has demonstrated that the 

purpose of the underlying statute has been met and that 

Petitioner would suffer a substantial hardship if required to 

comply with this rule (VW2013-217). 

A copy of the Order or additional information may be 

obtained by contacting: Mark Boutin, Bureau of Elevator 

Safety, 1940 North Monroe Street, Tallahassee, Florida 

32399-1013. 

_________________________________________________ 

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 

REGULATION 

Division of Hotels and Restaurants 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

61C-5.001: Safety Standards 

The Department of Business and Professional Regulation, 

Division of Hotels and Restaurants, Bureau of Elevator Safety 

hereby gives notice: on August 14, 2013 the Division issued 

an order. The Final Order was in response to a Petition for a 

temporary Variance from Premier North, filed July 25, 2013 

and advertised on July 31, 2013 in Vol. 39, No. 148, of the 

Florida Administrative Register. No comments were received 

in response to the petition. The Final Order on the Petition for 

Variance grants the Petitioner a variance from Rule 3.11.3 

ASME A17.3, 1996 edition, as adopted by paragraph 61C-

5.001(1)(a), Florida Administrative Code that requires 

upgrading the elevators with firefighters’ emergency 

operations because the Petitioner has demonstrated that the 

purpose of the underlying statute has been met and that 

Petitioner would suffer a substantial hardship if required to 

comply with this rule (VW2013-249). 

A copy of the Order or additional information may be 

obtained by contacting: Mark Boutin, Bureau of Elevator 

Safety, 1940 North Monroe Street, Tallahassee, Florida 

32399-1013. 

__________________________________________________ 

FLORIDA HOUSING FINANCE CORPORATION 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

67-48.002: Definitions 

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that on August 14, 2013, the 

Florida Housing Finance Corporation received a petition for 

waiver from Metro South Senior Apartments Limited 

Partnership, of subsection 67-48.002(94), Florida 

Administrative Code, to seek a waiver or variance from the 

provisions of the 2012 Qualified Allocation Plan (“QAP”) as 

they pertain to the process by which an applicant may return 

its Housing Credit allocation and obtain a reservation and 

allocation of Housing Credits for a later year. 

A copy of the Petition for Variance or Waiver may be 

obtained by contacting: Della Harrell, Corporation Clerk, 

Florida Housing Finance Corporation, 227 North Bronough 

Street, Suite 5000, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-1329. The 

Petition has also been posted on Florida Housing’s website at 

floridahousing.org. Florida Housing will accept comments 

concerning the Petition for 14 days from the date of 

publication of this notice. To be considered, comments must 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=249
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61C-5.001
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=249
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61C-5.001
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=67
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=67-48.002


Florida Administrative Register Volume 39, Number 160, August 16, 2013 

4141 

 

be received on or before 5:00 p.m., Eastern Standard Time, on 

the 14
th

 day after publication of this notice at Florida Housing 

Finance Corporation, 227 North Bronough Street, Suite 5000, 

Tallahassee, Florida 32399-1329. 

 

Section VI 

Notice of Meetings, Workshops and Public 

Hearings 

DEPARTMENT OF STATE 

Division of Historical Resources 

The Bureau of Historic Preservation, Florida Main Street Ad 

Hoc Selection Committee announces a public meeting to 

which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: August 30, 2013, 10:00 a.m. until 

conclusion 

PLACE: R.A. Gray Building, 1
st
 Floor Auditorium, 500 South 

Bronough Street, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-0250 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

The committee will convene in order to designate the new 

Florida Main Street Communities for 2013. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Alex 

Carlson, Florida Main Street Assistant at (800)847-7278 or via 

email: Alexander.Carlson@dos.myflorida.com. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 48 hours before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Alex Carlson at (800)847-7278 or via email: 

Alexander.Carlson@dos.myflorida.com. If you are hearing or 

speech impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida 

Relay Service, (800)955-8771 (TDD) or (800)955-8770 

(Voice). 

If any person decides to appeal any decision made by the 

Board with respect to any matter considered at this meeting or 

hearing, he/she will need to ensure that a verbatim record of 

the proceeding is made, which record includes the testimony 

and evidence from which the appeal is to be issued. 

For more information, you may contact: Alex Carlson at 

(800)847-7278 or via email: 

Alexander.Carlson@dos.myflorida.com. 

_________________________________________________ 

DEPARTMENT OF AGRICULTURE AND CONSUMER 

SERVICES 

Division of Administration 

The Florida Agriculture Center and Horse Park Authority 

announces a public meeting to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: Wednesday, August 28, 2013, 12:00 

Noon. 

PLACE: Ocala Hilton Hotel, 3600 SW 36
th

 Avenue, Ocala, FL 

34474. 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

This meeting is to discuss general board business. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Shawn 

Doherty, Executive Director; (352)307-6699 Ext 5 or email at 

execdir@flhorsepark.com. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 2 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Shawn Doherty, Executive Director; (352)307-

6699, ext. 5; or email at execdir@flhorsepark.com. If you are 

hearing or speech impaired, please contact the agency using 

the Florida Relay Service, (800)955-8771 (TDD) or (800)955-

8770 (Voice). 

__________________________________________________ 

REGIONAL PLANNING COUNCILS 

Tampa Bay Regional Planning Council 

The Tampa Bay Regional Planning Council's Clearinghouse 

Review Committee announces a public meeting to which all 

persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: August 26, 2013, 9:30 a.m. 

PLACE: 4000 Gateway Centre Blvd., Suite 100, Pinellas Park, 

FL 33782 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: to 

conduct the regular business of the Clearinghouse Review 

Committee. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: 

www.tbrpc.org. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 4 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Wren Krahl, (727)570-5151, ext. 22, or 

wren@tbrpc.org. If you are hearing or speech impaired, please 

contact the agency using the Florida Relay Service, (800)955-

8771 (TDD) or (800)955-8770 (Voice). 

For more information, you may contact: Mr. Avera Wynne, 

(727)570-5151, ext. 30, or avera@tbrpc.org. 

_________________________________________________ 

REGIONAL PLANNING COUNCILS 

Tampa Bay Regional Planning Council 

The Tampa Bay Regional Planning Council's Local 

Emergency Planning Committee announces a public meeting 

to which all persons are invited. 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=1
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=1
mailto:Alexander.Carlson@dos.myflorida.com
mailto:Alexander.Carlson@dos.myflorida.com
mailto:Alexander.Carlson@dos.myflorida.com
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=5
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=5
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=161
mailto:execdir@flhorsepark.com
mailto:execdir@flhorsepark.com
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=29
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=64
http://www.tbrpc.org/
mailto:wren@tbrpc.org
mailto:avera@tbrpc.org
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=29
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=64


Florida Administrative Register Volume 39, Number 160, August 16, 2013 

4142 

DATE AND TIME: August 28, 2013, 10:30 a.m. 

PLACE: 4000 Gateway Centre Blvd., #100, Pinellas Park, FL 

33782 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: To 

conduct the regular business of the Local Emergency Planning 

Committee. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: 

www.tbrpc.org. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 4 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Wren Krahl, (727)570-5151, ext. 22. If you are 

hearing or speech impaired, please contact the agency using 

the Florida Relay Service, (800)955-8771 (TDD) or (800)955-

8770 (Voice). 

For more information, you may contact: Mr. John Meyer, 

(727)570-5151, ext. 29. 

_________________________________________________ 

WATER MANAGEMENT DISTRICTS 

South Florida Water Management District 

The South Florida Water Management announces a public 

meeting to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: The WebBoard will be available for 

public comment on the Draft 2014 South Florida 

Environmental Report – Volume I from September 16, 2013, 

through October 24, 2013. The SFER WebBoard also will be 

available for public viewing from September 16, 2013, 

through November 8, 2013. 

Web-posting of the Draft 2014 South Florida Environmental 

Report (SFER) – Volume I. 

PLACE: http://www.sfwmd.gov/sfer. 

For persons without access to the Internet, access to the 

website is available at the headquarters office of the South 

Florida Water Management District, 3301 Gun Club Road, 

West Palm Beach, Florida, 8:00 a.m. – 5:00 p.m. Eastern 

Daylight Time, Monday through Friday. 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

Beginning on September 16, 2013, through November 8, 

2013, interested parties may access the SFER WebBoard and 

view communications among the peer-review panelists, 

agency responses to comments, electronically-stored 

communications and other public records associated with the 

Draft 2014 SFER – Volume I that are web-posted. Peer-

review panelists will post their comments and 

recommendations on the WebBoard, and the public can access 

this information via the website. The public may comment 

directly on the WebBoard at any time between September 16, 

2013, through October 24, 2013, on any aspect of the Draft 

2014 SFER – Volume I, particularly on relevant scientific or 

technical data and findings. Communications and documents 

from all parties can be accessed at any time once they are 

posted during the review period. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: not 

applicable. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Dr. Garth Redfield at (561)682-6611, or Trudy 

Stein, (561)682-6569. If you are hearing or speech impaired, 

please contact the agency using the Florida Relay Service, 

(800)955-8771 (TDD) or (800)955-8770 (Voice). 

For more information, you may write to the South Florida 

Water Management District, P.O. Box 24680, West Palm 

Beach, Florida 33416-4680, or call Dr. Garth Redfield, 

(561)682-6611. For assistance in obtaining WebBoard access 

for this review, please write to the South Florida Water 

Management District, P. O. Box 24680, West Palm Beach, 

Florida 33416-4680, or call Trudy Stein, (561)682-6569. 

__________________________________________________ 

WATER MANAGEMENT DISTRICTS 

South Florida Water Management District 

The South Florida Water Management District announces a 

public meeting to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: Wednesday, August 28, 2013, 10:00 a.m.; 

Everglades Region Land Assessment 2nd Public Meeting 

PLACE: South Florida Regional Planning Council Office, 

3440 Hollywood Boulevard, Suite 140, Hollywood, FL 33021 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

District staff shall provide information regarding the land 

assessment process and District lands within the Everglades 

Region. The purpose of the land assessment is to take a 

comprehensive and detailed look at the District’s land 

inventory to ensure that the present and future use of these 

lands will be utilized in the most effective manner to support 

the District’s core mission requirements, and to comply with 

other important state policy objectives. Public input and 

comment will be received. More information about the process 

is available at www.sfwmd.gov/landassessment. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: not 

applicable. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 5 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: the District Clerk, (561)682-2087. If you are 

hearing or speech impaired, please contact the agency using 

the Florida Relay Service, (800)955-8771 (TDD) or (800)955-

8770 (Voice). 

http://www.tbrpc.org/
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=40
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=124
http://www.sfwmd.gov/sfer
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=40
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=124
http://www.sfwmd.gov/landassessment


Florida Administrative Register Volume 39, Number 160, August 16, 2013 

4143 

 

For more information, you may contact: Andrea Schluter, 

aschlut@sfwmd.gov. 

__________________________________________________ 

REGIONAL UTILITY AUTHORITIES 

Peace River/Manasota Regional Water Supply Authority 

The Peace River Manasota Regional Water Supply Authority 

announces a public meeting to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: September 3, 2013, 9:30 a.m. 

PLACE: Charlotte County Administration Center, 

Commission Chambers, 18500 Murdock Circle, Port 

Charlotte, Florida 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

The Board of Directors will convene to conduct regular 

business of the Authority and Public Hearing for the 

Authority's FY14 Budget. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Linda 

Stewart at (941)316-1776 or email 

lstewart@regionalwater.org. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 2 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: (941)316-1776. If you are hearing or speech 

impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida Relay 

Service, (800)955-8771 (TDD) or (800)955-8770 (Voice). 

If any person decides to appeal any decision made by the 

Board with respect to any matter considered at this meeting or 

hearing, he/she will need to ensure that a verbatim record of 

the proceeding is made, which record includes the testimony 

and evidence from which the appeal is to be issued. 

For more information, you may contact: (941)316-1776. 

__________________________________________________ 

AGENCY FOR HEALTH CARE ADMINISTRATION 

Medicaid 

The Agency for Health Care Administration announces a 

public meeting to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: August 21, 2013, 10:00 a.m. – 4:00 p.m. 

– cancelled 

August 28, 2013, 10:00 a.m. – 4:00 p.m. 

PLACE: August 28, 2013, 10:00 a.m. – 4:00 p.m.: Agency for 

Health Care Administration, 2727 Mahan Drive, Building 3, 

Conference Room A, Tallahassee, FL 32308. To participate by 

phone, please call (877)415-3182, user ID# 596 425 07. 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

Regarding the upcoming Low Income Pool (LIP) Council 

meetings that have been publicly noticed for the month of 

August. We have cancelled the August 21 LIP Council 

Meeting and will hold the August 28 meeting. 

August 21, 10:00 a.m. – 4:00 p.m. – cancelled 

August 28, 10:00 a.m. – 4:00 p.m. – still occurring 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Nicole 

Maldonado at Nicole.Maldonado@ahca.myflorida.com or by 

calling (850)412-4287. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 7 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Nicole Maldonado at 

Nicole.Maldonado@ahca.myflorida.com or by calling 

(850)412-4287. If you are hearing or speech impaired, please 

contact the agency using the Florida Relay Service, (800)955-

8771 (TDD) or (800)955-8770 (Voice). 

For more information, you may contact: Nicole Maldonado at 

Nicole.Maldonado@ahca.myflorida.com or by calling 

(850)412-4287. 

_________________________________________________ 

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 

REGULATION 

Board of Professional Engineers 

The Florida Engineers Management Corporation Board 

Operations Committee announces a telephone conference call 

to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: September 6, 2013, 10:00 a.m. (EST) or 

soon thereafter 

PLACE: Florida Board of Professional Engineers, 2639 North 

Monroe St., Building B-112, Tallahassee, FL 32303 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: to 

monitor the operations of the Florida Board of Professional 

Engineers and the Florida Engineers Management Corporation 

and other general business of the Committee. If you would 

like to participate in the call, please contact Rebecca Sammons 

at (850)521-0500, ext. 114 at least 48 hours prior to the date of 

the meeting. 

Telephone Conference number: (888)392-4560. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Rebecca 

Sammons. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 48 hours before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Rebecca Sammons. If you are hearing or speech 

impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida Relay 

Service, (800)955-8771 (TDD) or (800)955-8770 (Voice). 

If any person decides to appeal any decision made by the 

Board with respect to any matter considered at this meeting or 

hearing, he/she will need to ensure that a verbatim record of 

the proceeding is made, which record includes the testimony 

and evidence from which the appeal is to be issued. 

For more information, you may contact: Rebecca Sammons, 

rsammons@fbpe.org. 

_________________________________________________ 

mailto:aschlut@sfwmd.gov
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=49
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=160
mailto:lstewart@regionalwater.org
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=59
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=192
mailto:Nicole.Maldonado@ahca.myflorida.com
mailto:Nicole.Maldonado@ahca.myflorida.com
mailto:Nicole.Maldonado@ahca.myflorida.com
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=267
mailto:rsammons@fbpe.org


Florida Administrative Register Volume 39, Number 160, August 16, 2013 

4144 

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 

REGULATION 

Board of Professional Engineers 

The Florida Board of Professional Engineers Application 

Committee and/or Educational Advisory Committee 

announces a public meeting to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: September 17, 2013, 8:30 a.m. (EST) or 

soon thereafter 

PLACE: Florida Board of Professional Engineers, 2639 North 

Monroe St. , Building B-112, Tallahassee, FL 32303 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

Review applications for licensure and other general business 

of the committees. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Rebecca 

Sammons. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 48 hours before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Rebecca Sammons. If you are hearing or speech 

impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida Relay 

Service, (800)955-8771 (TDD) or (800)955-8770 (Voice). 

If any person decides to appeal any decision made by the 

Board with respect to any matter considered at this meeting or 

hearing, he/she will need to ensure that a verbatim record of 

the proceeding is made, which record includes the testimony 

and evidence from which the appeal is to be issued. 

For more information, you may contact: Rebecca Sammons, 

rsammons@fbpe.org. 

_________________________________________________ 

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 

REGULATION 

Board of Professional Engineers 

The Florida Board of Professional Engineers Probable Cause 

Panel announces a public meeting to which all persons are 

invited. 

DATE AND TIME: September 17, 2013, 1:00 p.m. (EST) or 

soon thereafter 

PLACE: Florida Board of Professional Engineers, 2639 North 

Monroe St., Building B-112, Tallahassee, FL 32303 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

Although this meeting is open to the public, the Probable 

Cause Panel meeting may be closed consistent with law. If 

you wish to participate in any public portion of the Probable 

Cause Panel Meeting, please contact Rebecca Sammons at 

least 48 hours prior to the meeting. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Rebecca 

Sammons. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 48 hours before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Rebecca Sammons. If you are hearing or speech 

impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida Relay 

Service, (800)955-8771 (TDD) or (800)955-8770 (Voice). 

If any person decides to appeal any decision made by the 

Board with respect to any matter considered at this meeting or 

hearing, he/she will need to ensure that a verbatim record of 

the proceeding is made, which record includes the testimony 

and evidence from which the appeal is to be issued. 

For more information, you may contact: Rebecca Sammons, 

rsammons@fbpe.org. 

__________________________________________________ 

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 

REGULATION 

Board of Professional Engineers 

The Florida Board of Professional Engineers announces a 

telephone conference call to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: September 27, 2013, 10:00 a.m. (EST) or 

soon thereafter 

PLACE: Florida Board of Professional Engineers, 2639 North 

Monroe St., Building B-112, Tallahassee, FL 32303 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: To 

act on the recommendations from the Application & 

Educational Advisory Committee to approve or deny 

applications for licensure and any old or new business of the 

Board. If you would like to participate in the call, please 

contact Rebecca Sammons at (850)521-0500, ext. 114 at least 

48 hours prior to the date of the meeting. 

Telephone Conference number: (888)392-4560. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Rebecca 

Sammons. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 48 hours before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Rebecca Sammons. If you are hearing or speech 

impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida Relay 

Service, (800)955-8771 (TDD) or (800)955-8770 (Voice). 

If any person decides to appeal any decision made by the 

Board with respect to any matter considered at this meeting or 

hearing, he/she will need to ensure that a verbatim record of 

the proceeding is made, which record includes the testimony 

and evidence from which the appeal is to be issued. 

__________________________________________________ 

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH 

Board of Acupuncture 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

64B1-4.0011 Documentation Necessary for Licensure 

Application 

Notice is hereby given that the following correction has been 

made to the proposed Notice of Public Hearing, published in 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=267
mailto:rsammons@fbpe.org
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=267
mailto:rsammons@fbpe.org
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=267
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=64
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=300


Florida Administrative Register Volume 39, Number 160, August 16, 2013 

4145 

 

Vol. 39, No. 124, of the June 26, 2013, issue of the Florida 

Administrative Register. 

The place shall now read as follows: Residence Inn 

Tallahassee Universities at the Capitol, 600 West Gaines 

Street, Tallahassee, FL 32304, (850)329-9080. 

This correction does not affect the substance of the notice as it 

appeared in the Florida Administrative Register as outlined 

above. 

The person to be contacted regarding the proposed rule is: 

Anthony Jusevitch, Executive Director, Board of 

Acupuncture/MQA, 4052 Bald Cypress Way, Bin #C06, 

Tallahassee, Florida 32399-3256. 

__________________________________________________ 

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH 

Office of Statewide Research 

The Florida Department of Health announces a public meeting 

to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: August 28, 2013, 3:00 p.m. – 5:00 p.m. 

PLACE: Conference call: (888)670-3525, conference code: 

2922384719 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

Biomedical Research Advisory Council meeting pertaining to 

the James and Esther King Biomedical Research Program and 

the Bankhead-Coley Cancer Research Program. Agenda and 

meeting materials will be located at www.floridabiomed.com. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Sarah 

Hofmeister, Public Health Research Unit, (850)245-4444, ext. 

3591. 

For more information, you may contact: Sarah Hofmeister, 

Public Health Research Unit, (850)245-4444, ext. 3591. 

__________________________________________________ 

FISH AND WILDLIFE CONSERVATION COMMISSION 

The Florida Fish and Wildlife Conservation Commission 

announces public meetings to which all persons are invited. 

DATES AND TIMES: September 5 and 6, 2013, 8:30 a.m. 

each day 

PLACE: Crowne Plaza Pensacola Grand Hotel, 200 East 

Gregory Street, Pensacola, Florida 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: To 

review and discuss substantive and procedural issues 

associated with the Fish and Wildlife Conservation 

Commission and to take action on proposed rules and policy 

issues. The meeting may include fact-finding field trips to 

Commission managed areas or facilities and to other areas to 

learn about management, and enforcement activities. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Robin 

Stetler, Florida Fish and Wildlife Conservation Commission, 

620 S. Meridian St., Tallahassee, FL 32399-1600. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 5 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: the ADA Coordinator, at (850)488-6411. If you 

are hearing or speech impaired, please contact the agency 

using the Florida Relay Service, (800)955-8771 (TDD) or 

(800)955-8770 (Voice). 

For more information, you may contact: Mr. Bud Vielhauer, 

General Counsel, 620 South Meridian Street, Tallahassee, 

Florida 32399-1600 or (850)487-1764. 

 

Section VII 

Notice of Petitions and Dispositions 

Regarding Declaratory Statements 

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 

REGULATION 

Florida Building Commission 

RULE NO.:  RULE TITLE: 

61G20-1.001: Florida Building Code Adopted 

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that the Florida Building 

Commission has received the petition for declaratory 

statement from Michael Goolsby of Miami-Dade County 

Board and Code Administration Division. The petition seeks 

the agency's opinion as to the applicability of Section 105.3, 

Florida Building Code, Building and section 553.73(6)F.S. as 

it applies to the petitioner. 

Petitioner seeks clarification of which building code should 

govern permit applications and extensions made after March 

1, 2002 but prior to March 15, 2012. 

A copy of the Petition for Declaratory Statement may be 

obtained by contacting: Agency Clerk's Office, Department of 

Business and Professional Regulation, 1940 North Monroe 

Street, Suite 92, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-2203, (850)921-

0342, AGC.Filing@myfloridalicense.com. 

Please refer all comments to: Mo Madani, Planning Manager, 

Building Codes and Standards Office, Department of Business 

and Professional Regulation, Suite 90A, 1940 North Monroe, 

Tallahassee, Florida 32399, (850)487-1824, 

mo.madani@myfloridalicense.com. 

April L. Hammonds, Office of the General Counsel, 

Department of Business and Professional Regulation, 1940 

North Monroe Street, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-1000, 

(850)487-1824, april.hammonds@myfloridalicense.com. 

Responses, motions to intervene, or requests for a hearing, 

§120.57(2), Fla. Stat., must be filed within 21 days of this 

notice. 

_________________________________________________ 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=64
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=338
http://www.floridabiomed.com/
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=68
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=1071
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61G20-1.001
mailto:AGC.Filing@myfloridalicense.com
mailto:mo.madani@myfloridalicense.com
mailto:april.hammonds@myfloridalicense.com


Florida Administrative Register Volume 39, Number 160, August 16, 2013 

4146 

Section VIII 

Notice of Petitions and Dispositions 

Regarding the Validity of Rules 

Notice of Petition for Administrative Determination has been 

filled with the Division of Administrative Hearings on the 

following rules: 

NONE 

Notice of Disposition of Petition for Administrative 

Determination has been filled with the Division of 

Administrative Hearings on the following rules: 

NONE 

Section IX 

Notice of Petitions and Dispositions 

Regarding Non-rule Policy Challenges 

NONE 

Section X 

Annoucements and Objection Reports of the 

Joint Adminstrative Procedures Committee 

NONE 

Section XI 

Notices Regarding Bids, Proposals and 

Purchasing 

Hillsborough County Aviation Authority 

HCAA RFQ 13-411-040 Project Nos. 1100, 1105, 8700 

ConRAC & APM Design and Construction 

HILLSBOROUGH COUNTY AVIATION AUTHORITY 

(AUTHORITY) 

Request for Qualifications 

Solicitation Number 13-411-040 

Project Numbers 1100 13, 1105 14 and 8700 14 

Sealed qualifications for the Consolidated Rental Car Facility 

and Automated People Mover system will be received from 

design-build firms by the Authority at Tampa International 

Airport Offices located at 4160 George J. Bean Parkway, Suite 

2400, Administrative Building, Second Level, Red Side, 

Tampa, Florida 33607.  

Solicitation documents and detailed requirements will be 

available on the Tampa International Airport website at 

www.tampaairport.com, Airport Business, Active 

Solicitations. 

_________________________________________________ 

Section XII 

Miscellaneous 

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 

REGULATION 

Division of Alcoholic Beverages and Tobacco 

NOTICE OF QUOTA LIQUOR LICENSE DRAWINGS 

The division will accept Quota License Drawing Entry Forms 

for 45 days beginning the third Monday in August. This year 

entry forms will be accepted from August 19, 2013, until 5:00 

p.m. on October 2, 2013, for the following counties and 

amounts: Charlotte (1), Dade (4), Duval (1), Hillsborough (1), 

Lee (1), Manatee (1), Orange (2), Osceola (1), Polk (1), 

Sumter (1). 

The division must receive all entry forms before this deadline. 

No exceptions. Mail the completed entry form, including 

payment (check or money order made payable to the division), 

to: Division of Alcoholic Beverages and Tobacco, Attention: 

Quota License Drawing, 1940 North Monroe Street, 

Tallahassee, Florida 32399-1019. 

DBPR ABT-6033 is the only entry form that will be accepted 

for filing into these drawings. All other entry forms from prior 

drawings will be denied. All interested persons should contact 

the Division's district office serving their area of interest or 

visit the Division’s internet website: 

http://www.myfloridalicense.com/dbpr/abt to obtain the 

proper application form. 

Further information may also be obtained by calling: 

(850)488-8284 or writing to Division of Alcoholic Beverages 

and Tobacco, Bureau of Licensing, New Quota License 

Drawing, 1940 North Monroe Street, Tallahassee, FL 32399-

1019. 

__________________________________________________ 

DEPARTMENT OF ECONOMIC OPPORTUNITY 

Division of Community Development 

Final Order No. DEO-13-0080 

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that the Florida Department of 

Economic Opportunity issued Final Order No. DEO-13-0080 

on August 14, 2013, in response to an application submitted 

by Deer Run #8A Homeowners Association, Inc. for covenant 

revitalization under Chapter 720, Part III, Florida Statutes. The 

Department determined that the application met the statutory 

requirements for covenant revitalization. Accordingly, the 

Department’s Final Order approved the application for 

covenant revitalization. A copy of the final order may be 

obtained by writing to Miriam Snipes, Agency Clerk, 

Department of Economic Opportunity, 107 E. Madison Street, 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=794
http://www.tampaairport.com/
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=247
http://www.myfloridalicense.com/dbpr/abt
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=73
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=1066


Florida Administrative Register Volume 39, Number 160, August 16, 2013 

4147 

 

MSC 110, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-4128 or 

miriam.snipes@deo.myflorida.com. 

__________________________________________________ 

DEPARTMENT OF ECONOMIC OPPORTUNITY 

Division of Community Development 

Final Order No. DEO-13-082 

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that the Florida Department of 

Economic Opportunity issued Final Order No. DEO-13-082 

on August 14, 2013, in response to an application submitted 

by Villas of Beacon Groves Homeowners’ Assn., Inc. for 

covenant revitalization under Chapter 720, Part III, Florida 

Statutes. The Department determined that the application met 

the statutory requirements for covenant revitalization. 

Accordingly, the Department’s Final Order approved the 

application for covenant revitalization. Copies of the final 

order may be obtained by writing to Miriam Snipes, Agency 

Clerk, Department of Economic Opportunity, 107 E. Madison 

Street, MSC 110, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-4128 or 

miriam.snipes@deo.myflorida.com. 

__________________________________________________ 

DEPARTMENT OF ECONOMIC OPPORTUNITY 

Division of Community Development 

Final Orders 

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that the Florida Department of 

Economic Opportunity issued Final Order No. DEO-13-072 

and Final Order No. DEO-13-078 on August 7, 2013, in 

response to applications submitted by Palm-Aire Village 

Private Home Townhouse Park Board, Inc. and Pine Island 

Village, Unit 1 and Unit 2, Homeowners Association, Inc., 

respectively, for covenant revitalization under Chapter 720, 

Part III, Florida Statutes. The Department determined that the 

applications met the statutory requirements for covenant 

revitalization. Accordingly, the Department’s Final Orders 

approved the two applications for covenant revitalization. 

Copies of the final order may be obtained by writing to 

Miriam Snipes, Agency Clerk, Department of Economic 

Opportunity, 107 E. Madison Street, MSC 110, Tallahassee, 

Florida 32399-4128 or miriam.snipes@deo.myflorida.com. 

__________________________________________________ 

DEPARTMENT OF ECONOMIC OPPORTUNITY 

Division of Community Development 

Final Order No. DEO-13-084 

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that the Florida Department of 

Economic Opportunity issued Final Order No. DEO-13-084 

on August 13, 2013, in response to an application submitted 

by Club Manor Property Owners’ Association, Inc. for 

covenant revitalization under Chapter 720, Part III, Florida 

Statutes. The Department determined that the application met 

the statutory requirements for covenant revitalization. 

Accordingly, the Department’s Final Order approved the 

application for covenant revitalization. Copies of the final 

order may be obtained by writing to Miriam Snipes, Agency 

Clerk, Department of Economic Opportunity, 107 E. Madison 

Street, MSC 110, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-4128 or 

miriam.snipes@deo.myflorida.com. 

_________________________________________________ 

DEPARTMENT OF ECONOMIC OPPORTUNITY 

Division of Community Development 

Final Order No. DEO-13-077 

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that the Florida Department of 

Economic Opportunity issued Final Order No. DEO-13-077 

on August 14, 2013, in response to an application submitted 

by Timberway Community Association, Inc., respectively, for 

covenant revitalization under Chapter 720, Part III, Florida 

Statutes. The Department determined that the application met 

the statutory requirements for covenant revitalization. 

Accordingly, the Department’s Final Orders approved the 

application for covenant revitalization. Copies of the final 

order may be obtained by writing to Miriam Snipes, Agency 

Clerk, Department of Economic Opportunity, 107 E. Madison 

Street, MSC 110, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-4128 or 

miriam.snipes@deo.myflorida.com. 

________________________________________________ 

Section XIII 

Index to Rules Filed During Preceeding 

Week 

NOTE: The above section will be published on Tuesday 

beginning October 2, 2012, unless Monday is a holiday, then it 

will be published on Wednesday of that week. 

__________________________________________________ 

mailto:miriam.snipes@deo.myflorida.com
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=73
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=1066
mailto:miriam.snipes@deo.myflorida.com
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=73
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=1066
mailto:miriam.snipes@deo.myflorida.com
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=73
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=1066
mailto:miriam.snipes@deo.myflorida.com
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=73
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=1066
mailto:miriam.snipes@deo.myflorida.com

