Florida Administrative Register

Volume 41, Number 60, March 27, 2015

Section |
Notice of Development of Proposed Rules
and Negotiated Rulemaking

DEPARTMENT OF AGRICULTURE AND CONSUMER
SERVICES

Division of Aquaculture

RULE NOS.: RULE TITLES:

5L-3.004 Aquaculture Best Management Practices
Manual

5L-3.005 Aquaculture Certificate of Registration

5L-3.006 Minimal Impact Aquaculture Facilities

5L-3.007 Failure to Comply With the Best

Management Practices
PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The amendments proposed will
update the referenced sections of Rule Chapter 5L-3, F.A.C.,
to better reflect advances of the aquaculture industry.
SUBJECT AREA TO BE ADDRESSED: Any proposed
amendments will update and provide clarifications for
aquaculture best management practices, registration, minimal
impact aquaculture facilities, and penalties.
RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 570.07(23),
791.07 FS.
LAW IMPLEMENTED: 570.232, 597.002, 597.003, 597.004,
597.0041 FS.
A RULE DEVELOPMENT WORKSHOP WILL BE HELD
AT THE DATE, TIME AND PLACE SHOWN BELOW:
DATE AND TIME: April 13, 2015, 1:00 p.m.
PLACE: Division of Aquaculture, 11350 SW 153rd Court,
Cedar Key, FL 32625
DATE AND TIME: April 14, 2015, 10:00 a.m.
PLACE: Division of Aquaculture, 170 Century Boulevard,
Bartow, FL 33830
DATE AND TIME: April 16, 2015, 10:00 a.m.
PLACE: Division of Aquaculture, Holland Building, 600 S
Calhoun Street, Suite 217, Tallahassee, FL 32399
Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 5 days before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: Portia Sapp, Bureau Chief, Division of
Aquaculture, (850)617-7600 If you are hearing or speech
impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida Relay
Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice).
THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT AND A COPY OF
THE PRELIMINARY DRAFT, IF AVAILABLE, IS: Portia
Sapp, Division of Aquaculture, 600 S Calhoun Street, Suite
217, Tallahassee, Florida 32301, Phone: (850)617-7600
THE PRELIMINARY TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE
DEVELOPMENT IS NOT AVAILABLE.

597.004(2),

DEPARTMENT OF EDUCATION

Florida’s Office of Early Learning

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE:

6M-9.300 Child Care Resource and Referral
PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The purpose of the revised rule is
to clarify the duties and responsibilities of child care resource
and referral (CCR&R) and align the rule to recent statutory
changes for CCR&R, which reflect changes made to federal
regulations regarding consumer education and resource and
referral.

SUBJECT AREA TO BE ADDRESSED: Child Care
Resource and Referral and Consumer Education.
RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 1002.92 FS.

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 1002.92 FS.

A RULE DEVELOPMENT WORKSHOP WILL BE HELD
AT THE DATE, TIME AND PLACE SHOWN BELOW:
DATES AND TIMES: April 14, 2015, 1:00 p.m. — 2:30 p.m.,
ET or until business is concluded, whichever is sooner, and
April 21, 2015, 5:30-7:00 PM, ET, or until business is
concluded, whichever is sooner

PLACE: via GoToWebinar only. To register for the webinar,
please visit:
http://www.floridaearlylearning.com/oel_resources/rules_guid
ance_technical_assistance/proposed_rules.aspx

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 7 days before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: Molly Grant, 250 Marriott Drive, Tallahassee, FL
32399, Telephone: (850)717-8578. If you are hearing or
speech impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida
Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770
(Voice).

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT AND A COPY OF
THE PRELIMINARY DRAFT, IF AVAILABLE, IS: Molly
Grant, 250 Marriott Drive, Tallahassee, FL 32399, Telephone:
(850)717-8578

THE PRELIMINARY TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE
DEVELOPMENT IS AVAILABLE AT NO CHARGE
FROM THE CONTACT PERSON LISTED ABOVE.

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL
REGULATION

Florida Real Estate Appraisal Board

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE:

61J1-2.005 Inactive Registration

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The Board proposes the rule
amendment to delete unnecessary language and to update the
forms required for registration for inactive status.

1485


https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=5
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=5
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=172
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=5L-3.004
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=5L-3.005
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=5L-3.006
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=5L-3.007
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=570.07(23)%20F.S.
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20597.004(2)%20F.S.
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/cfr.asp?id=%20791.07%20F.S
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=570.232%20F.S.
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20597.002%20F.S.
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20597.003%20F.S.
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20597.004%20F.S.
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20597.0041%20F.S.
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=6
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=1044
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=6M-9.300
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/cfr.asp?id=1002.92
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/cfr.asp?id=1002.92
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=282
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61J1-2.005

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 41, Number 6, March 27, 2015

SUBJECT AREA TO BE ADDRESSED:
registration.

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 475.614, 475.619 FS.
LAW IMPLEMENTED: 475.613(2), 475.618, 475.619 FS.

IF REQUESTED IN WRITING AND NOT DEEMED
UNNECESSARY BY THE AGENCY HEAD, A RULE
DEVELOPMENT WORKSHOP WILL BE NOTICED IN
THE NEXT AVAILABLE FLORIDA ADMINISTRATIVE
REGISTER.

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT AND A COPY OF
THE PRELIMINARY DRAFT, IF AVAILABLE, IS: Juana
Watkins, Director, Division of Real Estate, 400 West
Robinson Street, Hurston Building, North Tower, Suite N801,
Orlando, Florida 32801

THE PRELIMINARY TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE
DEVELOPMENT IS AVAILABLE AT NO CHARGE
FROM THE CONTACT PERSON LISTED ABOVE.

Inactive

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL
REGULATION

Drugs, Devices and Cosmetics

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE:

61N-1.016 Product Registration

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The purpose and effect of the rule
amendment is to incorporate the application forms to be used
for registration and renewal of drug and cosmetic products.
SUBJECT AREA TO BE ADDRESSED: The subject area to
be addressed in this rule is the registration and renewal of drug
and cosmetic products.

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 499.015, 499.05 FS.

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 499.01, 499.015, 499.04, 499.05 FS.
IF REQUESTED IN WRITING AND NOT DEEMED
UNNECESSARY BY THE AGENCY HEAD, A RULE
DEVELOPMENT WORKSHOP WILL BE NOTICED IN
THE NEXT AVAILABLE FLORIDA ADMINISTRATIVE
REGISTER.

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT AND A COPY OF
THE PRELIMINARY DRAFT, IF AVAILABLE, IS: Dinah
Greene, Division of Drugs, Devices and Cosmetics,
Department of Business and Professional Regulation, 1940 N.
Monroe Street, Suite 26A, Tallahassee, FL 32399-1047,
dinah.greene@myfloridalicense.com, (850)717-1802

THE PRELIMINARY TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE
DEVELOPMENT IS NOT AVAILABLE.

1486

Section Il
Proposed Rules

LAND AND WATER ADJUDICATORY COMMISSION

RULE NOS.: RULE TITLES:

42-2.002 Pleadings

42-2.005 Time for Filing Appeal
42-2.0121 Definitions

42-2.019 Filing and Service of Documents

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The purpose and effect is to repeal
the identified rules.

SUMMARY: The identified rules are unnecessary as the
subject of each rule is either within the scope of the Uniform
Rules of Procedure or is addressed through statutory language.
SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF ESTIMATED
REGULATORY COSTS AND LEGISLATIVE
RATIFICATION: The Agency has determined that this will
not have an adverse impact on small business or likely
increase directly or indirectly regulatory costs in excess of
$200,000 in the aggregate within one year after the
implementation of the rule. A SERC has not been prepared by
the Agency.

The Agency has determined that the proposed rule is not
expected to require legislative ratification based on the
statement of estimated regulatory costs or if no SERC is
required, the information expressly relied upon and described
herein: The Commission has determined that repeal of the
rules is not expected to require legislative ratification based on
the fact that the rules are unnecessary as the subject of each
rule is either within the scope of the Uniform Rules of
Procedure or is addressed through statutory language.

Any person who wishes to provide information regarding a
statement of estimated regulatory costs, or provide a proposal
for a lower cost regulatory alternative must do so in writing
within 21 days of this notice.

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 373.114(1)(f), 380.07(1) FS.

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 373.114, 380.07 FS.

IF REQUESTED WITHIN 21 DAYS OF THE DATE OF
THIS NOTICE, A HEARING WILL BE SCHEDULED AND
ANNOUNCED IN THE FAR.

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULE IS: Barbara Leighty, Office of the
Governor, Room 1801, The Capitol, Tallahassee, FL 32399-
0001, telephone: (850)717-9513


https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=475.614
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20475.619%20FS.
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=475.613(2)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20475.618
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20475.619%20FS.
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=1057
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61N-1.016
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/cfr.asp?id=499.015,%20499.05%20FS
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/cfr.asp?id=499.01,%20499.015,%20499.04,%20499.05%20FS
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=42
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=42-2.002
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=42-2.005
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=42-2.0121
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=42-2.019
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/cfr.asp?id=373.114(1)(f),%20380.07(1),%20FS
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/cfr.asp?id=373.114,%20380.07,%20FS

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 41, Number 60, March 27, 2015

THE FULL TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE IS:

42-2.002 Pleadings.
Rulemaking  Authority 373.114(1)(f), 380.07(1) FS. Law
Implemented 373.114, 380.07 FS. History—New 10-2-75, Formerly
22G-1.03, 27G-1.02, Amended 8-10-86, 3-15-95, Repealed

42-2.005 Time for Filing Appeal.
Rulemaking  Authority 373.114(1)(f), 380.07(1) FS. Law
Implemented 380.07 FS. History—New 10-2-75, Formerly 22G-1.05,
27G-1.05, Amended 8-10-86, 11-11-87, Repealed .

42-2.0121 Definitions.
Rulemaking  Authority 373.114(1)(f), 380.07(1) FS. Law
Implemented 373.114, 380.07 FS. History—New 6-8-77, Formerly
22G-1.121, Amended 2-7-84, Formerly 27G-1.121, Amended 2-20-
94, Repealed .

42-2.019 Filing and Service of Documents.
Rulemaking  Authority  373.114(1)(f), 380.07(1) FS. Law
Implemented 373.114, 380.07 FS. History—New 6-8-77, Formerly
22G-1.19, Amended 2-7-84, Formerly 27G-1.19, Amended 2-20-94,
Repealed .

NAME OF PERSON ORIGINATING PROPOSED RULE:
Florida Land and Water Adjudicatory Commission

NAME OF AGENCY HEAD WHO APPROVED THE
PROPOSED RULE: Florida Land and Water Adjudicatory
Commission

DATE PROPOSED RULE APPROVED BY AGENCY
HEAD: March 10, 2015

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL
REGULATION

Regulatory Council of Community Association Managers

RULE NOS.: RULE TITLES:

61E14-4.001 Continuing Education Renewal
Requirements.

61E14-4.004 Reactivation Continuing Education.

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: For Rule 61E14-4.001, F.A.C., to
clarify existing rule and change requirement from 4 hours of
legal update seminars — including a 2-hour legal seminar — to 4
total hours of seminars; for Rule 61E14-4.004, F.A.C., to
clarify continuing education requirements for inactive and
delinquent licenses and time periods for completion of same.
SUMMARY:: For Rule 61E14-4.001, F.A.C., clarify existing
rule and change seminar requirements; for Rule 61E14-4.004,
F.A.C., clarify continuing education requirements for
licensure reactivation.

SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF ESTIMATED
REGULATORY COST AND LEGISLATIVE
RATIFICATION: The agency has determined that this will
not have an adverse impact on small business or likely
increase directly or indirectly regulatory costs in excess of
$200,000 in the aggregate within one year after the
implementation of the rule. A SERC has not been prepared by
the agency. The agency has determined that the proposed rule
is not expected to require legislative ratification based on the
statement of estimated regulatory costs or if no SERC is
required, the information expressly relied upon and described
herein: For Rule 61E14-4.001, F.A.C., the amendments will
reduce overall costs to licensees and course providers, because
it will increase flexibility and the ability to offer the legal
update seminars in time increments that best meet the licensee
and course provider's needs; for Rule 61E14-4.004, F.A.C.,
the rule rewording will reduce overall costs, since it will
reduce confusion among licensees and those seeking to apply
the rule, as well as reduce the chance that licensees will not be
able to reinstate their licenses due to misapprehension of the
rule's requirements.

Any person who wishes to provide information regarding a
statement of estimated regulatory costs, or provide a proposal
for a lower cost regulatory alternative must do so in writing
within 21 days of this notice.

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 455.2123,
468.4315, (2), 468.4336, 468.4337, 468.4338 FS.
LAW IMPLEMENTED: 455.2123, 455.2124, 455.271(4),
(10), 468.4336, 468.4337, 468.4338 FS.

IF REQUESTED WITHIN 21 DAYS OF THE DATE OF
THIS NOTICE, A HEARING WILL BE SCHEDULED AND
ANNOUNCED IN THE FAR.

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULE IS: Robyn Barineau, Executive Director,
Regulatory Council of Community Association Managers,
1940 N. Monroe Street, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-0783,
(850)717-1980

455.2124,

THE TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE IS:

61E14-4.001
Requirements.

(1) All community association manager licensees must
satisfactorily complete a minimum of 20 hours of continuing
education per biennial renewal cycle. Each hour shall consist
of 50 minutes of student involvement in approved classroom,
correspondence, interactive, distance education or internet
courses which-courses-shall-inchude-the-required-hours-at-an
approved-update-seminar. No license shall be renewed unless

the licensee has completed the required continuing education.

Continuing Education Renewal

1487


file://dossdlisstore/gateway/department.asp%3fid=61
file://dossdlisstore/gateway/department.asp%3fid=61
file://dossdlisstore/gateway/organization.asp%3fid=835

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 41, Number 6, March 27, 2015

(2) No change.

(3) The required 20 hours of continuing education shall be
comprised of courses approved pursuant to Rule 61E14-4.003,
F.A.C., in the following areas:

(@ 4 hours of legal update seminars. Licensees—shall
satisfactoriy—complete—a—2-heur—legalupdate—seminar The
legal update seminars shall consist of instruction regarding
changes to Chapters 455, 468, Part VIII, 617, 718, 719, 720,
and 721, F.S., and other legislation, case law, and regulations
impacting community association management. Licensees
shall not be awarded continuing education credit for
completing the same legal update seminar more than once
even if the seminars were taken during different years.

(b) through (e) No change.

(4) No licensee will receive credit, for purposes of
meeting the continuing education requirement, for completing
the same continuing education course more than once during a
biennial renewal cycle period.

(5) Course instructors may receive continuing education
credit hours in the amount of hours approved by the Council
for licensees only once every biennial renewal cycle peried for
each approved course taught by the instructor.

(6) Anyone licensed for more than 24 months at renewal

time will be required to have complied with the continuing
education GE requirements set forth in subsection (1), above,
prior to license renewal. “More than 24 months”; means 24
months plus 1 day. Licensees licensed for 24 months or less at
renewal time are exempt from compliance with the continuing
education GE requirements set forth in subsection (1) above,
until the end of the next renewal cycle.
Rulemaking Authority 455.2123, 455.2124, 468.4315(2), 468.4336,
468.4337 FS. Law Implemented 455.2123, 455.2124, 468.4336,
468.4337 FS. History—New 5-5-88, Amended 3-22-89, 2-5-91, 12-
28-92, Formerly 7D-55.008, 61B-55.008, Amended 10-18-99, 3-13-
00, 2-21-01, 7-21-03, 4-25-05, 2-28-07, Formerly 61-20.508,
Amended 2-1-15,_ .

(Substantial rewording of Rule 61E14-4.004 follows. See
Florida Administrative Code for present text.)

61E14-4.004 Reactivation Continuing Education.

(1) Inactive Licenses. As a condition for reactivating an
inactive license, a licensee must complete twenty (20)
classroom hours of continuing education instruction, as
required by Rule 61E14-4.001, F.A.C., all of which must have
been completed within the current or immediately preceding
licensure renewal cycles.

(2) Delinquent Licenses. As a condition for reactivating a
delinquent license, a licensee must complete twenty (20)
classroom hours of continuing education instruction, as
required by Rule 61E14-4.001, F.A.C., all of which must have
been completed during the licensure cycle in which the
licensee becomes delinquent.

1488

(3) All inactive or delinquent licensees applying for
reactivation must take the legal update seminars required by
Rule 61E14-4.001(3)(a), F.A.C. for the current and
immediately preceding year.

Rulemaking Authority 468.4315, 468.4338 FS. Law Implemented

455.271(4), (10), 468.4338 FS. History—New 1-8-98, Amended 3-13-
00, Formerly 61-20.509, Amended 1-5-10

NAME OF PERSON ORIGINATING PROPOSED RULE:
Regulatory Council of Community Association Managers
NAME OF AGENCY HEAD WHO APPROVED THE
PROPOSED RULE: Regulatory Council of Community
Association Managers

DATE PROPOSED RULE APPROVED BY AGENCY
HEAD: February 20, 2015

DATE NOTICE OF PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT
PUBLISHED IN FAR: March 11, 2015

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL
REGULATION

Board of Professional Engineers

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE:

61G15-20.0015 Application for Licensure by Endorsement
PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The Board proposes the rule
amendment to delete unnecessary language and to add new
language to clarify the requirements for application for
licensure by endorsement.

SUMMARY: The rule amendment will delete unnecessary
language and add new language to clarify the requirements for
application for licensure by endorsement.

SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF ESTIMATED
REGULATORY COSTS AND LEGISLATIVE
RATIFICATION:

The Agency has determined that this will not have an adverse
impact on small business or likely increase directly or
indirectly regulatory costs in excess of $200,000 in the
aggregate within one year after the implementation of the rule.
A SERC has not been prepared by the Agency.

The Agency has determined that the proposed rule is not
expected to require legislative ratification based on the
statement of estimated regulatory costs or if no SERC is
required, the information expressly relied upon and described
herein: During discussion of the economic impact of this rule
at its Board meeting, the Board, based upon the expertise and
experience of its members, determined that a Statement of
Estimated Regulatory Costs (SERC) was not necessary and
that the rule will not require ratification by the Legislature. No
person or interested party submitted additional information
regarding the economic impact at that time.


https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=267
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61G15-20.0015

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 41, Number 60, March 27, 2015

Any person who wishes to provide information regarding a
statement of estimated regulatory costs, or provide a proposal
for a lower cost regulatory alternative must do so in writing
within 21 days of this notice.

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 471.008, 471.013, 471.015
FS.

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 471.013, 471.015 FS.

IF REQUESTED WITHIN 21 DAYS OF THE DATE OF
THIS NOTICE, A HEARING WILL BE SCHEDULED AND
ANNOUNCED IN THE FAR.

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULE IS: Zana Raybon, Executive Director,
Board of Professional Engineers, 2639 North Monroe Street,
Suite B-112, Tallahassee, FL 32303

THE FULL TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE IS:

61G15-20.0015
Endorsement

(1) through (4) No change.

(5) The Board shall deem that an applicant for licensure
by endorsement who has an engineering degree that is not
EAC/ABET accredited has demonstrated substantial
equivalency to an EAC/ABET accredited engineering
program, as required by Rule 61G15-20.007, F.A.C., when
such applicant has held a valid professional engineer’s license
in another state for 15 years and has had 20 years of
contindous professional-level engineering experience, to
include the active practice of engineering for at least 3 of the
last 5 years.

(6) No change.

Rulemaking Authority 471.008, 471.013, 471.015 FS. Law

Implemented 471.013, 471.015 FS. History—New 9-27-01, Amended
4-9-07, 10-15-09, 11-16-10, 9-14-14

Application  for  Licensure by

NAME OF PERSON ORIGINATING PROPOSED RULE:
Board of Professional Engineers

NAME OF AGENCY HEAD WHO APPROVED THE
PROPOSED RULE: Board of Professional Engineers

DATE PROPOSED RULE APPROVED BY AGENCY
HEAD: January 26, 2015

DATE NOTICE OF PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT
PUBLISHED IN FAR: March 10, 2015

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL
REGULATION
Board of Professional Engineers
RULE NO.: RULE TITLE:
61G15-31.006  Design of Structural Systems Utilizing Open
Web Steel Joists and Joist Girders
PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The Board proposes the rule
amendment to delete unnecessary language and to add new
language to clarify the requirements for the design of
structural systems utilizing open web steel joists and joist
girders.
SUMMARY: The rule amendment will delete unnecessary
language and add new language to clarify the requirements for
the design of structural systems utilizing open web steel joists
and joist girders.
SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF ESTIMATED
REGULATORY COSTS AND LEGISLATIVE
RATIFICATION: The Agency has determined that this will
not have an adverse impact on small business or likely
increase directly or indirectly regulatory costs in excess of
$200,000 in the aggregate within one year after the
implementation of the rule. A SERC has not been prepared by
the Agency.
The Agency has determined that the proposed rule is not
expected to require legislative ratification based on the
statement of estimated regulatory costs or if no SERC is
required, the information expressly relied upon and described
herein: During discussion of the economic impact of this rule
at its Board meeting, the Board, based upon the expertise and
experience of its members, determined that a Statement of
Estimated Regulatory Costs (SERC) was not necessary and
that the rule will not require ratification by the Legislature. No
person or interested party submitted additional information
regarding the economic impact at that time.
Any person who wishes to provide information regarding a
statement of estimated regulatory costs, or provide a proposal
for a lower cost regulatory alternative must do so in writing
within 21 days of this notice.
RULEMAKING AUTHORITY:: 471.033(2), 471.008 FS.
LAW IMPLEMENTED: 471.033(1)(9), (j) FS.
IF REQUESTED WITHIN 21 DAYS OF THE DATE OF
THIS NOTICE, A HEARING WILL BE SCHEDULED AND
ANNOUNCED IN THE FAR.
THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULE IS: Zana Raybon, Executive Director,
Board of Professional Engineers, 2639 North Monroe Street,
Suite B-112, Tallahassee, FL 32303

1489


https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=471.008
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20471.013
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20471.015%20FS.
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20471.015%20FS.
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=471.013
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20471.015%20FS.
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=267
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61G15-31.006
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=471.033(2)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20471.008%20FS.
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=471.033(1)(g)

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 41, Number 6, March 27, 2015

THE FULL TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE IS:

61G15-31.006 Design of Structural Systems Utilizing
Open Web Steel Joists and Joist Girders.

(1) The Engineer of Record shall indicate on the
Structural Engineering Documents the steel joist and joist
girder designations as required in Section 2206 of the Florida
Building Code from—the—1997 Steel Joist—Institute's
Specifications—and—load—tables and shall indicate the
appropriate standards for joist and joist girder design, layout,
end supports, anchorage, bridging requirements, etc.,
including connections to walls. These documents shall
indicate special requirements for concentrated loads, non-
uniform loads, openings, extended ends, and resistance to
uplift loads.

(2) The steel joist and joist girder manufacturer shall
design the steel joist and joist girder members in accordance
with as required in Section 2206 of the Florida Building Code
the-1997 SteelJoist-Institute-SpecHicationsand-load-tables to
support the loads per the Engineer of Record's specified joist
and joist girder designations and/or special loading diagrams,
as set forth in Structural Engineering Documents. The
Engineer of Record may require the submission of the steel
joist and joist girder design calculations as an indication of
compliance. When required to submit the steel joist and joist
girder calculations, the steel joist and joist girder manufacturer
shall submit a cover letter along with the steel joist and joist
girder design calculations. The cover letter shall bear the seal
and signature of a Florida registered professional engineer
responsible for design of the steel joist and joist girders.

Rulemaking Speeifie Authority 471.033(2), 471.008 FS. Law
Implemented 471.033(1)(q), (j) FS. Hlstory—New 1-26-93, Formerly
21H-31.006, Amended 10-19-97

NAME OF PERSON ORIGINATING PROPOSED RULE:
Board of Professional Engineers

NAME OF AGENCY HEAD WHO APPROVED THE
PROPOSED RULE: Board of Professional Engineers

DATE PROPOSED RULE APPROVED BY AGENCY
HEAD: January 26, 2015

DATE NOTICE OF PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT
PUBLISHED IN FAR: March 10, 2015

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL
REGULATION

Drugs, Devices and Cosmetics

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE:

61N-1.010 Guidelines for Manufacturing Cosmetics
PURPOSE AND EFFECT: To protect the public health,
safety, and welfare by setting forth requirements that cosmetic

1490

manufacturers must follow to ensure the safety of the
products.

SUMMARY:: The proposed rule development addresses good
manufacturing practices that must be followed by persons that
manufacture or are seeking licensure to manufacture cosmetics
in Florida, including but not limited to: building and facility,
equipment, personnel, raw material, product, internal audit,
and complaint and recall requirements.

SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF ESTIMATED
REGULATORY COSTS AND LEGISLATIVE
RATIFICATION: The Agency has determined that this will
not have an adverse impact on small business or likely
increase directly or indirectly regulatory costs in excess of
$200,000 in the aggregate within one year after the
implementation of the rule. A SERC has not been prepared by
the Agency.

The Agency has determined that the proposed rule is not
expected to require legislative ratification based on the
statement of estimated regulatory costs or if no SERC is
required, the information expressly relied upon and described
herein: The economic review conducted by the agency.

Any person who wishes to provide information regarding a
statement of estimated regulatory costs, or provide a proposal
for a lower cost regulatory alternative must do so in writing
within 21 days of this notice.

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY:: 499.05 FS.

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 499.002, 499.008, 499.009 FS.

IF REQUESTED WITHIN 21 DAYS OF THE DATE OF
THIS NOTICE, A HEARING WILL BE SCHEDULED AND
ANNOUNCED IN THE FAR.

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULE IS: Dinah Greene, Division of Drugs,
Devices and Cosmetics, Department of Business and
Professional Regulation, 1940 N. Monroe Street, Suite 26A,
Tallahassee, Florida 32399-1047,
Dinah.Greene@myfloridalicense.com, (850)717-1802

THE FULL TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE IS:

61N-1.010 Guidelines for Manufacturing Cosmetics.
(1) AIll persons who manufacture or relabel {abel

cosmetics in Florida must follow the minimum guidelines
requirements for manufacturing contained in this section to
help assure product safety and quality. If a person does not
engage in all phases of cosmetic manufacturing, that person
need only comply with paragraphs applicable to those

operations in WhICh the person is engaged Reeepdkeepmg—te



https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=1057
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61N-1.010
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=499.05
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=499.002
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20499.008
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20499.009

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 41, Number 60, March 27, 2015

(a) As used in this section, “good manufacturing practice”

in-process materials), and finished products (This applies to
containers, closures, labels and labeling materials as well.);

(b) Be free of filth and infestation by rodents, birds,
insects, and other vermin;

(c) Have a designated quarantine area for the storage of
products that are suspected of being contaminated, adulterated,
or otherwise potentially injurious to users;

(d) Have floors, walls, and ceilings constructed of
smooth, easily cleanable surfaces;

(e) Have adequate lighting and ventilation, and, if
necessary for control purposes, screening, filtering, dust,
humidity, temperature, and bacteriological controls;

() Have adequate washing, cleaning, plumbing, toilet,
and locker facilities to allow for:

1. Sanitary operation;

2. Cleaning of facilities, equipment and utensils; and

3. Personal cleanliness; and

(a) Have fixtures, ducts, pipes, and drainages installed to
prevent condensate or drip contamination.

(3) Equipment requirements.

Equipment, machinery and  utensils used in
manufacturing, processing, packaging, or relabeling of
cosmetics must be of appropriate design, size, material and
workmanship for the intended purpose to prevent corrosion,
accumulation of static material, and adulteration with
lubricants, coolants, dirt, and sanitizing agents. The equipment
must be:

(a) Maintained in a clean and orderly condition, sanitized
at appropriate times, and stored in a manner that protects

means that part of quality assurance aimed at ensuring that

against splash, dust, and other contaminants;

products are consistently manufactured to a quality
appropriate to their intended use. It is thus concerned with

(b) Constructed to facilitate adjustment, cleaning, and
maintenance;

both manufacturing and quality control procedures.
(b) As used in this subparagraph, “internal audit” means a

(c) Of suitable size and accuracy for measuring, mixing,
and weighing operations;

systematic and independent examination made by competent
personnel inside the company, the aim of which is to

(d) Calibrated regularly or checked according to a
standard operating procedure with results documented, where

determine whether activities covered by these rules and related

appropriate; and

results comply with planned arrangements and whether these
arrangements are implemented effectively and are suitable for

(e) Removed from use if it is defective, does not meet
recommended tolerances, or cannot be repaired and calibrated

achieving objectives.

(c) As used section, “‘standard operating
procedure” means instructions on how to perform tasks and
descriptions of the approved or required procedures for

in__this

immediately.
(4) Personnel requirements.

(a) Personnel supervising or performing cosmetics
manufacturing must have the education, training, experience,

accomplishing specific guality assurance objectives.
(2) Buildings and facilities requirements.
Buildings and facilities used for manufacture, processing,

or combination thereof, to perform their assigned functions.
(b) Personnel coming in direct contact with cosmetic raw
materials, in-process materials, finished products, or contact

packaging, or relabeling of cosmetics must:
(a) Be of suitable size, design, and construction, and

surfaces must wear clean clothing appropriate for the duties
they perform and necessary protective apparel (for example,

maintained in a clean and orderly manner to prevent selection

uniforms, gloves, safety glasses, and hair restraints).

errors  (i.e., mix-ups) or cross contamination between
consumables, raw materials, intermediate formulations (i.e.,

(c) Personnel must maintain _adequate personal
cleanliness, and be free from abnormal sources of

1491



Florida Administrative Register

Volume 41, Number 6, March 27, 2015

microbiological contamination (for example, sores and

indicate contents, batch identification or designation, stage of

infected wounds).

(d) Eating food, drinking beverages, or using tobacco
must be restricted to appropriate designated areas away from

processing and control status;

(c) There are appropriate measures to prevent
contamination with microorganisms, chemicals, filth, or other

storage and processing areas.

(e) All personnel and visitors must be properly supervised
while in the manufacturing facility.

(f) Only authorized personnel shall be allowed access into

extraneous material;

(d) There are in-process controls to ensure product
uniformity, integrity (for example, in-process batch weights),

accurate fill of mixing containers, and adequacy of mixing;

production, storage, and product control areas.
(5) Raw materials requirements.
Raw materials must be identified, stored, examined,

(e) The tamper-resistant packaging and labeling for liquid
oral hygiene products and vaginal products meet the

requirements of 21 CFR 700.25;

tested, inventoried, handled, and controlled to ensure they
conform to appropriate standards and specifications. In

(f) The storage and handling of packaging materials that
are_intended to come into direct contact with the product

particular, raw materials must be:
(a) Stored and handled to prevent mistakes (i.e., mix-ups

prevent selection errors and microbiological or chemical
contamination; and

or_selection errors), contamination with microorganisms or
other chemicals, and degradation from exposure to excessive

(q) Finished product packages bear permanent
meaningful, unigue lot or control numbers and there is a

environmental conditions (e.g., heat, cold, sunlight, moisture,

coding system that corresponds to these numbers.

etc.);

(b) Held in closed containers and stored off the floor;
(c) Maintained in containers that are labeled with the

(8) Laboratory controls.
Cosmetic _manufacturers shall develop and maintain
laboratory controls addressing sample collection technigues,

identity, lot number, and control status (release or quarantine);

specifications, test methods, laboratory equipment, and

(d) Sampled and tested for conformance with

technician qualifications; the laboratory controls should

specifications and to ensure the absence of filth,

include provisions to ensure that:

microorganisms, and other adulterants prior to processing or

usage; and
(e) Properly identified and controlled to prevent the use of

(a) Raw materials (including water), in-process and
finished product samples are tested or examined for identity
and compliance with applicable specifications (for example,

materials that fail to meet acceptance specifications.

(6) Water requirements.

(a) There must be established procedures for ensuring that
the water used as a cosmetic ingredient is being tested or

physical and chemical properties), microbial contamination,
and hazards or other chemical contamination; and

(b) Returned cosmetics are examined for deterioration,
contamination, and compliance with acceptance specifications.

monitored reqularly to verify that it meets applicable
chemical, physical, and microbiological specifications for
quality.

(b) The entire system for supplying water used as a
cosmetic ingredient must be set up to avoid stagnation and
risks of contamination (This system should be routinely

(9) Internal audit requirements.

Cosmetic _manufacturers must have
procedures that ensure:

(a) Internal audits occur regularly or on demand;

(b) Internal audits are conducted by individuals who do
not have direct responsibility for the matters being audited;

internal _audit

cleaned and sanitized according to an appropriate standard
operation procedure that ensures no biofilm build-up.).

(7) Product requirements.

Cosmetic _manufacturers shall develop and maintain
written manufacturing and control standard operating

(c) All observations made during the internal audit are
evaluated and shared with appropriate _management,
production, quality control, and lab personnel; and

(d) Internal audit follow-up confirms the satisfactory
completion or implementation of corrective actions.

procedures addressing formulations, processing instructions,
in-process control methods, packaging instructions, and
instructions for operating equipment); the procedures must

(10) Complaints, adverse events and recall requirements.
Cosmetic _manufacturers must have standard operating
procedures sufficient to:

include provisions to ensure that:
(a) The selection, weighing, and measuring of raw

(a) Facilitate the receipt, processing, evaluation and
follow up on written and oral complaints;

materials and the determination of finished vield are verified;
(b) Major equipment, transfer lines, containers and tanks

(b) Facilitate the identification and retrieval of reported
adverse incidents involving allegations of bodily injury or

used for processing, holding, or filling are identified to

harm;

1492



Florida Administrative Register

Volume 41, Number 60, March 27, 2015

(c) Facilitate the effective and efficient identification and
recall of products, including market withdrawal; and

(d) Ensure timely notification of adverse incidents and
product recalls to the appropriate state and federal regulatory
agencies.
Rulemaking Authority 499.013; 499.05 FS. Law Implemented

499.013, 499.002 499.008, 499.009, FS. History—New 7-1-96,
Formerly = 10D-45.0505, Formerly  64F-12.010, @ Amended

NAME OF PERSON ORIGINATING PROPOSED RULE:
Reginald Dixon, Director

NAME OF AGENCY HEAD WHO APPROVED THE
PROPOSED RULE: Ken Lawson, Secretary

DATE PROPOSED RULE APPROVED BY AGENCY
HEAD: February 25, 2015

DATE NOTICE OF PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT
PUBLISHED IN FAR: March 16, 2015

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL
REGULATION

Drugs, Devices and Cosmetics

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE:

61N-1.018 Fees

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The purpose and effect of the
proposed rule is to correct the title of two medical gas related
permits and to set forth the biennial licensure fees for the
Restricted Rx Drug Distributor — Blood Establishment permit.
SUMMARY: The proposed rule amends the title of two
medical gas related permits and sets forth the biennial
licensing fees for the Restricted Rx Drug Distributor — Blood
Establishment permit.

SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF ESTIMATED
REGULATORY COSTS AND LEGISLATIVE
RATIFICATION: The Agency has determined that this will
not have an adverse impact on small business or likely
increase directly or indirectly regulatory costs in excess of
$200,000 in the aggregate within one year after the
implementation of the rule. A SERC has not been prepared by
the Agency.

The Agency has determined that the proposed rule is not
expected to require legislative ratification based on the
statement of estimated regulatory costs or if no SERC is
required, the information expressly relied upon and described
herein: The economic review conducted by the agency.

Any person who wishes to provide information regarding a
statement of estimated regulatory costs, or provide a proposal
for a lower cost regulatory alternative must do so in writing
within 21 days of this notice.

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 499.01, 499.04, 499.05,
499.831, 499.832 FS.

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 499.01, 499.012, 499.015, 499.04,
499.041, 499.05, 499.028, 499.831, 499.832 FS.

IF REQUESTED WITHIN 21 DAYS OF THE DATE OF
THIS NOTICE, A HEARING WILL BE SCHEDULED AND
ANNOUNCED IN THE FAR.

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULE IS: Dinah Greene, Government
Operations Consultant 11, Division of Drugs, Devices and
Cosmetics, Department of Business and Professional
Regulation, 1940 N. Monroe Street, Suite 26A, Tallahassee,
FL 32399-1047, (850)717-1802,
dinah.greene@myfloridalicense.com

THE FULL TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE IS:

61N-1.018 Fees.
(1) Biennial fees for a MANUFACTURER or
REPACKAGER permit are as follows:

Prescription Drug Manufacturer

Prescription Drug Repackager

Device Manufacturer

Cosmetic Manufacturer

Over-the Counter Drug Manufacturer
Compressed Medical Gas Manufacturer
Non-resident Prescription Drug Manufacturer

No manufacturer shall be required to pay more than one fee
per establishment to obtain an additional manufacturing
permit; but the manufacturer must pay the highest fee
applicable to the operations in each establishment.

(2)(a) Biennial fees for a WHOLESALE DISTRIBUTOR
or FREIGHT FORWARDER permit that is issued on a
BIENNIAL basis are as follows:

Compressed Medical Gas Wholesale Distributor
Retail Pharmacy Drug Wholesale Distributor
Freight Forwarder

Veterinary Prescription Drug Wholesale Distributor
Limited Prescription Drug Veterinary Wholesale Distributor

(b) No change.
(3) Biennial fees for OTHER permits are as follows:

Complimentary Drug Distributor
Veterinary Prescription Drug Retail Establishment
Medical Oxygen Retail Establishment

Restricted Prescription Drug Distributor — Blood Establishment

Restricted Prescription Drug Distributor — Health Care Entity

1493


https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=1057
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61N-1.018
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=499.01
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20499.04
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20499.05
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20499.831
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20499.832%20FS.
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/cfr.asp?id=499.01,%20499.012,%20499.015,%20499.04,%20499.041,%20499.05,%20499.028,%20499.831,%20499.832%20FS
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/cfr.asp?id=499.01,%20499.012,%20499.015,%20499.04,%20499.041,%20499.05,%20499.028,%20499.831,%20499.832%20FS

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 41, Number 6, March 27, 2015

Restricted Prescription Drug Distributor — Charitable Organizasemfish) and tw#600ral species (elkhorn and staghorn) that
Restricted Prescription Drug Distributor — Reverse Distributor Were mistakenly ggggd to the latter rule when it was created.

Restricted Prescription Drug Distributor — Destruction

Restricted Prescription Drug Distributor — Government Progranﬂ

RULEMAKING@E\)bbTHORITY: Article 1V, Section 9, Florida
Constitution
i\W IMPLEI\EI(\)H'ED: Article 1V, Section 9, Florida

Restricted Prescription Drug Distributor — Institutional Resea“@onstitution n: 3%%91 Florida Statutes

Third Party Logistics Provider
Health Care Clinic Establishment

(4) through (5) No change.
Rulemaking Authority 499.01, 499.04, 499.05, 499.831, 499.832 FS.
Law Implemented 499.01, 499.012, 499.015, 499.04, 499.041,
499.05, 499.028, 499.831, 499.832 FS. History—New 7-1-96,
Formerly 10D-45.0544, Amended 4-17-01, 7-6-03, 1-1-04, 9-13-04,
2-14-06, 9-5-07, 3-10-09, Formerly 64F-12.018, Amended

NAME OF PERSON ORIGINATING PROPOSED RULE:
Reginald D. Dixon, Director

NAME OF AGENCY HEAD WHO APPROVED THE
PROPOSED RULE: Ken Lawson, Secretary

DATE PROPOSED RULE APPROVED BY AGENCY
HEAD: March 16, 2015

DATE NOTICE OF PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT
PUBLISHED IN FAR: April 17, 2014

FISH AND WILDLIFE CONSERVATION
COMMISSION
Freshwater Fish and Wildlife
RULE NOS.: RULE TITLES:
68A-27.003 Designation of Endangered and Threatened
Species; Prohibitions
68A-27.0031 Marine Endangered and Threatened Species
PURPOSE, EFFECT AND SUMMARY: The purpose and
effect of this rule amendment is to revise the Florida
Endangered and Threatened Species List to reflect Federal
listing changes. Rule 68A-27.0012(1) of the Florida
Administrative Code requires that when species native to
Florida are added or reclassified under the Federal Endangered
Species Act (ESA), the species shall be so listed or reclassified
in the Florida Administrative Code to reflect the federal
designation. Because of recent federal designations, staff is
proposing to add seven species of mollusks (Choctaw bean,
round ebonyshell, southern kidneyshell, fuzzy pigtoe, narrow
pigtoe, tapered pigtoe and southern sandshell); one mammal
(Florida bonneted bat); one bird (rufa red knot); two insects
(Bartram’s scrub-hairstreak, Florida leafwing butterflies); four
corals (lobed star, bounder star, mountainous star and rough
cactus) to paragraph one of Rule 68A-27.003; F.A.C., change
the indicated federal listing for one bird (wood stork) from
endangered to threatened; and move one species of coral
(pillar coral) from subsection two to subsection one. Staff also
proposes to move into Rule 68A-27.003(1) and delete from
Rule 68A-27.0031, F.A.C., one fish species (smalltoothed

1494

THIS RULEMAYR0G IS UNDERTAKEN PURSUANT TO
SECTION $255

120.54(6), F.S. WRITTEN COMMENTS MAY BE
SUBMITTED WITHIN 14 DAYS OF THE DATE OF THIS
NOTICE TO: Dr. Thomas Eason, Director, Division of
Habitat and Species Conservation, Fish and Wildlife
Conservation Commission, 620 South Meridian Street,
Tallahassee, Florida 32399-1600.

SUBSTANTIALLY AFFECTED PERSONS MAY WITHIN
14 DAYS OF THE DATE OF THIS NOTICE, FILE AN
OBJECTION TO THIS RULEMAKING WITH THE
AGENCY. THE OBJECTION SHALL SPECIFY THE
PORTIONS OF THE PROPOSED RULE TO WHICH THE
PERSON OBJECTS AND THE SPECIFIC REASONS FOR
THE OBJECTION.

THE FULL TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE IS:

68A-27.003 Designation of Endangered and Threatened
Species; Prohibitions.

(1) Federally-designated Endangered and Threatened
species:

(@) No person shall take, possess, or sell any of the
endangered or threatened species included in this subsection,
or parts thereof or their nests or eggs except as allowed by
specific federal or state permit or authorization.

(b) The following Federally-designated Endangered and
Threatened species shall be afforded the protection afforded
under Commission rules and Florida Statutes and under the
Federal Endangered Species Act, 16 U.S.C. 8 1531 et seq. and
its implementing regulations. Species classified as endangered
are identified below by (E) and threatened as (T).

(c) Fish:

1. Atlantic  sturgeon (Acipenser  oxyrinchus
oxyrinchus)(E); South Atlantic distinct population segment
(consistent with 77 Fed. Reg. 5914-5982),

2. Okaloosa darter (Etheostoma okaloosae)(T) (consistent
with 76 Fed. Reg. 18087-18103),

3. Smalltooth sawfish (Pristis pectinata)(E).

(d) Amphibians:

1.  Frosted flatwoods salamander  (Ambystoma
cingulatum)(T),
2. Reticulated flatwoods salamander (Ambystoma

bishopi)(E).


https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=68
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=68
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=347
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=68A-27.003
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=68A-27.0031
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/flconstitution.asp?id=Article%20IV,%20Section%209,%20Florida%20Constitution
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/flconstitution.asp?id=Article%20IV,%20Section%209,%20Florida%20Constitution
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/flconstitution.asp?id=Article%20IV,%20Section%209,%20Florida%20Constitution
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/flconstitution.asp?id=Article%20IV,%20Section%209,%20Florida%20Constitution
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/cfr.asp?id=n;%20379.2291,%20Florida%20Statutes

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 41, Number 60, March 27, 2015

(e) Reptiles:

1. American alligator (Alligator
mississippiensis)(T[S/A]); Listed only because of similarity of
appearance to the American crocodile,

2. American crocodile (Crocodylus acutus)(T),

3. Atlantic salt marsh snake (Nerodia clarkii taeniata)(T),

4. Bluetail mole skink (Eumeces egregius lividus)(T),

5. Eastern indigo snake (Drymarchon corais couperi)(T),

6. Sand skink (Neoseps reynoldsi)(T).

(f) Birds:

1. Audubon’s crested caracara (Polyborus plancus
audubonii (T),

2. Bachman’s wood warbler (Vermivora bachmanii)(E),

3. Cape Sable seaside sparrow (Ammodramus maritimus
mirabilis)(E),

4. Everglade snail kite (Rostrhamus sociabilis
plumbeus)(E),

5. Eskimo curlew (Numenius borealis)(E),

6. Florida grasshopper sparrow  (Ammodramus

savannarum floridanus)(E),

7. Florida scrub-jay (Aphelocoma coerulescens)(T),

8. Ivory-billed woodpecker (Campephilus principalis)(E),

9. Kirtland’s wood warbler (Dendroica kirtlandii)(E),

10. Piping plover (Charadrius melodus)(T),

11. Red-cockaded woodpecker (Picoides borealis)(E),

12. Roseate tern (Sterna dougallii dougallii)(T),

13. Whooping crane (Grus americana)(XN); Listed as
experimental population in Florida,

14. Wood stork (Mycteria americana)(ET)-,

15. Rufa red knot (Calidris canutus rufa)(T) (consistent
with 79 Fed Reg. 73706-73748).

(g) Mammals:

1. Anastasia Island beach mouse (Peromyscus polionotus
phasma)(E),

2. Choctawhatchee beach mouse (Peromyscus polionotus
allophrys)(E),

3. Florida panther (Puma (=Felis) concolor coryi)(E),

4. Florida salt marsh vole (Microtus pennsylvanicus
dukecampbelli)(E),

5. Gray bat (Myotis grisescens)(E),

6. Gray wolf (Canis lupus)(E),

7. Indiana bat (Myotis sodalis)(E),

8. Key deer (Odocoileus virginianus clavium)(E). No
person shall feed Key deer by hand or by placing any food that
serves to attract such species,

9. Key Largo cotton mouse (Peromyscus gossypinus
allapaticola)(E),

10. Key Largo woodrat (Neotoma floridana smalli)(E),

11. Lower Keys rabbit (Sylvilagus palustris hefneri)(E),

12. Perdido Key beach mouse (Peromyscus polionotus
trissyllepsis)(E),

13. Red wolf (Canis rufus)(E),

14. Rice rat (Oryzomys palustris natator (E); Lower Keys
population west of 7-mile bridge,

15. Southeastern beach mouse (Peromyscus polionotus
niveiventris)(T),

16. St. Andrew beach mouse (Peromyscus polionotus
peninsularis)(E).

17. Florida bonneted bat (Eumops floridanus)(E)
(consistent with 78 Fed. Reg. 61004-61043).

(h) Crustaceans:

Squirrel  Chimney
cummingi)(T).

(i) Insects:

1. American burying beetle (Nicrophorus americanus)(E),

2. Cassius blue butterfly  (Leptotes cassius
theonus)(T[S/A]), ceraunus blue butterfly (Hemiargus
ceraunus antibubastus) (T[S/A]), and nickerbean blue
butterfly (Cyclargus ammon)(T[S/A]) are listed due to
similarity of appearance to Miami blue butterfly (consistent
with 77 Fed. Reg. 20948-20986) and as such only the
following prohibitions apply to these three species:

a. Incidental take, that is, take that results from, but is not
a purpose of, carrying out an otherwise lawful activity will not
apply to cassius blue butterfly, ceraunus blue butterfly, and
nickerbean blue butterfly.

b. Collection of the cassius blue butterfly, ceraunus blue
butterfly, and nickerbean blue butterfly is prohibited in coastal
counties south of Interstate 4 and extending to the boundaries
of the State of Florida at the endpoints of Interstate 4 at Tampa
and Daytona Beach. Specifically, such activities are prohibited
in the following counties: Brevard, Broward, Charlotte,
Collier, De Soto, Hillsborough, Indian River, Lee, Manatee,
Pinellas, Sarasota, St. Lucie, Martin, Miami-Dade, Monroe,
Palm Beach, and Volusia.

3. Miami blue butterfly (Cyclargus thomasi
bethunebakeri)(E) (consistent with 77 Fed. Reg. 20948-
20986),

4. Schaus swallowtail butterfly (Heraclides aristodemus
ponceanus)(E).

5. Bartram’s scrub-hairstreak (Strymon acis bartrami)(E)
(consistent with 79 Fed. Req. 47222-47244),

6. Florida leafwing (Anaea troglodyte floridalis)(E)
(consistent with 79 Fed. Req. 47222-47244).

(1) Mollusks:

1. Chipola slabshell (mussel) (Elliptio chiplolaensis)(T),

2. Fat threeridge (mussel) (Amblema neislerii)(E),

3. Gulf  moccasinshell  (mussel)  (Medionidus
penicillatus)(E),

4. Ochlockonee moccasinshell (mussel) (Medionidus
simpsonianus)(E),

5. Oval pigtoe (mussel) (Pleurobema pyriforme)(E),

Cave shrimp  (Palaemonetes

1495



Florida Administrative Register

Volume 41, Number 6, March 27, 2015

6. Purple bankclimber  (mussel)  (Elliptoideus
sloatianus)(T),
7. Shinyrayed pocketbook (mussel) (Lampsilis

subangulata)(E),

8. Stock Island tree snail (Orthalicus reses [not incl.
nesodryas])(T).

9. Choctaw bean (Villosa choctawensis)(E) (consistent
with 77 Fed. Reg. 61664-61719),

10. Round ebonyshell (Fusconaia rotulata)(E) (consistent
with 77 Fed. Reg. 61664-61719),

11. Southern kidneyshell (Ptychobranchus jonesi)(E)
(consistent with 77 Fed. Req. 61664-61719),

12. Fuzzy pigtoe (Pleurobema strodeanum)(T) (consistent
with 77 Fed. Reg. 61664-61719),

13. Narrow pigtoe (Fusconaia escambia)(T) (consistent
with 77 Fed. Reg. 61664-61719),

14. Tapered pigtoe (Fusconaia burki)(T) (consistent with
77 Fed. Reg. 61664-61719),

15. Southern sandshell (Hamiota australis)(T) (consistent
with 77 Fed. Reg. 61664-61719).

(k) Corals:

1. Elkhorn coral (Acropora palmata)(T),

2. Staghorn coral (Acropora cervicornis)(T).

3. Pillar_coral (Dendrogyra cylindricus)(T) (consistent
with 79 Fed. Req. 53852-54123),

4. Lobed star coral (Orbicella annularis) (T) (consistent
with 79 Fed. Reg. 53852-54123),

5. Moutainous star coral (Orbicella faveolata) (T)
(consistent with 79 Fed. Req. 53852-54123),

6. Boulder star coral (Orbicella franksi) (T) (consistent
with 79 Fed. Reg. 53852-54123),

7. Rough cactus coral (Mycetophyllia ferox) (T)
(consistent with 79 Fed. Req. 53852-54123).

(2) State-designated Threatened species:

(a) No person shall take, possess, or sell any threatened
species included in this subsection or parts thereof or their
nests or eggs except as authorized by Commission rule or by
permit from the Commission.

(b) The species in this subsection are hereby declared to
be State-designated Threatened Species, and shall be afforded
the protective provisions specified.

(c) Fish:

1. Blackmouth shiner (Notropis melanostomus),

2. Crystal darter (Crystallaria asprella),

3. Key silverside (Menidia conchorum).

(d) Reptiles:

1. Florida brownsnake (Storeria victa); lower Keys
population only,

2. Peninsula ribbon snake
sackenii); lower Keys population only,

(Thamnophis  sauritus

1496

3. Gopher tortoise (Gopherus polyphemus). The Gopher
tortoise shall be afforded the protective provisions specified in
this subparagraph. No person shall take, attempt to take,
pursue, hunt, harass, capture, possess, sell or transport any
gopher tortoise or parts thereof or their eggs, or molest,
damage, or destroy gopher tortoise burrows, except as
authorized by Commission permit or when complying with
Commission approved guidelines for specific actions which
may impact gopher tortoises and their burrows. A gopher
tortoise burrow is a tunnel with a cross-section that closely
approximates the shape of a gopher tortoise. Permits will be
issued based wupon whether issuance would further
management plan goals and objectives.

4. Key ringneck snake (Diadophis punctatus acricus),

5. Rim rock crowned snake (Tantilla oolitica),

6. Short-tailed snake (Stilosoma extenuatum),

7. Striped mud turtle (Kinosternon baurii); lower Keys
population only.

(e) Birds:

1. Florida sandhill crane (Grus canadensis pratensis),

2. Least tern (Sterna antillarum),

3. Snowy plover (Charadrius alexandrinus),

4. Southeastern American Kkestrel (Falco sparverius
paulus),

5. White-crowned pigeon (Patagioenas leucocephala).

(f) Mammals:

1. Big Cypress fox squirrel (Sciurus niger avicennia),

2. Everglades mink (Neovison vison evergladensis),

{g)-Corals:

" I lindri
Rulemaking Authority Art. IV, Sec. 9, Fla. Const. Law Implemented

Art. IV, Sec. 9, Fla. Const. History—New 8-1-79, Amended 6-22-80,
7-1-83, 7-1-84, 7-1-85, Formerly 39-27.03, Amended 6-1-86, 5-10-
87, 4-27-89, 9-14-93, 6-23-99, Formerly 39-27.003. Amended 12-16-
03, 7-20-09, 11-8-10, 11-14-11, 8-23-12, 9-19-12 .

68A-27.0031 Marine
Species.

(1) Under the Florida constitutional revision that revised
Article 1V, Section 9 of the Florida Constitution and created
Article XII, Section 22, the Commission’s constitutional
authority does not include authority to regulate marine life
when those species meet the definition of endangered and
threatened species as those terms were defined in Section
372.072, F.S. (1997).

(2) The following species are Marine endangered and
threatened species:

(a) Fish:

1. Gulf sturgeon (Acipenser oxyrinchus [=oxyrhynchus]
desotoi)(T),

2. Shortnose sturgeon (Acipenser brevirostrum)(E);.

Endangered and Threatened



Florida Administrative Register

Volume 41, Number 60, March 27, 2015

(b) Reptiles:
1. Green sea turtle (Chelonia mydas)(E),
2. Hawksbill sea turtle (Eretmochelys imbricata)(E),
3. Kemp’s ridley sea turtle (Lepidochelys kempii)(E),
4. Leatherback sea turtle (Dermochelys coriacea)(E),
5. Loggerhead sea turtle (Caretta caretta)(T),
(c) Mammals:
1. Caribbean monk seal (Monachus tropicalis)(E),
2. Finback whale (Balaenoptera physalus)(E),
3. West Indian manatee (Trichechus manatus)(E),
4. Humpback whale (Megaptera novaeangliae)(E),
5. North Atlantic right whale (Eubalaena glacialis)(E),
6. Sei whale (Balaenoptera borealis)(E),
7. Sperm whale (Physeter macrocephalus)(E),
{e)-Corals:
1-Elkhorn-coral-(Acropora-palmata)} (),
Rulemaking Authority 379.1025 FS. Law Implemented 379.2291 FS.
History—New 11-14-11 .

Section 11
Notice of Changes, Corrections and
Withdrawals

DEPARTMENT OF AGRICULTURE AND CONSUMER
SERVICES

Division of Consumer Services

RULE NOS.: RULE TITLES:

5J-17.001 Probable Cause Panel

5J-17.010 Grounds for Discipline

5J-17.032 Content of Examination

5J-17.040 Continuing Education Requirements for
Reactivation of Inactive License

5J-17.041 Continuing Education Credit for Biennial
Renewal

5J-17.044 Obligations of Continuing Education
Providers

5J-17.048 Reinstatement of Null and Void License

5J-17.050 Minimum Technical Standards: Definitions

5J-17.051 Minimum Technical Standards: General
Survey, Map, and Report Content
Requirements

5J-17.052 Minimum Technical Standards: Specific
Survey, Map, and Report Requirements

5J-17.053 Standards of Practice: Professional Matters

in Surveying and Mapping
NOTICE OF CHANGE
Notice is hereby given that the following changes have been
made to the proposed rule in accordance with subparagraph
120.54(3)(d)1., F.S., published in Vol. 40 No. 250, December
30, 2014 issue of the Florida Administrative Register.

5J-17.001 Probable Cause Panel.

(1) through (3) No change.
Rulemaking Authority 120.53(1); 472.008, 472.033(4) FS. Law
Implemented 120-53(1){e); 472.033(4) FS. History—New 2-7-91,
Amended 3-23-93, Formerly 21HH-1.0051, Amended 5-31-95, 7-27-
00, Formerly 61G17-1.0051, Amended

5J-17.010 Grounds for Discipline.
No change to unnumbered preamble.

(1) through (7) No change.
Rulemaking Authority 472.008, 472.027 FS. Law Implemented
472.015, 472.025, 472,02, 472.027, 472.0351(1)(f), (g), (h), (2) FS.
History—New 1-3-80, Formerly 21HH-2.01, Amended 9-1-88,
Formerly 21HH-2.001, Amended 6-1-95, 10-13-97, 9-19-06,
Formerly 61G17-2.001, Amended

5J-17.032 Content of Examination.

(1) through (2) No change.

(3) The Florida Jurisdictional Multiple Choice
Examination shall be based on Florida’s laws and rules
regarding the practice of surveying and mapping. The
following areas shall be tested on the examination and will be
weighted approximately as designated:

Statute/Rule Area Tested Assigned Weight]

Chapter 177, Part I, F.S. Platting

Chapter 177, Part I, F.S. Coastal Mapping
Chapter 161, F.S. 30%
Chapter 62B-33, F.A.C

Chapter 177, Part 111, F.S. Restoration of Corners

Chapter 472, F.S. Land . Surveying and 15%
Mapping

Chapter 718, F.S. Condominiums 5%

Chapter 95, F.S. Adverse Possession 5%

5J-17.001 to 5J-17.007, Organization & Purpose
F.A.C. Grounds for Discipline
5J-17.010 to 5J-17.016, Continuing Education
F.A.C. Standards of Practice
5J-17.040 to 5J-17.047,

F.AC Seals, Signatures and 40%
5J-17.050 to 5J-17.053 534 Certificates of Authorization
17052, F.A.C. Penalties

5J-17.060 to 5J-17.062,

F.A.C.

5J-17.080 to 5J-17.085,

F.A.C.

Chapter 472, F.S., and
Section 287.055, F.S.

Department of Agriculture]
and Consumer Services
General provisiong 5%
Consultants”  Competitive
Negotiation Act

Rulemaking Authority 472.0131, 472.027 FS. Law Implemented
472.0131, 472.027 FS. History—New 1-3-80, Amended 1-25-84,
Formerly 21HH-4.02, Amended 9-16-87, 12-13-88, 8-30-92,
Formerly 21HH-4.002, Amended 5-30-95, 5-17-99, 7-9-00, 10-31-
08, Formerly 61G17-4.002,

1497


https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=5
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=5
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=170
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=5J-17.001
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=5J-17.010
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=5J-17.032
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=5J-17.040
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=5J-17.041
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=5J-17.044
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=5J-17.048
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=5J-17.050
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=5J-17.051
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=5J-17.052
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=5J-17.053

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 41, Number 6, March 27, 2015

5J-17.040 Continuing Education
Reactivation of Inactive License.
No change.
Rulemaking Authority 472.019(2), 472.027 FS. Law Implemented
472.019(2), 472.027 FS. History—New 10-29-80, Formerly 21HH-
5.01, Amended 2-7-91, Formerly 21HH-5.001, Amended 3-28-94, 5-
30-95, 10-13-97, 6-29-00, 6-22-03, 6-20-06, 1-29-07, Formerly
61G17-5.001, Amended

Requirements for

5J-17.041 Continuing Education Credit for Biennial
Renewal.
No change.

Rulemaking Authority 472.008, 472.018, 472.027 FS. Law
Implemented 472.018, 472.027 FS. History—New 3-28-94, Amended
5-30-95, 9-21-98, 7-27-00, 6-22-03, 6-23-05, 6-20-06, Formerly
61G17-5.0031, Amended 10-17-12,

5J-17.044 Obligations of Continuing Education Providers.
No change.
Rulemaking Authority 472.008, 472.011, 472.018, 472.027 FS. Law
Implemented 472.018, 472.027 FS. History—New 3-28-94, Amended
5-30-95, 7-27-00, 8-18-03, 8-18-04, 12-28-05, 1-29-07, Formerly
61G17-5.0043, Amended 10-17-12,

5J-17.048 Reinstatement of Null and Void License.

(1) An applicant seeking reinstatement of a license which
has become null and void shall submit Submit a Florida
Surveyor and Mapper application for reinstatement of a null
and void surveyor and mapper license in which the applicant
shall:

(@) through (i) No change.

(2) through (3) No change.

Rulemaking Authority 472.0202, 472.027 FS. Law Implemented

472.0202, 472.027 FS. History—New 6-20-06, Formerly 61G17-
10.001, Amended

5J-17.050 Definitions.

As used in this chapter, the following terms have the following
meanings:

(1) through (13) No change.

(14) Work Pproduct: the final drawings, plans,
specifications, plats, reports, and all related calculations and
field notes of the professional surveyor and mapper in
responsible charge or made under his/her supervision.

(15) No change.

(16) Faithful Agent: a licensee acting in professional
surveying matters who safequards as confidential any
information obtained by the licensee as to the business affairs,
technical methods or processes of a client or employer, and
who avoids or discloses a conflict of interest that might
influence the licensee’s actions or judgment.

(17) Conflict of Interest: a conflict between one’s duty to
act for the benefit of the public or a specific individual or
entity, and the interests of self or others; which conflict has the

1498

potential of influencing, or the appearance of influencing, the
exercise of one’s professional judgment in carrying out that

duty.

Rulemaking Authority 472.008, 472.027 FS. Law Implemented
472.027 FS. History—New 9-1-81, Formerly 21HH-6.02, Amended
12-18-88, Formerly 21HH-6.002, Amended 12-25-95, 5-25-99, 3-25-
01, 3-13-03, 4-4-06, Formerly 61G17-6.002, Amended

5J-17.051 Standards of Practice: General Survey, Map,
and Report Content Requirements.
No change.
Rulemaking Authority 472.008, 472.027 FS. Law Implemented
472.025, 472.027 FS. History—-New 9-1-81, Amended 7-29-85,
Formerly 21HH-6.03, Amended 12-18-88, 11-27-89, 5-26-91,
Formerly 21HH-6.003, Amended 12-25-95, 5-13-96, 11-3-97, 5-25-
99, 4-4-06, 8-31-06, 8-18-08, Formerly 61G17-6.003, Amended

5J-17.052 Standards of Practice: Specific Survey, Map,
and Report Requirements.
No change.
Rulemaking Authority 472.008, 472.027 FS. Law Implemented
472.027 FS. History—New 9-1-81, Formerly 21HH-6.04, Amended
12-18-88, Formerly 21HH-6.004, Amended 12-25-95, 5-13-96, 5-25-
99, 4-4-06, 8-31-06, 8-18-08, Formerly 61G17-6.004, Amended

5J-17.053 Standards of Practice: Professional Matters in
Surveying and Mapping.
No change.

Rulemaking Authority 472.027 FS. Law Implemented 472.027.
History-New .

Section IV
Emergency Rules

NONE

Section V
Petitions and Dispositions Regarding Rule
Variance or Waiver

DEPARTMENT OF HIGHWAY SAFETY AND MOTOR
VEHICLES

Division of Driver Licenses

RULE NO. RULE TITLE

15A-10.014 Cost Standards and Allocations

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that on March 16, 2015, the
Department of Highway Safety and Motor Vehicles received a
petition for Variance or Waiver from Barbara L. Reincke,
Executive Director of West Central Florida Driver
Improvement, Inc., 225 N.E. 14th Street, Ocala, FL 34470.
Pursuant to Section 120.542, F.S., and Rule 28-104.002,


https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=15
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=15
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=40
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=15A-10.014

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 41, Number 60, March 27, 2015

F.A.C., the Petitioner is seeking a variance from or a waiver of
paragraph 15A-10.014(2)(d), F.A.C., to allow for employer
contribution to their 403(b) retirement plan in excess of the
limit currently set for FRS employer contribution to the
Regular Class of employees.

A copy of the Petition for Variance or Waiver may be
obtained by contacting: Todd Sumner, Assistant General
Counsel, Department of Highway Safety and Motor Vehicles,
2900 Apalachee Parkway, A-432, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-
0504.

The Department will accept comments concerning the Petition
for 14 days from the date of publication of this notice. To be
considered, comments must be received on or before 5:00 p.m.
on April 10, 2015.

ASME A17.1b, 2009 edition, as adopted by paragraph 61C-
5.001(1)(a), F.A.C., from providing phase | emergency recall
operation by fire alarm initiating devices because the
Petitioner has demonstrated that the purpose of the underlying
statute has been met and that Petitioner would suffer a
substantial hardship if required to comply with this rule
(VW2015-067).

A copy of the Order or additional information may be
obtained by contacting: Doug Melvin, Bureau of Elevator
Safety, 1940 North Monroe Street, Tallahassee, Florida
32399-1013.

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL
REGULATION

Division of Hotels and Restaurants

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE:

61C-5.001 Safety Standards

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that on March 24, 2015, the
Department of Business and Professional Regulation, Division
of Hotels and Restaurants, Bureau of Elevator Safety, received
a petition for B112 at Universal Studios. Petitioner seeks an
emergency variance of the requirements of ASME Al7.1,
Section 2.4.1.5 and 2.15.92, as adopted by subsection 61C-
5.001(1), F.A.C., to request the use of a retracting toe guard
which poses a significant economic/financial hardship. Any
interested person may file comments within 5 days of the
publication of this notice with Doug Melvin, Bureau of
Elevator Safety, 1940 North Monroe Street, Tallahassee,
Florida 32399-1013 (VW2015-076).

A copy of the Petition for Variance or Waiver may be
obtained by contacting: Doug Melvin, Bureau of Elevator
Safety, 1940 North Monroe Street, Tallahassee, Florida
32399-1013.

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL
REGULATION

Division of Hotels and Restaurants

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE:

61C-5.001 Safety Standards

The Department of Business and Professional Regulation,
Division of Hotels and Restaurants, Bureau of Elevator Safety
hereby gives notice:

On March 26, 2015, the Division issued an order. The Final
Order was in response to a Petition for an emergency Variance
from Habitat at Hideaway, filed March 17, 2015, and
advertised on March 20, 2015, in Vol. 41, No. 55, of the
Florida Administrative Register. No comments were received
in response to the petition. The Final Order on the Petition for
Variance grants the Petitioner a variance from Rule 2.27.3.2.1

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL
REGULATION

Board of Professional Engineers

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE:

61G15-20.007 Educational Requirements for Applicants
Without EAC/ABET Accredited Engineering Degrees

The Board of Professional Engineers hereby gives notice of
the issuance of an Order regarding the Petition for Variance,
filed on March 3, 2014, by Daniel Joita. The Notice of Petition
for Waiver or Variance was published in Vol. 40, No. 16, of
the January 24, 2014, Florida Administrative Register.
Petitioner sought a waiver or variance of subsection 61G15-
20.007(1), F.A.C., with respect to the requirement that each
applicant for a Florida engineers license must demonstrate the
completion of 16 college semester credit hours in Humanities
and Social Sciences.

The Board’s Order, filed on February 10, 2015, grants the
petition finding that the petition was in substantial compliance
with the provisions of Section 120.542, Florida Statutes, and
Chapter 28-104, Florida Administrative Code. The Board
found that the applicant has otherwise shown that the
application of the rule would violate principles of fairness as
applied to him.

A copy of the Order or additional information may be
obtained by contacting: Zana Raybon, Executive Director,
Board of Professional Engineers, 2369 North Monroe Street,
Suite B-112, Tallahassee, Florida 32801.

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL
REGULATION

Board of Professional Engineers

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE:

61G15-20.007  Educational Requirements for Applicants
Without EAC/ABET Accredited Engineering Degrees
NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that on February 27, 2015, the
Board of Professional Engineers, received a petition for
Variance or Waiver, filed by Sivakumar Munuswamy, Ph.D.
The Petitioner seeks the Variance or Waiver from Rule
61G15-20.007, F.A.C., with respect to the requirement that
each applicant for a Florida engineers license must

1499


https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=249
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61C-5.001
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=249
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61C-5.001
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=267
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61G15-20.007
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=267
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61G15-20.007

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 41, Number 6, March 27, 2015

demonstrate the completion of a substantial equivalency for
the general education course requirements.

The Board will address this Petition at its next meeting.
Comments on this petition should be filed with the Board of
Professional Engineers, 2507 Callaway Road, Suite 200,
Tallahassee, FL 32303-5268, within 14 days of publication of
this notice.

A copy of the Petition for Variance or Waiver may be
obtained by contacting: Zana Raybon, Executive Director,
Board of Professional Engineers, at the above address or
(850)521-0500.

A copy of the Petition for Variance or Waiver may be
obtained by contacting: Christy Robinson, Executive Director,
Board of Massage Therapy, 4052 Bald Cypress Way, Bin
#CO06, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-3258, (850)245-4588 or by
email: christy.robinson@flhealth.gov.

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL
REGULATION

Board of Professional Engineers

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE:

61G15-20.001  Definitions

The Board of Professional Engineers hereby gives notice of
the issuance of an Order regarding the Petition for Variance,
filed on December 9, 2014, by Louis Kneip. The Notice of
Petition for Waiver or Variance was published in Vol. 40, No.
244, of the December 18, 2014, Florida Administrative
Register. Petitioner sought a waiver or variance of subsection
61G15-20.0015(5), F.A.C., which allows an applicant with a
non-EAC/ABET engineering degree to meet the education
requirements of Rule 61G15-20.007, F.A.C., without the need
to have the education evaluated, if the applicant has been
licensed for 15 years as a professional engineer and
demonstrates 20 years of engineering experience.

The Board’s Order, filed on March 13, 2015, denied the
petition finding that the petition was in substantial compliance
with the provisions of Section 120.542, Florida Statutes, and
Chapter 28-104, Florida Administrative Code. Petitioner has
not otherwise met the purpose of the underlying statute. The
Board is precluded from granting the petition because granting
of the petition would violate statute.

A copy of the Order or additional information may be
obtained by contacting: Zana Raybon, Executive Director,
Board of Professional Engineers, 2369 North Monroe Street,
Suite B-112, Tallahassee, Florida 32801.

Section VI
Notice of Meetings, Workshops and Public
Hearings

DEPARTMENT OF AGRICULTURE AND CONSUMER
SERVICES

The Florida State Fair Authority, Agribusiness Committee
announces a public meeting to which all persons are invited.
DATE AND TIME: April 13, 2015, 10:00 a.m.

PLACE: Florida State Fairgrounds

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED:
Old and New Business.

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Sonia
Velez at (813)627-4221.

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 2 days before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: Sonia Velez at (813)627-4221. If you are hearing
or speech impaired, please contact the agency using the
Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-
8770 (Voice).

For more information, you may contact: Sonia Velez at
(813)627-4221.

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH

Board of Massage Therapy

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that on March 20, 2015, the
Board of Massage Therapy received a petition for Simone
Muscolino, seeking a variance or waiver of subsection
480.003(9), F.S., and paragraph 64B7-32.002(2)(a), F.A.C.,
regarding the requirements for proof of graduation. Comments
on this petition should be filed with the Board of Massage
Therapy, 4052 Bald Cypress Way, Bin #CO06, Tallahassee,
Florida 32399-3258, within 14 days of publication of this
notice.

1500

DEPARTMENT OF AGRICULTURE AND CONSUMER
SERVICES

The Florida State Fair Authority, Finance Committee
announces a public meeting to which all persons are invited.
DATE AND TIME: April 13, 2015, 10:30 a.m.

PLACE: Florida State Fairgrounds

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED:
Old and New Business.

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Sonia
Velez at (813)627-4221.

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least days before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: Sonia Velez at (813)627-4221. If you are hearing
or speech impaired, please contact the agency using the
Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-
8770 (Voice).


https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=267
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61G15-20.001
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=64
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=330
mailto:christy.robinson@flhealth.gov
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=5
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=5
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=5
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=5

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 41, Number 60, March 27, 2015

For more information, you may contact: Sonia Velez at
(813)627-4221.

DEPARTMENT OF AGRICULTURE AND CONSUMER
SERVICES

The Florida State Fair Authority, Marketing Committee
announces a public meeting to which all persons are invited.
DATE AND TIME: April 13, 2015, 11:00 a.m.

PLACE: Florida State Fairgrounds

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED:
Old and New Business.

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Sonia
Velez at (813)627-4221.

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 2 days before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: Sonia Velez. If you are hearing or speech
impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida Relay
Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice).
For more information, you may contact: Sonia Velez at
(813)627-4221.

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Roy
Cosgrove, (850)245-3317, roy.cosgrove@vr.fldoe.org.
Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 7 days before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: Roy Cosgrove, (850)245-3317,
roy.cosgrove@vr.fldoe.org. If you are hearing or speech
impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida Relay
Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (\Voice).
For more information, you may contact: Roy Cosgrove,
(850)245-3317, roy.cosgrove@vr.fldoe.org.

DEPARTMENT OF AGRICULTURE AND CONSUMER
SERVICES

The Florida State Fair Authority Board announces a public
meeting to which all persons are invited.

DATE AND TIME: April 13, 2015, 1:00 p.m.

PLACE: Florida State Fairgrounds

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED:
Old and New Business.

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Sonia
Velez at (813)627-4221.

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 2 days before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: Sonia Velez at (813)627-4221. If you are hearing
or speech impaired, please contact the agency using the
Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-
8770 (Voice).

For more information, you may contact: Sonia Velez at
(813)627-4221.

DEPARTMENT OF EDUCATION

The Florida Rehabilitation Council announces a telephone
conference call to which all persons are invited.

DATE AND TIME: April 21, 2015, 2:30 p.m. — 4:30 p.m.
PLACE: Conference call: 1(888)670-3525, code: 7513637441
GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED:
Florida Rehabilitation Council, Planning and Coordination
Committee, General Planning and Coordination Business.

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Roy
Cosgrove, (850)245-3317, roy.cosgrove@vr.fldoe.org.
Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 7 days before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: Roy Cosgrove, (850)245-3317,
roy.cosgrove@vr.fldoe.org. If you are hearing or speech
impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida Relay
Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice).
For more information, you may contact: Roy Cosgrove,
(850)245-3317, roy.cosgrove@vr.fldoe.org.

DEPARTMENT OF EDUCATION

The Florida Rehabilitation Council announces a telephone
conference call to which all persons are invited.

DATE AND TIME: April 14, 2015, 9:00 a.m. — 11:00 a.m.
PLACE: Conference call: 1(888)670-3525, code: 7513637441
GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED:
Florida Rehabilitation Council; Legislative Committee;
General Legislative Business.

DEPARTMENT OF EDUCATION

The Florida Rehabilitation Council announces a telephone
conference call to which all persons are invited.

DATE AND TIME: April 22, 2015, 10:00 a.m. — 12:00 Noon
PLACE: Conference call: 1(888)670-3525, code: 7513637441
GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED:
Florida Rehabilitation Council; Public Awareness Committee;
General Public Awarenes Business.

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Roy
Cosgrove, (850)245-3317, roy.cosgrove@vr.fldoe.org.
Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 7 days before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: Roy Cosgrove, (850)245-3317,
roy.cosgrove@vr.fldoe.org. If you are hearing or speech
impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida Relay
Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice).

1501


https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=5
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=5
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=5
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=5
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=6
mailto:roy.cosgrove@vr.fldoe.org
mailto:roy.cosgrove@vr.fldoe.org
mailto:roy.cosgrove@vr.fldoe.org
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=6
mailto:roy.cosgrove@vr.fldoe.org
mailto:roy.cosgrove@vr.fldoe.org
mailto:roy.cosgrove@vr.fldoe.org
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=6
mailto:roy.cosgrove@vr.fldoe.org
mailto:roy.cosgrove@vr.fldoe.org

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 41, Number 6, March 27, 2015

For more information, you may contact: Roy Cosgrove,
(850)245-3317, roy.cosgrove@vr.fldoe.org.

WATER MANAGEMENT DISTRICTS

Southwest Florida Water Management District

The Southwest Florida Water Management District
(SWFWMD) announces a public meeting to which all persons
are invited.

DATE AND TIME: Monday, April 6, 2015, 3:30 p.m. -
cancelled

PLACE: District Brooksville Office, 2379 Broad Street,
Brooksville, FL 34604

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED:
This is to publish notice of cancellation for the meeting of the
Hernando County Task Force.

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting:
WaterMatters.org — Boards, Meetings & Event Calendar;
1(800)423-1476 (FL only) or (352)796-7211.

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 5 days before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: SWFWMD Human Resources Bureau Chief at
1(800)423-1476 (FL only) or (352)796-7211, ext. 4703; TDD
(FL only) 1(800)231-6103 or email:
ADACoordinator@swfwmd.state.fl.us. If you are hearing or
speech impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida
Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770
(Voice).

If any person decides to appeal any decision made by the
Board with respect to any matter considered at this meeting or
hearing, he/she will need to ensure that a verbatim record of
the proceeding is made, which record includes the testimony
and evidence from which the appeal is to be issued.

For more information, you may contact:
Jeanette.lopez@watermatters.org; 1(800)423-1476 (FL only)
or (352)796-7211, ext. 4378 (Ad Order EXE0406).

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting:
WaterMatters.org — Boards, Meetings & Event Calendar;
1(800)423-1476 (FL only) or (352)796-7211.

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 5 days before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: SWFWMD Human Resources Bureau Chief at
1(800)423-1476 (FL only) or (352)796-7211, ext. 4703; TDD
(FL only) 1(800)231-6103 or email:
ADACoordinator@swfwmd.state.fl.us. If you are hearing or
speech impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida
Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770
(Voice).

If any person decides to appeal any decision made by the
Board with respect to any matter considered at this meeting or
hearing, he/she will need to ensure that a verbatim record of
the proceeding is made, which record includes the testimony
and evidence from which the appeal is to be issued.

For more information, you may contact:
Lori.manuel@watermatters.org; 1(800)423-1476 (FL only) or
(352)796-7211, ext. 4606 (Ad Order EXE0407).

WATER MANAGEMENT DISTRICTS

Southwest Florida Water Management District

The Southwest Florida Water Management District
(SWFWMD) announces a public meeting to which all persons
are invited.

DATE AND TIME: Tuesday, April 14, 2015, 1:30 p.m.
PLACE: SWFWMD Tampa Service Office, 7601 US
Highway 301 North, Tampa, FL 33637

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED:
Environmental Advisory Committee meeting: Discuss
committee business. All or part of this meeting may be
conducted by means of communications media technology in
order to permit maximum participation of Governing Board
members.

1502

WATER MANAGEMENT DISTRICTS

Southwest Florida Water Management District

The Southwest Florida Water Management District
(SWFWMD) announces a public meeting to which all persons
are invited.

DATE AND TIME: Monday, April 13, 2015, 2:00 p.m.
PLACE: Lecanto Government Building, 3600 West Sovereign
Path, Suite 226, Lecanto, FL 34461

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED:
Citrus County Task Force meeting to receive public input and
discuss issues relative to the Tsala Apopka Chain of Lakes,
Lake Rousseau and Crystal River/Kings Bay.

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting:
WaterMatters.org — Boards, Meetings & Event Calendar;
1(800)423-1476 (FL only) or (352)796-7211.

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 5 days before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: SWFWMD Human Resources Bureau Chief at
1(800)423-1476 (FL only) or (352)796-7211, ext. 4703; TDD
(FL only) 1(800)231-6103 or email:
ADACoordinator@swfwmd.state.fl.us. If you are hearing or
speech impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida
Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770
(Voice).

If any person decides to appeal any decision made by the
Board with respect to any matter considered at this meeting or


mailto:roy.cosgrove@vr.fldoe.org
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=40
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=123
mailto:ADACoordinator@swfwmd.state.fl.us
mailto:Jeanette.lopez@watermatters.org
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=40
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=123
mailto:ADACoordinator@swfwmd.state.fl.us
mailto:Lori.manuel@watermatters.org
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=40
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=123
mailto:ADACoordinator@swfwmd.state.fl.us

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 41, Number 60, March 27, 2015

hearing, he/she will need to ensure that a verbatim record of
the proceeding is made, which record includes the testimony
and evidence from which the appeal is to be issued.
For more information, you may contact:
Jeanette.lopez@watermatters.org; 1(800)423-1476 (FL only)
or (352)796-7211, ext. 4378 (Ad Order EXE0408).

WATER MANAGEMENT DISTRICTS

South Florida Water Management District

The South Florida Water Management District announces a
public meeting to which all persons are invited.

DATE AND TIME: Thursday, April 9, 2015, 9:00 a.m.
PLACE: SFWMD Headquarters, B-1 Building, 3301 Gun
Club Road, West Palm Beach, FL 33406

All or part of this meeting may be conducted as a
teleconference in order to permit maximum participation by
Governing Board members. The Governing Board may take
official action on any item appearing on the agendas for the
meetings and on any item that is added to the agendas for any
of the meetings as a result of a change to the agendas
approved by the presiding officer of the meeting pursuant to
Section 120.525, Florida Statutes.

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED:
The Governing Board will discuss and consider District
business, including regulatory and non-regulatory matters.

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Brenda
Low, (561)682-6805 or at https://www.sfwmd.gov.

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 5 days before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: Jacki McGorty, (561)682-2087. If you are hearing
or speech impaired, please contact the agency using the
Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-
8770 (Voice).

If any person decides to appeal any decision made by the
Board with respect to any matter considered at this meeting or
hearing, he/she will need to ensure that a verbatim record of
the proceeding is made, which record includes the testimony
and evidence from which the appeal is to be issued.

For more information, you may contact: Jacki McGorty,
(561)682-2087 or jmcgorty@sfwmd.gov.

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED:
The Board of Directors will convene to conduct regular
business of the Authority.

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Linda
Stewart at (941)316-1776 or email:
Istewart@regionalwater.org.

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 2 days before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: (941)316-1776. If you are hearing or speech
impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida Relay
Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (\Voice).
If any person decides to appeal any decision made by the
Board with respect to any matter considered at this meeting or
hearing, he/she will need to ensure that a verbatim record of
the proceeding is made, which record includes the testimony
and evidence from which the appeal is to be issued.

For more information, you may contact: (941)316-1776.

REGIONAL UTILITY AUTHORITIES

Peace River/Manasota Regional Water Supply Authority

The Peace River/Manasota Regional Water Supply Authority
announces a public meeting to which all persons are invited.
DATE AND TIME: April 8, 2015, 9:30 a.m.

PLACE: Sarasota County Administration Center, Commission
Chambers, 1660 Ringling Boulevard, Sarasota, Florida

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL
REGULATION

Division of Pari-Mutuel Wagering

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE:

61D-6.005 Procedures for Sampling of Racing Animals

The Department of Business and Professional Regulation
announces the cancellation of a hearing, which was formally
scheduled as follows:

DATE AND TIME: March 30, 2015, 9:00 a.m. — 5:00 p.m.:
cancelled

PLACE: Florida Department of Business and Professional
Regulation, Northwood Centre, Board Room, 1940 N. Monroe
Street, Tallahassee, Florida 32399

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED:
Public hearing regarding proposed language for Rule 61D-
6.005, F.A.C.

The Department of Business and Professional Regulation will
be rescheduling this hearing at a time and place to be
announced in a subsequent issue of the Florida Administrative
Register.

For more information, you may contact: Bryan Barber,
Department of Business and Professional Regulation, 1940
North  Monroe Street, Tallahassee, Florida 32399,
bryan.barber@myfloridalicense.com.

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL
REGULATION

Board of Pilot Commissioners

The Board of Pilot Commissioners announces a public
meeting to which all persons are invited.

DATE AND TIME: April 23, 2015, 9:00 a.m.

1503


mailto:Jeanette.lopez@watermatters.org
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=40
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=124
https://www.sfwmd.gov/
mailto:jmcgorty@sfwmd.gov
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=49
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=160
mailto:lstewart@regionalwater.org
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=250
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61D-6.005
mailto:bryan.barber@myfloridalicense.com
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=266

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 41, Number 6, March 27, 2015

PLACE: Hilton Cocoa Beach Oceanfront, 1550 North Atlantic
Avenue, Cocoa Beach, Florida 32931-3268, (321)799-0003
GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED:
General Board Business.

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Board of
Pilot Commissioners, 1940 N. Monroe Street, Tallahassee, FL
32399, (850)717-1892.

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 5 days before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: Board of Pilot Commissioners, 1940 N. Monroe
Street, Tallahassee, FL 32399, (850)717-1892. If you are
hearing or speech impaired, please contact the agency using
the Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or
1(800)955-8770 (Voice).

If any person decides to appeal any decision made by the
Board with respect to any matter considered at this meeting or
hearing, he/she will need to ensure that a verbatim record of
the proceeding is made, which record includes the testimony
and evidence from which the appeal is to be issued.

For more information, you may contact: Board of Pilot
Commissioners, 1940 N. Monroe Street, Tallahassee, FL
32399, (850)717-1892.

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 10 days before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: Ms. Barbara Bryant, Building Codes and
Standards Office, Division of Professions, Department of
Business and Professional Regulation, 1940 North Monroe
Street, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-0772, telephone: (850)717-
1838, fax: (850)414-8436. If you are hearing or speech
impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida Relay
Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice).
If any person decides to appeal any decision made by the
Board with respect to any matter considered at this meeting or
hearing, he/she will need to ensure that a verbatim record of
the proceeding is made, which record includes the testimony
and evidence from which the appeal is to be issued.

For more information, you may contact: Jim Richmond,
Building Codes and Standards Office, Division of Professions,
Department of Business and Professional Regulation, 1940
North Monroe Street, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-0772,
(850)717-1823, fax: (850)414-8436 or visit our website at:
https://floridabuilding.org.

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL
REGULATION

Florida Building Commission

The Florida Building Commission announces public meetings
to which all persons are invited.

DATES AND TIMES: Monday, April 6, 2015, 10:00 a.m.;
Monday, April 27, 2015, 10:00 a.m.; Monday, May 4, 2015,
10:00 a.m.; and Monday, May 11, 2015, 10:00 a.m.

PLACE: This notice supersedes that published on March 11,
2015, in Vol.41, No. 48 of the Florida Administrative Register
and corrects the call-in information. Meeting to be conducted
using communications media technology, specifically
conference call. Call in number: 1(888)670-3525, participant
code: 7535107261. Public point of access: 1940 North Monroe
Street, Room 90, Tallahassee, Florida

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: To
review proposed legislation related to the Florida Building
Code, and take up additional items in accordance with the
Commission’s agenda.

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Jim
Richmond, Building Codes and Standards Office, Division of
Professions, Department of Business and Professional
Regulation, 1940 North Monroe Street, Tallahassee, Florida
32399-0772, (850)717-1823, fax: (850)414-8436 or visit our
website at https://floridabuilding.org.

1504

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH

Board of Dentistry

The Board of Dentistry announces a public meeting to which
all persons are invited.

DATE AND TIME: May 29, 2015, 7:30 a.m.

PLACE: Hilton University of Florida Conference Center
Gainesville, 1714 SW 34th Street, Gainesville, FL 32607,
(352)371-3600

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: To
conduct general board business.

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Sue
Foster, Executive Director, Department of Health, Board of
Dentistry, 4052 Bald Cypress Way, BIN #C08, Tallahassee,
Florida 32399-3258. If any person decides to appeal any
decision made by the Board with respect to any matter
considered at this meeting, he/she will need to ensure that a
verbatim record of the proceeding is made, which record
includes the testimony and evidence upon which the appeal is
to be made. Those who are hearing impaired, using TDD
equipment can call the Florida Telephone Relay System at
1(800)955-8771. Persons requiring special accommodations
due to disability or physical impairment should contact Sue
Foster at (850)245-4474.

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH

Board of Dentistry

The Board of Dentistry announces a public meeting to which
all persons are invited.

DATE AND TIME: May 1, 2015, 9:00 a.m.


https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=1071
https://floridabuilding.org/
https://floridabuilding.org/
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=64
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=328
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=64
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=328

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 41, Number 60, March 27, 2015

PLACE: Department of Health, 4042 Bald Cypress Way,
Room #301, Tallahassee, Florida 32399

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: To
review reconsideration cases.

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Sue
Foster, Executive Director, Department of Health, Board of
Dentistry, 4052 Bald Cypress Way, BIN #C08, Tallahassee,
Florida 32399-3258. If any person decides to appeal any
decision made by the Board with respect to any matter
considered at this meeting, he/she will need to ensure that a
verbatim record of the proceeding is made, which record
includes the testimony and evidence upon which the appeal is
to be made. Those who are hearing impaired, using TDD
equipment can call the Florida Telephone Relay System at
1(800)955-8771. Persons requiring special accommodations
due to disability or physical impairment should contact Sue
Foster at (850)245-4474.

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH

Board of Nursing

The Council on Certified Nursing Assistants announces a
telephone conference call to which all persons are invited.
DATE AND TIME: April 6, 2015, 11:00 a.m., EST

PLACE: Department of Health, Tallahassee at Meet Me
number: 1(888)670-3525, passcode: 9908086106 #
GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED:
Discussion regarding proposed rule changes.

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Joe
Baker, Jr., Executive Director, 4052 Bald Cypress Way, Bin
#CO02, Tallahassee, FL 32399-3257.

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 48 hours before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: the Board at (850)245-4125. If you are hearing or
speech impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida
Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770
(Voice).

If any person decides to appeal any decision made by the
Board with respect to any matter considered at this meeting or
hearing, he/she will need to ensure that a verbatim record of
the proceeding is made, which record includes the testimony
and evidence from which the appeal is to be issued.

65C-41.004 Case Management Services For Young Adults in
Extended Foster Care

65C-41.005 Judicial Interaction

65C-41.006 Discharge from Program

The Department of Children and Families announces a public
meeting to which all persons are invited.

DATE AND TIME: April 6, 2015, 9:00 a.m. — 10:30 a.m.
PLACE: Florida Department of Children and Families, 1317
Winewood Boulevard, Bldg. 1, 3rd Floor, Room 305,
Tallahassee, FL 32399-0700; also via conference call:
1(888)670-3525, code: 314 879 3079 #

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED:
The purpose of this meeting is to discuss the forms
incorporated by reference into Rule 65C-41, Extended Foster
Care.

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Jodi
Abramowitz, (850)717-4189 or
Jodi.abramowitz@myflfamilies.com.

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 3 days before the workshop/meeting by
contacting:  Jodi  Abramowitz, (850)717-4189  or
Jodi.abramowitz@myflfamilies.com. If you are hearing or
speech impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida
Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770
(Voice).

For more information, you may contact: Jodi Abramowitz,
(850)717-4189 or Jodi.abramowitz@myflfamilies.com.

DEPARTMENT OF CHILDREN AND FAMILIES
Family Safety and Preservation Program
RULE NOS.:RULE TITLES:

65C-41.001 Definitions

65C-41.002 Application Procedures for
Extended Foster Care

65C-41.003 Appeals

Readmission to

DEPARTMENT OF CHILDREN AND FAMILIES

Family Safety and Preservation Program

RULE NOS.:RULE TITLES:

65C-42.001 Definitions

65C-42.002 Postsecondary Education Services and Support
65C-42.003 Aftercare Services

65C-42.004 Appeals

The Department of Children and Families announces a public
meeting to which all persons are invited.

DATE AND TIME: April 6, 2015, 10:30 a.m. — 12:00 Noon
PLACE: Florida Department of Children and Families, 1317
Winewood Boulevard, Bldg. 1, 3rd Floor, Room 305,
Tallahassee, FL 32399-0700; also via conference call:
1(888)670-3525, code: 314 879 3079 #

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED:
The purpose of this meeting is to discuss the forms
incorporated by reference into Rule 65C-42, Road to

Independence.
A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Jodi
Abramowitz, (850)717-4189 or

Jodi.abramowitz@myflfamilies.com.

1505


https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=64
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=332
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=65
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=342
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=65C-41.001
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=65C-41.002
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=65C-41.003
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=65C-41.004
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=65C-41.005
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=65C-41.006
mailto:Jodi.abramowitz@myflfamilies.com
mailto:Jodi.abramowitz@myflfamilies.com
mailto:Jodi.abramowitz@myflfamilies.com
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=65
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=342
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=65C-42.001
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=65C-42.002
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=65C-42.003
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=65C-42.004
mailto:Jodi.abramowitz@myflfamilies.com

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 41, Number 6, March 27, 2015

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 3 days before the workshop/meeting by
contacting:  Jodi  Abramowitz, (850)717-4189  or
Jodi.abramowitz@myflfamilies.com. If you are hearing or
speech impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida
Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770
(Voice).

For more information, you may contact: Jodi Abramowitz,
(850)717-4189 or Jodi.abramowitz@myflfamilies.com.

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting:
coultermom@aol.com.

For more information, you may contact: Amelia Milton at
(850)414-2378.

ORANGE COUNTY RESEARCH AND DEVELOPMENT
AUTHORITY

The Orange County Research and Development Authority
announces a public meeting to which all persons are invited.
DATE AND TIME: April 9, 2015, 11:30 a.m.

PLACE: Central Florida Research Park, 12424 Research
Parkway, Suite 100, Orlando, FL 32826

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED:
General Business Meeting.

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Joe
Wallace, (407)282-3944.

CITIZENS PROPERTY INSURANCE CORPORATION

The Citizens Property Insurance Corporation Board of
Governors announces a telephone conference call to which all
persons are invited.

DATE AND TIME: April 7, 2015, 11:30 a.m.

PLACE: Dial-in:  1(888)942-8686, conference ID:
5743735657#

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED:
Topics to include, but are not limited to, 2015 Pre-event
Financing.

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting:
www.citizensfla.com.

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 5 days before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: Barbara Walker, (850)513-3744. If you are hearing
or speech impaired, please contact the agency using the
Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-
8770 (Voice).

FLORIDA COMMISSION ON ACCESS TO CIVIL
JUSTICE

The Florida Commission on Access to Civil Justice:
Continuum of Services Subcommittee announces a telephone
conference call to which all persons are invited.

DATE AND TIME: Tuesday, March 31, 2015, 2:00 p.m.,
Eastern Time

PLACE: Conference call: 1(888)376-5050, participant PIN:
4533883354#

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED:
The agenda focuses on discussing the scope of the Continuum
subcommittee's charge as well as reviewing a multi-step
process that self-represented individuals may go through when
engaging the civil justice system; what resources are available
at each step of the process, and efforts by other entities and
jurisdictions to address the continuum of services issue.

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting:
Francisco-Javier Digon-Greer at 1(800)342-8060, ext. 5793 or
email: flaccessjustice@flabar.org.

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 1 day before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: Francisco-Javier Digon-Greer at 1(800)342-8060,
ext. 5793 or email: flaccessjustice@flabar.org. If you are
hearing or speech impaired, please contact the agency using
the Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or
1(800)955-8770 (Voice).

For more information, you may contact: Francisco-Javier
Digon-Greer at 1(800)342-8060, ext. 5793 or email:
flaccessjustice@flabar.org.

FOUNDATION FOR INDIGENT GUARDIANSHIP

The Foundation for Indigent Guardianship announces a public
meeting to which all persons are invited.

DATE AND TIME: April 7, 2015, 9:00 a.m. — 2:30 p.m.
PLACE: 4040 Esplanade Way, Tallahassee

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: In-
person Board Meeting.

1506

ENTERPRISE FLORIDA, INC.

Enterprise Florida, Inc. and the Florida Defense Support Task
Force announce a public meeting to which all persons are
invited.

DATE AND TIME: Thursday, April 16, 2015, 9:00 a.m. —
11:45am., ET

PLACE: DoubleTree by Hilton Tallahassee, 101 S Adams
Street, Tallahassee, Florida 32301

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED:
This meeting will discuss proposed actions that will assist in
preserving, protecting and enhancing Florida’s military
installations and missions.

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Marcy
Sanders, (850)878-4566, msanders@enterpriseflorida.com.


mailto:Jodi.abramowitz@myflfamilies.com
mailto:Jodi.abramowitz@myflfamilies.com
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=582
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=582
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=591
http://www.citizensfla.com/
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=1200
mailto:coultermom@aol.com
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=1196
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=1196
mailto:flaccessjustice@flabar.org
mailto:flaccessjustice@flabar.org
mailto:flaccessjustice@flabar.org
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=680
mailto:msanders@enterpriseflorida.com

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 41, Number 60, March 27, 2015

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 1 day before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: Marcy Sanders, (850)878-4566,
msanders@enterpriseflorida.com. If you are hearing or speech
impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida Relay
Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice).
For more information, you may contact: Bruce Grant,
(850)878-0826, bgrant@enterpriseflorida.com.

Section VIII
Notice of Petitions and Dispositions
Regarding the Validity of Rules

Notice of Petition for Administrative Determination has been
filled with the Division of Administrative Hearings on the
following rules:

NONE

Section VII
Notice of Petitions and Dispositions
Regarding Declaratory Statements

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL
REGULATION

Division of Florida Condominiums, Timeshares and Mobile
Homes

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that the Division of Florida
Condominiums, Timeshares, and Mobile Homes, Department
of Business and Professional Regulation, State of Florida, has
received the petition for declaratory statement from Susan
Schneider, Unit Owner, In Re: Bayshore Diplomat
Condominium Association, Inc., Docket No. 2015013518,
filed on March 23, 2015.The petition seeks the agency's
opinion as to the applicability of Section 718.112(2)(d)2,
Florida Statutes, as it applies to the petitioner.

Whether, under Section 718.112(2)(d)2, Florida Statutes, the
terms of the Board members of the Bayshore Diplomat
Condominium Association expire at the annual meeting?

A copy of the Petition for Declaratory Statement may be
obtained by contacting: Rikki Anderson, Administrative
Assistant 11, at Department of Business and Professional
Regulation, Division of Florida Condominiums, Timeshares,
and Mobile Homes, 1940 North Monroe Street, Tallahassee,
Florida 32399-2217, (850)717-1415,
Rikki.Anderson@myfloridalicense.com.

Please refer all comments to: Thomas Morton, Chief Attorney,
Department of Business and Professional Regulation, Division
of Florida Condominiums, Timeshares, and Mobile Homes,
1940 North Monroe Street, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-2202.
Responses, motions to intervene, or requests for an agency
hearing, §120.57(2), Fla. Stat., must be filed within 21 days of
this notice.

Notice of Disposition of Petition for Administrative
Determination has been filled with the Division of
Administrative Hearings on the following rules:

NONE

Section IX
Notice of Petitions and Dispositions
Regarding Non-rule Policy Challenges

NONE

Section X
Announcements and Objection Reports of
the Joint Adminstrative Procedures
Committee

NONE

Section XI
Notices Regarding Bids, Proposals and
Purchasing

DEPARTMENT OF EDUCATION
School Districts
DCPS Intercom Replacement at Jean Ribault Middle School
No. 212/DCSB
Project No. M-83970/OFDC-ITB-024-15

DUVAL COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS ADVERTISEMENT
FOR BIDS - Invitation To Bid for an Electrical Contractor -
Publish Date — March 27, 2015. Sealed bids will be received
by Duval County Public Schools, Division of Facilities, Room
535, 1701 Prudential Drive, Jacksonville, FL 32207 until the
time and date(s) recorded below and immediately thereafter
publicly opened and recorded in the Duval County Public
Schools, School Board Building, located at 1701 Prudential
Drive, Jacksonville, Florida, 5th Floor, Room 513D. BIDS
ARE DUE ON OR BEFORE APRIL 28, 2014 AND WILL

1507


mailto:msanders@enterpriseflorida.com
mailto:bgrant@enterpriseflorida.com
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=248
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=248
mailto:Rikki.Anderson@myfloridalicense.com
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=6
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=211

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 41, Number 6, March 27, 2015

BE ACCEPTED UNTIL 2:00 P.M.. OFFICIAL PROJECT
TITLE: DCPS Intercom Replacement at Jean Ribault Middle
School No. 212/DCSB Project No. M-83970/OFDC-1TB-024-
15. SCOPE OF WORK: The project consists of intercom
replacement. The estimated construction cost is not to exceed
$250,000.

All contractors that are interested in bidding are required to
attend a mandatory pre-bid conference to be held on April 7,
2015, 9:00 a.m. at Jean Ribault Middle School No. 212, which
is located at 3610 Ribault Scenic Drive, Jacksonville, FL
32208. Failure to attend the pre-bid conference shall result in
disqualification of that firm’s proposal. Attendees will be
required to sign an attendance register. Project funding is
subject to availability of funds as authorized by the Owner.
The District reserves the right to reject any and all bids.
Contract documents for bidding may be obtained at the office
of: ARC/4613 Phillips Highway, Suite 202/ Jacksonville, FL
32207, (904)399-8946. Contract documents for bidding may
be examined at the Duval County Public Schools
Administration Building located at 1701 Prudential Drive,
Jacksonville, FL 32207. Name of A/E Firm: John Searcy &
Associates, Inc., 2700 University Blvd. W., Ste. B-4,
Jacksonville, Florida 32217, telephone: (904)739-1231. MBE
Participation Goal: Sheltered, SBE — Only SBE’s certified
with DCPS as an SBE can participate. All Contractors
submitting bids must be prequalified with Duval County
Public Schools at the time of the bid opening. No bids will be
accepted from Contractors who are not prequalified with
Duval County Public Schools. Prequalification forms and
information may be obtained at www.duvalschools.org under
Departments/Facilities/Forms and Standards/General
Documents/Contractor Prequalification Procedures. The Bid
Award Recommendation will be posted on the first floor
bulletin board at the Duval County School Board Building,
1701 Prudential Drive, Jacksonville, Florida 32207-8182.

Section XII
Miscellaneous

AGENCY FOR HEALTH CARE ADMINISTRATION
Medicaid

Proposed Amendment to Florida’s 1115 Managed Medical

Assistance Waiver

THIS NOTICE REPLACES THE NOTICE PUBLISHED IN
VOL. 41, NO 58, F.A.R., MARCH 25, 2015. PLEASE NOTE
THAT THE DATE FOR THE TAMPA PUBLIC MEETING
HAS CHANGED FROM APRIL 1 to APRIL 7, 2015.
The Agency for Health Care Administration announces a
public meeting to which all persons are invited.

1508

DATES AND TIMES: April 7, 2015, 1:00 p.m. — 3:30 p.m.;
April 14, 2015, 3:00 p.m. — 5:00 p.m.

PLACES: April 7, 2015, 1:00 p.m. — 3:30 p.m.: The Agency
for Health Care Administration, 6800 North Dale Mabry
Highway, Suite 220, Main Training Room, Tampa, FL 33614.
To participate by phone, please call 1(877)299-4502 and enter
the participant passcode 769 730 07#.

April 14, 2015, 3:00 p.m. — 5:00 p.m.: Agency for Health Care
Administration, Building 3, 1st Floor, Conference Room A,
2727 Mahan Drive, Tallahassee, FL 32308. To participate by
phone, please call 1(877)299-4502 and enter the participant
passcode 758 844 10#.

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
Agency at least 7 days before the workshop/meeting by
contacting Heather Morrison at (850)412-4034 or by email at
Heather.Morrison@ahca.myflorida.com.

If you are hearing or speech impaired, please contact the
Agency using the Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771
(TTY) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice).

SUMMARY DESCRIPTION OF PROPOSED
AMENDMENT: The Agency plans to submit an amendment
to Florida’s 1115 Managed Medical Assistance (MMA)
Waiver to the Centers for Medicare and Medicaid Services
(Federal CMS) to assign Medicaid-eligible individuals who
are mandated to participate in Florida’s MMA program, a
component of the Statewide Medicaid Managed Care
program, to a managed care plan immediately after eligibility
determination. The State is requesting an effective date of
September 1, 2015.

The proposed amendment will allow individuals to be enrolled
in a managed care plan immediately after eligibility
determination. Under the proposed amendment, individuals
will receive both their managed care plan assignment and
information about the managed care plan choices in their area,
to encourage an active selection, immediately after eligibility
determination.

During the initial 30-day period post-enrollment, if a recipient
decides to change plans, the change will take effect the first
day of the following month. The 30-day change period will be
followed by a 90-day disenrollment period. During the 90-day
disenrollment period, if a recipient decides to change plans,
the change will take effect the first day of the following
month.

The State is not requesting any changes to the 1115 MMA
Waiver authorities or expenditure authorities authorized July
31, 2014. The State is requesting to amend Special Term and
Conditions (STCs) #2, #21, #22, and #40 of this waiver to
remove the 30-day delay period between eligibility
determination and managed care plan enrollment and to


http://www.duvalschools.org/
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=59
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=192
mailto:Heather.Morrison@ahca.myflorida.com

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 41, Number 60, March 27, 2015

amend the auto-assignment criteria to conform to Section
409.977(2), Florida Statutes, which states:

When automatically enrolling recipients in

managed care plans, the agency shall

automatically enroll based on the following

criteria: (a) Whether the plan has sufficient

network capacity to meet the needs of the

recipients. (b) Whether the recipient has

previously received services from one of the

plan’s primary care providers. (¢c) Whether

primary care providers in one plan are more

geographically accessible to the recipient’s

residence than those in other plans.”
To view the full description of the proposed amendment
request please see the public notice document published on the
Agency’s website at the following link:
http://ahca.myflorida.com/medicaid/statewide_mc/mma_fed_a
uth_amend_waiver_2015-03.shtml
PUBLIC NOTICE AND PUBLIC COMMENT PERIOD:
MARCH 27, 2015 — APRIL 26, 2015
The Agency will conduct a 30-day public notice and comment
period prior to the submission of the proposed amendment
request to Federal CMS. The Agency will consider all public
comments received regarding the proposed amendment
request. The 30-day public notice and public comment period
begins March 27, 2015 and ends April 26, 2015. This public
notice and public comment period is being held to solicit
public input from recipients, providers and all stakeholders
and interested parties on the development of the proposed
amendment request to Florida’s 1115 MMA Waiver.
To submit comments by postal service or internet email,
please follow the directions outlined below. When providing
comments regarding the proposed amendment to the 1115
MMA Waiver, please have ‘Proposed Amendment to 1115
MMA Waiver’ referenced in the subject line. Mail comments
and suggestions to:

Proposed Amendment to 1115 MMA Waiver

Office of the Deputy Secretary for Medicaid

Agency for Health Care Administration
2727 Mahan Drive, MS #8
Tallahassee, Florida 32308
Email your comments and suggestions to:

FLMedicaidWaivers@ahca.myflorida.com.
SUMMARY DESCRIPTION OF THE 1115 MMA WAIVER:
Florida’s 1115 Research and Demonstration Waiver was
initially approved by Federal CMS October 19, 2005 to
operate for the period from July 1, 2006 to June 30, 2010.
Implementation of the waiver occurred in Broward and Duval
counties on July 1, 2006 with expansion to Baker, Clay and
Nassau counties occurring July 1, 2007. Federal CMS granted
temporary extensions of the waiver until December 15, 2011,

when final approval of the extension request was granted, for
the period from December 16, 2011 to June 30, 2014.

On June 14, 2013, Federal CMS approved an amendment to
the waiver that allows for implementation of an improved
statewide model of managed care in 2014 and the continuation
of the Low Income Pool program. The amendment also
changed the name of the waiver to the Florida Managed
Medical Assistance Waiver.

On November 27, 2013, the Agency submitted another three-
year waiver extension request to Federal CMS to extend
Florida’s 1115 MMA Waiver for the period July 1, 2014 to
June 30, 2017. With the submission of the three- year waiver
extension request, the State is seeking federal authority to
extend Florida’s 1115 MMA Waiver for the period July 1,
2014 to June 30, 2017. The waiver is designed to implement a
new statewide managed care delivery system without
increasing costs and to continue the Low Income Pool
program. The program is guided by principles designed to
improve coordination and patient care while fostering fiscal
responsibility.

The MMA program will provide primary and acute medical
care for the majority of Medicaid recipients through high
quality, competitively selected managed care organizations.
Moving from a fee-for-service system to the MMA program,
the program increases consumer protections as well as quality
of care and access for Floridians in many ways including:

e Increases recipient participation on Florida’s Medical
Care Advisory Committee and convenes smaller
advisory committees to focus on key special needs
populations;

e  Ensures the continuation of services until the primary
care or behavioral health provider reviews the
enrollee’s treatment plan (no more than 60 calendar
days after the effective date of enroliment);

e Ensures recipient complaints, grievances and appeals
are reviewed immediately for resolution as part of the
rapid cycle response system;

e Establishes Healthy Behaviors programs to
encourage and reward healthy behaviors and, at a
minimum, requires plans offer a medically approved
smoking cessation program, a medically directed
weight loss program and a substance abuse treatment
plan;

e Requires Florida’s External Quality Review
Organization to validate each plan’s encounter data
every three years;

e Enhances consumer report cards to ensure recipients
have access to an understandable summary of quality,
access, and timeliness regarding the performance of
each participating managed care plan;

e Enhances the plan’s performance improvement
projects by focusing on six key areas with the goal of

1509


http://ahca.myflorida.com/medicaid/statewide_mc/mma_fed_auth_amend_waiver_2015-03.shtml
http://ahca.myflorida.com/medicaid/statewide_mc/mma_fed_auth_amend_waiver_2015-03.shtml
mailto:FLMedicaidWaivers@ahca.myflorida.com

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 41, Number 6, March 27, 2015

achieving improved patient care, population health
and reducing per capita Medicaid expenditures;

e Enhances metrics on plan quality and access to care
to improve plan accountability; and

e Enhances the state’s comprehensive continuous
quality improvement strategy, focusing it on all
aspects of quality improvement in Medicaid.

did not meet the statutory requirements for covenant
revitalization.

Copies of the final order may be obtained by writing to the
Agency Clerk, Department of Economic Opportunity, 107 E.
Madison Street, MSC 110, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-4128 or
Katie.zimmer@DEO.MyFlorida.com.

DEPARTMENT OF ECONOMIC OPPORTUNITY
Division of Community Development

Final Order No.: DEO-15-039
NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that the Florida Department of
Economic Opportunity issued Final Order No. DEO-15-039
on March 25, 2015, in response to an application submitted by
the Charleston Square Homeowners Association of
Tallahassee, Inc. for covenant revitalization under Chapter
720, Part I1l, Florida Statutes.
The Department’s Final Order denied the application for
covenant revitalization after determining that the application

Section XIlI
Index to Rules Filed During Preceeding
Week

NOTE: The above section will be published on Tuesday
beginning October 2, 2012, unless Monday is a holiday, then it
will be published on Wednesday of that week.

1510

CLERK OF COURT OPERATIONS CORPORATION
Florida Clerks of Court Operations Corporation
Pursuant to Section 121.055, Florida Statutes, the Florida
Clerks of Court Operations Corporation (CCOC) provides
public notice of the intent to include the following position in
the Florida Retirement System’s Senior Management Service

Class effective May 1, 2015: Deputy Executive Director.
Additional information may be obtained by writing to the
Florida Clerks of Court Operations Corporation, Attn: Lisa
Daws, 2560-102 Barrington Circle, Tallahassee, Florida
32308.



https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=73
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=1066
mailto:Katie.zimmer@DEO.MyFlorida.com
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=592

