
Florida Administrative Register Volume 48, Number 152, August 5, 2022 

3123 

 

Section I 

Notice of Development of Proposed Rules 

and Negotiated Rulemaking 

DEPARTMENT OF EDUCATION 

State Board of Education 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

6A-1.0955 Education Records 

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: To protect student privacy when 

school districts contract with third parties to provide 

educational technology services. This rule will strengthen the 

privacy and rights of students and safeguard their educational 

record in accordance with state and federal law. Other general 

amendments designed to strengthen privacy of student records 

will also be considered. 

SUBJECT AREA TO BE ADDRESSED: Privacy and rights of 

students’ educational records when using third-party 

technology services. 

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 1001.02(1), (2)(n), 

1002.22(3), 1003.25(2), F.S. 

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 1001.52(2), (3), 1002.22(2), (3), 

1002.221, 1003.25, 1008.405, F.S. 

IF REQUESTED IN WRITING AND NOT DEEMED 

UNNECESSARY BY THE AGENCY HEAD, A RULE 

DEVELOPMENT WORKSHOP WILL BE HELD AT THE 

DATE, TIME AND PLACE SHOWN BELOW: 

DATE AND TIME: August 19, 2022, 10:00-10:30 am EDT, or 

upon conclusion of business, whichever is earlier. 

PLACE: https://teams.microsoft.com/l/meetup-

join/19%3ameeting_NzU4MjUyOWYtNWI4Ny00OTU1LTk

3NjEtYzcwNWI5MWU2NWM1%40thread.v2/0?context=%7

b%22Tid%22%3a%2263bf107b-cb6f-4173-8c1c-

1406bb5cb794%22%2c%22Oid%22%3a%22b1c8c45b-6d85-

4903-9ebd-dd0d11833505%22%7d. 

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE 

PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT AND A COPY OF 

THE PRELIMINARY DRAFT, IF AVAILABLE, IS: Dr. 

Andre Smith, Deputy Commissioner, Division of Technology 

and Innovation, Andre.Smith@fldoe.org. To comment on this 

rule development or to request a rule development workshop, 

please go to https://web02.fldoe.org/rules or contact: Chris 

Emerson, Director, Office of Executive Management, 

(850)245-9601 or email Christian.Emerson@fldoe.org. 

THE PRELIMINARY TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE 

DEVELOPMENT IS NOT AVAILABLE. 

DEPARTMENT OF EDUCATION 

State Board of Education 

RULE NO. RULE TITLE: 

6A-1.094120: Youth Mental Health Awareness Training 

and Reporting 

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The proposed rule will set forth 

requirements relating to youth mental health awareness training 

(YMHAT) and reporting. The rule will provide notice of the 

procedures and criteria utilized by the department for school 

districts’ training, monitoring and reporting for compliance 

with those requirements. 

SUBJECT AREA TO BE ADDRESSED: Requirements 

relating to youth mental health awareness training (YMHAT) 

and reporting. 

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 1001.02(1), (2)(n), F.S. 

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 1012.584, F.S. 

IF REQUESTED IN WRITING AND NOT DEEMED 

UNNECESSARY BY THE AGENCY HEAD, A RULE 

DEVELOPMENT WORKSHOP WILL BE HELD AT THE 

DATE, TIME AND PLACE SHOWN BELOW: 

DATE AND TIME: August 19, 2022, 10:30 a.m. EDT 

PLACE: https://zoom.us/meeting/register/tJYvdO-

tqzkuHNcGprtKh5FUbT3T7zarVysS. 

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE 

PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT AND A COPY OF 

THE PRELIMINARY DRAFT, IF AVAILABLE, IS: Victoria 

Gaitanis, Chief, Bureau of Exceptional Education and Student 

Services, (850)245-0475. To comment on this rule development 

or to request a rule development workshop, please go to 

https://web02.fldoe.org/rules or contact: Chris Emerson, 

Director, Office of Executive Management, (850)245-9601 or 

email Christian.Emerson@fldoe.org. 

THE PRELIMINARY TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE 

DEVELOPMENT IS NOT AVAILABLE. 

DEPARTMENT OF EDUCATION 

State Board of Education 

RULE NO. RULE TITLE: 

6A-1.094124: Required Instruction Planning and Reporting 

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The proposed rule change will 

update terminology related to mental health and references to 

Florida’s state academic standards (per Senate Bill 1048). 

SUBJECT AREA TO BE ADDRESSED: Update terminology 

regarding state academic standards and mental health. 

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 1001.02(2)(n), 1003.42(2), 

F.S. 

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 1003.42, F.S. 

IF REQUESTED IN WRITING AND NOT DEEMED 

UNNECESSARY BY THE AGENCY HEAD, A RULE 

DEVELOPMENT WORKSHOP WILL BE HELD AT THE 

DATE, TIME AND PLACE SHOWN BELOW: 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=6
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=195
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=6A-1.0955
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=1001.02(1)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%201002.22(3)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%201003.25(2)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=1001.52(2)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%201002.22(2)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%201002.221
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%201003.25
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%201008.405
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=6
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=195
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=6A-1.094120
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=1001.02(1)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=1012.584
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=6
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=195
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=6A-1.094124
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=1001.02(2)(n)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%201003.42(2)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=1003.42


Florida Administrative Register Volume 48, Number 152, August 5, 2022 

 

3124 

DATE AND TIME: August 19, 2022, 9:30 a.m. EDT 

PLACE: https://zoom.us/meeting/register/tJAsd-

msqTgiGdOhzIwSFwnfahdDmtgLo0YI. 

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE 

PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT AND A COPY OF 

THE PRELIMINARY DRAFT, IF AVAILABLE, IS: Victoria 

Gaitanis, Chief, Bureau of Exceptional Education and Student 

Services, (850)245-0475. To comment on this rule development 

or to request a rule development workshop, please go to 

https://web02.fldoe.org/rules or contact: Chris Emerson, 

Director, Office of Executive Management, (850)245-9601 or 

email Christian.Emerson@fldoe.org. 

THE PRELIMINARY TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE 

DEVELOPMENT IS NOT AVAILABLE. 

DEPARTMENT OF EDUCATION 

State Board of Education 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

6A-4.0010 Continuing Education and Inservice 

Training Materials for Youth Suicide 

Awareness and Prevention and Criteria for 

Suicide Prevention Certified Schools 

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The proposed amendments align 

with recent legislative updates, including the new Section 

1006.07(11), F.S., in House Bill 1421, which requires district 

school boards to adopt policies to ensure district schools and 

local mobile response teams use the same suicide risk 

assessment instrument approved by the Department of 

Education. The rule may include other changes to strengthen 

suicide awareness and prevention. 

SUBJECT AREA TO BE ADDRESSED: Administration of 

approved suicide risk assessments. 

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 1001.02(1), (2)(n), 

1012.583(5), F.S. 

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 1006.07(11), 1012.583(5), F.S. 

IF REQUESTED IN WRITING AND NOT DEEMED 

UNNECESSARY BY THE AGENCY HEAD, A RULE 

DEVELOPMENT WORKSHOP WILL BE HELD AT THE 

DATE, TIME AND PLACE SHOWN BELOW: 

DATE AND TIME: August 19, 2022, 10:00 a.m. EDT 

PLACE: 

https://zoom.us/meeting/register/tJcqce6qrDMvHNdnvKzy7D

_QEFclWhniGvI1. 

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE 

PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT AND A COPY OF 

THE PRELIMINARY DRAFT, IF AVAILABLE, IS: Victoria 

Gaitanis, Chief, Bureau of Exceptional Education and Student 

Services, (850)245-0475. To comment on this rule development 

or to request a rule development workshop, please go to 

https://web02.fldoe.org/rules or contact: Chris Emerson, 

Director, Office of Executive Management, (850)245-9601 or 

email Christian.Emerson@fldoe.org. 

THE PRELIMINARY TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE 

DEVELOPMENT IS NOT AVAILABLE. 

DEPARTMENT OF EDUCATION 

State Board of Education 

RULE NOS. RULE TITLE: 

6A-6.0786: Forms for Charter School Applicants and 

Sponsors 

6A-6.0791: Special Magistrate for Unresolved Student 

Welfare Complaints at Charter Schools 

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: To revise the Model Florida Charter 

School Application (Form IEPC-M1), the evaluation 

instrument for that model application (Form IEPC-M2), and the 

Florida Standard Charter Contract (Form IEPC-SC) to align 

with recent legislative changes. In addition, a new rule will be 

created to set forth the procedures around the special magistrate 

for unresolved student welfare complaints at charter schools. 

SUBJECT AREA TO BE ADDRESSED: Charter School 

Applicants and Sponsors, and Charter School Operators. 

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 1001.02(1), (2)(n), 

1002.33(28), F.S. 

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 1001.42(8)(c)7., 1002.33, F.S. 

A RULE DEVELOPMENT WORKSHOP WILL BE HELD 

AT THE DATE, TIME AND PLACE SHOWN BELOW: 

DATE AND TIME: August 25, 2022, 10:00 a.m. to 11:00 a.m., 

or until conclusion of business. 

PLACE: Webinar with conference line. To participate virtually, 

register for the webinar at the following link: 

https://register.gotowebinar.com/register/74434780650727937

6. A conference line will be provided upon registration. 

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE 

PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT AND A COPY OF 

THE PRELIMINARY DRAFT, IF AVAILABLE, IS: Adam 

Emerson, Executive Director, Office of Independent Education 

and Parental Choice, (850)245-0502, 

adam.emerson@fldoe.org. To comment on this rule 

development workshop, please go to 

https://web02.fldoe.org/rules or contact: Chris Emerson, 

Director, Office of Executive Management, (850)245-9601 or 

email Christian.Emerson@fldoe.org. 

THE PRELIMINARY TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE 

DEVELOPMENT IS NOT AVAILABLE. 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=6
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=195
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=6A-4.0010
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=1001.02(1)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%201012.583(5)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=1006.07(11)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%201012.583(5)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=6
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=195
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=6A-6.0786
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=6A-6.0791
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=1001.02(1)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%201002.33(28)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=1001.42(8)(c)7.
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%201002.33


Florida Administrative Register Volume 48, Number 152, August 5, 2022 

3125 

 

DEPARTMENT OF EDUCATION 

State Board of Education 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

6A-10.086 School District Policies for Parental 

Notification Regarding Designation of 

Bathrooms and Locker Rooms 

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: To protect the fundamental rights 

of parents to ensure they are fully informed of how bathrooms 

are designated and how locker rooms are designated and 

supervised. This rule will ensure full transparency to enhance 

the safety of students and protect parental rights. 

SUBJECT AREA TO BE ADDRESSED: School district 

policies for parental notification of bathroom designations and 

locker room designations and supervision. 

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 1000.05(3)(e), (6)(a), 

1001.02(1), (2)(n), F.S. 

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 1000.05(3), F.S. 

IF REQUESTED IN WRITING AND NOT DEEMED 

UNNECESSARY BY THE AGENCY HEAD, A RULE 

DEVELOPMENT WORKSHOP WILL BE HELD AT THE 

DATE, TIME AND PLACE SHOWN BELOW: 

DATE AND TIME: August 19, 2022, 11:00-11:30 a.m. EDT or 

upon conclusion of business. 

PLACE: https://teams.microsoft.com/l/meetup-

join/19%3ameeting_NDIzOTMwYmMtNGYwMC00OGMyL

WJlNDItNjRkZWUxZWU4YTUx%40thread.v2/0?context=%

7b%22Tid%22%3a%2263bf107b-cb6f-4173-8c1c-

1406bb5cb794%22%2c%22Oid%22%3a%22b1c8c45b-6d85-

4903-9ebd-dd0d11833505%22%7d. 

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE 

PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT AND A COPY OF 

THE PRELIMINARY DRAFT, IF AVAILABLE, IS: Kosec, 

Jr., Chief, Office of Professional Practices Services, 

Randy.Kosec@fldoe.org. To comment on this rule 

development or to request a rule development workshop, please 

go to https://web02.fldoe.org/rules or contact: Chris Emerson, 

Director, Office of Executive Management, (850)245-9601 or 

email Christian.Emerson@fldoe.org. 

THE PRELIMINARY TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE 

DEVELOPMENT IS NOT AVAILABLE. 

AGENCY FOR HEALTH CARE ADMINISTRATION 

Hospital and Nursing Home Reporting Systems and Other 

Provisions Relating to Hospitals 

RULE NOS.: RULE TITLES: 

59E-4.101 Definitions 

59E-4.102 Florida Nursing Home Uniform Reporting 

System 

59E-4.103 Prior Year Report Revisions, Ownership 

Change and Fiscal Year End (FYE) Change 

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: At the direction of HB 539 (2022-

49, L.O.F.) and SB 2518 (2021-041, L.O.F.) the Agency 

proposes to create three new rules within Chapter 59E-4 to 

establish a uniform system for financial reporting by nursing 

homes and nursing home’s home offices. 

SUBJECT AREA TO BE ADDRESSED: Uniform system for 

financial reporting by nursing homes and nursing home’s home 

offices. 

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 408.061, 408.15, 408.15(8), 

408.061(2), FS. 

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 408.032, 408.061(2), FS. 

A RULE DEVELOPMENT WORKSHOP WILL BE HELD 

AT THE DATE, TIME AND PLACE SHOWN BELOW: 

DATE AND TIME: August 25, 2022, from 10:00 – 11:00 am 

PLACE: Agency for Health Care Administration, 2727 Mahan 

Drive, Building 3, Conference Room B, Tallahassee, FL 32308. 

You may also participate by dialing the Open Voice conference 

line, 1(888)585-9008, then enter the conference room number 

followed by the pound sign, 998-518-088#. The agenda and 

related materials will be posted prior to the workshop at: 

https://ahca.myflorida.com/MCHQ/Health_Facility_Regulatio

n/Rulemaking.shtml. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 3 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Jeremy Roberts, 2727 Mahan Drive, Tallahassee, 

Florida, (850)412-4432 If you are hearing or speech impaired, 

please contact the agency using the Florida Relay Service, 

1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice). 

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE 

PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT AND A COPY OF 

THE PRELIMINARY DRAFT, IF AVAILABLE, IS: Jeremy 

Roberts, (850)412-4432, email: 

Jeremy.roberts@ahca.myflorida.com. 

THE PRELIMINARY TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE 

DEVELOPMENT IS AVAILABLE AT NO CHARGE FROM 

THE CONTACT PERSON LISTED ABOVE. 

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 

REGULATION 

Florida Building Commission 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

61G20-1.001 Florida Building Code Adopted 

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: Senate Bill 4-D (2022) was passed 

by the Legislature during a special session, and went into effect 

upon being signed by the Governor. The bill contains a 

provision which expands repair options for existing roofs which 

were built, repaired, or replaced to the standards of the 2007 

Florida Building Code, or any later edition, and directs the 

Florida Building Commission to adopt this provision into the 

Code. The bill also contains provisions concerning mandatory 

structural inspections for condominium and cooperative 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=6
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=195
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=6A-10.086
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=1000.05(3)(e)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%201001.02(1)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=1000.05(3)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=59
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=190
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=190
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=59E-4.101
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=59E-4.102
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=59E-4.103
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=408.061
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20408.15
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20408.15(8)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20408.061(2)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=408.032
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20408.061(2)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=1071
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61G20-1.001


Florida Administrative Register Volume 48, Number 152, August 5, 2022 

 

3126 

buildings, and the Commission intends to incorporate these into 

the Code as well. 

SUBJECT AREA TO BE ADDRESSED: Corresponding 

changes to provisions of the Florida Building Code, 7th Edition 

(2020), which are impacted by state statute. 

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 553.73(1), 553.73(2), 

553.73(7), 553.73(8), 553.76(1), 553.77(1), 553.901 FS. 

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 553.72, 553.73(2), 553.73(3), 

553.73(7), 553.73(8), 553.73(9), 553.844(5), 553.901 FS. 

IF REQUESTED IN WRITING AND NOT DEEMED 

UNNECESSARY BY THE AGENCY HEAD, A RULE 

DEVELOPMENT WORKSHOP WILL BE NOTICED IN 

THE NEXT AVAILABLE FLORIDA ADMINISTRATIVE 

REGISTER. 

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE 

PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT AND A COPY OF 

THE PRELIMINARY DRAFT, IF AVAILABLE, IS: Mo 

Madani, Technical Director, Florida Building Commission, 

Department of Business and Professional Regulation, 2601 

Blair Stone Road, Tallahassee, Florida 32399, (850)717-1825. 

THE PRELIMINARY TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE 

DEVELOPMENT IS NOT AVAILABLE. 

Section II 

Proposed Rules 

PUBLIC SERVICE COMMISSION 

RULE NOS.: RULE TITLES:  

25-22.002 Agenda of Meetings 

25-22.100 Authority 

25-22.101 Purpose 

25-22.1035 Official Reporter for Final Orders 

25-22.104 Numbering of Orders 

25-22.105 Electronic Database of Orders and Other 

Records 

25-22.107 Plan for Making Orders Available to the 

Public 

25-22.033 Communications Between Commission 

Employees and Parties 

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: To repeal these Commission rules.  

Docket No. 20220127-PU 

SUMMARY: The Commission determined that there is no 

implementing authority or rulemaking authority for these rules 

and, therefore, they are being repealed. 

SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF ESTIMATED 

REGULATORY COSTS AND LEGISLATIVE 

RATIFICATION: The Agency has determined that this will not 

have an adverse impact on small business or likely increase 

directly or indirectly regulatory costs in excess of $200,000 in 

the aggregate within one year after the implementation of the 

rule. A SERC has not been prepared by the Agency. 

The Agency has determined that the proposed rule is not 

expected to require legislative ratification based on the 

statement of estimated regulatory costs or if no SERC is 

required, the information expressly relied upon and described 

herein: Because these are rule repeals, it was determined that no 

costs would be incurred as a result of the repeals and, therefore, 

the proposed repeal of the rules will not require legislative 

ratification.  

Any person who wishes to provide information regarding a 

statement of estimated regulatory costs, or provide a proposal 

for a lower cost regulatory alternative must do so in writing 

within 21 days of this notice. 

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 120.53, 120.532, 120.533, 

350.12, 350.0, F.S. 

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 120.525, 120.53, 120.569, 120.57, 

350.042, FS  

IF REQUESTED WITHIN 21 DAYS OF THE DATE OF THIS 

NOTICE, A HEARING WILL BE SCHEDULED AND 

ANNOUNCED IN THE FAR. 

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE 

PROPOSED RULE IS: Adria Harper, Office of General 

Counsel, 2540 Shumard Oak Blvd., Tallahassee, FL 32399-

0850, (850)413-6082, aharper@psc.state.fl.us. 

 

THE FULL TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE IS:   

 

25-22.002 Agenda of Meetings. 

Rulemaking Authority 350.127(2) FS. Law Implemented 120.525 FS. 

History–New 12-21-81, Formerly 25-22.02, Amended 4-18-94, 5-3-

99, Repealed__________. 

 

25-22.100 Authority. 

Rulemaking Authority 120.533 FS. Law Implemented 120.53(2)-(4) 

FS. History–New 9-24-92, Amended 12-27-94, Repealed__________. 

 

25-22.101 Purpose. 

Rulemaking Authority 120.533 FS. Law Implemented 120.53(2)-(4) 

FS. History–New 9-24-92, Amended 12-27-94, Repealed__________. 

 

25-22.1035 Official Reporter for Final Orders. 

Rulemaking Authority 120.532, 120.533 FS. Law Implemented 

120.53(2)(a), (d), (4) FS. History–New 12-27-94, Amended 2-2-10, 

Repealed__________. 

 

25-22.104 Numbering of Orders. 

Rulemaking Authority 120.53(1) FS. Law Implemented 120.53(2)-(4) 

FS. History–New 9-24-92, Amended 12-27-94, 12-26-01, 

Repealed_________. 

 

25-22.105 Electronic Database of Orders and Other 

Records. 

Rulemaking Authority 120.533(1)(f) FS. Law Implemented 120.53(2)-

(4) FS. History–New 9-24-92, Amended 12-27-94, 2-2-10, 

Repealed_________. 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=553.73(1)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20553.73(2)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20553.73(7)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20553.73(8)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20553.76(1)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20553.77(1)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20553.901%20FS.
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=553.72
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20553.73(2)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20553.73(3)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20553.73(7)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20553.73(8)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20553.73(9)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20553.844(5)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20553.901%20FS.
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=25


Florida Administrative Register Volume 48, Number 152, August 5, 2022 

3127 

 

 

25-22.107 Plan for Making Orders Available to the 

Public. 

Rulemaking Authority 120.53(2), (8) FS. Law Implemented 120.52(2) 

FS. History–New 9-24-92, Amended 12-27-94, 2-2-10, 

Repealed__________. 

 

25-22.033 Communications Between Commission 

Employees and Parties. 

Rulemaking Authority 350.01(7), 350.127(2) FS. Law Implemented 

120.569, 120.57, 350.042 FS. History–New 3-24-93, 

Repealed__________. 

 

NAME OF PERSON ORIGINATING PROPOSED RULE: 

Adria Harper 

NAME OF AGENCY HEAD WHO APPROVED THE 

PROPOSED RULE: Florida Public Service Commission 

DATE PROPOSED RULE APPROVED BY AGENCY 

HEAD: August 2, 2022 

PUBLIC SERVICE COMMISSION 

RULE NOS.: RULE TITLES:  

25-25.001 Purpose 

25-25.002 Intent 

25-25.003 Definitions 

25-25.004 Procurement Organization 

25-25.005 Delegation of Authority 

25-25.006 Formal Bids Required 

25-25.0061 Purchasing Threshold Amounts and 

Procedures for Automatic Annual 

Adjustments 

25-25.007 Legal Advertisements 

25-25.008 Contracts for Class B Printing 

25-25.009 Source Selection, Bid Openings and 

Contract Awards 

25-25.010 Single Source Procurement 

25-25.011 Emergency Procurement 

25-25.012 Responsibility of Bidders and Offerors 

25-25.013 Multi-Term Contracts 

25-25.014 Cancellation Clause 

25-25.015 Installment Sale and Purchase Contracts 

25-25.016 Exemptions from Competitive Bid 

Requirements 

25-25.017 Bid Borrowing 

25-25.018 Use of the Terms “or equivalent” and “no 

substitute.” 

25-25.019 Purchases Not Requiring Formal Bids 

25-25.020 Determinations 

25-25.021 Protest of Commission Decision 

25-25.022 Acquisition of Printing, Duplicating and 

Reproduction Equipment 

25-25.023 Vendors and Suppliers 

25-25.024 Contractual Services 

25-25.025 Minority Business Companies 

25-25.030 Leases for Real Property 

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: To repeal these Commission rules. 

Docket No. 20220127-PU 

SUMMARY: These rules are being repealed because they are 

outdated and obsolete.  

SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF ESTIMATED 

REGULATORY COSTS AND LEGISLATIVE 

RATIFICATION: The Agency has determined that this will not 

have an adverse impact on small business or likely increase 

directly or indirectly regulatory costs in excess of $200,000 in 

the aggregate within one year after the implementation of the 

rule. A SERC has not been prepared by the Agency. 

The Agency has determined that the proposed rule is not 

expected to require legislative ratification based on the 

statement of estimated regulatory costs or if no SERC is 

required, the information expressly relied upon and described 

herein: Because these are rule repeals, it was determined that no 

costs would be incurred as a result of the repeals and, therefore, 

the proposed repeal of the rules will not require legislative 

ratification.  

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=25


Florida Administrative Register Volume 48, Number 152, August 5, 2022 

 

3128 

Any person who wishes to provide information regarding a 

statement of estimated regulatory costs, or provide a proposal 

for a lower cost regulatory alternative must do so in writing 

within 21 days of this notice. 

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 350.0603, 287.056,  287.057, 

287.017, and 287.058,  F.S. 

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 350.0603, 287.056,  287.057, 

287.017, and 287.058,  F.S. 

IF REQUESTED WITHIN 21 DAYS OF THE DATE OF THIS 

NOTICE, A HEARING WILL BE SCHEDULED AND 

ANNOUNCED IN THE FAR. 

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE 

PROPOSED RULE IS: Adria Harper, Office of General 

Counsel, 2540 Shumard Oak Blvd., Tallahassee, FL 32399-

0850, (850)413-6082, aharper@psc.state.fl.us. 

 

THE FULL TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE IS:  

 

25-25.001 Purpose. 

Rulemaking Authority 350.0603, 350.127(2) FS. Law Implemented 

350.0603 FS. History–New 4-12-83, Formerly 25-25.01, 

Repealed___________. 

 

25-25.002 Intent. 

Rulemaking Authority 350.0603, 350.127(2) FS. Law Implemented 

350.0603 FS. History–New 4-12-83, Formerly 25-25.02, 

Repealed_____________. 

 

25-25.003 Definitions. 

Rulemaking Authority 350.0603, 350.127(2) FS. Law Implemented 

350.0603 FS. History–New 4-12-83, Formerly 25-25.03, Amended 

12-24-86, 8-15-90, Repealed___________. 

 

25-25.004 Procurement Organization. 

Rulemaking Authority 350.0603, 350.127(2) FS. Law Implemented 

350.0603, 350.127(3) FS. History–New 4-12-83, Formerly 25-25.04, 

Repealed___________. 

 

25-25.005 Delegation of Authority. 

Rulemaking Authority 350.0603, 350.127(2) FS. Law Implemented 

350.0603 FS. History–New 4-12-83, Formerly 25-25.05, Amended 

12-24-86 Repealed____________. 

 

25-25.006 Formal Bids Required. 

Rulemaking Authority 350.0603, 350.127(2) FS. Law Implemented 

350.0603 FS. History–New 4-12-83, Formerly 25-25.06, Amended 

12-24-86 Repealed__________. 

 

25-25.0061 Purchasing Threshold Amounts and 

Procedures for Automatic Annual Adjustments. 

Rulemaking Authority 350.0603, 350.127(2) FS. Law Implemented 

350.0603 FS. History–New 12-24-86, Amended 6-19-95, 

Repealed__________. 

 

25-25.007 Legal Advertisements. 

Rulemaking Authority 350.0603, 350.127(2) FS. Law Implemented 

350.0603 FS. History–New 4-12-83, Formerly 25-25.07, Amended 

12-24-86, Repealed__________. 

 

25-25.008 Contracts for Class B Printing. 

Rulemaking Authority 350.0603, 350.127(2) FS. Law Implemented 

350.0603 FS. History–New 4-12-83, Formerly 25-25.08, Amended 

12-24-86, Repealed___________. 

 

25-25.009 Source Selection, Bid Openings and Contract 

Awards. 

Rulemaking Authority 350.0603, 350.127(2) FS. Law Implemented 

350.0603 FS. History–New 4-12-83, Formerly 25-25.09, Amended 

12-24-86, 6-19-95, Repealed__________. 

 

25-25.010 Single Source Procurement. 

Rulemaking Authority 350.0603, 350.127(2) FS. Law Implemented 

350.0603 FS. History–New 4-12-83, Formerly 25-25.10, 

Repealed__________. 

 

25-25.011 Emergency Procurement. 

Rulemaking Authority 350.0603, 350.127(2) FS. Law Implemented 

350.0603 FS. History–New 4-12-83, Formerly 25-25.11, 

Repealed____________. 

 

25-25.012 Responsibility of Bidders and Offerors. 

Rulemaking Authority 350.0603, 350.127(2) FS. Law Implemented 

350.0603 FS. History–New 4-12-83, Formerly 25-25.12, 

Repealed___________. 

 

25-25.013 Multi-term Contracts. 

Rulemaking Authority 350.0603, 350.127(2) FS. Law Implemented 

350.0603 FS. History–New 4-12-83, Formerly 25-25.13, 

Repealed___________. 

 

25-25.014 Cancellation Clause. 

Rulemaking Authority 350.0603, 350.127(2) FS. Law Implemented 

350.0603 FS. History–New 4-12-83, Formerly 25-25.14, Amended 

12-24-86, Repealed_____________. 

 

25-25.015 Installment Sale and Purchase Contracts. 

Rulemaking Authority 350.0603, 350.127(2) FS. Law Implemented 

350.0603 FS. History–New 4-12-83, Formerly 25-25.15, 

Repealed___________. 

 

25-25.016 Exemptions from Competitive Bid 

Requirements. 

Rulemaking Authority 350.0603, 350.127(2) FS. Law Implemented 

350.0603 FS. History–New 4-12-83, Formerly 25-25.16, Amended 

12-24-86, 6-19-95, Repealed___________. 

 

25-25.017 Bid Borrowing. 

Rulemaking Authority 350.0603, 350.127(2) FS. Law Implemented 

350.0603 FS. History–New 4-12-83, Formerly 25-25.17, Amended 

12-24-86, Repealed__________. 

 

mailto:aharper@psc.state.fl.us


Florida Administrative Register Volume 48, Number 152, August 5, 2022 

3129 

 

25-25.018 Use of the Terms “or equivalent” and “no 

substitute.” 

Rulemaking Authority 350.0603, 350.127(2) FS. Law Implemented 

350.0603 FS. History–New 4-12-83, Formerly 25-25.18, 

Repealed____________. 

 

25-25.019 Purchases Not Requiring Formal Bids. 

Rulemaking Authority 350.0603, 350.127(2) FS. Law Implemented 

350.0603 FS. History–New 4-12-83, Formerly 25-25.19, Amended 

12-24-86, Repealed__________. 

 

25-25.020 Determinations. 

Rulemaking Authority 350.0603, 350.127(2) FS. Law Implemented 

350.0603 FS. History–New 4-12-83, Formerly 25-25.20, 

Repealed__________. 

 

25-25.021 Protest of Commission Decision. 

Rulemaking Authority 350.0603, 350.127(2) FS. Law Implemented 

350.0603 FS. History–New 4-12-83, Formerly 25-25.21, 

Repealed__________. 

 

25-25.022 Acquisition of Printing, Duplicating and 

Reproduction Equipment. 

Rulemaking Authority 350.0603, 350.127(2) FS. Law Implemented 

350.0603 FS. History–New 4-12-83, Formerly 25-25.22, 

Repealed_________. 

 

25-25.023 Vendors and Suppliers. 

Rulemaking Authority 350.0603, 350.127(2) FS. Law Implemented 

350.0603 FS. History–New 4-12-83, Formerly 25-25.23, Amended 

12-24-86, Repealed________. 

 

25-25.024 Contractual Services. 

Rulemaking Authority 350.0603, 350.127(2) FS. Law Implemented 

350.0603 FS. History–New 4-12-83, Formerly 25-24.24, Amended 

12-24-86, Repealed_________. 

 

25-25.025 Minority Business Companies. 

Rulemaking Authority 350.0603, 350.127(2) FS. Law Implemented 

350.0603 FS. History–New 4-12-83, Formerly 25-25.25, 

Repealed__________.\ 

 

25-25.030 Leases for Real Property. 

Rulemaking Authority 350.0603, 350.127(2) FS. Law Implemented 

350.0603 FS. History–New 8-15-90, Repealed_________. 

 

NAME OF PERSON ORIGINATING PROPOSED RULE: 

Adria Harper 

NAME OF AGENCY HEAD WHO APPROVED THE 

PROPOSED RULE: Florida Public Service Commission 

DATE PROPOSED RULE APPROVED BY AGENCY 

HEAD: August 2, 2022 

DEPARTMENT OF FINANCIAL SERVICES 

Division of Funeral, Cemetery, and Consumer Services 

RULE NOS.: RULE TITLES:  

69K-10.001 Preneed Funeral Contract Consumer 

Protection Trust Fund 

69K-10.003 Remittances to the Preneed Funeral Contract 

Consumer Protection Trust Fund 

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The proposed rulemaking will 

clarify how stakeholders make remittances to the Preneed 

Funeral Contract Consumer Trust Fund. The amendment 

references the Online Quarterly Preneed Remittance System as 

the new system to make required remittances. 

SUMMARY: The rule amendment updates how stakeholders 

make remittances to the Preneed Funeral Contract Consumer 

Trust Fund. 

SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF ESTIMATED 

REGULATORY COSTS AND LEGISLATIVE 

RATIFICATION:  

The Agency has determined that this will not have an adverse 

impact on small business or likely increase directly or indirectly 

regulatory costs in excess of $200,000 in the aggregate within 

one year after the implementation of the rule. A SERC has not 

been prepared by the Agency.  

The Agency has determined that the proposed rule is not 

expected to require legislative ratification based on the 

statement of estimated regulatory costs or if no SERC is 

required, the information expressly relied upon and described 

herein: The Department’s economic review for this rulemaking. 

Any person who wishes to provide information regarding a 

statement of estimated regulatory costs, or provide a proposal 

for a lower cost regulatory alternative must do so in writing 

within 21 days of this notice. 

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 497.103, 497.141, 497.161, 

497.456, 497.464 FS. 

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 497.103, 497.141, 497.161, 497.456, 

497.458, 497.462, 497.464 FS. 

IF REQUESTED WITHIN 21 DAYS OF THE DATE OF THIS 

NOTICE, A HEARING WILL BE SCHEDULED AND 

ANNOUNCED IN THE FAR. 

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE 

PROPOSED RULE IS: Ellen Simon, Assistant Director, 

Department of Financial Services, Division of Funeral, 

Cemetery, and Consumer Services, (850)413-4985. 

 

THE FULL TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE IS:  

 

69K-10.001 Preneed Funeral Contract Consumer 

Protection Trust Fund. 

The amounts required to be remitted by a preneed licensee 

to the Preneed Funeral Contract Consumer Protection Trust 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=69
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=369
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=69K-10.001
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=69K-10.003
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=497.103
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20497.141
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20497.161
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20497.456
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20497.464%20FS.
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=497.103
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20497.141
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20497.161
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20497.456
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20497.458
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20497.462
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20497.464%20FS.


Florida Administrative Register Volume 48, Number 152, August 5, 2022 

 

3130 

Fund, pursuant to the provisions of section 497.456, F.S., shall 

be determined in accordance with the following criteria: 

(1) through (6) No change. 

(7) All remittances to the Preneed Funeral Contract 

Consumer Trust Fund must be electronically completed and 

submitted to the Department on a quarterly basis following the 

process described in Rule 69K-5.0024, F.A.C. for quarterly 

preneed remittances as provided in Rule 69K-10.003, 

F.A.C.shall be sent with the Quarterly Remittance Invoice. This 

form, DFS-N1-2013, is incorporated by reference in rule 69K-

1.001, F.A.C., and shall be available from the Department of 

Financial Services, Division of Funeral, Cemetery, and 

Consumer Services, 200 East Gaines Street, Tallahassee, 

Florida 32399-0361. Checks should be made payable to the 

Department of Financial Services. Remittances should be 

submitted to the board office within 60 days following a 

calendar quarter. 

(8) through (9) No change. 

Rulemaking Authority 497.103, 497.141, 497.456(3) FS. Law 

Implemented 497.103, 497.141, 497.456, 497.141 FS. History–New 5-

23-94, Amended 10-26-00, Formerly 3F-10.001, Amended 3-7-

16,__________. 

 

69K-10.003 Remittances to the Preneed Funeral 

Contract Consumer Protection Trust Fund. 

(1) No change. 

(2) Quarterly preneed remittances shall be made by 

preneed licensees in the following manner: using Department 

form DFS-N1-2013, “Quarterly Preneed Remittance Invoice,” 

as incorporated by reference in rule 69K-1.001, F.A.C.  

(a) Servicing agents must follow the procedures in Form 

DFS-PNS-1, User Manual for Servicing Agents for the Preneed 

Remittance System (PNRS), which is incoporated by reference 

in Rule 69K-5.0024, F.A.C. 

(b) Appointing agents and third-party users must follow the 

procedures in Form DFS-PNS-2, User Manual for Appointing 

Entity Users for the Preneed Remittance System (PNRS), which 

is incorporated by reference in Rule 69K-5.0024, F.A.C. 

Rulemaking Authority 497.103, 497.141, 497.161, 497.456(13), 

497.464 FS. Law Implemented 497.103, 497.141, 497.161, 497.456, 

497.458, 497.462, 497.464 FS. History–New 3-19-97, Amended 8-2-

01, Formerly 3F-10.003, Amended 6-7-10, 9-20-18,__________. 

 

NAME OF PERSON ORIGINATING PROPOSED RULE: 

Mary Schwantes, Director, Division of Funeral, Cemetery, and 

Consumer Services 

NAME OF AGENCY HEAD WHO APPROVED THE 

PROPOSED RULE: Jimmy Patronis, Chief Financial Officer 

DATE PROPOSED RULE APPROVED BY AGENCY 

HEAD: August 02, 2022 

DATE NOTICE OF PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT 

PUBLISHED IN FAR: January 16, 2019 

Section III 

Notice of Changes, Corrections and 

Withdrawals 

NONE 

Section IV 

Emergency Rules 

NONE 

Section V 

Petitions and Dispositions Regarding Rule 

Variance or Waiver 

NONE 

Section VI 

Notice of Meetings, Workshops and Public 

Hearings 

DEPARTMENT OF LEGAL AFFAIRS 

The Department of Legal Affairs announces a public meeting 

to which all persons are invited. 

DATES AND TIMES: August 22, 2022, 10:00 a.m. – 3:00 

p.m.; August 23, 2022, 10:00 a.m. – 3:00 p.m.; August 24, 

2022, 10:00 a.m. – 3:00 p.m.; August 25, 2022, 10:00 a.m. – 

3:00 p.m.; August 26, 2022, 10:00 a.m. – 3:00 p.m. 

PLACE: Via Gotowebinar originating in Tallahassee; contact 

Kairi Sisask for more information at (850)414-3500. 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

Florida New Motor Vehicle Arbitration Board, 2022 Board 

member Training (Gotowebinar). The same single-day 

presentation will be presented each day. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Kairi 

Sisask at (850)414-3500. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 3 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Kairi Sisask at (850)414-3500. If you are hearing or 

speech impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida 

Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 

(Voice). 

For more information, you may contact: Kairi Sisask at 

(850)414-3500. 

https://flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=2


Florida Administrative Register Volume 48, Number 152, August 5, 2022 

3131 

 

DEPARTMENT OF LEGAL AFFAIRS 

The Department of Legal Affairs announces a public meeting 

to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: Thursday, August 18, 2022, 10:00 a.m. – 

1:00 p.m. 

PLACE: Via Webinar originating in Tallahassee; contact Kairi 

Sisask at (850)414-3500 for more information. 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

Florida New Motor Vehicle Arbitration Board, 2022 New 

Board Member Training (Webinar) 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Kairi 

Sisask at (850)414-3500. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 3 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: If you are hearing or speech impaired, please 

contact the agency using the Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-

8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice). 

For more information, you may contact: Kairi Sisask at 

(850)414-3500. 

DEPARTMENT OF AGRICULTURE AND CONSUMER 

SERVICES 

Division of Administration 

The Florida Agricultural Museum announces a public meeting 

to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: Monday, August 15, 2022, 10:00 a.m. 

PLACE: Legacy Lodge in Princess Place, 2500 Princess Place 

Road, Palm Coast, FL 32137 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: The 

Florida Agricultural Museum will conduct a meeting of the 

Board of Trustees to discuss general business. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Kara 

Hoblick at (386)446-7630 or 

kara.hoblick@floridaagmuseum.org. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 2 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Kara Hoblick at (386)446-7630 or 

kara.hoblick@floridaagmuseum.org. If you are hearing or 

speech impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida 

Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 

(Voice). 

For more information, you may contact: Kara Hoblick at 

(386)446-7630 or kara.hoblick@floridaagmuseum.org. 

DEPARTMENT OF AGRICULTURE AND CONSUMER 

SERVICES 

Division of Administration 

The Florida Agricultural Museum Board of Trustees announces 

a public meeting to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: September 2, 2022, 10:00 a.m. – 4:00 p.m. 

PLACE: UF/IFAS Extension Center, Putnam County, 111 

Yelvington Rd., Suite 1, East Palatka, FL 32131. 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: The 

Florida Agricultural Museum Board of Trustees will meet to 

conduct a Strategic Planning Session. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Kara 

Hoblick at (386)446-7630 or 

kara.hoblick@floridaagmuseum.org. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 2 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Kara Hoblick at (386)446-7630 or 

kara.hoblick@floridaagmuseum.org. If you are hearing or 

speech impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida 

Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 

(Voice). 

For more information, you may contact: Kara Hoblick at 

(386)446-7630 or kara.hoblick@floridaagmuseum.org. 

DEPARTMENT OF EDUCATION 

Division of Florida Colleges 

The Florida State College at Jacksonville (FSCJ) District Board 

of Trustees (DBOT) announce the following (UPDATE 

previous notice, FAR Volume 48, Issue 151) campus tour for 

Monday, August 8, 2022, which is open to the public.  

DATE: Monday, August 8, 2022 

PLACE:  FSCJ Cecil Center Campus, 5640 POW-MIA 

Memorial Parkway, Jacksonville, FL 32221  

CAMPUS TOUR: 

TIME:  1:30 p.m. – 3:30 p.m.   

PLACE:  Cecil Center Campus 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED:  

Tour of Cecil Center Campus  

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to attend the 

tour is asked to advise the agency at least 24 hours before the 

tour by contacting: The Office of the College President (OCP) 

Administration Support Manager Kimberli Sodek at 

904.632.3205 or Kim.Sodek@fscj.edu. If you are hearing or 

speech impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida 

Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 

(Voice). 

Florida State College at Jacksonville does not discriminate 

against any person on the basis of race, disability, color, 

ethnicity, national origin, religion, gender, age, sex, sexual 

orientation/expression, marital status, veteran status, pregnancy 

or genetic information in its programs, activities and 

https://flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=2
https://flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=5
https://flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=5
https://flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=161
https://flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=5
https://flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=5
https://flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=161
https://flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=6
https://flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=212
mailto:Kim.Sodek@fscj.edu


Florida Administrative Register Volume 48, Number 152, August 5, 2022 

 

3132 

employment. For more information, visit FSCJ’s Equal 

Access/Equal Opportunity page.  

For more information, you may contact: Kimberli Sodek, OCP 

Administration Support Manager at (904)632.3205 or 

Kim.Sodek@fscj.edu. 

 

PUBLIC SERVICE COMMISSION 

The Florida Public Service Commission announces its Internal 

Affairs Meeting, to which all interested persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: Tuesday, August 16, 2022, immediately 

following the Hearing which commences at 9:30 a.m. in Joseph 

P. Cresse Hearing Room 148 

PLACE: Room 148, Betty Easley Conference Center, 4075 

Esplanade Way, Tallahassee, Florida 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: To 

discuss and make decisions on matters affecting Commission 

operations. Internal Affairs Agendas and FPSC contact 

information is available at www.floridapsc.com 

ADA: In accordance with the Americans with Disabilities Act, 

persons needing a special accommodation to participate at this 

proceeding should contact the Office of Commission Clerk no 

later than five days prior to the conference at 2540 Shumard 

Oak Boulevard, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-0850 or (850)413-

6770 (Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8770 Voice or 

1(800)955-8771 TDD). Assistive Listening Devices are 

available upon request from the Office of Commission Clerk, 

Gerald L. Gunter Building, Room 152. 

EMERGENCY CANCELLATION OF MEETING: If a named 

storm or other disaster requires cancellation of the meeting, 

Commission staff will attempt to give timely notice. Notice of 

cancellation will be provided on the Commission’s website 

(www.floridapsc.com) under the Hot Topics link on the home 

page. Cancellation can also be confirmed by calling the Office 

of Commission Clerk at (850)413-6770. 

DEPARTMENT OF CORRECTIONS 

The Florida Department of Corrections announces a public 

meeting to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: Tuesday, August 16, 2022, 10:00 a.m. 

PLACE: Reception and Medical Center (Training Building), 

7765 south County Road 231 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

Notice of Meeting/Workshop Hearing. Department of 

Corrections. 

Regular Quarterly Meeting of the RMC Hospital Governing 

Body. A portion of the meeting governed by Sections 

945.6032(3) and 766.101(7)(a), F.S., is to be closed to the 

public to allow the RMCH Governing Body to discuss 

information that is confidential and exempt from public 

meetings and public records. This portion of the meeting will 

be announced at the meeting. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Colby 

Elwood at (386)496-7204 or celwood@TemaCenturion.com. It 

may also be obtained at the following link: 

http://www.dc.state.fl.us/ci/docs/RMC_Agenda_081622.pdf. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 3 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Colby Elwood at (386)496-7204 or 

celwood@TeamCenturion.com. If you are hearing or speech 

impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida Relay 

Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice). 

DEPARTMENT OF MANAGEMENT SERVICES 

Division of Purchasing 

The Department of Management Services announces a public 

meeting to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: October 11, 2022, 2:00 p.m. 

PLACE: Department of Management Services, 4050 Esplanade 

Way, Conf. Room 101, Tallahassee, FL 32399 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: The 

Florida Department of Management Services (DMS) will 

conduct a public meeting for Invitation to Negotiate Nos.: 

DMS-22/23-072, entitled "TPA Services for HMO Health 

Insurance" and DMS-22/23-073, entitled "TPA Services for 

PPO Health Insurance". 

The purpose of the meeting is to open and record Replies 

received for the above ITNs. 

Any changes or additional meeting(s) will be posted on the 

Vendor Information Portal (VIP) in accordance with Section 

287.042(3), Florida Statutes. Access the VIP at 

https://vendor.myfloridamarketplace.com/. 

DMS will not re-advertise any notice in the Florida 

Administrative Register (FAR). 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: 

dms.purchasing@dms.fl.gov. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 5 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: dms.purchasing@dms.fl.gov. If you are hearing or 

speech impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida 

Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 

(Voice). 

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH 

Board of Dentistry 

The Board of Dentistry announces a telephone conference call 

to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: September 9, 2022, 9:00 a.m. 

PLACE: 1(888)585-9008 when prompted, enter conference 

room number 599196982# 

mailto:Kim.Sodek@fscj.edu
https://flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=25
http://www.floridapsc.com/
http://www/
https://flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=33
https://flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=60
https://flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=220
https://flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=64
https://flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=328


Florida Administrative Register Volume 48, Number 152, August 5, 2022 

3133 

 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

Probable Cause Panel with reconsiderations. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: 

www.floridasdentistry.gov. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 7 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: (850)245-4474. If you are hearing or speech 

impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida Relay 

Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice). 

If any person decides to appeal any decision made by the Board 

with respect to any matter considered at this meeting or hearing, 

he/she will need to ensure that a verbatim record of the 

proceeding is made, which record includes the testimony and 

evidence from which the appeal is to be issued. 

For more information, you may contact: (850)245-4474. 

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH 

Division of Emergency Preparedness and Community Support 

The FL Department of Health, Bureau of Emergency Medical 

Oversight's Brain and Spinal Cord Injury Program announces a 

public meeting to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: Friday, August 26, 2022, 2:00 p.m. – 3:00 

p.m. ET 

PLACE: Via Webinar and Conference Call via Microsoft 

Teams: https://teams.microsoft.com/l/meetup-

join/19%3ameeting_YTEyNTZmYTQtNDI4OC00YWRiLWJ

lMmMtYjNlNWFiMjcxM2Rm%40thread.v2/0?context=%7b

%22Tid%22%3a%2228cd8f80-3c44-4b27-81a0-

cd2b03a31b8d%22%2c%22Oid%22%3a%2294c1885c-fcda-

49db-835c-f471ab38cdac%22%7d 

Meeting ID: 221 899 906 657, Passcode: b4SBX4 

Join with a video conferencing device: 

teams@meetme.flhealth.gov, Video Conference ID: 111 709 

846 5 

Or call in (audio only): (850)792-1375, 18880169# United 

States, Tallahassee, Phone Conference ID: 188 801 69# 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

BSCIP Advisory Council Performance/Quality Improvement 

Committee Meeting to conduct the general business of the 

Brain and Spinal Cord Injury Advisory Council. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Robert 

Pfister by email: Robert.Pfister@flhealth.gov, or by phone: 

(407)488-4322. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 7 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Robert Pfister by email: 

Robert.Pfister@flhealth.gov, or by phone: (407)488-4322. If 

you are hearing or speech impaired, please contact the agency 

using the Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 

1(800)955-8770 (Voice). 

For more information, you may contact: Robert Pfister by 

email: Robert.Pfister@flhealth.gov, or by phone: (407)488-

4322. 

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH 

Division of Emergency Preparedness and Community Support 

The FL Department of Health, Bureau of Emergency Medical 

Oversight's Brain and Spinal Cord Injury Program announces a 

public meeting to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: Thursday, August 25, 2022, 1:00 p.m. – 

2:00 p.m. ET 

PLACE: Via Webinar and Conference Call: 

https://teams.microsoft.com/l/meetup-

join/19%3ameeting_OGQ2OTgxYTQtOGJmNS00YmI0LWJl

NTEtMzE5MDE4MWYyOWY3%40thread.v2/0?context=%7

b%22Tid%22%3a%2228cd8f80-3c44-4b27-81a0-

cd2b03a31b8d%22%2c%22Oid%22%3a%2294c1885c-fcda-

49db-835c-f471ab38cdac%22%7d 

Meeting ID: 236 065 962 419, Passcode: UNYEKY 

Join with a video conferencing device: 

teams@meetme.flhealth.gov, Video Conference ID: 117 725 

636 8 

Or call in (audio only): (850)792-1375, 267047921# United 

States, Tallahassee, Phone Conference ID: 267 047 921# 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

BSCIP Advisory Council Public Awareness Committee 

Meeting to conduct general business of the Brain and Spinal 

Cord Injury Advisory Council. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Kimberly 

Robinson by email: Kimberly Robinson@flhealth.gov, or by 

phone: (850)245-4967. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 7 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Kimberly Robinson by email: Kimberly 

Robinson@flhealth.gov, or by phone: (850)245-4967. If you 

are hearing or speech impaired, please contact the agency using 

the Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 

1(800)955-8770 (Voice). 

For more information, you may contact: Kimberly Robinson by 

email: Kimberly Robinson@flhealth.gov, or by phone: 

(850)245-4967. 

DEPARTMENT OF CHILDREN AND FAMILIES 

Substance Abuse Program 

RULE NOS.: RULE TITLES: 

65D-30.0033 License Types 

65D-30.0036 Licensure Application and Renewal 

https://flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=64
https://flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=832
https://flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=64
https://flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=832
https://flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=65
https://flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=343
https://flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=65D-30.0033
https://flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=65D-30.0036


Florida Administrative Register Volume 48, Number 152, August 5, 2022 

 

3134 

The Department of Children and Families announces a hearing 

to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: August 15, 2022, 11:00 a.m. 

PLACE: Join Zoom Meeting: 

https://us06web.zoom.us/j/83112234081?pwd=WVhicSsxbDl

qakRnQWxtRUZ5YVUvdz09  

Meeting ID: 831 1223 4081, Passcode: 235803  

One tap mobile: 

+16469313860,,83112234081#,,,,*235803# US  

+13017158592,,83112234081#,,,,*235803# US (Washington 

DC)  

Dial by your location: 

(646)931-3860 US 

(301)715-8592 US (Washington DC) 

(312)626-6799 US (Chicago) 

(646)558-8656 US (New York) 

(564)217-2000 US 

(669)444-9171 US 

(720)707-2699 US (Denver) 

(253)215-8782 US (Tacoma) 

(346)248-7799 US (Houston) 

(386)347-5053 US 

Meeting ID: 831 1223 4081, Passcode: 235803  

Find your local number: 

https://us06web.zoom.us/u/kcdAqXzXiK 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

Public comments and questions about proposed rules. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Elizabeth 

Floyd at Elizabeth.Floyd@myflfamilies.com. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 5 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Elizabeth Floyd at 

Elizabeth.Floyd@myflfamilies.com. If you are hearing or 

speech impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida 

Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 

(Voice). 

DEPARTMENT OF ECONOMIC OPPORTUNITY 

Division of Community Development 

RULE NOS.: RULE TITLES: 

73C-50.001 Definitions 

73C-50.002 Forms 

73C-50.003 Application Requirements and Process 

73C-50.004 Application Review 

73C-50.005 Application Challenge Process 

73C-50.006 Evaluation Criteria 

73C-50.007 Grant Awards 

73C-50.008 Reporting 

73C-50.009 Grant Closeout 

The Division of Community Development Office of Broadband 

announces a workshop to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: August 22, 2022, 3:00 p.m. – 6:00 p.m. 

PLACE: Stuart Center, UF/IFAS Extension Office, Polk 

County, 1702 South Hollard Pkwy, Bartow, FL 33830 

DATE AND TIME: August 25, 2022, 3:00 p.m. – 6:00 p.m. 

PLACE: UF/IFAS Extension Office, Santa Rosa County, 6263 

Dogwood Drive, Milton, FL 32570 

DATE AND TIME: August 29, 2022, 3:00 p.m. – 6:00 p.m. 

PLACE: Doyle Conner Building, UF/IFAS Extension Office, 

Glades County, 900 US Highway 27 SW, Moore Haven, FL 

33471 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: The 

purpose of the workshops is to allow public comment and input 

on the development of rules to implement the Florida 

Broadband Opportunity Program, sections 288.9961 and 

288.9962, F.S. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Kiwanis 

Curry, Office of Broadband, Florida Department of Economic 

Opportunity, 107 East Madison Street, Tallahassee, FL 32399, 

Broadband@deo.myflorida.com. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 5 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Broadband@deo.myflorida.com. If you are hearing 

or speech impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida 

Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 

(Voice). 

For more information, you may contact: Kiwanis Curry, Office 

of Broadband, Florida Department of Economic Opportunity, 

107 East Madison Street, Tallahassee, FL 32399, 

Broadband@deo.myflorida.com. 

QUINCY-GADSDEN AIRPORT AUTHORITY 

The Quincy-Gadsden Airport Authority announces a public 

meeting to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: Monday, August 15, 2022, 5:30 p.m. ET 

PLACE: Quincy Municipal Airport Terminal Conference 

Room, 1300 Airport Drive, Quincy, FL 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: To 

hold the regular monthly meeting of the Quincy-Gadsden 

Airport Authority 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Janice 

Watson, QGAA Administrator, P.O. Box 1905 Quincy, FL 

32353, quincyairport@tds.net or (850)643-7752. 

FLORIDA SPORTS FOUNDATION 

The Florida Sports Foundation, Inc. announces a public 

meeting to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: Wednesday, September 28, 2022, 9:00 

a.m. 

https://flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=73
https://flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=1066
https://flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=73C-50.001
https://flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=73C-50.002
https://flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=73C-50.003
https://flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=73C-50.004
https://flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=73C-50.005
https://flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=73C-50.006
https://flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=73C-50.007
https://flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=73C-50.008
https://flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=73C-50.009
https://flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=1335
https://flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=690


Florida Administrative Register Volume 48, Number 152, August 5, 2022 

3135 

 

PLACE: Art Ovation Hotel, 1255 N. Palm Avenue, Sarasota, 

FL 34236 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

Quarterly Board of Directors Meeting 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: 

jhightower@playinflorida.com. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 7 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: jhightower@playinflorida.com. If you are hearing 

or speech impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida 

Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 

(Voice). 

If any person decides to appeal any decision made by the Board 

with respect to any matter considered at this meeting or hearing, 

he/she will need to ensure that a verbatim record of the 

proceeding is made, which record includes the testimony and 

evidence from which the appeal is to be issued. 

For more information, you may contact: 

jhightower@playinflorida.com. 

THE CORRADINO GROUP, INC. 

The Florida Department of Transportation (FDOT) District 

Four announces a public meeting to which all persons are 

invited. 

DATES AND TIMES: Wednesday, August 17, 2022, Virtual 

Public Meeting, 5:00 p.m. – 6:00 p.m.; Wednesday, August 17, 

2022, In-person Construction Open House, 6:00 p.m. – 7:00 

p.m. 

The Virtual Public Meeting is scheduled for Wednesday, 

August 17, 2022, 5:00 p.m. – 6:00 p.m. Please use the following 

link to register: https://bit.ly/LakeWorthRd-VPM or (562)247-

8422; Access Code: 213-472-897. A brief presentation 

followed by questions and comments will be held from 5:00 

p.m. – 5:30 p.m., and again from 5:30 p.m. – 6:00 p.m. Please 

note that questions and comments may be submitted via online 

chat for the project team to address directly. 

The In-person Construction Open House is scheduled for 

Wednesday, August 17, 2022, 6:00 p.m. – 7:00 p.m. at the Palm 

Beach State College Continuing Education Building, Room CE 

119 located at 4200 South Congress Avenue, Lake Worth, FL 

33461. This meeting will have an informal open house format, 

with project representatives available to answer questions and 

address comments at any time during the meeting. 

PLACE: Palm Beach State College, Continuing Education 

Building, Room CE 119, 4200 South Congress Avenue, Lake 

Worth, FL 33461 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

Financial Management No.: 441632-1-52-01 

Project Description: State Road (SR) 802/Lake Worth Road 

Improvements Project in Palm Beach County 

Project improvements include Constructing a new exclusive 

right turn lane from eastbound Lake Worth Road into the Mid-

County Senior Center, installing new seven-foot bike lanes with 

upgraded safety features, milling and resurfacing Lake Worth 

Road in both directions, replacing underground Palm Beach 

County utilities throughout the project limits, improving 

sidewalk and driveways on both sides of Lake Worth Road, 

modifying medians to improve motorist safety, improving 

signalized intersections and pedestrian crossings, and installing 

new signage, pavement markings, and lighting. Construction 

will occur in phases to minimize impacts to the traveling public. 

Lane closures will not occur from 3:30 p.m. – 7:30 p.m., 

Monday through Sunday. One lane in each direction will 

remain open at all times. Active work areas will be limited to 

the listed segments to minimize public impact: Raulerson Drive 

to Kirk Road, Kirk Road to Davis Road, Davis Road to S 

Congress Avenue, and S Congress Avenue to Palm Beach State 

College Entrance. Driveway and street access will be 

maintained at all times. 

Construction will begin August 2022 and is estimated to be 

completed in summer 2024. The estimated construction cost is 

$14 million. 

Public participation is solicited without regard to race, color, 

national origin, age, sex, religion, disability, or family status. 

Persons who require translation services (free of charge) should 

contact Khosrow Gandjei, E.I., FDOT Construction Project 

Manager, at (561)531-3877 or by email at 

khosrow.gandjei@dot.state.fl.us. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: No 

agenda 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 7 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Khosrow Gandjei, E.I., FDOT Construction Project 

Manager, at (561)531-3877 or by email at 

khosrow.gandjei@dot.state.fl.us. If you are hearing or speech 

impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida Relay 

Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice). 

For more information, you may contact: Melissa Readling, 

Community Outreach Specialist, at (772)577-8803 or by email 

at mreadling@corradino.com. 

https://flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=1048


Florida Administrative Register Volume 48, Number 152, August 5, 2022 

 

3136 

Section VII 

Notice of Petitions and Dispositions 

Regarding Declaratory Statements 

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 

REGULATION 

Florida Real Estate Commission 

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that the Florida Real Estate 

Commission has received the petition for declaratory statement 

from Carl Eldred, Esquire, on behalf of Joined Development 

Partners LLC and Joined Management Services LLC, filed on 

August 3, 2022.The petition seeks the agency's opinion as to the 

applicability of 475.011(2) and (4), Florida Statutes, as it 

applies to the petitioner. 

Petitioner seeks a Declaratory Statement requesting that the 

Florida Real Estate Commission determine whether Joined 

Development Partners LLC, Joined Management Services 

LLC, their subsidiaries and affiliated companies, including 

Buena Vista Apartments LLC, and their on-site salaried 

employees, are required to hold a Florida real estate broker or 

agent license in order to lease, manage, and operate property 

owned by Joint Development Partners LLC, its subsidiaries, or 

its affiliated companies, because no commission will be paid in 

relation thereto. Except for good cause shown, motions for 

leave to intervene must be filed within 21 days after the 

publication of this notice. 

A copy of the Petition for Declaratory Statement may be 

obtained by contacting: Giuvanna Corona, Executive Director, 

Florida Real Estate Commission, 400 W. Robinson Street, 

#N801, Orlando, FL 32801, 

Giuvanna.Corona@myfloridalicense.com. 

Section VIII 

Notice of Petitions and Dispositions 

Regarding the Validity of Rules 

Notice of Petition for Administrative Determination has been 

filed with the Division of Administrative Hearings on the 

following rules: 

NONE 

Notice of Disposition of Petition for Administrative 

Determination has been filed with the Division of 

Administrative Hearings on the following rules: 

NONE 

Section IX 

Notice of Petitions and Dispositions 

Regarding Non-rule Policy Challenges 

NONE 

Section X 

Announcements and Objection Reports of 

the Joint Administrative Procedures 

Committee 

NONE 

Section XI 

Notices Regarding Bids, Proposals and 

Purchasing 

DEPARTMENT OF EDUCATION 

University of Florida 

Notice of Bid 

NOTICE OF BID 

University of Florida Procurement Services will receive sealed 

bids for ITB23KO-105, Reitz Lawn and Inner Road Utility and 

Roadway Improvements. A Mandatory Pre-bid Meeting will be 

held on August 16, 2022, 12:00 Noon. Contractor questions and 

requests for clarification are due August 23, 2022, 5:00 p.m. 

Bids are due September 8, 2022, 3:00 p.m. All questions can be 

directed to Karen Olitsky, Procurement Agent III, at 

kolitsk@ufl.edu. For bid documents and all other information 

visit https://procurement.ufl.edu/vendors/schedule-of-bids/. 

SARASOTA COUNTY PUBLIC HOSPITAL BOARD 

REQUEST FOR QUALIFICATIONS FOR PROFESSIONAL 

CONTINUING ARCHITECTURAL SERVICES FOR 

SARASOTA MEMORIAL HEALTH CARE SYSTEM 

[SMHCS] 

The Sarasota County Public Hospital District d/b/a Sarasota 

Memorial Hospital and its governing board (collectively, “the 

Hospital”), located in Sarasota County, Florida, announces that 

continuing professional services are required for the following 

discipline: Architect, minimum of three (3), with the ability to 

service the Sarasota Memorial Health Care System (SMHCS). 

These services may be used for projects anywhere in the 

buildings and spaces owned or operated by SMHCS throughout 

Sarasota County. 

PROJECT DESCRIPTION:  Projects included in the scope of 

this agreement will be specific projects for renovations, 

alterations, new construction, and additions for SMHCS 

https://flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=283
https://flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=6
https://flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=198
mailto:kolitsk@ufl.edu
https://procurement.ufl.edu/vendors/schedule-of-bids/
https://flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=1112


Florida Administrative Register Volume 48, Number 152, August 5, 2022 

3137 

 

facilities that have a construction budget that does not exceed 

$4,000,000.00 or survey or studies for which the fee for 

professional services that does not exceed $500,000.00. 

Design and document services required may include 

architectural programming, schematic design, design 

development, construction documents, and construction 

administration services. Projects for SMHCS facilities may 

include clinical and non-clinical spaces. 

Continuing Service contracts for these projects provide that the 

Consultant will be available on an as-needed basis for a period 

of not less than three (3) years.  This selection is based upon 

architectural services only.  Other services (including 

mechanical, electrical, and construction management, etc.) that 

may be required for specific projects may be provided under as 

separate agreement with those consultants, however, as part of 

basic services, the selected Architect may be asked to provide 

the services of sub-consultants, including mechanical, 

electrical, structural, fire protection, plumbing, and other 

construction-related engineering services, based upon specific 

project need. An Architect receiving the award will not have an 

exclusive contract to perform services for all SMHCS projects. 

The Sarasota Memorial Health Care System may have 

additional continuing service professionals under contract 

during the same time period. 

Blanket professional liability insurance in the amount of 

$1,000,000.00 shall be required for the contract. Services 

required to be provided under the Continuing Service Contracts 

include the development of record drawings by the Continuing 

Service Consultant for projects designed by that Architect to 

reflect as-built conditions to facilitate the SMHCS space 

management program.  Submittal of as-built CAD drawings for 

use by the Owner in management, maintenance, and Agency-

required documents (e.g.: life safety plans) at the conclusion of 

each project or project phase shall be included as part of basic 

services and will not be considered as an additional service. 

The Architect contract shall be in compliance with the selection 

provisions in Section 287.055, Florida Statues. It is the Sarasota 

Memorial Health Care System’s responsibility to negotiate a 

fair, competitive and reasonable compensation per Section 

287.055, Florida Statutes. A fair, competitive and reasonable 

compensation shall be evaluated based upon the following 

information: (1) Compensation on similar projects; (2) other 

compensation reference data; and (3) after approval of the 

ranking, proposals requested from the selected firms based 

upon an hourly/unit costs for services document to be provided 

at the time of negotiations. 

INSTRUCTIONS: 

Firms interested in being considered as candidates are required 

to submit ten (10) bound statements of qualifications that 

include at least the following data, to be organized in the 

following order: 

1.          A copy of current/valid Florida Architecture licensure 

and corporate registration certificates. 

2.          Legal entity, Firm and Company Information. 

3.          Proof of General, Professional Liability, and Errors and 

Omissions insurance coverage in the minimum amount of 

$1,000,000 per claim; $1,000,000 annual aggregate. The Firm’s 

insurer(s) shall be rated A- (or better) by A.M. Best. 

4.          Identify, by City and State, the Firm’s office that will 

support this service agreement, and provide the approximate 

distance (miles) from the SMHCS main campus. 

5.          A list of at least three (3) client references consisting of 

name, title, address, telephone number and project name(s) for 

each project specified. Please ensure that your references are 

updated and are willing to reply.  Reference responses are 

mandatory and non-responding references will not be 

considered as valid references. 

6.          Related Experience of the firm, and key individuals: 

Provide past five (5) years of completed healthcare facility 

projects that demonstrate the firm’s experience.  Include related 

experience with Authorities Having Jurisdiction, including 

AHCA, the City of Sarasota, and Sarasota County, Florida.. 

7.          Project Team: Provide the resumes of team members 

assigned to support this service agreement, with all relevant 

licensure and experience information. 

8.          An explanation of how the firm intends to respond 

expeditiously on project matters. 

9.          A separate statement as to whether the firm is a certified 

Minority Business Enterprise. If your firm claims MBE, 

WMBE status, a copy of your firm’s current, valid MBE, 

WMBE certificate is required as part of the submission 

package. 

10.       Doing business: Outline the firm’s approach to 

successful project delivery and quality control. 

 All interested firms are further informed as follows: 

1.          The SMHCS reserves the right to reject any or all 

submittals at any time during this process. 

2.          The basis for selecting candidates includes, but is not 

limited to the firm’s experience with local regulatory agency 

having jurisdiction, AHCA experience, consideration of related 

project experience, qualifications of proposed team design 

criteria experience as stated above, ability to quickly respond, 

and the firm’s proposed project approach. 

3.          The Hospital reserves the right to request additional 

information beyond the data set forth above. 

4.          Questions regarding submissions shall be directed to 

John Salt, (941)917-1802 

5.          Except as specified herein, no person employed by or 

acting on behalf of a firm submitting a proposal may contact 

directly or indirectly the any member of the Sarasota County 

Public Hospital Board or any officers, agents or employees of 

the Sarasota Memorial Health Care System. Violation of this 



Florida Administrative Register Volume 48, Number 152, August 5, 2022 

 

3138 

prohibition may result in the firm’s proposal being rejected and 

the firm being disqualified from the review and selection 

process. 

6.          As required by Section 287.133, Florida Statutes, a 

Consultant may not submit a proposal for this project if it is on 

the convicted vendor list for a public entity crime committed 

within the past 36 months.  The selected Consultant must 

warrant that it will neither utilize the services of, nor contract 

with, any supplier, subcontractor, or Consultant in excess of 

$25,000.00 in connection with this project for a period of 36 

months from the date of their being placed on the convicted 

vendor list. 

Submissions shall be titled: 

Statement of Qualifications for 

ARCHITECTURAL CONTINUING SERVICES 

Sarasota Memorial Health Care System 

1.          Submissions must be received by the SMHCS no later 

than 1:00 PM on Friday, August 26, 2022. Submit statements 

to the attention of John Salt, Director Facility Management, 

Attn: Facility Management, 1700 South Tamiami Trail, 

Sarasota, FL 34239. Submittals received after this deadline will 

remain unopened and available for pick up. 

2.          Only John Salt shall be contacted with regard to this 

Request. No other SMH staff, administrators, or board members 

shall be contacted. Failure to comply could result in immediate 

disqualification. 

3.          Interested persons should contact John Salt at 

(941)917-1802 with any project-related questions. 

4.          The selection committee will meet in a public meeting 

at Sarasota Memorial Hospital’s Waldemere Auditorium, 1700 

S. Tamiami Trail, Sarasota, FL 34239, (ground level entrance), 

at 9:00 a.m. on Wednesday, September 7, 2022, to hear 

presentations, discuss and announce the top three ranked firms 

with whom the Hospital will subsequently engage in contract 

negotiations. If fewer than three (3) Firms respond, the 

Selection Committee will also evaluate current statements of 

qualifications and performance data on file with Hospital, in 

determining which Firm is the most highly qualified to perform 

the required services and announce the top three ranked Firms. 

All interested parties are invited to attend. 

Section XII 

Miscellaneous 

DEPARTMENT OF STATE 

Index of Administrative Rules Filed with the Secretary of State 

Pursuant to subparagraph 120.55(1)(b)6. – 7., F.S., the below 

list of rules were filed in the Office of the Secretary of State 

between 3:00 p.m., Friday, July 29, 2022 and 3:00 p.m., Friday, 

August 5, 2022.  

Rule No. File Date Effective  

Date 

5JER22-2 8/3/2022 8/3/2022 

19-8.010 7/29/2022 8/18/2022 

19-8.028 7/29/2022 8/18/2022 

19-8.029 7/29/2022 8/18/2022 

59G-1.050 8/1/2022 8/21/2022 

61J2-3.008 8/1/2022 8/21/2022 

62S-8.001 8/2/2022 8/22/2022 

62S-8.002 8/2/2022 8/22/2022 

62S-8.003 8/2/2022 8/22/2022 

64B19-11.012 8/2/2022 8/22/2022 

68A-6.004 8/3/2022 8/23/2022 

68A-6.010 8/3/2022 8/23/2022 

68A-6.017 8/3/2022 8/23/2022 

68A-6.0172 8/3/2022 8/23/2022 

68A-9.005 8/3/2022 8/23/2022 

69L-6.007 8/2/2022 8/22/2022 

LIST OF RULES AWAITING LEGISLATIVE 

APPROVAL SECTIONS 120.541(3), 373.139(7) 

AND/OR 373.1391(6), FLORIDA STATUTES 

Rule No. File Date Effective  

Date 

5K-4.020 12/10/2021 **/**/**** 

5K-4.035 12/10/2021 **/**/**** 

5K-4.045 12/10/2021 **/**/**** 

60FF1-5.009 7/21/2016 **/**/**** 

62-6.001 5/10/2022 **/**/**** 

62-600.405 11/16/2021 **/**/**** 

62-600.705 11/16/2021 **/**/**** 

62-600.720 11/16/2021 **/**/**** 

64B8-10.003 12/9/2015 **/**/**** 

65C-9.004 3/31/2022 **/**/**** 

69L-7.020 10/22/2021 **/**/**** 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=1


Florida Administrative Register Volume 48, Number 152, August 5, 2022 

3139 

 

64B8-10.003 12/9/2015 **/**/**** 

 

DEPARTMENT OF HIGHWAY SAFETY AND MOTOR 

VEHICLES 

Division of Motor Vehicles 

Establishment of Riva Motorsports Miami Inc., line-make 

CFHG 

Notice of Publication for a New Point 

Franchise Motor Vehicle Dealer in a County of More 

than 300,000 Population 

Pursuant to section 320.642, Florida Statutes, notice is given 

that CF Moto Powersports, Inc., intends to allow the 

establishment of Riva Motorsports Miami Inc., as a dealership 

for the sale of motorcycles manufactured by Chunfeng Holding 

Group Co, Ltd. (line-make CFHG) at 11995 Southwest 222 

Street, Miami, (Miami-Dade County), Florida 33170, on or 

after September 4, 2022. 

The name and address of the dealer operator(s) and principal 

investor(s) of Riva Motorsports Miami Inc. are dealer 

operator(s): Shane Buchanan, 11995 Southwest 222nd Street, 

Miami, Florida 33170; principal investor(s): David Bamdas, 

3671 North Dixie Highway, Pompano Beach, Florida 33064, 

Michael Martin, 102550 Overseas Highway, Key Largo, 

Florida 33037, Joseph Bamdas, 3671 North Dixie Highway, 

Pompano Beach, Florida 33064. 

The notice indicates intent to establish the new point location in 

a county of more than 300,000 population, according to the 

latest population estimates of the University of Florida, Bureau 

of Economic and Business Research. 

Certain dealerships of the same line-make may have standing, 

pursuant to section 320.642, Florida Statutes, to file a petition 

or complaint protesting the application. 

Written petitions or complaints must be received by the 

Department of Highway Safety and Motor Vehicles within 30 

days of the date of publication of this notice and must be 

submitted to: Sondra L. Howard, Administrator, Dealer License 

Section, Department of Highway Safety and Motor Vehicles, 

Room A-312 MS65, Neil Kirkman Building, 2900 Apalachee 

Parkway, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-0635. 

A copy of such petition or complaint must also be sent by US 

Mail to: Derek Jordahl, CF Moto Powersports, Inc., 3555 Holly 

Lane # 30, Plymouth, Minnesota 55447. 

If no petitions or complaints are received within 30 days of the 

date of publication, a final order will be issued by the 

Department of Highway Safety and Motor Vehicles approving 

the establishment of the dealership, subject to the applicant's 

compliance with the provisions of Chapter 320, Florida 

Statutes. 

DEPARTMENT OF HIGHWAY SAFETY AND MOTOR 

VEHICLES 

Division of Motor Vehicles 

Establishment of Riva Yamaha South Inc., line-make CFHG 

Notice of Publication for a New Point 

Franchise Motor Vehicle Dealer in a County of Less 

than 300,000 Population 

Pursuant to section 320.642, Florida Statutes, notice is given 

that CF Moto Powersports, Inc., intends to allow the 

establishment of Riva Yamaha South Inc., as a dealership for 

the sale of motorcycles manufactured by Chunfeng Holding 

Group Co, Ltd. (line-make CFHG) at 102550 Overseas 

Highway, Key Largo, (Monroe County), Florida 33037, on or 

after September 6, 2022. 

The name and address of the dealer operator(s) and principal 

investor(s) of Riva Yamaha South Inc are dealer operator(s): 

Neel Harrington, 102550 Overseas Highway, Key Largo, 

Florida 33037, principal investor(s): David Bamdas, 3671 

North Dixie Highway, Pompano Beach, Florida 33064, 

Michael Martin, 102550 Overseas Highway, Key Largo, 

Florida 33037, Joseph Bamdas, 3671 North Dixie Highway, 

Pompano Beach, Florida 33064. 

The notice indicates intent to establish the new point location in 

a county of less than 300,000 population, according to the latest 

population estimates of the University of Florida, Bureau of 

Economic and Business Research. 

Certain dealerships of the same line-make may have standing, 

pursuant to section 320.642, Florida Statutes, to file a petition 

or complaint protesting the application. 

Written petitions or complaints must be received by the 

Department of Highway Safety and Motor Vehicles within 30 

days of the date of publication of this notice and must be 

submitted to: Sondra L. Howard, Administrator, Dealer License 

Section, Department of Highway Safety and Motor Vehicles, 

Room A-312 MS65, Neil Kirkman Building, 2900 Apalachee 

Parkway, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-0635. 

A copy of such petition or complaint must also be sent by US 

Mail to: Derek Jordahl, CF Moto Powersports, Inc., 3555 Holly 

Lane # 30, Plymouth, Minnesota 55447. 

If no petitions or complaints are received within 30 days of the 

date of publication, a final order will be issued by the 

Department of Highway Safety and Motor Vehicles approving 

the establishment of the dealership, subject to the applicant's 

compliance with the provisions of Chapter 320, Florida 

Statutes. 

DEPARTMENT OF HIGHWAY SAFETY AND MOTOR 

VEHICLES 

Division of Motor Vehicles 

Establishment of Otwell's Extreme Motorsports, Inc., line-

make CFHG 

https://flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=15
https://flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=15
https://flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=42
https://flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=15
https://flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=15
https://flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=42
https://flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=15
https://flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=15
https://flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=42


Florida Administrative Register Volume 48, Number 152, August 5, 2022 

 

3140 

Notice of Publication for a New Point 

Franchise Motor Vehicle Dealer in a County of More 

than 300,000 Population 

Pursuant to section 320.642, Florida Statutes, notice is given 

that CF Moto Powersports, Inc., intends to allow the 

establishment of Otwell's Extreme Motorsports, Inc., as a 

dealership for the sale of motorcycles manufactured by 

Chunfeng Holding Group Co, Ltd. (line-make CFHG) at 2931 

West Fairfield Drive, Pensacola, (Escambia County), Florida 

32505, on or after September 6, 2022. 

The name and address of the dealer operator(s) and principal 

investor(s) of Otwell's Extreme Motorsports, Inc. are dealer 

operator(s): Ashley Otwell, 2931 West Fairfield Drive, 

Pensacola, Florida 32505; principal investor(s): Charles Otwell, 

3287 Idlewood Drive, Pensacola, Florida 32505, Ashley 

Otwell, 3287 Idlewood Drive, Pensacola, Florida 32505. 

The notice indicates intent to establish the new point location in 

a county of more than 300,000 population, according to the 

latest population estimates of the University of Florida, Bureau 

of Economic and Business Research. 

Certain dealerships of the same line-make may have standing, 

pursuant to section 320.642, Florida Statutes, to file a petition 

or complaint protesting the application. 

Written petitions or complaints must be received by the 

Department of Highway Safety and Motor Vehicles within 30 

days of the date of publication of this notice and must be 

submitted to: Sondra L. Howard, Administrator, Dealer License 

Section, Department of Highway Safety and Motor Vehicles, 

Room A-312 MS65, Neil Kirkman Building, 2900 Apalachee 

Parkway, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-0635. 

A copy of such petition or complaint must also be sent by US 

Mail to: Derek Jordahl, CF Moto Powersports, Inc, 3555 Holly 

Lane # 30, Plymouth, Minnesota 55447. 

If no petitions or complaints are received within 30 days of the 

date of publication, a final order will be issued by the 

Department of Highway Safety and Motor Vehicles approving 

the establishment of the dealership, subject to the applicant's 

compliance with the provisions of Chapter 320, Florida 

Statutes. 

DEPARTMENT OF HIGHWAY SAFETY AND MOTOR 

VEHICLES 

Division of Motor Vehicles 

Establishment of Crystal Motorsports LLC dba Crystal 

Supercenter, line-make CFHG 

Notice of Publication for a New Point 

Franchise Motor Vehicle Dealer in a County of Less 

than 300,000 Population 

Pursuant to section 320.642, Florida Statutes, notice is given 

that CF Moto Powersports, Inc., intends to allow the 

establishment of Crystal Motorsports LLC dba Crystal 

Supercenter, as a dealership for the sale of motorcycles 

manufactured by Chunfeng Holding Group Co, Ltd. (line-make 

CFHG) at 3477 Commercial Way, Spring Hill, (Hernando 

County), Florida 34606, on or after September 6, 2022. 

The name and address of the dealer operator(s) and principal 

investor(s) of Crystal Motorsports LLC are dealer operator(s): 

Steve Craig, 3477 Commercial Way, Spring Hill, Florida 

34606, principal investor(s): Steven D. Lamb, 900 Southwest 

Kings Bay Drive, Crystal River, Florida 34429, Justin A. Lamb, 

12265 West Deodar Street, Crystal River, Florida 34428. 

The notice indicates intent to establish the new point location in 

a county of less than 300,000 population, according to the latest 

population estimates of the University of Florida, Bureau of 

Economic and Business Research. 

Certain dealerships of the same line-make may have standing, 

pursuant to section 320.642, Florida Statutes, to file a petition 

or complaint protesting the application. 

Written petitions or complaints must be received by the 

Department of Highway Safety and Motor Vehicles within 30 

days of the date of publication of this notice and must be 

submitted to: Sondra L. Howard Administrator, Dealer License 

Section, Department of Highway Safety and Motor Vehicles, 

Room A-312 MS65, Neil Kirkman Building, 2900 Apalachee 

Parkway, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-0635. 

A copy of such petition or complaint must also be sent by US 

Mail to: Derek Jordahl, CF Moto Powersports, Inc., 3555 Holly 

Lane # 30, Plymouth, Minnesota 55447. 

If no petitions or complaints are received within 30 days of the 

date of publication, a final order will be issued by the 

Department of Highway Safety and Motor Vehicles approving 

the establishment of the dealership, subject to the applicant's 

compliance with the provisions of Chapter 320, Florida 

Statutes. 

DEPARTMENT OF HIGHWAY SAFETY AND MOTOR 

VEHICLES 

Division of Motor Vehicles 

Establishment of Lambretta South Inc.dba Riva Motorsports, 

line-make CFHG 

Notice of Publication for a New Point 

Franchise Motor Vehicle Dealer in a County of More 

than 300,000 Population 

Pursuant to section 320.642, Florida Statutes, notice is given 

that CF Moto Powersports, Inc., intends to allow the 

establishment of Lambretta South Inc.dba Riva Motorsports, as 

a dealership for the sale of motorcycles manufactured by 

Chunfeng Holding Group Co, Ltd. (line-make CFHG) at 3671 

North Dixie Highway, Pompano Beach, (Broward County), 

Florida 33064, on or after September 6, 2022. 

The name and address of the dealer operator(s) and principal 

investor(s) of Lambretta South Inc are dealer operator(s): Vinny 

https://flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=15
https://flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=15
https://flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=42
https://flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=15
https://flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=15
https://flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=42


Florida Administrative Register Volume 48, Number 152, August 5, 2022 

3141 

 

Gerardi, 3671 North Dixie Highway, Pompano Beach, Florida 

33064; principal investor(s): Leslie Bamdas Ferrera, 1785 

Parkside Circle South, Boca Raton, Florida 33486, David 

Bamdas, 1033 SouthWest 16 Street, Boca Raton, Florida 

33486, Joe Bamdas, 908 Hyacinth Drive, Delray Beach, Florida 

33483. 

The notice indicates intent to establish the new point location in 

a county of more than 300,000 population, according to the 

latest population estimates of the University of Florida, Bureau 

of Economic and Business Research. 

Certain dealerships of the same line-make may have standing, 

pursuant to section 320.642, Florida Statutes, to file a petition 

or complaint protesting the application. 

Written petitions or complaints must be received by the 

Department of Highway Safety and Motor Vehicles within 30 

days of the date of publication of this notice and must be 

submitted to: Sondra L. Howard, Administrator, Dealer License 

Section, Department of Highway Safety and Motor Vehicles, 

Room A-312 MS65, Neil Kirkman Building, 2900 Apalachee 

Parkway, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-0635. 

A copy of such petition or complaint must also be sent by US 

Mail to: Derek Jordahl, CF Moto Powersports, Inc., 3555 Holly 

Lane # 30, Plymouth, Minnesota 55447. 

If no petitions or complaints are received within 30 days of the 

date of publication, a final order will be issued by the 

Department of Highway Safety and Motor Vehicles approving 

the establishment of the dealership, subject to the applicant's 

compliance with the provisions of Chapter 320, Florida 

Statutes. 

DEPARTMENT OF HIGHWAY SAFETY AND MOTOR 

VEHICLES 

Division of Motor Vehicles 

Establishment of Powersports of Palm Beach LLC, line-make 

APRI 

Notice of Publication for a New Point 

Franchise Motor Vehicle Dealer in a County of More 

than 300,000 Population 

Pursuant to section 320.642, Florida Statutes, notice is given 

that Piaggio Group Americas, Inc., intends to allow the 

establishment of Powersports of Palm Beach LLC, as a 

dealership for the sale of motorcycles manufactured by Piaggio 

Group Americas, Inc., (line-make APRI) at 1422 10th Street, 

Lake Park, (Palm Beach County), Florida 33403, on or after 

September 1, 2022. 

The name and address of the dealer operator(s) and principal 

investor(s) of Powersports of Palm Beach LLC are dealer 

operator(s): Tony Mommone, 1422 110th Street, Lake Park, 

Florida 33403; principal investor(s): Tony Mommone, 1422 

10th Street, Lake Park, Florida 33403.  

The notice indicates intent to establish the new point location in 

a county of more than 300,000 population, according to the 

latest population estimates of the University of Florida, Bureau 

of Economic and Business Research. 

Certain dealerships of the same line-make may have standing, 

pursuant to section 320.642, Florida Statutes, to file a petition 

or complaint protesting the application. 

Written petitions or complaints must be received by the 

Department of Highway Safety and Motor Vehicles within 30 

days of the date of publication of this notice and must be 

submitted to: Sondra L. Howard, Administrator, Dealer License 

Section, Department of Highway Safety and Motor Vehicles, 

Room A-312 MS65, Neil Kirkman Building, 2900 Apalachee 

Parkway, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-0635. 

A copy of such petition or complaint must also be sent by US 

Mail to: Brian Skutt, Piaggio Group Americas, Inc., 860 

Washington street, 9th Floor, New York, New York 10014. 

If no petitions or complaints are received within 30 days of the 

date of publication, a final order will be issued by the 

Department of Highway Safety and Motor Vehicles approving 

the establishment of the dealership, subject to the applicant's 

compliance with the provisions of Chapter 320, Florida 

Statutes. 

DEPARTMENT OF HIGHWAY SAFETY AND MOTOR 

VEHICLES 

Division of Motor Vehicles 

Establishment of Powersports of Palm Beach LLC, line-make 

PIAG 

Notice of Publication for a New Point 

Franchise Motor Vehicle Dealer in a County of More 

than 300,000 Population 

Pursuant to section 320.642, Florida Statutes, notice is given 

that Piaggio Group Americas, Inc., intends to allow the 

establishment of Powersports of Palm Beach LLC, as a 

dealership for the sale of motorcycles manufactured by Piaggio 

Group Americas, Inc., (line-make PIAG) at 1422 10th Street, 

Lake Park, (Palm Beach County), Florida 33403, on or after 

September 1, 2022. 

The name and address of the dealer operator(s) and principal 

investor(s) of Powersports of Palm Beach LLC are dealer 

operator(s): Tony Mommone, 1422 110th Street, Lake Park, 

Florida 33403; principal investor(s): Tony Mommone, 1422 

10th Street, Lake Park, Florida 33403.  

The notice indicates intent to establish the new point location in 

a county of more than 300,000 population, according to the 

latest population estimates of the University of Florida, Bureau 

of Economic and Business Research. 

Certain dealerships of the same line-make may have standing, 

pursuant to section 320.642, Florida Statutes, to file a petition 

or complaint protesting the application. 

https://flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=15
https://flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=15
https://flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=42
https://flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=15
https://flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=15
https://flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=42


Florida Administrative Register Volume 48, Number 152, August 5, 2022 

 

3142 

Written petitions or complaints must be received by the 

Department of Highway Safety and Motor Vehicles within 30 

days of the date of publication of this notice and must be 

submitted to: Sondra L. Howard, Administrator, Dealer License 

Section, Department of Highway Safety and Motor Vehicles, 

Room A-312 MS65, Neil Kirkman Building, 2900 Apalachee 

Parkway, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-0635. 

A copy of such petition or complaint must also be sent by US 

Mail to: Brian Skutt, Piaggio Group Americas, Inc., 860 

Washington street, 9th Floor, New York, New York 10014. 

If no petitions or complaints are received within 30 days of the 

date of publication, a final order will be issued by the 

Department of Highway Safety and Motor Vehicles approving 

the establishment of the dealership, subject to the applicant's 

compliance with the provisions of Chapter 320, Florida 

Statutes. 

DEPARTMENT OF HIGHWAY SAFETY AND MOTOR 

VEHICLES 

Division of Motor Vehicles 

Establishment of Powersports of Palm Beach LLC, line-make 

MOGU 

Notice of Publication for a New Point 

Franchise Motor Vehicle Dealer in a County of More 

than 300,000 Population 

Pursuant to section 320.642, Florida Statutes, notice is given 

that Piaggio Group Americas, Inc., intends to allow the 

establishment of Powersports of Palm Beach LLC, as a 

dealership for the sale of motorcycles manufactured by Piaggio 

Group Americas, Inc., (line-make MOGU) at 1422 10th Street, 

Lake Park, (Palm Beach County), Florida 33403, on or after 

September 1, 2022. 

The name and address of the dealer operator(s) and principal 

investor(s) of Powersports of Palm Beach LLC are dealer 

operator(s): Tony Mommone, 1422 110th Street, Lake Park, 

Florida 33403; principal investor(s): Tony Mommone, 1422 

10th Street, Lake Park, Florida 33403.  

The notice indicates intent to establish the new point location in 

a county of more than 300,000 population, according to the 

latest population estimates of the University of Florida, Bureau 

of Economic and Business Research. 

Certain dealerships of the same line-make may have standing, 

pursuant to section 320.642, Florida Statutes, to file a petition 

or complaint protesting the application. 

Written petitions or complaints must be received by the 

Department of Highway Safety and Motor Vehicles within 30 

days of the date of publication of this notice and must be 

submitted to: Sondra L. Howard, Administrator, Dealer License 

Section, Department of Highway Safety and Motor Vehicles, 

Room A-312 MS65, Neil Kirkman Building, 2900 Apalachee 

Parkway, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-0635. 

A copy of such petition or complaint must also be sent by US 

Mail to: Brian Skutt, Piaggio Group Americas, Inc., 860 

Washington street, 9th Floor, New York, New York 10014. 

If no petitions or complaints are received within 30 days of the 

date of publication, a final order will be issued by the 

Department of Highway Safety and Motor Vehicles approving 

the establishment of the dealership, subject to the applicant's 

compliance with the provisions of Chapter 320, Florida 

Statutes. 

DEPARTMENT OF HIGHWAY SAFETY AND MOTOR 

VEHICLES 

Division of Motor Vehicles 

Establishment of Motorcycle Clinic, line-make QIPA 

Notice of Publication for a New Point 

Franchise Motor Vehicle Dealer in a County of More 

than 300,000 Population 

Pursuant to section 320.642, Florida Statutes, notice is given 

that American Lifan Industry, Inc., intends to allow the 

establishment of Motorcycle Clinic, as a dealership for the sale 

of motorcycles manufactured by Jiangmen Qipai Motorcycle 

Co Ltd (line-make QIPA) at 807 East Vine Street, Kissimmee, 

(Osceola County), Florida 34744, on or after September 1, 

2022. 

The name and address of the dealer operator(s) and principal 

investor(s) of Motorcycle Clinic are dealer operator(s): Brian 

Dady, 807 East Vine Street, Kissimmee, Florida 34744; 

principal investor(s): Brian Dady, 807 East Vine Street, 

Kissimmee, Florida 34744. 

The notice indicates intent to establish the new point location in 

a county of more than 300,000 population, according to the 

latest population estimates of the University of Florida, Bureau 

of Economic and Business Research. 

Certain dealerships of the same line-make may have standing, 

pursuant to section 320.642, Florida Statutes, to file a petition 

or complaint protesting the application. 

Written petitions or complaints must be received by the 

Department of Highway Safety and Motor Vehicles within 30 

days of the date of publication of this notice and must be 

submitted to: Sondra L. Howard, Administrator, Dealer License 

Section, Department of Highway Safety and Motor Vehicles, 

Room A-312 MS65, Neil Kirkman Building, 2900 Apalachee 

Parkway, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-0635. 

A copy of such petition or complaint must also be sent by US 

Mail to: Qi Sun, American Lifan Industry, Inc., 9272 Hyssop 

Drive, Rancho Cucamonga, California 91730. 

If no petitions or complaints are received within 30 days of the 

date of publication, a final order will be issued by the 

Department of Highway Safety and Motor Vehicles approving 

the establishment of the dealership, subject to the applicant's 

https://flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=15
https://flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=15
https://flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=42
https://flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=15
https://flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=15
https://flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=42


Florida Administrative Register Volume 48, Number 152, August 5, 2022 

3143 

 

compliance with the provisions of Chapter 320, Florida 

Statutes. 

DEPARTMENT OF HIGHWAY SAFETY AND MOTOR 

VEHICLES 

Division of Motor Vehicles 

Establishment of Riva Motorsports Miami Inc., DBA Riva 

Motorsports Miami, line-make INDI 

Notice of Publication for a New Point 

Franchise Motor Vehicle Dealer in a County of More 

than 300,000 Population 

Pursuant to section 320.642, Florida Statutes, notice is given 

that Polaris Sales and Service, Inc., intends to allow the 

establishment of Riva Motorsports Miami Inc., DBA Riva 

Motorsports Miami, as a dealership for the sale of motorcycles 

manufactured by Indian Motorcycle Co. By Polaris Industries 

Inc., (line-make INDI) at 11995 Southwest 222 Street, Miami, 

(Miami-Dade County), Florida 33170, on or after September 1, 

2022. 

The name and address of the dealer operator(s) and principal 

investor(s) of Riva Motorsports Miami Inc are dealer 

operator(s): Michael Martin, 37 North Bounty Lane, Key 

Largo, Florida 33037; principal investor(s): David Bamdas, 

1033 SW 16 St, Boca Raton, Florida 33486, Michael Martin, 

37 North Bounty Lane, Key Largo, Florida 33037, Joseph 

Bamdas, 908 Hyacinth Drive, Delray Beach, Florida 33483, 

Leslie Ferrara, 1785 Parkside Circle South, Boca Raton, Florida 

33486. 

The notice indicates intent to establish the new point location in 

a county of more than 300,000 population, according to the 

latest population estimates of the University of Florida, Bureau 

of Economic and Business Research. 

Certain dealerships of the same line-make may have standing, 

pursuant to section 320.642, Florida Statutes, to file a petition 

or complaint protesting the application. 

Written petitions or complaints must be received by the 

Department of Highway Safety and Motor Vehicles within 30 

days of the date of publication of this notice and must be 

submitted to: Sondra L. Howard, Administrator, Dealer License 

Section, Department of Highway Safety and Motor Vehicles, 

Room A-312 MS65, Neil Kirkman Building, 2900 Apalachee 

Parkway, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-0635. 

A copy of such petition or complaint must also be sent by US 

Mail to: Jordan Britt, Polaris Sales and Service, Inc., 2100 

Highway 55, Medina, Minnesota 55340. 

If no petitions or complaints are received within 30 days of the 

date of publication, a final order will be issued by the 

Department of Highway Safety and Motor Vehicles approving 

the establishment of the dealership, subject to the applicant's 

compliance with the provisions of Chapter 320, Florida 

Statutes. 

AGENCY FOR HEALTH CARE ADMINISTRATION 

Certificate of Need 

NOTICE OF HOSPICE PROGRAM FIXED NEED POOL 

The Agency for Health Care Administration has projected a 

fixed need pool for hospice programs, defined in accordance 

with Sections 400.601-400.602, Florida Statutes (F.S.) and 

408.031-408.045, F.S.  Fixed need pool projections are for 

hospice programs planned for January 2024, pursuant to the 

provisions of Rule 59C-1.0355, Florida Administrative Code.  

Letters of intent to apply for Certificates of Need pursuant to 

this notice must be filed with the Certificate of Need Program 

Office, 2727 Mahan Drive, Building 2, Room C-1, MS 28, 

Tallahassee, Florida 32308, on or before 5:00 p.m., August 22, 

2022. 

Any person who identifies an error in the fixed need pool 

numbers must advise the agency of the error within ten (10) 

days of the publication. If the agency concurs with the error, the 

fixed need pool number will be adjusted and republished in the 

first available edition of the Florida Administrative Register.  

Failure to notify the agency of the error during this ten day 

period waives a person's right to raise the error at subsequent 

proceedings. Any other adjustments will be made in the first 

cycle subsequent to identification of the error including those 

errors identified through administrative hearings or final 

judicial review. 

Any person whose substantial interest is affected by this action 

and who timely advised the agency of an error in the action has 

a right to request an administrative hearing pursuant to Section 

120.57, F.S. In order to request a proceeding under Section 

120.57, F.S., a request for an administrative hearing must state 

with specificity which issues of material fact or law are in 

dispute.  All requests for hearings shall be made to the Agency 

for Health Care Administration and must be filed with the 

agency clerk at 2727 Mahan Drive, Building 3, Room 3431, MS 

3, Tallahassee, Florida 32308.  All requests for hearings must 

be filed with the agency clerk within 21 days of this publication 

or the right to a hearing is waived. 

Hospice Program Net Need 

Service AreaNet Need             Service Area Net 

Need 

District 1 0                  Subdistrict 6C 0 

Subdistrict 2A             0                  Subdistrict 7A 0 

Subdistrict 2B             0                  Subdistrict 7B 0 

Subdistrict 3A             0                  Subdistrict 7C 0 

Subdistrict 3B             0                  Subdistrict 8A 0 

Subdistrict 3C             0                  Subdistrict 8B 0 

Subdistrict 3D             0                  Subdistrict 8C 0 

Subdistrict 3E             0                  Subdistrict 8D 0 

Subdistrict 4A             0                  Subdistrict 9A 0 

Subdistrict 4B             0                  Subdistrict 9B 0 

Subdistrict 5A             0                  Subdistrict 9C 0 

https://flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=15
https://flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=15
https://flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=42
https://flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=59
https://flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=188


Florida Administrative Register Volume 48, Number 152, August 5, 2022 

 

3144 

Subdistrict 5B             0                   District    10 0 

Subdistrict 6A             0                   District    11 0 

Subdistrict 6B             0                     Total 0 

Section XIII 

Index to Rules Filed During Preceding 

Week 

NOTE: The above section will be published on Tuesday 

beginning October 2, 2012, unless Monday is a holiday, then it 

will be published on Wednesday of that week. 

 


