CHAPTER 61G15-22

LICENSE RENEWAL, CONTINUING EDUCATION

61G15-22.0001
License Renewal
61G15-22.0002
Licensure Change of Status, Reactivation; Reinstatement of Void Licenses
61G15-22.0003
Exemption from Renewal Requirements for Spouses of Members of the Armed Forces of the United States

61G15-22.001
Continuing Education Requirements

61G15-22.002
Definitions

61G15-22.003
Qualifying Activities for Area of Practice Requirement

61G15-22.004
Conversion of Education Units to Continuing Education Hours
61G15-22.005
Non-Qualifying Activities

61G15-22.006
Demonstrating Compliance; Audits; Investigations
61G15-22.007
Noncompliance (Repealed) 
61G15-22.008
Record Keeping (Repealed)
61G15-22.009
Exemptions from Continuing Education Requirements
61G15-22.010
Qualifying Activities for Laws and Rules Requirement

61G15-22.0105
Approval of Continuing Education Courses in Laws and Rules and Courses in Professional Ethics
61G15-22.011
Board Approval of Continuing Education Providers

61G15-22.012
Obligations of Continuing Education Providers

61G15-22.013
Evaluation of Providers

61G15-22.014
Duration of Provider Status

61G15-22.0001 License Renewal.

(1) Active or Inactive Status. To renew an active or inactive status license, the licensee must remit to FEMC a completed renewal application and the biennial renewal licensure fee for active or inactive status licenses as specified by Rule 61G15-24.001, F.A.C. The application form FBPE/020, 12/17, Professional Engineer License Renewal Application And Instructions, is incorporated by reference herein and may be obtained from www.fbpe.org/index.php/licensure/other-forms or at https://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-09413. All applications for renewal of inactive status licenses must also contain a statement certifying that the licensee has neither practiced engineering in Florida nor violated any of the provisions of Section 471.033, F.S., since the date on which the license was first placed on inactive status.
(2) Delinquent status.

(a) Pursuant to Section 455.271(6)(a), F.S., licensees with delinquent status licenses must affirmatively apply for either active or inactive status during the renewal cycle in which the license becomes delinquent; failure to do so by the end of the renewal cycle renders the license void without further action by the Board.
(b) Application for renewal of a delinquent status license shall be made on form FBPE/020, and shall be accompanied by all fees as specified by Section 455.271(7), F.S., and Rule 61G15-24.001, F.A.C. In addition, applications for renewal of a delinquent status license must be accompanied by documentation of the licensee’s compliance with the continuing education requirements established by Section 471.017(3)(a), F.S., and Rule 61G15-22.001, F.A.C.
(3) Members of the Armed Forces and Spouses. 
(a) Members of the United States Armed Forces serving on active duty, or having been discharged within the twenty-four (24) months preceding renewal; or spouses or surviving spouses of active duty members, may renew a license as specified in Sections 455.02(1) and (2), F.S. Applications for renewal shall be made by remitting to FEMC Form FBPE 040, 12/18, Renewal Application Military Change of Status, which is incorporated by reference herein and may be obtained from www.fbpe.org/index.php/licensure/other-forms or at https://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-10315. 
(b) The active or inactive license of a member of the Florida National Guard or United States Armed Forces Reserve shall not expire while that member is serving on federal active duty, and shall be extended through the period of federal active duty and for up to ninety (90) days thereafter, as provided by Section 250.4815, F.S.

Rulemaking Authority 455.271(2), (5), (6)(a), (7), 471.011, 471.017(2) FS. Law Implemented 250.4815, 455.02(1), (2), 455.271(2), (5), (6)(a), (7), 471.011, 471.017 FS. History–New 8-1-02, Amended 2-18-16, 2-27-17, 11-21-17, 5-28-18, 4-1-19, 7-25-19.
61G15-22.0002 Licensure Change of Status, Reactivation; Reinstatement of Void Licenses.

(1) Active to Inactive Licensure Status Change. Licensees may inactivate their license and change their licensure status from active to inactive by remitting to FEMC a completed Change of Status Application, Form FBPE/023, 09/19, and the fee specified by Rule 61G15-24.001, F.A.C. The application form FBPE/023 is incorporated by reference herein and may be obtained from www.fbpe.org/index.php/licensure/other-forms or at https://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-11355.

(2) Reactivation of Inactive Licenses. Licensees may reinstate an inactive license and change their licensure status from inactive to active by remitting to FEMC a completed Change of Status Application, referenced in subsection (1), the fee specified by Rule 61G15-24.001, F.A.C., and proof of completion of eighteen (18) hours of continuing education obtained within the two (2) years immediately prior to application and in compliance with subsection 61G15-22.001(1), F.A.C.
(3) Reinstatement of Void Licenses. Persons previously licensed as professional engineers in Florida may not re-apply for licensure by examination or by endorsement pursuant to Section 471.013 or 471.015, F.S.  Rather, pursuant to Sections 455.271(6) and 471.019, F.S., any person previously licensed as a professional engineer in Florida whose Florida license has become void must apply for reinstatement of the previous license. Application for reinstatement shall be made on form FBPE/023, Change of Status Application, referenced in subsection (1). In addition to a completed application form, all applications for reinstatement shall be accompanied by the following.

(a) The fees specified by Rule 61G15-24.001, F.A.C.;

(b) Documentation of satisfaction of any disciplinary obligations imposed against the void license;
(c) Passage of the Board’s Laws and Rules Study Guide as detailed in Rule 61G15-20.0016, F.A.C.; and
(d) Documentation of one of the following:

1. Current active practice as a professional engineer in another U.S state or territory. Such documentation shall include verification of active licensure in good standing and compliance with such state or territory’s continuing education requirements; or

2. Applicants not currently in active practice as a professional engineer must provide proof of completion of thirty-six (36) hours of Board approved continuing education, including two (2) hours of professional ethics and a one (1) hour course in Florida Laws and Rules. With the exception of the one (1) hour Florida Laws and Rules course, which can be taken online, the remaining thirty-five (35) hours must be either in-person or synchronous live streaming/videoconference/interactive webinar OR obtained through distance learning CE courses provided by a national or Florida statewide engineering society or association pursuant to Rule 61G15-22.011, F.A.C.; other online or distance learning courses will not be accepted.
(4) No later than 90 days prior to December 31, 2026, the Board shall review and consider amendment, modification, or repeal of this rule if review determines this rule creates barriers to entry for private business competition, is duplicative, outdated, obsolete, overly burdensome, or imposes excessive costs. Failure by the Board to act in accordance with this provision will result in the expiration in this rule December 31, 2016.
Rulemaking Authority 455.271, 471.008, 471.019 FS. Law Implemented 455.271, 471.019 FS. History–New 8-1-02, Amended 2-27-17, 12-29-19, 12-27-21.
61G15-22.0003 Exemption from Renewal Requirements for Spouses of Members of the Armed Forces of the United States.

Spouses of members of the Armed Forces of the United States are exempt from licensure renewal provisions, but only in cases of absence from the state because of their spouses’ duties with the Armed Forces. Copies of the military orders requiring the change in duty station must be sent to the Board office in order to qualify for the exemption. Upon receipt of the military orders by the Board office confirming exemption eligibility, the spouse’s license will be placed on inactive status with no fee required. Reactivation of the inactive license will not require payment of the fee set forth in paragraph 61G15-24.001(2)(i), F.A.C. The license will remain in inactive status for up to two renewal cycles at which time the licensee must either renew this exemption, before expiration, by submitting a current set of orders establishing eligibility for the exemption or reactivate the license. The licensee may reactivate the license by submitting an application for change of status from inactive to active and will not be required to pay the fee set forth in paragraph 61G15-24.001(2)(j), F.A.C., nor be required to comply with any rules setting conditions for reactivation of licensure, including continuing education requirements imposed by Section 455.271(10), F.S. If a license is not reactivated nor the exemption renewed by the expiration date, the license shall become delinquent. Reactivation of the delinquent license will not require payment of the fee set forth in paragraph 61G15-24.001(2)(d), F.A.C.

Rulemaking Authority 455.02(2) FS. Law Implemented 455.02(2) FS. History–New 6-8-03.
61G15-22.001 Continuing Education Requirements.

(1) Each licensee shall complete eighteen (18) continuing education hours during each license renewal biennium as a condition of license renewal. Four (4) hours shall relate to the licensee’s area(s) of practice; one (1) hour must be related to professional ethics; and one (1) hour shall relate to Chapter 471, F.S., and the rules of the Board. The remaining hours may relate to any topic pertinent to the practice of engineering as defined in Rule 61G15-22.002, F.A.C. 
(a) The one (1) hour of professional ethics must be obtained from a professional ethics course approved for credit in any US jurisdiction.

(b) The one (1) hour of laws and rules required by Section 471.017, F.S., must be obtained from courses approved by the Board pursuant to Rule 61G15-22.0105, F.A.C.
(c) Pursuant to Section 471.017(3)(a), F.S., a licensee may earn the required professional ethics and laws and rules hours by serving as a member of the Legislature or as an elected state or local official.

(2) There shall be no carryover of hours permitted from one licensure renewal biennium to the next.
(3) Beginning with the Fifth Edition of the Florida Building Code, all licensees actively participating in the design of engineering works or systems in connection with buildings, structures, or facilities and systems covered by the Florida Building Code, as identified within Section 553.73(1)(a), F.S., shall:

(a) Complete at least one (1) advanced Florida Building Code course within twelve (12) months of each edition of the Florida Building Code effective date, 

(b) Provide the Board with a copy of a certificate of completion which shows: course number, course hours, Code edition year, and Code or course focus. This course may also count towards the area of practice requirement for continuing education set forth in Rule 61G15-22.001, F.A.C.

(4) The Board shall approve all Advanced Florida Building Code courses. Courses submitted for approval shall have been designated an “Advanced” course by the Florida Building Commission and shall be within the discipline of civil structure, mechanical, electrical or general engineering.
Rulemaking Authority 471.008, 471.017(3), 471.0195 FS. Law Implemented 471.017(3), 471.0195 FS. History–New 8-19-80, Formerly 21H-22.01, Amended 5-14-86, Formerly 21H-22.001, Amended 6-22-99, 6-13-00, 2-22-01, 9-16-01, 3-7-13, 9-29-14, 2-18-16, 8-1-18, 12-29-19.
61G15-22.002 Definitions.

(1) Area of Practice: An engineering discipline for which a Principles and Practice of Engineering examination is offered by the National Council for Examiners of Engineering and Surveying (NCEES).

(2) Continuing Education Hour (CEH): A time measurement requiring a minimum of 50 minutes instruction or presentation per hour. The Continuing Education hour is the common denominator for other units of credit. A continuing education hour is equivalent to a professional development hour (PDH).

(3) Contact Hour. A contact hour shall consist of fifty (50) clock minutes of instruction.

(4) College/Unit Semester/Quarter Hour: Credit for course in ABET-approved programs or other related engineering college course.

(5) Course/Activity: Any qualifying course or activity with a clear purpose and objective which will maintain, improve, or expand the skills and knowledge relevant to the licensee’s area of practice.

(6) Commercial educator: An individual or business organization trained in teaching and offering education courses for a profit.
(7) Vendor: An individual or business organization who sells products or services related to an engineering area of practice.
(8) Topic pertinent to the practice of engineering: For purposes of meeting the continuing education requirements, a topic pertinent to the practice of engineering is any topic that falls within the definition of the practice of “engineering” as defined in Section 471.005(7), F.S. Topics on marketing, foreign language skills, and basic math skills below the requirements set forth in paragraph 61G15-20.007(1)(a), F.A.C. are not acceptable and are excluded.
Rulemaking Authority 455.213(7), 455.2178, 455.2179, 471.008, 471.017(3) FS. Law Implemented 455.213(7), 455.2178, 455.2179 FS. History–New 9-16-01, Amended 8-1-02, 7-30-03, 2-18-16.
61G15-22.003 Qualifying Activities for Area of Practice Requirement.

(1) Successful completion of college courses.

(2) Successful completion of short courses, tutorials, webinars, and distance education courses offered through delivery methods such as live, correspondence, recorded, Internet-based; or attending seminars (including in-house engineering seminars), workshops, or professional and technical presentations at meetings, conventions or conferences presented/sponsored by a provider or vendor with specific knowledge related to the licensee’s area of practice approved under Rule 61G15-22.011, F.A.C.

(3) Teaching or instructing in subsection (1) or (2) above. However, teaching credit is valid for teaching a course or seminar for the first time only. Teaching credit does not apply to full-time faculty.

(4) Authoring published technical engineering papers, articles, or books; or accepted licensee examination items for NCEES. Continuing education credits are earned on the date of publication.
(5) Patents.

(6) Active participation in professional or technical societies. Civic or trade organizations do not qualify under this provision. Credit for this activity requires that the licensee serve as an officer of the organization or actively participate on a committee in the organization. Continuing Education credits are not earned until the end of each year of completed service.

Rulemaking Authority 455.213(7), 471.008, 471.017(3) FS. Law Implemented 455.213(7), 471.017(3) FS. History–New 9-16-01, Amended 5-14-06, 2-18-16.
61G15-22.004 Conversion of Education Units to Continuing Education Hours.

(1) One (1) college semester hour credit is equal to 45 continuing education hours.

(2) One (1) college quarter hour credit is equal to 30 continuing education hours.

(3) One (1) contact hour of professional development in course work, seminars (including in-house seminars at an engineering firm), or professional or technical presentations made at meetings, conventions, or conferences is equal to 1 continuing education hour.

(4) For teaching of subsections (1) through (3) above, apply a multiple of 2, if the requirements of subsection 61G15-22.003(3), F.A.C., are met.
(5) Each published peer-reviewed paper or book in the licensee’s area of professional practice is equal to 10 continuing education hours.
(6) Each published paper or article (other than in paragraph (5) above) in the licensee’s area of professional practice is equal to 5 continuing education hours.

(7) Authoring accepted licensee examination items for NCEES is equal to 2 continuing education hours.

(8) Each patent developed using engineering principles is equal to 10 continuing education hours.

(9) Active participation in professional and technical societies as described in subsection 61G15-22.003(6), F.A.C. Each hour of participation is equal to 1 continuing education hour, with a maximum credit of 4 continuing education hours per renewal period.

Rulemaking Authority 471.008, 471.017(3) FS. Law Implemented 471.017(3) FS. History–New 9-16-01, Amended 2-18-16.
61G15-22.005 Non-Qualifying Activities. 

Activities that do not qualify as Continuing Education Hours include but are not limited to the following:

(1) Self-generated courses, that being courses generated and presented by the licensee to himself or herself for continuing education credit.

(2) Personal self-improvement courses.

(3) Equipment demonstrations or trade show displays.

(4) Enrollment without attendance.

(5) Repetitive attendance or teaching of the same course.

(6) Tours of buildings, structures, schools, museums and such unless there is a clear objective to maintain and strengthen competency in a technical field.

(7) Regular employment.

(8) Personal, estate or financial planning.

(9) Courses the content of which is below the level of knowledge and skill that reflects the responsibility of engineer in charge.

Rulemaking Authority 471.008, 471.017(3) FS. Law Implemented 471.017(3) FS. History–New 9-16-01, Amended 6-3-07, 2-18-16.
61G15-22.006 Demonstrating Compliance; Audits; Investigations.

(1) In order to demonstrate compliance with continuing education requirements, licensees must affirmatively declare completion of the continuing education requirements upon licensure renewal.
(2) The Board will randomly audit a minimum of three percent (3%) of licensees to assure that the continuing education requirements are met.
(a) In addition, licensees audited in the previous biennium who failed to demonstrate compliance will be included with the group of licensees audited for the current renewal cycle.

(b) Licensees whose void license was reactivated during the previous renewal cycle will be included within the group of licensees audited for the current renewal cycle.

(c) A failure to produce documentation of compliance with continuing education requirements during an audit will result in the opening of a disciplinary complaint against the licensee for violation of paragraph 61G15-19.001(6)(s), F.A.C. If a violation is proven, the penalty shall be within the guidelines established by sub-subparagraph 61G15-19.004(2)(g)4.i., F.A.C.
(3) The licensee shall retain such receipts, vouchers, certificates, or other papers as may be necessary to document completion of the continuing education pursuant to an audit for four (4) years from the date of completion of the continuing education activity.

In addition, the Board shall use attendance information submitted by the provider to determine whether licensees can demonstrate compliance.
(4) In addition to auditing licensee compliance as provided in subsection (2), to monitor licensee compliance with continuing education requirements, any investigation conducted pursuant to Section 455.225, F.S., shall be expanded to include investigation of compliance with continuing education.
Rulemaking Authority 455.213(7), 455.2178, 471.008, 471.017(3) FS. Law Implemented 455.2177, 455.2178, 471.017(3) FS. History–New 9-16-01, Amended 7-13-04, 8-20-12, 1-2-18, 8-1-18, 12-29-19.
61G15-22.007 Noncompliance.

Rulemaking Authority 455.213(6), 455.2178, 455.2179, 471.017(3), 471.019 FS. Law Implemented 455.213(6), 455.2177, 455.2178, 455.2179, 471.008, 471.017, 471.019 FS. History–New 9-16-01, Repealed 2-2-12.
61G15-22.008 Record Keeping.

Rulemaking Authority 471.008, 471.017(3) FS. Law Implemented 471.017(3) FS. History–New 9-16-01, Amended 2-18-16, Repealed 4-4-21.
61G15-22.009 Exemptions from Continuing Education Requirements.

(1) Licensees who have become licensed in Florida during the current biennium shall be exempt from continuing education requirements except for the requirement of Section 471.0195, F.S., regarding Advanced Building Code training and the Florida-approved Laws and Rules and Professional Ethics hours required by paragraphs 61G15-22.001(1)(a) and (b), F.A.C.

(2) Any licensee whose license is placed in retired status shall be exempt thereafter.

(3) Any licensee whose license is placed in inactive status, for so long as it remains inactive. 
(4) Any licensee who is a member of the United States Armed Forces and maintains Florida licensure pursuant to Section 455.02, F.S. 

(5) This rule shall be reviewed, and if necessary, repealed, modified, or renewed through the rulemaking process five years from the effective date.

Rulemaking Authority 455.213(7), 471.017(3), 471.019 FS. Law Implemented 455.213(6), 455.2179, 471.017(3) FS. History–New 9-16-01, Amended 12-29-19, 11-16-20, 2-1-23.
61G15-22.010 Qualifying Activities for Laws and Rules Requirements.

(1) In order to comply with the provisions of Section 471.017(3), F.S., licensees shall demonstrate professional competency relative to Chapter 471, F.S., and the Board’s rules, by:

(a) Either completing a continuing education course, as detailed in subsection (2) below;
(b) By serving as a board member, as detailed in subsection (3) below, or

(c) By approval of the Board as a consulting engineer providing assistance to the Board in the performance of its duties, as detailed in subsection (4) below.

(2) Successful completion of a course of continuing education for laws and rules of the Board which must consist of a minimum of one (1) continuing education hour in laws and rules of the Board.

(3) Members of the Board of Professional Engineers shall receive credit for the laws and rules and ethics requirements set forth in Section 471.017(3)(a), F.S., for their service as board members.

(4) All consultant engineers used by the Board in the resolution of Board business, including rulemaking and prosecution of discipline cases and complaints, shall receive credit for the laws and rules of the Board and area of practice requirement by specific approval of the Board of a written list of such consultants during each biennium.
(5) Service as a member of the legislature or as an elected state or local official shall meet the laws and rules and ethics requirements set forth in Section 471.017(3)(a), F.S.
Rulemaking Authority 471.008, 471.017(3) FS. Law Implemented 455.213(7), 471.017(3) FS. History–New 9-16-01, Amended 9-4-02, 1-16-03, 8-10-09, 2-18-16.
 SEQ CHAPTER \h \r 161G15-22.0105 Approval of Continuing Education Courses in Laws and Rules and Courses in Professional Ethics.
(1) Each course provider approved by the Board to conduct courses in Florida Laws and Rules and courses in Professional Ethics must meet the requirements of Rule 61G15-22.011, F.A.C., and shall submit an application for approval of a continuing education course in Laws and Rules or in Professional Ethics.
(a) Applications for approval of Florida Laws and Rules courses shall be made on Form FBPE/008, Application for Approval of Laws and Rules Continuing Education Course (rev. 10/15), which is incorporated by reference herein and may be obtained from www.fbpe.org/licensure/application-process or at https://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-06012.
(b) Applications for approval of Professional Ethics courses shall be made on Form FBPE/009, Application for Approval of Professional Ethics Continuing Education Course (rev. 10/15), which is incorporated by reference herein and may be obtained from www.fbpe.org/licensure/application-process or at https://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-06013.
(2) All applications shall be submitted on the applicable course approval application identified above and shall include the following:

(a) Course materials, including the course syllabus and a detailed outline of the contents of the course;
(b) The total number of classroom or interactive distance learning continuing education hours;
(c) For courses in Laws and Rules, course content that shall include:

1. Changes to Chapters 455 and 471, F.S., and rules adopted, amended or repealed during the immediately preceding biennium;

2. A list of resources used to develop the course content.
(d) For courses in laws and rules, course content may also include:

1. Application of the provisions of Chapter 471, F.S., to individual disciplinary cases and unlicensed practice cases during the immediately preceding biennium.

2. The laws and rules of the Board pertaining to signing and sealing, responsibility rules, certification and responsible charge.

(e) For courses in Professional Ethics, course content that shall include one or more of the following:

1. Codes of ethics or other guidelines for ethical decision making as applied to the practice of engineering;

2. The importance of ethics as a broad professional concern rather than a personal one;

3. The engineer’s obligations to society, clients, and the profession;

4. Ethical dilemmas encountered in engineering practice; or

5. The application of professional ethics to decision making through hypothetical or illustrative examples.

(3) Continuing education course approval is valid for the biennium during which it was approved, provided no substantial change is made in the course and the approval status of the provider has not expired or been suspended or revoked. Substantial changes made in any course will require a new approval of that course. A provider must reapply for course approval ninety (90) days prior to the date of the end of the biennium which would be the expiration of course approval in order to prevent a lapse in course approval.

(4) If a course is approved, the board shall assign the course a number. The course provider shall use the course number in the course syllabus, in all other course materials used in connection with the course and in all written advertising materials used in connection with the course.
Rulemaking Authority 455.2123, 455.213, 455.2179, 471.017(3), 471.019 FS. Law Implemented 455.2123, 455.213, 455.2179, 471.017(3), 471.019 FS. History–New 4-8-07, Amended 4-28-08, 12-21-15.
61G15-22.011 Board Approval of Continuing Education Providers.

(1) Applicants for continuing education provider status must either be registered as a continuing education provider with the Registered Continuing Education Program (RCEP) of the American Council of Engineering Companies (ACEC) or International Association for Continuing Education and Training (IACET) as of March 1, 2015, or meet the requirements of subsection (2) of this rule, to demonstrate the education and/or the experience necessary to instruct professional engineers in the conduct of their practice.

(2) To demonstrate the education and/or the experience necessary to instruct professional engineers in the conduct of their practice for continuing education credit, an applicant for continuing education provider status must be a regionally accredited educational institution, a commercial educator, a governmental agency, a state or national professional association whose primary purpose is to promote the profession of engineering, an engineer with a Florida license to practice engineering who is not under disciplinary restrictions pursuant to any order of the Board, a vendor with specific knowledge related to the licensee’s area of practice, or an engineering firm properly qualified as an engineering business organization by the Board pursuant to Section 471.023, F.S.

(3) To allow the Board to evaluate an application for continuing education provider status, the applicant must submit the following:

(a) A completed Application For Continuing Education Provider New Provider Application, Form FBPE/007 (10/17), incorporated by reference herein, which may be obtained from www.fbpe.org/licensure/application-process or at https://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-09327.
(b) The name, address and telephone number of the prospective provider; and,
(c) Proof of registration as continuing education provider with ACEC or IACET, or if the applicant is not registered as a continuing education provider with ACEC or IACET, the applicant must submit the following:

1. A description of the type of courses or seminars the provider expects to conduct for credit;

2. A description of the staffing capability of the applicant;

3. A sample of intended course materials;

4. A list of anticipated locations to conduct the courses;

5. A complete course curriculum for each course the applicant intends to offer;

6. A description of the means the applicant will use to update the course in response to rule or law changes;

7. A description of the means the applicant will use to evaluate the licensee’s performance in the course;

8. A fee of $250.

(4) No engineer may conduct continuing education courses or seminars for credit upon the engineer’s receipt of any disciplinary order from any professional regulatory board in any jurisdiction. Rather, the engineer must notify the Board office within ten (10) days of the engineer’s receipt of any such order.

(5) Should the Board determine that the provider has failed to provide appropriate continuing education services, it shall request that the Department of Business and Professional Regulation issue an order requiring the provider cease and desist from offering any continuing education courses and shall request that the Department revoke any approval of the provider granted by the Board.

(6) No provider may allow an engineer to conduct any course or seminar offered by the provider if that engineer has been disciplined and has not been released from the terms of the final order in the disciplinary case. Upon receipt of notice that an instructor is under discipline, the provider shall, within seven (7) days, write to the Board office and confirm that the engineer is no longer conducting any course or seminar offered by the provider. For the purpose of this subsection, a letter of guidance or a reprimand shall not constitute “under discipline.”

(7) The Board retains the right and authority to audit and/or monitor programs and review records and course materials given by any provider approved pursuant to this rule. The Board shall request that the Department of Business and Professional Regulation revoke the approved status of the provider or reject individual programs given by a provider if the provider disseminated any false or misleading information in connection with the continuing education programs, or if the provider fails to conform to and abide by the rules of the Board. Licensees will not lose credit for attending courses offered by approved providers that are later rejected or stopped by the Board.

(8) Members of the Board of Professional Engineers or the Florida Engineers Management Corporation Board of Directors are prohibited from being a continuing education provider.

(9) The following providers shall be approved as providers, and the Board shall accept their courses for continuing education credit:

(a) Educational Institutions teaching college level courses;

(b) Federal and State Governmental Agencies that establish rules, regulations, guidelines, or otherwise have an impact on the practice of engineering; and,
(c) State and National Engineering Professional Associations approved by the Board.
(10) No later than December 31, 2024, the Board shall review and consider amendment, modification, or repeal of this rule if review determines this rule creates barriers to entry for private business competition, is duplicative, outdated, obsolete, overly burdensome, or imposes excessive costs.
Rulemaking Authority 455.213(6), 455.2179, 471.008, 471.017(3) FS. Law Implemented 455.213(6), 455.2179, 471.017(3) FS. History–New 9-16-01, Amended 9-4-02, 12-21-03, 8-8-05, 6-11-06, 1-29-07, 6-3-07, 8-10-09, 7-8-10, 2-18-16, 5-8-18, 5-3-20.
61G15-22.012 Obligations of Continuing Education Providers.

To maintain status as a continuing education provider, the provider must:

(1)(a) Provide courses or seminars designed to enhance the education of engineers in the practice of engineering;

(b) Require each licensee to complete the entire course or seminar in order to receive a certificate of completion;

(c) Furnish each participant with an individual certificate of attendance. An attendance record shall be maintained by the provider for four years and shall be available for inspection by the Board and the Florida Engineers Management Corporation.
(d) Ensure that all promotional material for courses or seminars offered to professional engineers for credit contain the provider number.

(e) Allow only one continuing education hour for each hour of classroom, audio or video instruction, an “hour of classroom, audio or video instruction” being a minimum of 50 minutes instruction or presentation.
(f) Allow only one continuing education hour for each “hour of correspondence study.” The “hour of correspondence study” must be based on the average completion time of each course as established by the provider.

(g) Provide a written examination to each participating licensee in correspondence study courses. In order to complete the course, the licensee must sign and date the examination and receive a minimum grade of seventy percent (70%). If a licensee fails the examination, they will be permitted to take the examination again in order to achieve a passing grade.
(h) Notify the Board within fourteen (14) days of any change in the address or telephone number of the provider.

(i) Allow FEMC’s and the Board’s designee to have access to information concerning courses or seminars conducted by the provider for continuing education credit.
(2) Providers must make available to potential participants course information sufficient to allow a participant to clearly understand the course content, learning objectives and outcomes, and level of difficulty prior to enrolling in the course. This requirement may be satisfied by either posting a detailed course description or representative excerpts of the course materials, if course materials in their entirety are not made available for review prior to course registration.
Rulemaking Authority 471.008, 471.017(3) FS. Law Implemented 471.017(3) FS. History–New 9-16-01, Amended 2-18-16, 5-8-18.
61G15-22.013 Evaluation of Providers.

(1) The Board, or its designee, reserves the right to evaluate continuing education courses or seminars offered to engineers for credit by the following methods:

(a) Observing such courses or seminars; and,
(b) Reviewing the files of the provider to gain information about any course or seminar offered to professional engineers for credit.

(2) The Board shall not revoke the continuing education credit given to any professional engineer for completion of any continuing education course or seminar about which the professional engineer registers a complaint with the Board.

Rulemaking Authority 455.213(7), 455.2178, 455.2179, 471.008, 471.017(3) FS. Law Implemented 455.213(7), 455.2177, 455.2178, 455.2179, 471.008, 471.017(3) FS. History–New 9-16-01.
61G15-22.014 Duration of Provider Status.

(1) Continuing education providers are approved only for the biennium during which they applied and must reapply for provider status at the beginning of each biennium. The biennium for continuing education providers ends on May 31st of each odd-numbered year.

(2) A provider must reapply for approval ninety (90) days prior to the date of expiration of provider status in order to prevent a lapse in provider status.

Rulemaking Authority 455.213(7), 455.2178, 455.2179, 471.008, 471.017(7) FS. Law Implemented 455.213(7), 455.2178, 455.2179, 471.017(3) FS. History–New 9-16-01.
